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Summary
Randall Eberts explores the role of teachers unions in public education. He focuses particularly
on how collective bargaining agreements shape the delivery of educational services, how unions
affect both student achievement and the cost of providing quality education, and how they sup-
port educational reform efforts.

Eberts’s synthesis of the empirical research concludes that union bargaining raises teachers’
compensation, improves their working conditions, and enhances their employment security—
while also raising the cost of providing public education by upwards of 15 percent. The effect
of unions on student performance is mixed. Students of average ability who attend school in
union districts perform better on standardized tests, whereas low-achieving and high-achieving
students perform worse. However, the overall gain in achievement does not make up for the
higher cost.

Of late, unions have begun to be more supportive of school reform, moving from an adversarial
bargaining model to a more collaborative one in which teachers and administrators share com-
mon goals and hold joint responsibility. Yet unions’ desire to participate in reform does not
match their fervor to organize in the 1960s and 1970s. While national union leadership has
talked about reform, local affiliates have initiated most of the reform efforts, pioneering re-
forms such as accountability and incentive pay. In Eberts’s view, one reason that unions have
been slow to embrace reform efforts is the lack of consensus on their effectiveness. He argues
that many reforms have been too narrowly focused; rather, effective schools result from well-
designed systems and processes. In principle, adopting standards that help teachers focus on
lessons they want students to learn, aligning their teaching to the lessons, and devising meas-
urements that demonstrate that students are responding to these lessons can improve teaching
as long as the public, policymakers, and school administrators acknowledge the complexity of
the learning process and the broad outcomes that society desires.
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America’s need to provide high-
quality education to its chil-
dren has never been greater. In
today’s knowledge-based econ-
omy, education—and public

education in particular—is at the center of
U.S. efforts to maintain a competitive inter-
national edge. But many observers fear that
those efforts are failing. In international tests,
U.S. students rank only in the mid-range of
nations in the critical areas of math and sci-
ence. Public surveys reveal grave concern
about the quality of public education—and
also about efforts to improve it. Over the past
several decades federal, state, and local poli-
cymakers have adopted one education reform
after another, with little systemwide success.
Some reforms focus on improving the exist-
ing system—for example, by adopting incen-
tive pay and encouraging accountability. Oth-
ers aim to create new systems—for example,
by promoting vouchers and charter schools.
So far, the public appears to prefer reforming
the current system, not abandoning it.1

Some observers blame specific groups linked
with public education for the slow pace of
improvement. Some of the strongest attacks
have been reserved for teachers unions,
which are said to have captured schools to
advance their own interests, not those of the
students. Many critics of unions believe that
collective bargaining has created a tangled
web of rules that keep public schools from
being able to respond to the changing needs
of students and that the bargaining process
has influenced public education more than
any other factor.2 As a result, they say, public
education is both more costly and less effec-
tive than it should be. Such criticisms are not
new. In 1983 the landmark study A Nation at
Risk, by the congressionally mandated Na-
tional Commission on Excellence in Educa-
tion, alerted Americans to a crisis in educa-

tion.3 The study, which challenged educators,
policymakers, and parents to rethink the way
students are educated, set in motion a wave
of educational reform that continues to this
day. Teachers, who had hitherto attracted lit-
tle public notice, suddenly found themselves
at center stage in the controversy over school
quality. The nation’s immediate response to
the report was to set up systems to improve
teacher and school accountability. Because
the new focus—on monitoring and assessing
teacher practices and on tying compensation
to teachers’ performance—was antithetical to
two decades of work by teachers unions to
decouple salaries from performance and to
increase the autonomy of teachers in the
classroom, teachers came to be perceived as
reluctant participants in reform. Meanwhile,
reform efforts gained little traction and
yielded few, if any, sustained attempts at
merit pay or systems of accountability. Today
these same reforms remain under discussion
and teachers unions continue to find them-
selves in the fray.

Aware of charges that they are resistant to
change, teachers unions have voiced concern
about school quality and urged the need for
reform. Robert Chase, past president of the
National Education Association (NEA), the
nation’s largest teachers union, called for a
new unionism based on collaborative bar-
gaining with school districts to help improve
school performance. In an address at the Na-
tional Press Club in 1997, he reminded his
nearly 2.7 million members of the need for
unions to take an active role in planning and
implementing educational reforms.4

In this article I explore both the extent to
which teachers’ collective bargaining affects
the quality of education and the role of bar-
gaining in the educational reform movement.
Beyond the rhetoric of union advocates and

R a n d a l l  W.  E b e r t s

176 T H E  F U T U R E  O F  C H I L D R E N

09 5564-7 Eberts.qxp  1/15/2007  10:17 PM  Page 176



opponents, what do researchers know about
how unions affect student achievement and
the cost of providing quality education? Are
unions a help or a hindrance? To what extent
are they promoting constructive change to
improve public education and to what extent
are they thwarting such efforts?

Collective Bargaining by Teachers
Collective bargaining is the process by which
teachers and administrators agree on a set of
regulations that govern working conditions
and determine compensation and fringe ben-
efits. Dubbed a “web of rules,” it can affect
every dimension of the workplace and can
subsequently influence educational out-
comes.5 It defines the rights and duties of
teachers to particular assignments, guaran-
tees teachers’ participation in school gover-
nance and educational policymaking, estab-
lishes grievance procedures, and at times
creates disciplinary sanctions for teachers’
failure to achieve certain standards. It also
provides for teacher participation in restruc-
turing the workplace. More specifically, the
far-reaching web of rules may include work-
ing conditions, such as the length of the
school day, hours of instruction and prepara-
tion time, and interaction time with parents;
class size; the number and responsibility of
supplemental classroom personnel, such as
aides; employment protection; assignment to
schools and grade levels; criteria for promo-
tion; reductions in force; professional ser-
vices; in-service and professional develop-
ment; instructional policy committees;
student grading and promotion; teacher eval-
uation; performance indicators; grievance
procedures; student discipline and teacher
safety; and the exclusion of pupils from the
classroom. The list goes on. Suffice it to say
that collective bargaining agreements,
through negotiated rules and regulations, es-
tablish school policy and govern how teach-

ers, administrators, parents, and students in-
teract in the delivery of educational services.
As the Wall Street Journal noted nearly three
decades ago, “Teachers’ unions have become
crucial forces in deciding how public educa-
tion should be run in the U.S.” 6

Laws governing public sector collective bar-
gaining have come almost exclusively from

state governments. Although the National
Labor Relations Act (NLRA) of 1935, as
amended in 1947, required employers to
meet and confer in good faith with respect to
wages, hours, and other terms and conditions
of employment, it did not include public sec-
tor employers. Congress has considered leg-
islation to govern negotiations of public em-
ployees, but states have assumed leadership.

Meaningful state legislation giving public
employees a voice in determining the condi-
tions of their employment was first enacted
in the 1960s. Before then, two states, Alaska
and New Hampshire, had allowed local gov-
ernments to negotiate with groups represent-
ing public employees, but neither state ex-
tended to public employees the same rights
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as granted to private employees. Alaska’s law
(in 1935) and New Hampshire’s law (in 1955)
did not require or ensure bargaining; they
only allowed local governments to negotiate
under specified conditions. Permitting public
employees to bargain, nonetheless, was a big
step in treating private and public employees
equally in the bargaining arena. Before pas-
sage of the two state collective bargaining

laws, contracts between school boards and
teachers unions were seen as an illegal dele-
gation to school boards of local citizens’ sov-
ereign constitutional powers. Granting teach-
ers and other public employees the power to
bargain collectively was believed to give them
clout over and above their private sector
counterparts because they were already able,
through the political process, to elect the
public officials who would govern and man-
age the workplace.7

In 1962 Wisconsin became the first state to
pass legislation governing public employee
bargaining that resembled the language
found in the NLRA. The Wisconsin statute
required local governments to bargain in
good faith with employee groups and also
created administrative enforcement meas-
ures. It charged the Wisconsin Public Em-
ployee Relations Board with determining ap-
propriate bargaining units, enforcing the
prevention of prohibited practices, fact find-

ing, and mediating disputes. The law also
marked the beginning of widespread recogni-
tion of the rights of public employees to bar-
gain collectively. Within the next five years,
New York and Michigan passed similar laws,
and by 1974 thirty-seven states had passed
legislation permitting public employee bar-
gaining—a number that remains unchanged
to this day.

After public sector collective bargaining was
legally recognized, teacher representation
grew significantly. In 1974 roughly 22 percent
of public school teachers were covered by col-
lective bargaining. That share doubled in six
years and grew to more than 60 percent by
the mid-1980s. Today unions represent 67
percent of the nation’s 3 million active public
elementary and secondary school teachers.8

The coverage rate for teachers is much higher
than the average of 40 percent for all public
sector employees. Representation varies geo-
graphically, with some teachers in all regions
and all states reporting that they belong to a
labor union or a similar association or else are
nevertheless covered under a collective bar-
gaining contract. The highest proportion of
representation is in the Middle Atlantic re-
gion (88 percent), with the New England (82
percent), East North Central (81 percent),
and Pacific (82 percent) regions close behind.
Coverage is lowest in the West South Central
region, at 40 percent, and slightly higher in
the South Atlantic (47 percent) and East
South Central (52 percent) regions.

Teachers were not always anxious to be a part
of organized labor. In the early years of the
NEA, members saw its role as promoting the
professional side of teaching. Although NEA
members were sensitive to their financial
needs, the union’s official posture was one of
discourse, not collective action.9 The Ameri-
can Federation of Teachers (AFT), by con-
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trast, tried from its inception to bring teach-
ers into the mainstream of organized labor.
Unlike the larger and more powerful NEA,
the AFT advocated collective action as the
best way to promote the interest of teachers.

Researchers generally cite four reasons for
the growth of collective bargaining for teach-
ers.10 The first, as noted, was the passage of
state laws protecting teachers’ rights to seek
bargaining recognition. Second, declining en-
rollment and skyrocketing inflation in the
1970s eroded teachers’ financial well-being,
and general discontent with access to and in-
fluence over educational decisionmaking di-
minished teachers’ sense of professionalism.
Third, changing social conditions and work-
force demographics and an increasing mili-
tancy and social awareness provided fertile
ground for the union movement. Finally, as
unionism in the private sector continually de-
clined, union organizers came to see teachers
and the public sector as ripe for organizing.
And rivalry between the AFT and the NEA
increased their fervor.11

During their formative years of collective
bargaining, teachers unions patterned them-
selves after their private sector counterparts,
which followed what has been called an in-
dustrial bargaining model.12 According to the
NEA’s Chase, “When we reinvented our asso-
ciation in the 1960s, we modeled it after tra-
ditional, industrial unions. Likewise, we ac-
cepted the industrial premise: Namely, that
labor and management have distinct, con-
flicting roles and interests . . . that we are
destined to clash . . . that the union-manage-
ment relationship is inherently adversarial.”13

The industrial model is based on an adversar-
ial, not collaborative role, with management
controlling the workplace and workers filling
narrowly defined tasks. Such a model values
standardized practice and views similarly

skilled workers as interchangeable, each to
be treated alike. From the viewpoint of
teachers in the classroom, administrators uni-
laterally set educational policy and teachers
comply. Instruction is delivered uniformly to
large groups of students, and the teaching
force is undifferentiated. The primary role of
unions is to protect workers from unrealistic
demands of management, ensure a safe
working environment, and extract the maxi-
mum compensation possible. Bargaining fo-
cuses more on teachers’ interests and less on
their performance and how that performance
affects student outcomes. While perhaps
more applicable to private sector production
workers, such a stance places teachers at
odds with their desire to be treated as profes-
sionals as they bargain in their self-interest.

The extent to which teachers unions affect
school quality and ultimately student
achievement depends on many factors. First,
how successful are unions in negotiating
higher salaries and fringe benefits? Second,
how successful are they in negotiating provi-
sions that affect workplace conditions, such
as class size and transfers, which in turn may
affect students’ school-based learning envi-
ronment? Third, how successful are unions in
negotiating rules that govern teachers’ inter-
action with students, parents, and other
teachers? Fourth, how successful are they in
shielding teachers from accountability for
their own performance? All these factors and
others must be considered to determine the
bottom line of collective bargaining: what ef-
fect, if any, it has on student achievement.

Outcomes of Collective 
Bargaining Negotiations
I begin by examining the ability of teachers
unions to affect their compensation, working
conditions, employment security, and work-
place governance through collective bargain-
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ing and then look at the evidence of the over-
all effect of union bargaining on student
achievement.14 I note at the outset that re-
searchers at times draw a distinction between
unionization and collective bargaining.
Unionization is seen as the influence teachers
exert on their school district through the bar-
gaining power of their membership; collec-
tive bargaining, by contrast, has more to do
with the establishment of rules governing the
workplace and compensation through negoti-
ated collective bargaining agreements. It is a
subtle distinction, because the effects of bar-
gaining power are seen in the ability of
unions to negotiate higher compensation and
to include key provisions in their contracts.
Furthermore, bargaining power determines
the strength with which contract provisions
influence administrative decisions.15

A necessary foundation for bargaining power
is the extent to which state laws permit and
require collective bargaining. A recent re-
view of state collective bargaining laws for
the public sector found that the presence or
absence of state laws governing union secu-
rity and laws defining collective bargaining
rights affects the wages of public sector em-
ployees.16 For example, earnings of union
workers are between 4 and 11 percent higher
where an agency or union shop is either com-
pulsory or negotiable than where it is not.
Consequently, given the legal right to bargain
collectively, public sector unions are able to
increase the wages of their members, which
in turn affects the allocation of resources in
the public sector.

Teachers unions may wield power at the polls
and through the political process, as well as
around the bargaining table. As noted, one
argument against allowing public sector bar-
gaining was that public employees have the
ability to elect the government officials who

would govern and manage the workplace and
allocate resources that directly affect the
teachers’ working conditions and compensa-
tion.17 In addition to their individual votes, in
many local jurisdictions, teachers and other
public employees have the opportunity to
form a strong voting bloc that can dispropor-
tionately affect the outcomes of school board
elections, school bond elections, and other
referendum ballots directly affecting public
schools. Teachers unions can, and have, come
out strongly against state referenda to allow
charter schools and voucher systems, which
they believe could divert students away from
traditional public schools and thus reduce
public school resources, their union ranks,
and their bargaining and political power.18 A
state teachers union typically has a strong
lobbying arm that finances media campaigns,
supports political action committees, and
contributes to specific campaigns through
voluntary contributions from its members.19

Contract Provisions
Bargaining power may be reflected simply in
the number of significant provisions found in
contracts. One study of the collective bar-
gaining contracts of New York State school
districts, which are represented by either the
NEA or AFT, found that these agreements
are hierarchical, in that some provisions are
more easily negotiated, while others, presum-
ably more restrictive to management, are
harder to include.20 Thus contracts with
more restrictive provisions, such as no reduc-
tion in the teacher workforce during the
length of the contract, would seem to indi-
cate greater bargaining power on the part of
teachers unions. In fact, the study finds that
the sheer number of contract provisions posi-
tively affects the negotiation of teacher
salaries. Teachers in districts with fifty con-
tract provisions (of a possible fifty-three pre-
determined categories) received $1,900
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more, on average, than those in districts with
the minimum number of items. Budget allo-
cations are also affected by the inclusion or
removal of specific contract provisions
through the negotiating process, providing
further evidence of the link between bargain-
ing power and contract provisions.

Teacher Pay and Benefits
Two detailed studies, one by William Baugh
and Joe Stone and the other by Caroline
Hoxby, using different techniques and data
samples, find that teachers covered by collec-
tive bargaining tend to earn 5 to 12 percent
more than those who are not covered.21 This
is consistent with the typical range found for
union pay premiums in other sectors.22 Evi-
dence on the fringe benefit premium is not as
extensive. One study, based on contracts for
New York State public schools, finds that bar-
gaining has a larger effect on fringe benefits
than it does on pay.23 This finding corre-
sponds to evidence from other sectors, where
the effect of bargaining on fringe benefits is
typically larger than the effect on pay. As
noted, higher pay and fringe benefits, al-
though they increase educational costs, may
also increase the quality of education if they
attract better teachers.

Working Conditions
The working conditions about which teach-
ers appear to be most concerned are class
size, time for preparation and other activities
away from students, and autonomy in the
classroom.24 Three studies, each relying on
different data sets, find that student-teacher
ratios are 7–12 percent lower for union
teachers than for nonunion teachers.25

Teachers have also successfully negotiated
provisions that regulate instructional and
preparation time and limit the time they
must devote to administrative duties and
meeting with parents. A study by Eberts and

Joe Stone found that elementary teachers in
union districts spend 4 percent more time in
class preparation and administrative duties
but 3 percent less time in instruction than
their nonunion counterparts.

Another aspect of working conditions is
teachers’ mode of instruction. The Eberts
and Stone study finds that teachers unions
tend to “standardize” the workplace, by rely-
ing more on traditional classroom organiza-
tion than on other instructional methods. In
national data for fourth-grade students, it
also finds that union schools are less likely to
rely on specialized, less standard instruc-
tional methods in mathematics. Students in
union schools spend 42 percent less time
with a specialist, 62 percent less time with a
specialized aide, 26 percent less time with a
tutor, and 68 percent less time in indepen-
dent, programmed study.26 Such standardiza-
tion, common to unionized workplaces, may
affect average and atypical students in differ-
ent ways.

Employment Security
Unions and their members also seek job pro-
tection from temporary downturns in enroll-
ment and from reductions in employment as
the costs of union pay and fringe benefits
rise. Many public school teachers, both
union and nonunion, are granted tenure
after a few years of regular employment,
which protects them from dismissal except
for specific causes, few of which are related
to performance. But in addition, unions pro-
tect employment by negotiating lower class
size and reduction-in-force provisions. As
noted, student-teacher ratios tend to be
lower in union schools, even in the face of
higher pay and fringe benefits. Reduction-
in-force provisions are also prevalent in
many district contracts. Their effectiveness
in protecting employment can be seen in
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their positive effects on wages and their mit-
igating effects on terminations in districts
with declining enrollments.27

Cost of Instruction
In other unionized sectors, the increased pay,
better fringe benefits, improved working
conditions, more standardized and regulated
workplace, and protections against job loss
common in union contracts typically come at
the expense of a higher cost of production.28

The same is true for public education. Al-
though a few early studies found little or no
difference in the costs of operating unionized
schools, the two most detailed studies pro-
vide consistent evidence of higher operating
costs.29 One finds that the operating cost of
unionized elementary schools is about 15
percent higher; of unionized high schools,
about 8 percent higher.30 The other, relying
on different, more recent data, finds that the
costs of operating unionized high schools are
about 12 percent higher.31

By negotiating higher salaries and smaller
class size, teachers unions may influence the
way schools allocate their resources. It is pos-
sible that higher payroll costs could be cov-
ered by raising taxes, leaving the same money
available for other educational spending un-
related to teacher compensation. But studies
show that teachers unions distort the way ed-
ucational spending is allocated because the
higher compensation typically reduces funds
available for other instructional purposes.

Administrative Flexibility
By their very nature, contracts restrict the
discretion of administrators. They can dictate
class size and teacher assignments, impose
restrictions on teacher dismissal and reduc-
tion in force, and determine the extent to
which teachers participate in key decisions.
Codifying strict rules into a contract, which

may be in place for up to three years, could
be problematic for administrators seeking to
adapt to change. But although these provi-
sions reduce the discretion of administrators,
they need not completely impede their effec-
tiveness. As one study reports, “truly effec-
tive principals usually accept collective bar-
gaining and use the contract both to manage
their building more systematically and to in-
crease teacher participation in school deci-
sionmaking. Less effective principals may
view the contract as an obstacle to a well-run
school and then use it as an excuse for poor
management.”32 Superintendents may use
union rules to strengthen their control over
principals and centralize decisionmaking
within the district. Such efforts may lead to
more effective schools if they are aligned
with the desired outcomes and if teachers
and principals share similar views. Whether
this takes place is an empirical issue that few
analysts have examined with any rigor. The
Eberts and Stone study finds from a national
survey that the gap in perceptions between
elementary school teachers and principals
about a principal’s active leadership is larger
in union than in nonunion schools. The same
is true for perceptions about teachers and
principals working well together. By contrast,
it finds no difference in perceptions regard-
ing staff being well informed or identifying
conflict. It also finds that time spent by prin-
cipals in instructional leadership leads to
higher test scores in union districts but lower
scores in nonunion districts. These findings
are only suggestive of the differences in atti-
tudes and their effect on student achieve-
ment that stem from the greater structure in-
troduced by collective bargaining contracts.33

Student Achievement
The question that causes the most public
concern, of course, is whether teachers
unions affect student achievement. Evidence
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on “productivity” from other (nonteacher)
unionized sectors is mixed. In some sectors,
union workers appear to be more productive;
in others, less. In most cases, though, the dif-
ferences are small, especially in the most rig-
orous studies.34 For teachers the critical find-
ing seems to be not whether teachers unions
raise or lower student achievement, but how
they influence the effectiveness of schools.

What is the evidence on student achieve-
ment? The evidence that is available is not
ideal. One would like to assign students ran-
domly to schools that are also randomly as-
signed to union or nonunion status and then
observe student achievement over time. The
best approximations to this ideal experiment
use extensive statistical controls for both stu-
dent and school attributes, as well as for the
nonrandom assignment of students and
schools. But even good approximations to
the ideal have been difficult to achieve. An-
other approach has been to look at the ef-
fects of unions on schools’ ability to attract
and retain more qualified teachers, through
higher pay and fringe benefits, better work-
ing conditions, and a greater voice in deci-
sionmaking and teacher transfers. One
study, by Susanna Loeb and Marianne Page,
finds that higher wages attract a better pool
of teacher applicants.35 But another, by
Susan Moore Johnson and Morgaen Donald-
son, finds no consistent evidence that the
quality of teachers has increased or de-
creased as a result of collective bargaining.36

Although other studies have shown that
teachers contribute to student achievement,
they have difficulty identifying which
teacher attributes are responsible.37 There-
fore, I review studies that link collective bar-
gaining directly to student achievement, in-
stead of trying to piece together the effect of
unions on the various factors affecting stu-
dent achievement.

Often, the most widely reported evidence is
based on state data for SAT or ACT scores.
Three prominent state studies find roughly
similar positive effects for teachers unions on
average scores on either the SAT or the
ACT—between 4.5 and 8 percent.38 One of
these also finds a similar positive effect (4.4
percent) on high school graduation rates.39

These studies are problematic, however, be-

cause they have few controls for student and
district effects and aggregate the student out-
comes of vastly different school districts into
one measure of student outcomes for each
state.

A few studies have looked at student achieve-
ment using individual student data with rela-
tively detailed controls for both student and
school attributes.40 Across four different sam-
ples of students (the Sustaining Effects Sur-
vey, High School and Beyond, the National
Assessment of Economic Education, and the
National Educational Longitudinal Survey)
and three different grade levels (fourth,
tenth, and twelfth), these studies yield re-
markably consistent results. Collectively, they
find that teachers unions raise average stu-
dent scores on various standardized exams
between 1 and 2 percent. Some also estimate
the effect of unions on gains in test scores
from the beginning to the end of the school
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year. Eberts and Stone, for example, find that
students in union districts have a 5 percent
higher gain in before and after testing than
students in nonunion schools. Given the dif-
ferences among samples, grade levels, test
measures, and empirical methodologies, the
similarity of these findings cannot be ig-
nored. Yet the effects are relatively small.
Furthermore, they are positive only for aver-

age-achieving students. Low- and high-
performing students fare worse in union
schools.41

Caroline Hoxby uses a different measure of
student outcomes: high school dropout rates.
Using district-level data, she finds that teach-
ers unions are associated with a 2.3 percent
increase in dropout rates and infers that
unionization reduces student achievement.42

Hoxby also finds that union effects on
dropout rates are larger in areas with little in-
terdistrict competition.

Hoxby’s findings raise the question of how
teachers unions can raise average student
achievement on standardized exams (based
on the four studies mentioned), yet also in-
crease high school dropout rates. Given that
her analysis is based on district data, one an-
swer might be that low-scoring students are
more likely to drop out, so that relatively
higher-scoring students remain in the district
to take the tests. But that does not explain the

positive achievement found in early grades
(in the case of Eberts and Stone, fourth
grade), where the dropout rates are much
lower and the achievement results are still
similar to those for high school.

Another explanation may lie in the method-
ologies used and the ability to control for fac-
tors affecting student achievement that are
unrelated to unionization, as well as unobserv-
able variables that may have caused teachers
to unionize. A closer look at the two groups of
studies—those based on individual student
data and Hoxby’s, based on district data—
shows more similarities than differences in
their methodologies.43 Without considering
the problems inherent in using student
dropout rates to proxy student achievement, it
is not apparent that one methodology is supe-
rior to another, because each has its advantage
in controlling for important factors related to
student achievement.44

A more satisfactory answer may lie in the evi-
dence on the effect of unions on the distribu-
tion of student achievement, rather than on
average student achievement. The finding by
Eberts and Stone and others of an inverted-
U-shaped effect of teachers unions on stu-
dent achievement may help to reconcile the
evidence of positive effects on achievement
for average students with negative effects on
high school dropout rates. Dropout rates are
highly correlated with student success in
schools, and low-performing students are
much more likely to drop out. If teachers
unions tend to reduce the academic success
of weak students, one would tend to expect
the dropout rate to increase, because it is the
weakest students who are the most likely to
drop out.

Disparities in the way unions affect students
of varying ability can be explained in part by
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the standardizing effect of unions on schools.
As noted, unionized schools rely to a greater
extent on traditional classroom instruction
and less on specialized modes of instruction.
Because standard methods are likely to work
best for the average student and specialized
modes to work best for atypical students, one
might expect the effects to differ by student
ability.45 This explanation is reinforced by
Argys and Rees, who find that effects no
longer differ after they take into account the
type and size of the instructional setting and
other related classroom factors.46

The evidence on how unions affect student
achievement leads to the general conclusion
that there is no simple answer and that gen-
eralization is difficult. The average-achieving
student does not appear to be harmed by at-
tending union schools and may even fare
slightly better, whereas low-achieving, at-risk
students and high-achieving students tend to
do better in nonunion schools. Even though
some threads of evidence are promising, re-
searchers have much to learn about how
unions affect student outcomes. What is
known with some certainty is that the pro-
ductivity gains of unionization, if any, do not
match the increase in cost, upward of 15 per-
cent, that unions place on education through
higher compensation and their influence on
resource allocation within schools.

Reform Initiatives
In recent years, both the NEA and the AFT
have advocated a new model for collective bar-
gaining known as reform bargaining. Reform
bargaining recognizes that management and
labor are not adversaries but share common
interests, are jointly responsible for the out-
comes of their organization, and should find it
useful to collaborate to pursue those common
goals. Instead of a standardized workplace in
which duties are rigidly defined and compart-

mentalized, both management and labor strive
for flexibility, and workers participate in site-
based decisionmaking. For teacher collective
bargaining, the new model calls for teachers
and administrators to hold joint responsibility
for schooling, share common goals, and collab-
orate in determining governance, instruc-
tional, and personnel issues.47

The first waves of reform initiatives,
prompted in 1983 by A Nation at Risk, were
not widely embraced by teachers unions. In
many respects, the reform movement col-
lided head-on with the union movement,
which by the early 1980s included nearly
two-thirds of the nation’s public school teach-
ers. As described by Lorraine McDonnell
and Anthony Pascal in their study of the role
of unions in implementing reform, the bar-
gaining process continued to place material
gain, such as higher salaries and benefits and
better working conditions, over efforts to in-
crease teacher professionalism and accounta-
bility.48 Johnson and Kardos also conclude
that many unions tried to stall reform in the
belief that the public would soon lose inter-
est. But they discovered that far from losing
interest, the public instead began to call for
sweeping changes, such as vouchers and
charter schools, which could threaten the
very existence of public schools and of the
unions themselves.49

As in the race to organize teachers, the NEA
and AFT have continued to jockey for position
in leading the reform effort. Sensing the na-
tion’s concern about teacher complacency dur-
ing the 1980s, the AFT began to soften its
strong activist and militant stand in bargaining.
Instead of pushing for hard-line positions on
wage demands and bargaining provisions, the
AFT has urged its affiliates to establish higher
standards—to police its ranks, hold teachers
accountable to union standards, and bargain
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cooperatively rather than contentiously with
management.50 The NEA, most recently with
the public proclamations of President Chase,
has echoed these sentiments while insisting on
the urgent need for action.

Charles Kerchner and Julia Koppich note
that union-sponsored reform does not have
the momentum that collective bargaining had
during the 1960s and 1970s.51 They see three

internal challenges to union reform. The first
is a lack of clarity about goals. While union
leaders do not lack vision, say the authors, the
complexity of the task of improving school
quality makes it hard for them to discuss the
issue without raising teachers’ fears of how
reform will affect their work life and com-
pensation. The second challenge is organiza-
tional undercapacity, because union leaders
and members have not embraced the ur-
gency of reform. Many teachers do not be-
lieve that public schools need to be re-
formed. Third, without the vision and
commitment of teachers and leaders, it is dif-
ficult to build a strong political coalition that
would legitimate reform roles. Furthermore,
the lack of agreement about the effectiveness
of many reform initiatives makes it difficult
to convince teachers to implement the
changes.

While national union organizations have
talked about reform, much of the effort has
been initiated by local affiliates, sometimes
with resistance from their parent organiza-
tions. In 1996, a group of reform-minded
NEA and AFT local affiliates formed the
Teachers Union Reform Network (TURN).
The brainchild of two local union presidents,
TURN is funded primarily by grants from
private foundations, not from the parent or-
ganizations. Its twenty-plus members meet
regularly to exchange ideas and promote re-
form initiatives. Its goals include “improving
the quality of teaching” and “seeking to ex-
pand the scope of collective bargaining to in-
clude instructional and professional issues.”52

Kerchner and Koppich have analyzed the
collective bargaining contracts of twenty-one
TURN members to see which types of provi-
sions they find important for reform.53 The
provisions include (with the number of con-
tracts in parentheses): shared decisionmaking
and budgeting (21), uses of time (19), profes-
sional development (15), peer assistance and
review (14), school-based staff and budget
(14), intervention strategy for low-perform-
ing schools (10), alternative compensation,
such as pay-for-performance (8), parent en-
gagement (4), charter and pilot schools (4),
and learning standards (2).

In many cases, success in including these
provisions in collective bargaining agree-
ments came about not from a broad accept-
ance of the new unionism at the national
level, but from stances taken by local union
leaders and school administrators. Several
local unions and their districts stand out for
pioneering initiatives addressing accountabil-
ity and incentive pay. Both initiatives have
gained considerable support among policy-
makers and have been implemented to vary-
ing degrees across the country; performance
standards were most recently embodied in
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the No Child Left Behind Act (NCLB) of
2001. After briefly describing these initia-
tives, I will focus on evidence of their effec-
tiveness in improving student outcomes, in
particular, test scores.

Accountability
Reforms to improve the accountability of
schools have sought either to improve or re-
place the existing public education system.
Improvements within the system involve
changes that directly affect the internal oper-
ations of schools. Chief among these are stan-
dards for student performance, measurement
tools to track student progress, and pre-
scribed consequences for students, teachers,
and schools if standards are not met. Reforms
that go outside the system put competitive
pressure on schools to improve, by enhancing
parental choice. This latter wave of reform
has created a number of different voucher
programs that enable parents to use public
dollars to send their children to private
schools. It has also created publicly sup-
ported “charter” schools, outside the direct
control of local school boards, as alternatives
to conventional public schools.

Both types of reforms were proposed and
adopted by local teachers unions before they
were instituted as state or national policy.
Toledo, Ohio, is generally credited with
paving the way among teachers unions in
holding its members more accountable for
performance. Throughout the 1970s, the
union pressed to expand its role in evaluating
teachers. It finally codified a plan in its col-
lective bargaining agreement in 1981. Known
as the Toledo Plan, it included two separate
programs—an intern program for first-year
teachers and an intervention program for ex-
perienced teachers who need substantial re-
mediation. Both use consulting teachers, who
take a three-year leave from the classroom to

serve as both mentor and evaluator. A nine-
member Intern Board of Review, including
five teachers, makes the final decision to
renew or dismiss an intern. The board also
determines whether a tenured teacher who is
seen by the principal or the union’s building
committee as underperforming needs to un-
dergo a performance review and get assis-
tance. If performance does not improve suffi-
ciently, the teacher may be let go.54

Incentive Pay
Other school districts adopted the peer eval-
uation system initiated by Toledo and ex-
panded it to link pay to performance. For ex-
ample, the Columbus, Ohio, Education
Association adopted a peer evaluation system
in 1986 but later agreed to school-based
salary incentives and limits on the impact of
seniority.55 The Cincinnati Federation of
Teachers recently expanded its peer review
process and professional development acad-
emy by implementing a compensation system
based on professional development instead of
seniority. Teachers are assessed on predeter-
mined quality standards and paid accordingly
when they have achieved them. Seattle has
taken pay for performance one step further
by including student achievement as a quality
standard.

Denver, probably more than any other school
district to date, has pursued an ambitious
pay-for-performance experiment. Ironically,
in 1921 Denver became the first school dis-
trict to replace a merit pay approach with a
single salary schedule based on seniority. Sev-
enty-eight years later the district administra-
tion and teachers association agreed on a
two-year pilot that would base teachers’ pay
in part directly on the achievement of their
students. As described by Donald Gratz, who
was in charge of evaluating the Denver In-
centive Program, the pilot provided small
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bonuses for teachers who met either one or
two student achievement objectives that they
themselves chose.56 These objectives had to
be approved by their principals. For each ob-
jective met, teachers received $750. For a
school to join the pilot, 85 percent of its fac-
ulty had to vote for participation. Thirteen
schools signed up.

The Denver Teachers Association had op-
posed the new compensation system as ini-
tially proposed but, wishing to avoid contin-
ued confrontation with the administration,
agreed after winning three important conces-
sions. One was that teachers’ performance
would be based on objectives of their own
choice, with approval of their principals. An-
other was that an outside, objective party
would evaluate the effectiveness of the pilot.
The third was that the final plan would be
subject to a general vote of the association’s
members. By the time the system was
brought to a vote and approved in 2004, it
had been modified extensively. The approved
system included four components. Compen-
sation was based on student growth objec-
tives; on earned professional development
units, including advanced degrees; and on
two bonuses, one for serving in hard-to-staff
assignments and the other for serving in
hard-to-serve schools.

At first blush, it would seem that teachers
unions should find standards-based systems
attractive, because they promote standardiza-
tion of the workplace. With clearly defined
goals and objectives and mandates to adhere
to these standards, teachers understand what
is expected of them, are protected from capri-
cious directives from administrators that may
distract them from these goals, and can relate
negotiated contract provisions, such as class
size reduction, to the achievement of these
standards. But teachers believe that standards-

based accountability intrudes into their auton-
omy in the classroom. It dictates curriculum
and the tests that the teacher should adminis-
ter, and it establishes the outcomes that are ex-
pected. The first two items—curriculum and
testing—have normally been outside the im-
mediate discretion of teachers, although
teachers do participate in their design and im-
plementation. The third—being held account-
able for student outcomes—is the major point
of contention. Teachers believe that such ac-
countability can expose them to arbitrary
treatment by administrators and make them
responsible for things outside their immediate
control. They also believe it can base compen-
sation on ambiguous criteria.57 The few teach-
ers associations that have adopted accountabil-
ity systems linked to pay have opted to
maintain some control over determining ob-
jectives and how outcomes are measured.

The Effectiveness of Accountability 
and Incentive Pay
Between the mid-1990s, when Denver first
pursued a performance-based compensation
system, and 2004, when it approved it, nearly
every state implemented a school accounta-
bility program with the help and encourage-
ment of the federal government, although
most have not been linked directly to teach-
ers’ pay. For the most part, then, the question
of whether teachers unions will agree to such
accountability systems is moot, because they
are imposed by state and federal laws. The
question is how effective these programs are,
particularly when they are imposed and not
necessarily agreed to by teachers.

According to a recent study by Julian Betts
and Anne Danenberg, these programs are
based on three elements: content standards
that mandate what students should know and
when they should know it; an assessment sys-
tem that tracks the progress of students in
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meeting the state standards; and a set of re-
sponses by the state that may include finan-
cial incentives, penalties, sanctions, or addi-
tional resources.58 As the authors point out,
supporters of such a system argue that mak-
ing school performance more transparent to
the public, including parents, can put needed
pressure on schools to perform better. Propo-
nents claim that schools will be forced to im-
prove their operations and that teachers will
be more productive when presented with
well-defined goals and held accountable
through close scrutiny of their adherence to
these goals and a carefully designed system of
consequences.

But critics point out that state standards may
be unfair both to affluent districts with high
expectations for their students and to low-
income districts that lack adequate school-
and home-based resources to meet student
needs. For instance, they argue that imposing
one standard on all students and penalizing
districts that do not meet the standard while
rewarding districts that do may divert re-
sources from poor districts, which need the
additional resources, to affluent districts,
which do not. A related concern is that the
state will be slow in adjusting these standards
in response to changing times or the specific
needs of selected school districts.

Critics are also concerned about the assess-
ment system. Measuring a teacher’s contribu-
tion to a student’s progress is difficult be-
cause classrooms are not, as Gratz puts it,
“scientifically controlled environments,” but
are subject to outside influences beyond the
control of teachers.59 Furthermore, critics
worry about adverse incentives such as teach-
ing to the test and focusing instruction on the
narrower content covered by tests, rather
than offering broader topics and more in-
depth treatment of the material.

States have established standards-based ac-
countability systems more on principle and
their promise than on any evidence of their
effectiveness. Evidence of the success of ear-
lier accountability and incentive systems—
those implemented before the recent adop-
tion of high-stakes testing and accompanying
incentive systems by states and the federal
government—does not offer strong support.
Even though most observers agree that it is

human nature to respond to incentives, there
may be several other factors that work against
the effectiveness of performance measures in
individual incentive-based compensation
schemes—just as they often do in the private
sector.

Four characteristics of teaching and learning
in schools may reduce the effectiveness of
incentive-based compensation: the reliance
on subjectively measured outcomes; the
need to perform multiple tasks during the
day; the use of team teaching, where more
than one teacher is responsible for the out-
come of the student or the classroom; and
the existence of multiple stakeholders with
diverse objectives.60 In addition, most school
districts have little control over their rev-
enue streams and cannot offer the sizable in-
creases in compensation necessary to entice
teachers to put forth the extra effort and to
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assume the added risk inherent in a merit
pay system.

The net result of all these forces remains an
empirical issue. Yet little empirical evidence
has been collected on the effects of merit pay
on student achievement. Most of the early
experiences with merit pay systems in school
districts were rather short-lived and usually
negative. For example, one major study
found that 75 percent of merit pay programs
that had been in existence in 1983 were no
longer operational in 1993. An interesting
self-described limitation of this study is that
it did not examine student achievement. Its
authors note: “We would especially have
liked to have performed an in-depth analysis
of the impact of incentive programs on stu-
dent achievement. However, very few of the
participating districts had attempted any sys-
tematic evaluation of the effects of their in-
centive plans on student achievement, even
though a basic assumption behind incentive
plans is that teachers can indeed significantly
affect learning.”61

A study of a Pennsylvania district found no
gains in student achievement from a bonus
system.62 An analysis of Dallas’s perform-
ance-based system found an increase of 10 to
12 percent in the pass rate on selected
statewide tests.63

A recent evaluation of California’s school ac-
countability program, carried out by Betts
and Danenberg, offers a more positive assess-
ment of the effects of incentives.64 The pro-
gram, enacted in 1999, was based on highly
specific and comprehensive standards, a new
norm-referenced statewide test and high
school exit exam, and a complex series of re-
wards and punishments for school staff and
students. Betts and Danenberg analyze recent
trends in test scores and school resources and

find two particularly important trends: test
scores have risen significantly since imple-
mentation of the accountability program,
whereas instructional resources have de-
clined. Both trends are particularly evident
for the lowest-performing schools. In their
view, the accountability reforms and public
scrutiny have spurred genuine growth in
achievement. They recognize that the pat-
terns are consistent with teaching to the test
or a growing familiarity with the tests and
testing process, possibilities that detract from
the success of the program. Nonetheless, they
find that testing and related aspects of ac-
countability have neither diluted the high
school curriculum nor widened inequality be-
tween top- and bottom-performing schools.

Donald Gratz, the evaluator of the Denver
Incentive Program, concludes that a “system
that attempts to closely measure and regulate
instruction provides negative, rather than
positive incentives,” and that a complex sys-
tem that tries to capture results in a single
test score fails to meet its objective of im-
proving education.65 Gratz does not dismiss
standards. On the contrary, he contends that
clearly identified goals with which all parties
are familiar and lessons and assessments de-
signed to achieve these goals are a major ad-
vance over previous methods used by the dis-
trict. Adopting standards that help teachers
focus on lessons they want students to learn,
aligning their teaching to these lessons, and
devising measurements that demonstrate
that students are responding to them can im-
prove teaching. The message of the Denver
experiment, as echoed in the private sector, is
that a system of accountability needs to cap-
ture the contribution of employees to the en-
tire bottom line. For schools, such a system
must acknowledge the complexity of the
learning process and the broad outcomes that
society desires.
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Katharine Boudett, Elizabeth City, and
Richard Murnane set out similar standards
for effective schools. Effective schools have
“a coherent instructional program well-
aligned with strong standards,” and in these
schools “a community of adults committed to
working together to develop the skills and
knowledge of all students . . . have figured
out how to find time to do this work and are
acquiring the skills to do it well.”66

There is a clear consensus that public educa-
tion must be reformed. What is less clear is
how to reform it. Evaluations of two reform
efforts—accountability and incentive pay—
show some signs of promise, but do not pro-
vide sufficiently convincing evidence of their
effectiveness to elicit a groundswell of sup-
port from either union or nonunion school
districts. In many instances, school reform
initiatives have merely nibbled at the edges
of the broader issues confronting improve-
ments in school quality. The lessons learned
from several attempts at accountability warn
against adopting the narrow approach of link-
ing teacher incentive pay directly to student
test scores. They point instead to the ability
to define and articulate the goals of educa-
tion and align resources to accomplish those
goals. Under current collective bargaining
laws, for teachers and administrators to move
toward more comprehensive reform, negotia-
tions must allow for more shared responsibil-
ities and greater flexibility in trying new ap-
proaches and responding to the students’
needs. Restrictive provisions, such as class as-
signment based on a teacher’s seniority and
the rigid allocation of time among daily activ-
ities, must be replaced with provisions that
allow for shared decisionmaking and budget-
ing between teachers and administrators,
flexibility in the use of time, professional de-
velopment, and peer assistance and review.
Some teachers unions—but only a few—have

negotiated these items into their contracts.
Some states, however, do not allow certain
items, such as class size restrictions or class
assignment based on seniority, to go unmen-
tioned in the contract, and some do not allow
teachers to evaluate their own peers and
share in decisions reserved for management.
Therefore, state laws may also need to be
changed before teachers unions and adminis-
trators can negotiate more reform-minded
contracts.67

The Future of the New Unionism
and School Reform
Returning to the question posed in the
title—have unions been a help or a hindrance
to student achievement?—average students
appear not to have been harmed by attending
union schools. If anything, the performance
of average students on standardized tests is
slightly higher, but below- and above-average
students fare worse. Still, the overall increase
in productivity does not offset the higher
costs of unionized districts. Furthermore,
teachers unions reduce the discretion of ad-
ministrators, impose rigid standards, and re-
allocate school expenditures toward higher
compensation and greater employment and
away from resources for specialized and en-
hanced instruction.

A broader question is whether unions will
help or hinder school reform. And to that
question, the answer remains unclear and
speculative. Ask the public, and the response
is divided evenly. The last time the Phi Delta
Kappa/Gallup poll posed that question, 27
percent responded that unions helped, 26
percent said that they hurt, and 37 percent
said they made no difference.68 Ask the ex-
perts, and one receives strong arguments on
either side. Proponents argue that only by
bringing teachers fully into the process can
reform succeed; opponents claim that once
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shared decisionmaking makes its way into
collective bargaining contracts, flexibility is
lost, reform initiatives are stifled, and atten-
tion soon shifts from what is right for the stu-
dents to whether school administrators have
adhered to the contract.69

Yet ask the teachers and administrators of
school districts—union or not—who have
pursued reform to improve the quality of ed-

ucation, and one finds stakeholders who un-
derstand the complexity of the educational
process and recognize the need to build an
organization that can deliver high-quality ed-
ucation. Too often school reform takes a sim-
ple and naïve approach—if only teachers
were held accountable, if only teachers were
paid for their performance, if only students
and parents were given a choice in schools, if
only unions were disbanded, then the quality
of the educational system would vastly im-
prove. Obviously, there are teachers who are
not accountable, not working to their full po-
tential, and hiding behind the protection of
unions. There are unions that put teachers
before students and stand in the way of im-
proving the quality of education. The truth is
that we know little about what works and
what does not in the current reform move-
ment. What we do know, however, is that ed-
ucation is a complex process that defies sim-

ple approaches. Effective schools are not
honeycombs of individual autonomous class-
rooms, but rather well-designed and well-
executed systems and processes.

Can unions fit into that type of environment?
Can administrations and school boards? To
both questions, the answer is that some can
and have but many have not. The problem
lies in the inability of many to identify their
purpose, set goals and objectives, align re-
sources and policies with them, and find the
expertise and leadership to carry them out.
Attempts at reform have come and gone with
little progress in school improvement. In re-
cent years, the leadership of both major
teachers unions has shared the concern about
the deteriorating quality of education and has
called for more teacher participation and col-
laboration. But only a few local teachers
unions have initiated true reforms—at times
in the face of resistance from their national
parent organizations. Policymakers have
called for more accountability from teachers
and administrators but have enacted an ac-
countability system that makes little, if any,
connection between the actions of teachers
and the outcomes of their students.

While there are no quick fixes for improving
school quality, with respect to unions and col-
lective bargaining a few steps could be taken
that focus on building a high-performance
organization. First, school districts need or-
ganizational role models, leadership, and re-
sources. Second, union leadership and the
teacher membership need to realign their
focus and attitudes by assuming more re-
sponsibility for the outcomes of their stu-
dents. Third, administrators and school
boards must affirm the importance of teach-
ers as stakeholders in the educational process
and recognize, as high-performance school
districts have, that a high-performing work-
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force requires a culture of teamwork and an
understanding of what it takes to retain qual-
ity teachers. Fourth, teachers and administra-
tors must work together to determine goals
and objectives, and once established, align
resources and activities to achieve them.
Fifth, once resources and activities are
aligned, a set of measures must be devised
and used by the management team (which
would include teachers and union leaders) to
measure the performance of students and the
level of satisfaction and professional growth
of teachers and other staff. If properly imple-
mented and followed, the goals and objec-
tives and the monitoring system could serve

teachers much as collective bargaining provi-
sions do now.

Finally, teachers unions must embrace the
tenets of the new unionism and actively pur-
sue them in their collaboration with districts.
This means that teachers must be willing to
move away from the security of their con-
tracts and assume, with the administration, a
joint responsibility for schooling. With em-
powerment must come responsibility, and
only through systems of accountability in
which risk is recognized and accepted can
real progress be made in improving the edu-
cation of the nation’s children.
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