
SIEF, Vol.9, No.1, 2021 1119 

 

 

 

 

A Useful Exploration to Improve the 

Quality of Rural School Education 

Xiaoqiao Cheng 

School of Institute of Education Science, Nanjing Normal University, Nanjing 210097, 
Jiangsu, China 

 

“My vision for the country is to urbanise rural areas. What is 
available in the cities must be available in the villages.” 

–Jaggi  Vasudev 

 
HE British educational sociologist B. Bernstein (2003) believed that in 
human social communication, the language signs used by people can be 

divided into exquisite signs and restrictive signs. Exquisite symbols include 
the arrangement of complex grammatical sentences and general semantics; 
while restricted symbols consist of simple, low-selective and restricted 
grammars and words, relying on the semantics of a specific context. Children 
born in middle-class families are familiar with and mastered exquisite sym-
bols in their interactions with their parents, which is the basis for them to 
easily obtain excellent academic studies. Children born in poor families are 
familiar with restrictive symbols in their interactions with their parents. The 
language symbols used in the school education environment are mostly ex-
quisite symbols, or standard academic language. If children from poor fami-
lies cannot master the exquisite symbols, it will affect their understanding of 
the learning content, prone to learning difficulties, and lead to poor academic 
achievement. 

In the process of school science education, due to its subject charac-
teristics, teachers need to use scientific academic language to teach, and stu-
dents need to use scientific academic language to understand the content of 
scientific knowledge, otherwise it will affect students’ scientific academic 
achievements. To this end, teachers need to understand students’ language 
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usage habits, consciously create a learning environment, and train students to 
understand the core concepts of science through learning and mastering sci-
entific academic language, so as to describe the observed scientific phenom-
ena. These are relatively easy for teachers in urban schools to do because 
their family background or living environment provides them with conven-
ient conditions. But for teachers in rural schools, due to their family back-
ground or living environment, and long-term dealings with children from 
poor rural families and their parents, they are accustomed to using restricted 
symbols (popular language) to communicate with children. Obviously, this 
kind of teaching language habit of teachers is not conducive to the teaching 
of science courses, and the result is bound to affect the scientific academic 
achievements of rural school students. Therefore, if we want to improve the 
scientific academic achievement of rural school students, we must start with 
training rural school teachers and at the same time reform the curriculum of 
rural school science education. 

The article entitled Investigating the Impact of Literacy-infused Sci-
ence Intervention on Economically Challenged Students’ Science Achieve-
ment: A Case Study from a Rural District in Texas published in this issue of 
the journal is about the impact of educational interventions on the scientific 
and academic achievements of students from economically challenged rural 
families (Irby et al., 2021). The purpose of this study was to explore a new 
way to improve the teaching ability of rural school science teachers and the 
scientific academic achievement of rural school students. The research inter-
ventions included: training and guidance for teachers, implementing science 
courses that include scientific and language goals, and developing students’ 
scientific academic vocabulary and concepts through listening, speaking, 
reading, and writing. This experimental study proved that providing students 
with opportunities to practice language skills and organically combining lan-
guage teaching with science subject teaching will help rural students achieve 
higher academic achievements. This study also showed that the abstract and 
normative characteristics of science subjects make it difficult for students in 
rural schools to learn and understand the content of science subjects. To re-
duce the difficulties for students in learning science courses, it is necessary to 
improve the teaching ability of teachers in rural schools, especially the teach-
ing ability of science teachers. Therefore, to implement such a teaching strat-
egy in rural schools, it is necessary to strengthen the training and guidance of 
teachers, as well as provide support for various resources. 

This study has proved B. Bernstein’s theory of language signs in prac-
tice, that is, to improve the academic achievement of rural school students, it 
is necessary to help students from economically challenged rural families’ 
master exquisite signs. To achieve this goal, teachers in rural schools must be 
trained to organically embed the task of language teaching in subject teach-
ing. Undoubtedly, this study has enriched the research content of rural educa-
tion and provided a new idea for improving the quality of rural education. 
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