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Article

Children are experiencing abuse and neglect at staggering rates, 
with the number of cases reported increasing every year. 
Between 2011 and 2015, more than 3 million children were 
identified as victims of maltreatment each year, which translates 
to one in eight children experiencing abuse or neglect by their 
18th birthday (United States Department of Health and Human 
Services, 2017). Sadly, these numbers are growing, with 25,000 
more cases of abuse and neglect reported in 2015 compared with 
2011 (NCANDS, 2017). Moreover, researchers have noted that 
children who have experienced abuse and neglect are 4 times 
more likely to receive special education services (Sullivan & 
Knutson, 2000; Waldman, Perlman, & Lederman, 2007; Zetlin, 
2006), which highlights the need to gain a deeper understanding 
of how special education teams can better support children who 
have experienced abuse or neglect.

Researchers reported that children who receive trauma-
informed supports have better outcomes (Chu & Lieberman, 
2010). However, trauma-informed supports, also called 
trauma-informed care, trauma-informed services, trauma-
informed practices, or trauma-informed service delivery, are 
minimally available, and most children do not receive these 
supports due to environmental barriers, such as lack of trans-
portation or financial resources (Smith, Linnemeyer, Scallse, 
& Hamilton, 2013). In the short term, children who have 
experienced abuse and neglect and do not receive appropri-
ate support, are more likely to have greater cognitive, com-
munication, and social-emotional delays (Darwish, Esquivel, 

Houtz, & Alfonso, 2001; Eigsti & Cicchetti, 2004; Pears, 
Fisher, Bruce, Kim, & Yoerger, 2010). In the long term, chil-
dren are more likely to experience school failure, mental 
health concerns, substance abuse, and suicidal behavior 
(Arata, Langhinrichsen-Rohling, Bowers, & O’Farrill-
Swails, 2005; Denov, 2004; Goerge, Voorhis, Grant, Casey, 
& Robinson, 1992). The considerably large number of chil-
dren who have experienced abuse and neglect, coupled with 
the overrepresentation of many of these children also receiv-
ing special education services, highlights the need for spe-
cial education teams to be prepared to support this population 
of children.

Currently, 38 states mandate at least one training for 
school staff on reporting abuse or neglect (National 
Association of Child Care Resources & Referral Agencies, 
2013). Despite policy recommendations to include training 
around the support of children who have been abused or 
neglected (National Education Association [NEA], 2014), 
the mandate does not include training for how best to sup-
port these children in school settings. Miller, Santos, and 
Burke (2019) found that school social workers and school 
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psychologists believed providing trauma-informed support 
through special education service delivery was necessary 
but did not occur in actual practice due to a lack of staff 
preparation. Over the last 40 years, multiple calls for action 
have been made by organizations and researchers to address 
this growing concern (Council for Exceptional Children 
[CEC], 2018; Division for Early Childhood [DEC], 2016; 
McCaffrey & Tewey, 1978; NEA, 1989; Oseroff, Oseroff, 
Westling, & Gessner, 1999). Nonetheless, researchers con-
tinue to find that professionals employed in schools feel 
unprepared to support children who have experienced abuse 
and neglect (Anderson, Blitz, & Saastamoinen, 2015; 
Baxter & Beer, 1990; Costello, 2009; McIntyre, 1987; 
Miller et al., 2019; San Julian, 2013), and reported that the 
training they have received in this area is minimal and 
insufficient (Abrahams, Casey, & Daro, 1992). Before the 
field can move forward with how best to prepare special 
education teams to support children who have experienced 
abuse and neglect, it is critical that we understand what the 
research says related to the preparation of special education 
professionals around this topic.

To better understand the preparation of special education 
professionals on providing trauma-informed supports in 
school settings, it is important to not only consider their 
knowledge about trauma-informed care but also understand 
their beliefs. The intended focus of this literature review 
was to understand the preparation specifically of special 
education providers; however, due to a lack of research in 
this area, the search criteria were broadened to include all 
school employees, which is explained in more detail in the 
“Method” section. Therefore, the three focus areas of this 
literature review included (a) reported and assessed knowl-
edge base of school-based professionals on this topic, (b) 
attitudes and training beliefs of school-based professionals 
related to supporting children who have experienced abuse 
and neglect, and (c) access of training around trauma-
informed supports received through preservice or profes-
sional development opportunities. Furthermore, to 
understand the landscape of preparation for school staff 
over the last 40 years, from the call to action published by 
Exceptional Children in 1978 to present day, a longitudinal 
view of the research in this area was part of the focus of this 
literature review.

Method

Selection Criteria and Procedures

Using the framework identified by Littell, Corcoran, and 
Pillai (2008) for conducting systematic literature reviews, 
inclusion criteria were identified within the following areas: 
populations or samples, area of interest, and outcomes. 
Although the intended focus was to consider the preparation 
of special education teams around providing trauma-informed 

support, very few research studies included members of a 
special education team. Furthermore, if special education 
team members were included, it was within the larger school 
staff population. Our initial search yielded only one study in 
which special education teachers were the only participant 
group. We then extended the search to studies that included 
special education teachers as part of the participant group, 
which yielded only six studies. Therefore, the inclusion crite-
ria for articles were set to include any participant who was 
employed within a school that served children aged 3 to 21 
years. This could include, but was not limited to, general edu-
cation teachers, special education teachers, administrators, 
speech and language pathologists, nurses, school social 
workers, occupational therapists, physical therapist, school 
psychologists, transportation specialists, or office staff. Due 
to the inclusionary requirement of being employed by a 
school, this excluded early intervention providers, and volun-
teers, such as school mentors.

Second, the area of interest was limited to a focus on the 
perceptions of participants related to preparation around 
trauma-informed support; therefore, studies that described 
specific interventions for children who had experienced 
trauma and mandated reporting (e.g., determination, report-
ing) were not included. It should be noted that most of the 
studies included preparation related to mandated reporting 
in some form, but articles were only included if they also 
contained data related to supporting children who had expe-
rienced abuse or neglect.

Third, although there is overlap between children who 
have been identified as at risk of school failure and children 
who have experienced abuse and neglect, the focus of this 
review was specifically on preparation for working with 
children who have experienced abuse or neglect. As defined 
by the National Center for Injury Prevention and Control 
(2008), child abuse or neglect includes physical, emotional, 
or sexual maltreatment of children; therefore, only articles 
with this focus were included in the review.

Fourth, due to the sparse research in this area, both pre-
service preparation and in-service professional develop-
ment opportunities were included in this review. Fifth, 
specific outcome criteria were not set, which was inten-
tional, because the purpose of this literature review was to 
gain a deeper understanding of the preparation of school 
staff around the topic of maltreatment, which included out-
comes related to perceptions, experiences, or preparation. 
Sixth, due to different practices across countries, studies 
were only included if they took place in the United States, 
and were reported in English. Finally, preparation of school 
staff is an ever-changing process; therefore, research stud-
ies were included regardless of the year they were con-
ducted. However, only primary-source empirical studies 
were included. The staggering numbers of child abuse and 
neglect cases combined with a lack of preparation of school 
staff are an ongoing issue, including all available research 
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helped create a more holistic picture of the overall prepara-
tion of school staff related to providing trauma-informed 
support.

Search Strategies

To identify relevant articles, the following search terms 
were used: trauma, maltreatment, teacher preparation, 
school service personnel preparation, trauma-informed sup-
ports, school preparation, school staff, professional prepa-
ration, abuse, and neglect, or a combination of the 
aforementioned words. The following electronic databases 
were searched—EBSCOhost, PsycINFO, PubMed, and 
Google Scholar—and when articles met the inclusionary 
criteria, the reference lists of these articles were searched 
and articles that cited the identified article were considered. 
This search yielded 42 articles. After screening the titles 
and abstracts of these articles, we found 12 articles that had 
a focus on specific interventions or mandated reporting, and 
10 articles that had a focus on children who were consid-
ered at risk.

After conducting a full-text review on the remaining 
articles, the search methods and criteria described yielded a 
total of 20 empirical studies, three of which were unpub-
lished dissertation studies, and the remaining 17 were pub-
lished in peer-reviewed journals. It should be noted that the 
dissertation studies, although not peer reviewed, were 
empirical in nature, closely connected to the inclusionary 
criteria, and were current. For these reasons, it was decided 
to include these three studies, but this is noted as a limita-
tion of the literature review.

Results

The 20 identified studies were published between 1978 and 
2015. Across all studies, multiple roles of participants were 
represented, including general education teachers, special 
education teachers, school psychologists, administrators, 
teaching assistants, school nurses, counselors, and preser-
vice teachers. Although participants represented profession-
als who worked at the preschool through high school level, 
most of the studies included participants who worked at 
elementary schools, middle schools, or high schools (n = 
12). Also represented were studies that included only par-
ticipants who worked in elementary schools (n = 4); pre-
school, elementary, middle school, or high school (n = 2); 
preschool or elementary school (n = 1); and preschool only 
(n = 1). The results are organized into four areas of focus: 
(a) reported and assessed knowledge base of school-based 
professionals related to abuse and neglect, (b) attitudes and 
beliefs of school-based professionals related to this topic, 
(c) access to training around trauma-informed supports 
received through preservice or professional development 
opportunities, and (d) a longitudinal view of the reviewed 

studies. Please see Table 1 for further information related to 
each study, and to reference specific studies from the results 
below.

Reported and Assessed Knowledge Base

Of the 20 studies reviewed, a questionnaire or survey design 
was used for at least a portion of their study. Ninety percent 
of the studies (n = 18) used questionnaires as their primary 
source of data collection. Only 20% (n = 4) of research 
teams conducted intervention studies where they facilitated 
workshops and assessed knowledge before and after the 
workshop (Anderson et al., 2015; Hazzard, 1984; Kleemeier, 
Webb, Hazzard, & Pohl, 1988; Randolph & Gold, 1994). 
The researchers in the remaining studies investigated par-
ticipants’ beliefs, training opportunities, and understanding 
of abuse and neglect. Of the four intervention studies, three 
used questionnaires to assess knowledge before and after 
the workshops (Hazzard, 1984; Kleemeier et  al., 1988; 
Randolph & Gold, 1994).

Anderson and colleagues (2015) completed a needs 
assessment with participants related to training needs 
through open dialogue, similar to a larger focus group. The 
findings from this needs assessment were used to create 
four workshops. At the completion of the workshops, the 
research team conducted focus groups with the participants 
and utilized a survey to examine staff perceptions related to 
the workshops (Anderson et al., 2015). Finally, in a disser-
tation study conducted by Costello (2009), a survey was 
used as the main data collection tool, but the author also 
conducted two interviews with participants who were 
recruited from the survey portion of the study.

Sixty-five percent (n = 13) of studies reviewed included 
teachers or preservice teachers as the participants. Less than 
half of the studies (40%, n = 8) reported the participant’s 
role or involvement with special education service delivery. 
Moreover, only 20% (n = 4) of research groups (Costello, 
2009; Orelove, Hollahan, & Myles, 2000; Oseroff et  al., 
1999; San Julian, 2013) considered abuse and neglect as it 
directly related to the special education process or the rela-
tion between maltreatment and disability.

Questionnaires.  As noted, most of the identified studies 
(90%, n = 18) included a questionnaire or survey as their 
main method to assess knowledge and perceptions. Further-
more, of the research teams that used a questionnaire to 
assess knowledge, all had a primary focus of assessing 
knowledge related to mandated reporting. Thus, assessing 
knowledge related to supporting children who had experi-
enced abuse or neglect was a much smaller portion of the 
data collection if it was measured at all.

Fifty-five percent (n = 11) of the studies that utilized a 
questionnaire included teachers only, whereas seven included 
other school staff as well. Furthermore, 20% (n = 4) of 
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research teams used the Early Childhood Educators Child 
Abuse Questionnaire or a slightly modified version of this tool, 
which examines educators’ knowledge related to child mal-
treatment (Costello, 2009; Dinehart & Kenny, 2015; Kenny, 
2004; San Julian, 2013). The remaining research teams used 
independent researcher-developed questionnaires.

Intervention studies.  Four different research teams imple-
mented a workshop or training, and assessed changes in 
participants’ knowledge before and after the workshop 
(Anderson et  al., 2015; Hazzard, 1984; Kleemeier et  al., 
1988; Randolph & Gold, 1994). The training and work-
shops varied in length, from less than 6 hr to four full-day 
workshops (Anderson et  al., 2015; Hazzard, 1984; Klee-
meier et al., 1988; Randolph & Gold, 1994). Seventy-five 
percent (n = 3) of the intervention studies included a pre- 
and postsurvey or questionnaire as the means for measur-
ing growth before and after the training or workshop 
(Hazzard, 1984; Kleemeier et al., 1988; Randolph & Gold, 
1994), whereas one research team conducted a prework-
shop needs assessment and a postworkshop survey to 
assess perceptions after the workshops (Anderson et  al., 
2015). Half of intervention studies (n = 2) included teach-
ers only as the participants (Hazzard, 1984; Randolph & 
Gold, 1994), whereas the other intervention studies 
included additional school staff as well, such as teaching 
assistants or library assistants (Anderson et al., 2015; Klee-
meier et al., 1988).

Attitudes and Beliefs

This section aims to understand professionals’ perceptions 
related to preparation or lack of preparation they have 
received, which included school staff’s perceptions of train-
ing and preparation as it relates to children who have experi-
enced abuse and neglect. In almost half of the studies 
reviewed related to school staff’s perceptions (n = 8), 
researchers investigated how school staff felt related to their 
preparation in supporting children who have experienced 
abuse or neglect (Abrahams et  al., 1992; Anderson et  al., 
2015; Baxter & Beer, 1990; Bradshaw-Sears, 2015; Costello, 
2009; Kenny, 2004; McIntyre, 1987; San Julian, 2013). 
Findings from these eight studies suggested that school staff 
do not feel adequately prepared to support children who 
have experienced maltreatment. Of the participants who 
received training related to abuse and neglect, most believed 
the training they received was insufficient and did not pre-
pare them to support children who have been abused or 
neglected (Abrahams et  al., 1992; Anderson et  al., 2015; 
Baxter & Beer, 1990; Bradshaw-Sears, 2015; Costello, 
2009; Kenny, 2004). For example, in a large nationwide sur-
vey funded by the National Study on the Incidence of Child 
Abuse and Neglect, only a third of all participants believed 
the training they received was sufficient in terms of both the 

quality and quantity (Abrahams et al., 1992). Interestingly, 
Romano (1990) found that school administrators were more 
likely to be satisfied with the training they received related 
to abuse and neglect compared with other school staff.

In addition, researchers concluded that school staff 
believed the training they received related to supporting 
children who have experienced abuse and neglect was of 
poor quality (Abrahams et al., 1992; Costello, 2009; Kenny, 
2004), often too brief in nature (Abrahams et al., 1992), and 
was not a priority (Abrahams et al., 1992; Costello, 2009). 
Abrahams and colleagues (1992) illustrated this idea 
through a quote from a teacher participant, “I have been 
teaching for 10 years and during that time I have had only 
one meeting about child abuse and neglect” (p. 235). 
Furthermore, school staff believed providing trauma-
informed support is necessary (Abrahams et  al.,1992; 
Anderson et  al., 2015; Costello, 2009; McIntyre, 1987; 
Riggs & Evans, 1978; Romano, 1990), but reported some 
barriers including (a) lack of appropriate qualifications to 
implement trauma-informed supports (Abrahams et  al., 
1992; Baxter & Beer, 1990; Riggs & Evans, 1978), (b) time 
constraints (Abrahams et  al., 1992), (c) comfort with the 
topic (Abrahams et al., 1992; Costello, 2009), and (d) a lack 
of understanding related to district policy (Baxter & Beer, 
1990). Of the individuals who expressed more confidence 
related to this topic, their confidence was with regard to rec-
ognizing abuse or neglect and understanding when to report 
these cases, and not necessarily related to supporting this 
population of children (Bradshaw-Sears, 2015; Dinehart & 
Kenny, 2004; Yanowitz, Monte, & Tribble, 2003).

Access to Training

Due to the focus of this literature review, all the reviewed 
studies included findings related to preparation, which 
included both preservice preparation and in-service profes-
sional development. Access to training was divided into two 
different areas: (a) assessment of knowledge, which per-
tained to the knowledge of school staff related to supporting 
children who have experienced abuse and neglect, and (b) 
access to training opportunities, which included available 
preservice preparation experiences and in-service profes-
sional development experiences.

Assessment of knowledge.  The findings for this area included 
the knowledge (e.g., competency or confidence) of school 
staff related to supporting children who have experienced 
abuse and neglect. Of the six research teams that considered 
professionals’ confidence in supporting children who have 
experienced abuse or neglect, all found a positive correla-
tion between the amount of training and participant reported 
confidence levels (Anderson et al., 2015; Bradshaw-Sears, 
2015; Hazzard, 1984; Hazzard & Rupp, 1986; McIntyre, 
1987; Reyome & Gaeddert, 1998). In addition, researchers 
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suggested that training in this area improved school staff’s 
ability to recognize abuse, collaborate with other profes-
sionals regarding children who have experienced abuse and 
neglect, and appropriately support this population of chil-
dren (Anderson et al., 2015; Hazzard & Rupp, 1986; Klee-
meier et  al., 1988; McIntyre, 1987; Randolph & Gold, 
1994). For example, Kleemeier and colleagues (1988) com-
pared elementary school teachers who received a 6-hr train-
ing on sexual abuse with a control group of elementary 
school teachers with similar demographics. The teachers 
who received the training could identify content related to 
sexual abuse and were more able to correctly apply this 
content to hypothetical situations.

Although researchers suggested that some school staff 
understood the negative impact of abuse and neglect 
(Martin, Cromer, & Freyd, 2010; Yanowitz et  al., 2003), 
most school staff were unaware of the signs of maltreatment 
(Hazzard & Rupp, 1986; Kenny, 2004; McIntyre, 1987; 
Reyome & Gaeddert, 1998) and had limited understanding 
related to the connection between abuse and disability 
(Orelove et al., 2000; Riggs & Evans, 1978). Furthermore, 
Hazzard and Rupp (1986) found that teachers are less pre-
pared than pediatricians and mental health workers to sup-
port children who have experienced abuse and neglect.

Access to training opportunities.  In this section, results are 
presented related to the availability of preparation opportu-
nities around supporting children who have experienced 
abuse or neglect. In 75% (n = 15) of the reviewed studies, 
researchers examined prior training or preparation of school 
staff around the topic of abuse and neglect. The primary 
focus of preparation or training in all 15 studies was related 
to identifying abuse with the goal of reporting or general 
training around mandated reporting. However, responding 
to the needs and supporting a child who has experienced 
abuse or neglect were identified as the priority for training 
by school staff (Anderson et al., 2015; Orelove et al., 2000).

Despite school staff expressing an interest in additional 
professional development around supporting children who 
have been abused or neglected (Anderson et  al., 2015; 
Orelove et al., 2000; Oseroff et al., 1999), training was gen-
erally only provided once a year and was often delivered by 
a school social worker, counselor, or nurse who worked in 
the building (Abrahams et  al., 1992). Furthermore, some 
researchers found that less than 25% of school staff have 
received training in this area (Baxter & Beer, 1990; Hazzard, 
1984), and of the staff who have received training, most had 
received less than three total hours of training (Hazzard, 
1984; McIntyre, 1987). For example, in a study conducted 
by Costello (2009) a participant noted, “there is always a 
little side note” related to education around children who 
have been abused or neglected, which further illustrates the 
lack of priority this topic is given related to training staff. 
Furthermore, researchers found that if school staff do 

receive training around supporting children who have expe-
rienced abuse or neglect, more access this training through 
professional development opportunities once they are 
working in the field, rather than during their preservice 
preparation programs (McIntyre, 1987). Even so, these 
trainings are minimally offered and are rarely supplemented 
with written resources. In addition, these limited opportuni-
ties still have a primary focus on mandated reporting rather 
than supporting children (Abrahams et al., 1992).

Some training programs (Hazzard & Rupp, 1986; 
Randolph & Gold, 1994) have demonstrated an increase in 
knowledge related to supporting children who have experi-
enced abuse and neglect, but without follow-up, much of 
the growth in this area is lost. School staff reported a need 
for additional professional support following training 
opportunities (Anderson et al., 2015). They noted that their 
main preparation opportunities have been through informal 
opportunities, such as consultation with colleagues or on-
the-job experiences (Bradshaw-Sears, 2015). Although 
these experiences are inconsistent and more reactive, 
researchers suggested that appropriate supervision for 
school staff related to supporting children who have experi-
enced abuse or neglect may be useful (Bradshaw-Sears, 
2015).

Not surprisingly, school staff reported training on sup-
porting families who had dealt with abuse and neglect-
related issues as the least provided form of training 
(Abrahams et al., 1992). It is also not surprising that school 
staff have significantly greater negative emotions toward 
parents who have abused or neglected their child (Costello, 
2009; Hazzard, 1984; Hazzard & Rupp, 1986). Consistent 
themes were found in a study conducted by Hazzard (1984), 
where she noted that teachers were more likely to have neg-
ative reactions to family members who had been indicated 
or found guilty of committing abuse or neglect. Interestingly, 
after the teachers attended a 6-hr workshop on supporting 
children and families who had dealt with abuse and neglect-
related issues, teachers had less negative reactions to these 
same families (Hazzard, 1984). Findings also suggested 
that school staff may believe that supporting children who 
have been abused or neglected may not be as necessary if 
they teach in more affluent or more rural communities 
(Costello, 2009).

Preservice preparation.  All the preparation opportunities 
identified in the reviewed studies had a direct focus on man-
dated reporting. Three studies that focused on preservice 
preparation found that most preparation programs delivered 
information in a variety of different ways (e.g., practicum, 
lecture), and with minimal consistency or intention (Brad-
shaw-Sears, 2015; Costello, 2009; San Julian, 2013). Sadly, 
one preservice teacher who was interviewed on how she 
acquired knowledge related to supporting children who 
have been abused or neglected, reported that some of her 
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gained knowledge was through media, such as the movie 
Kindergarten Cop or the book One Child (Costello, 2009). 
Researchers found that the lack of intentionality contributed 
to gaps within preservice preparation programs related to 
this topic (Bradshaw-Sears, 2015; Costello, 2009; San 
Julian, 2013).

In-service training.  Consistent with preservice preparation, 
researchers found that school staff have limited professional 
development opportunities related to supporting children 
who have experienced abuse or neglect (Baxter & Beer, 
1990; Bradshaw-Sears, 2015; Orelove et  al., 2000). In a 
study conducted by Baxter and Beer (1990), professional 
development opportunities related to this topic were identi-
fied as a significant need. More specifically, in a study con-
ducted by San Julian (2013), most of the teachers surveyed 
noted they wanted more speakers and seminars compared 
with more instruction through lectures during college 
coursework. This is consistent with the findings from a 
study conducted by Oseroff and colleagues (1999), where 
participants reported a desire for more in-service training.

Longitudinal View of Themes

As noted previously, questionnaires have been the main tool 
for data collection related to this topic. Variations of the 
Early Childhood Educators Child Abuse Questionnaire 
have been the most utilized tool (Costello, 2009; Dinehart 
& Kenny, 2015; Kenny, 2004; San Julian, 2013). Although 
findings have suggested that not much change has occurred 
across the years related to supporting children who have 
been abused or neglected, there does appear to be some 
progress in identification and mandated reporting obliga-
tions by school staff. More studies were conducted before 
2000 (Hazzard, 1984; Kleemeier et al., 1988; Randolph & 
Gold, 1994) that examined posttraining outcomes, com-
pared with after 2000 (Anderson et al., 2015), but findings 
are consistent across all studies, which indicated that train-
ing does improve how well school staff understand how to 
support children who have experienced abuse or neglect.

By including a longitudinal look at all the studies con-
ducted in this area, it is clear that there has been a limited 
amount of growth related to supporting children who have 
experienced abuse or neglect. For example, three research 
studies conducted before 2000 (Abrahams et  al., 1992; 
Baxter & Beer, 1990; Hazzard, 1984) and two after 2000 
(Kenny, 2004; Orelove et al., 2000) found that school poli-
cies serve as a barrier, but there are no studies to date that 
look at addressing this issue. Furthermore, almost an equal 
number of studies before 2000 (Abrahams et  al., 1992; 
Baxter & Beer, 1990; Hazzard & Rupp, 1986; McIntyre, 
1987; Oseroff et  al., 1999; Reyome & Gaeddert, 1998; 
Riggs & Evans, 1978) and after 2000 (Anderson et  al., 
2015; Bradshaw-Sears, 2015; Costello, 2009; Kenny, 2004; 

Martin et al., 2010; Orelove et al., 2000; San Julian, 2013; 
Yanowitz et al., 2003) indicated that school staff lack prepa-
ration and training to support children who have experi-
enced abuse or neglect. Consequently, over the course of 
almost 40 years, researchers continue to come to the same 
conclusions, yet a limited number of studies have been con-
ducted that consider how best to prepare school staff. 
Therefore, without this intentional research, it is not sur-
prising that studies conducted across the last five decades 
continue to reveal that school staff feel unprepared to work 
with children who have experienced abuse or neglect 
(Abrahams et  al., 1992; Anderson et  al., 2015; Baxter & 
Beer, 1990; Bradshaw-Sears, 2015; Costello, 2009; Hazzard 
& Rupp, 1986; Kenny, 2004; McIntyre, 1987; Reyome & 
Gaeddert, 1998; Riggs & Evans, 1978).

Discussion

With the staggering numbers of children experiencing abuse 
and neglect (Chu & Lieberman, 2010), there continues to be 
a need to educate school staff to support the unique needs of 
this population. With almost half of the children who have 
been abused or neglected also qualifying to receive special 
education services (Zetlin, 2006), sufficient training for 
special education teams is imperative. Although the 20 
reviewed studies had components related to how well pre-
pared school staff were to support children who have expe-
rienced abuse or neglect, the primary focus of the studies 
was on how well prepared school staff were to identify and 
report abuse and neglect. The findings from this literature 
review are clear: (a) school staff are not prepared to support 
children who have experienced abuse or neglect; (b) preser-
vice and in-service professional development opportunities 
related to supporting children who have experienced abuse 
and neglect are lacking; (c) although training has the poten-
tial to improve outcomes for children who have experienced 
abuse and neglect, the quality of training is insufficient; and 
(d) surveys and questionnaires have been heavily relied on 
when conducting research in this area.

By considering the preparation of school staff related to 
supporting children who have experienced abuse and 
neglect, many implications for future research and practice 
became clear. Across the last 40 years, researchers have 
called for more work in this area, specifically related to sup-
porting children who have experienced abuse and neglect. 
For example, in 1978, Exceptional Children published an 
article outlying clear expectations for professionals related 
to supporting children who have experienced abuse and 
neglect (McCaffrey & Tewey, 1978). Although this article 
offered practice and research implications, 24 years later, 
Oseroff and colleagues (1999) referenced this article and 
pointed out that the field has not made much progress in this 
area. Unfortunately, 19 years after Oseroff and colleagues’ 
call for action, the gap still remains.
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In 2014, the NEA issued a policy recommendation that 
school staff become appropriately trained in supporting 
children who have experienced abuse or neglect. A similar 
statement was issued by the DEC in 2016. With the recent 
release of the position statement on the Prevention of and 
Response to Maltreatment by the CEC (2018), the field of 
special education must focus attention on how prepared 
special education professionals are to carry out this work.

Implications for Practice

Through the position statements issued by DEC and CEC, 
we have made a commitment to supporting children with 
special needs who have experienced abuse and neglect 
(CEC, 2018; DEC, 2016). These position statements offer a 
starting place for what quality care and instruction looks 
like for this population of children. In addition, through the 
position statements, there is a clear message that special 
education providers are responsible for providing appropri-
ate supports to children who have experienced abuse and 
neglect. However, based on the literature, we know profes-
sionals do not feel prepared, and preparation in this area is 
not seen as a priority. For professionals to carry out recom-
mendations outlined in the position statements, (a) we must 
ensure organizations that provide services to individuals 
with disabilities consider abuse and neglect when develop-
ing policies related to the provision of services; (b) we must 
prioritize the preparation of professionals related to sup-
porting children who have experienced abuse and neglect, 
which must include preservice preparation and ongoing in-
service professional development opportunities; and finally, 
(c) special educators must be seen as a priority group when 
working with this group of children, rather than the respon-
sibility falling on a different group of professionals.

Implications for Research

Considering the significant number of children who have 
experienced abuse and neglect and receive special educa-
tion services, coupled with the recommendations from the 
NEA, DEC, and CEC, the special education field has an 
obligation to appropriately support these children. 
Furthermore, there is a disparity in the high number of chil-
dren who are affected by abuse and neglect, and a lack of 
focus on research in this area. To more appropriately sup-
port children who have experienced abuse and neglect, 
research must be conducted (a) with a primary focus on 
supporting children beyond identifying and reporting mal-
treatment, (b) that directly targets the special education 
process and staff rather than considering special education 
as an afterthought, and (c) that diversifies research meth-
ods to develop a deeper understanding of the issues. Finally, 
within the existing literature, findings suggested that 
school staff are unprepared, and preparation and training 

are insufficient, so we must understand the facilitators and 
barriers to appropriately supporting children who have 
experienced abuse and neglect, and receive special educa-
tion services to design meaningful and appropriate profes-
sional development opportunities.

Limitations

This literature review does present some limitations, such 
as the fact that most of the studies had a focus on mandated 
reporting, and there was a heavy reliance on questionnaires. 
Furthermore, half of the articles included in this review 
were conducted prior to 2000, which may be considered 
outdated. However, it was necessary to include all the stud-
ies related to this topic to create a more holistic depiction of 
the current state of preparation of personnel related to sup-
porting children who have experienced abuse and neglect. 
Notably, although the articles included in this review span 
40 years, the findings were consistent. In addition, due to 
the lack of available research in this area, dissertation stud-
ies were included for review. Although, not peer reviewed, 
all three dissertation studies were original research, and 
were closely aligned with the guiding questions for this lit-
erature review. Furthermore, by including these studies, we 
were able to achieve a more comprehensive representation 
of the research that has been conducted in this area.

Conclusion

Children are experiencing abuse and neglect at staggering 
rates, and many of these children will receive special edu-
cation services. Fortunately, the field of special education 
has taken action through multiple position statements 
which highlights the importance of appropriately support-
ing this vulnerable group of children. However, special 
education professionals are not fully prepared to support 
children who have experienced abuse and neglect. As we 
move forward, we must prioritize work in this area spe-
cifically for special education providers. Although chil-
dren who have experienced abuse and neglect are 
overrepresented related to the provision of special educa-
tion services, preparation in this area has not been a prior-
ity for special education providers, and researchers in this 
area have not prioritized special education providers as 
participants in research studies. The field of special educa-
tion has highlighted the need to consider children who 
have experienced abuse and neglect, which is a promising 
step in the right direction; the next step is to prepare pro-
fessionals to carry out this important work.
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