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Abstract 

This study was intended to reveal pre-service music teachers’ perceptions of the concept of a “music teaching 
program” with the use of metaphors. Its sample included 130 pre-service music teachers in the Music Teaching 
Program of Fine Arts Teaching Department in Balıkesir University’s Education Faculty. The study data were 
collected by having the participants complete the sentences: “The music teaching program is like... because...” 
and “The music teaching program is similar to... because....”. The study’s qualitative data were collected using a 
survey form with open-ended questions. Subsequently, the data were interpreted using content analysis. The 
pre-service music teachers produced 30 metaphors. These metaphors were classified into six conceptual groups 
based on their shared aspects. The study concluded that pre-service music teachers explained the concept of a 
“music teaching program” using a variety of metaphors. 

Keywords: metaphors for the concept of a music teaching program, music teaching programs, pre-service music 
teachers 

1. Introduction 

We are living in an age of information, watching rapid developments in science and technology. Thus, there is a 
growing need for people who do research, question and criticize things, are capable of thinking creatively, 
produce knowledge and use superior thinking skills such as analysis and synthesis. This creates the need for 
continuous personal development for all people. Education has become even more important in such an 
environment, and it is compulsory for education institutions to review their functions. Teacher training programs 
have an obvious effect on the training of teachers that will meet the necessities of their occupation professionally. 
In this regard, the renovation of education institutions with a structuring based on social needs and expectations 
is important in this continually developing and changing world (Ünal & İlter, 2010). 

There were new configurations in teacher training in Turkey in the year 1998, and this was an important 
beginning of development. In 2006, music teacher programs were revised along with all the other undergraduate 
teaching programs in education faculties (Akman & Taşkın, 2010). The improvement of undergraduate teaching 
programs is necessary for teaching pre-service music teachers the knowledge and skills required in their study 
area and make them better qualified individuals since the quality of education is directly linked to the quality of 
teachers. Hence, all components of the teachers training system should be improved in order to train a sufficient 
number of teachers with the qualities required by current and future conditions (Azar, 2011). Quality education 
provided to pre-service teachers will have a major influence on their professional lives. It is certain that quality 
education is important in training better teachers. Researchers should be informed about pre-service teachers’ 
feelings, perceptions, attitudes, thoughts and expectations. These are important factors that have a fundamental 
influence on teacher training. Studies of these factors have mainly used metaphors for their research (Noyes, 
2004; Thomas & Beauchamp, 2011). A relevant study indicated that the study of pre-service teachers’ 
perceptions, attitudes and beliefs was one of the main objectives of teacher training studies, and the results of 
these studies were important since they contribute to the professional development of pre-service teachers by 
shaping occupational practices (Noyes, 2004).  

The use of metaphors reveals how individuals think and see the world when trying to understand it. Individuals 
employ metaphors when describing both their own thoughts and feelings and those of the others. Metaphors are 
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described as analogies, likenesses, resemblances or the expression of one entity as another (Sanchez, Barreiro, & 
Maojo, 2000). Metaphor is a tool for perception itself, and it includes the transfer of knowledge from a familiar 
field to an unfamiliar one. In other words, a metaphor is the symbolic transformation of a thing into a completely 
different thing (Anderson & Milbrandt, 2002). Longman (2015) suggested that metaphor is the description of a 
thing using its similarities with something else. In addition, metaphors are important in the concretization and 
visualization of abstract concepts when learning difficult concepts. About this point, Yob (2003) claims that 
metaphors are strong mental tools for understanding and explaining complex and abstract phenomena. Lakoff 
(2009) said that metaphors are helpful tools for revealing students’ cognitive perceptions of a concept and the 
affective aspects of their mental images. Thus, metaphors are personal images and strong education tools that 
can be used for reflection. They are mirrors that are good at helping us understand the world and what happens in 
it (Perry & Cooper, 2001). In this context, metaphor is one of the most important instruments in trying to 
comprehend partially things that we cannot comprehend as well as our feelings, aesthetic experiences, moral 
values and psychological structure (Lakoff & Johnson, 2005). 

Forceville (2002) stressed that three questions should be answered before accepting a thing as a metaphor: What 
is the subject of the metaphor, What is the source of the metaphor, and Which aspects are planned to be referred 
from the metaphor’s source to its subject? For instance, the sentence “A teacher is like a gardener” or “A 
teachers resembles a gardener” uses the image of the gardener to draw attention to the similarities of a teacher to 
a gardener. In these sentences, “teacher” is the subject of the metaphor, and gardener is its source. The aspect of 
the source of the metaphor that refer to its subject is that a gardener deals with the saplings being grown 
individually, and a teacher takes students’ individual differences into consideration (Saban, 2006). 

In the past few years, there has been an increase in the number of studies that are intended to determine how 
individuals perceive concepts related to their areas of study using the metaphoric perception technique. 
Metaphors are used in almost every moment of life in all areas, and they are included in education as well, which 
makes them a subject for educational research. In educational research, metaphors are frequently used as 
educational tools to reveal the traces of concepts in people’s minds with the use of different words and teach any 
subject (Botha, 2009). The use of metaphors in education makes it possible to learn new things and retain them 
in mind while improving individuals’ motivation, imagination and creativity (Hogler, Gross, Hartman, & 
Cunliffe, 2008; Vadeboncoeur & Torres, 2003). 

Metaphors are used to develop and plan educational programs, encourage students to learn and improve creative 
thinking. They can also be used for determining teachers’ and pre-service teachers’ occupational perceptions 
(Kösterelioğlu & Bayar, 2014). A review of the studies of metaphor revealed that there are many studies that 
have used metaphors to determine pre-service teachers’ perceptions of the concept of a teacher (Cerit, 2008; 
Gömleksiz, 2013; Günay, 2015; Kasoutas & Katerina, 2009; Saban, Koçbeker, & Saban, 2006; Zheng & Song, 
2010), their perceptions of the concept of a student (Guerrero & Villamil, 2002; Saban, 2009), the occupational 
perceptions of teachers and pre-service teachers (Martinez, Sauleda, & Huber, 2001; McEwan, 2007; Saban, 
2009), perceptions of the internet (Palmquist, 1996; Şahin & Baturay, 2013), perceptions of the concept of a 
principal (Ateş, 2016; Çobanoğlu & Gökalp, 2015; Zembat, Tençeli, & Akşin, 2015); perceptions of the concept 
of distance education (Özçınar & Tuncay, 2009) and perceptions of educational programs (Aykaç & Çelik, 2011; 
Gültekin, 2013). Studies of music have used metaphors to analyze music as a communication tool with the 
metaphorical language in musical pieces (Zangwill, 2014; Zbikowski, 2008), examined metaphor as an 
instructional tool in the creation and improvement of musical expression (Schippers, 2006; Woody, 2004) and 
determined perceptions of the concepts of music and music lessons (Umuzdaş S. & Umuzdaş M., 2013). 

To conclude, pre-service music teachers’ acceptance or rejection of the new knowledge they encounter during 
their education process plays an important role in research about teacher training. In this regard, metaphors can 
be used to reveal pre-service teachers’ expectations and perceptions (Cerit, 2008; Saban, 2004; Saban et al., 
2006). A review of the relevant literature showed that there are no studies of the metaphors that pre-service 
music teachers use for the concept of a music teaching program. For this reason, the aim of this study is to use 
metaphors to reveal pre-service music teachers’ perceptions of the concept of a music teaching program. Here 
are its research questions: 

 What are the metaphors that pre-service music teachers use for the concept of a music teaching 
program?  

 What categories can be created for the metaphors used by the pre-service teachers based on their 
shared aspects? 
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2. Materials and Methodology 

This study used “phenomenology”, a qualitative research design, with the purpose of determining pre-service 
music teachers’ perceptions of the concept of a “music teaching program” using metaphors. In the world we live 
in, we encounter phenomena in the forms of experience, perceptions, orientations, concepts and situations 
(McMillon, 2000). The aim of phenomenology is to reveal individuals’ experiences and perceptions related to a 
certain phenomenon as well as the meanings they attribute to them (Annells, 2006). Phenomenology is the study 
of how people make sense of their individual or collective experiences, how they perceive and transfer them to 
their minds, how they describe situations and the language they use to communicate them to other people 
(Merriam, 2013). Phenomenological design focuses on phenomena of which we are aware, but of which we do 
not have a deep and detailed understanding. For this reason, phenomenology is a suitable basis for studies that 
analyze phenomena that are not completely unfamiliar to us, but which we still cannot fully comprehend. In 
phenomenological studies, data analysis is intended to reveal experiences and meanings. Thus, content analysis 
attempts to conceptualize the data and create categories that can describe the phenomenon. The results are 
presented in a descriptive manner with frequent use of direct quotations. In addition, the study findings are 
explained and interpreted in the framework of the categories created by the study (Yıldırım & Şimşek, 2011). 

2.1 Study Sample 

The sample of this study included 130 pre-service music teachers from a university located in western Turkey. 
Of them, 79 (60.7%) were female, and 51 (39.3%) were male. 

2.2 Data Collection Tools 

The study data were collected in the 2017 spring semester using a survey form with open-ended questions. 
Before creating the data collection tool, the researcher analyzed studies that use metaphors to determine 
individual perceptions (Inbar, 1996; Linn, Sherman, & Gill, 2007; Pishghadam & Pourali, 2011; Saban, 2009). 
Although some of them utilized Likert-type scales, the majority asked their participants to complete open-ended 
sentences. Thus, the researcher initially held preliminary interviews with the participants to create the survey 
form and documented these conversations in writing. The pre-service music teachers were briefly informed 
about metaphors, their use and their purposes. They were also given examples of living and non-living things to 
choose as metaphors. Afterwards, the participants were asked to complete the sentences, “The music teaching 
program is like... because...” and “The music teaching program is similar to... because....”. This was intended to 
determine pre-service music teachers’ thoughts about the music teaching program and the reasons for them. The 
word “like” was used to have students build a connection between the source and subject of the metaphor, and 
the word “because” was used to have them produce a “justification” (or a “logical basis”) for the metaphors they 
created (Saban, 2009). The pre-service teachers’ responses were the main data source of this study. 

2.3 Data Analysis 

This study analyzed the data using survey and content analysis, both qualitative research methods. The 
application of the survey attempted to describe events (Karasar, 1995). This study attempted to determine the 
pre-service music teachers’ perceptions of the concept of a “music teaching program” with the use of metaphors. 
The analysis and interpretation of the metaphorical expressions written by pre-service teachers were conducted 
in the five-stage process described by Saban (2008): 

(1) naming, 

(2) organization (elimination and refinement), 

(3) category development, 

(4) establishing validity and reliability, 

(5) digitization of the data (Armstrong, Davis, & Paulson, 2011; Saban et al., 2006; Saban, 2008). 

1) Naming: In this stage, the participants’ metaphors were listed, giving a code to each metaphor as well (e.g., 
computer, grandmother, lighthouse, compass). Answer sheets that did not include any metaphors or metaphors 
with no justifications were excluded from the study. 

2) Organization (Elimination and Refinement): In this stage, the researcher used “metaphor analysis” techniques 
to divide each metaphor into its components and determine their similarities with the other metaphors (Moser, 
2000). Then, the metaphors were reread and reviewed individually, and each metaphor was analyzed considering 
its: a) subject, b) source and c) the relationship between subject and source. The researcher also created a 
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“sample metaphor list” for two main purposes: (a) using it as a reference for classifying metaphors in a certain 
category and (b) validating the data analysis and the interpretations of this study. 

3) Category Development: In this stage, the metaphors created by the pre-service teachers were analyzed for 
their shared aspects in relation to the concept of a “music teaching program”. The researcher created a metaphor 
list to see how each metaphor conceptualized the phenomenon of a “music teaching program”. Each metaphor 
produced by the pre-service teachers was correlated to a certain theme, which created six conceptual categories. 

4) Establishing Validity and Reliability: Validity and reliability are the two most important criteria for ensuring 
the credibility of study results: “Preparing a detailed report of the collected data and explaining how the study 
results were found are important criteria for validity in qualitative studies” (Yıldırım & Şimşek, 2011). When 
explaining the study results, the researcher provided direct quotations from pre-service teachers’ responses to the 
questions in survey form. To attribute the quotations, the participants were numbered from 1 to 130, and their 
genders were indicated with letters. For instance, (S:9F) means (student 9, female), and (S:11M) means (student 
11, male). 

The researcher also consulted expert opinion to ensure the reliability of the study. Two experts in this kind of 
research were given two lists. The first list showed samples of the metaphors that were produced by the 
pre-service teachers, and the second showed the names and characteristics of six conceptual categories for the 
music teaching program metaphors. The experts were asked to match the sample metaphors on the first list with 
the six conceptual categories on the second list, leaving none of the metaphors out. Afterwards, the researcher 
compared the experts’ matching to that of this study. The researcher determined the numbers of agreements and 
disagreements and calculated the reliability of the study using the formula by Miles and Huberman (1994) 
(reliability=agreement/agreement+disagreement). Qualitative studies are reliable at the desired level when the 
consistency between evaluations by experts and researchers is 90% or higher (Miles & Huberman, 1994). The 
reliability of this research was 96%. 

5) Uploading the data: The study data were digitized, and their frequencies (f) and percentages (%) were 
calculated. Then, they were prepared for interpretation by the researcher. 

3. Findings 

This section will present the findings related to the research questions. The findings will be presented in tables, 
and the conceptual categories that include metaphors by their shared aspects will be examined based on 
examples of the pre-service teachers’ responses. 

1) What are the metaphors that pre-service music teachers use for the concept of a “music teaching program”? 

Table 1 shows an alphabetical list of the metaphors that the pre-service music teachers created for the concept of 
a “music teaching program” in addition to the numbers and percentages of students who used each metaphor. 

 

Table 1. The metaphors that the pre-service music teachers created for the concept of a music teaching program, 
and the numbers and percentages of students who used each metaphor 

Sequence of 

the Metaphor 

Name of the 

Metaphor 

f % Sequence of the 

Metaphor 

Name of the Metaphor f % 

1 Root of a tree 5 3.84 16 Sculptor 7 5.38 

2 Brain 3 2.30 17 Light 2 1.53 

3 Computer 5 3.84 18 Human life 4 4.61 

4 Grandmother 6 4.61 19 Hair gel 5 3.84 

5 To raise a child 7 5.38 20 Guide 5 3.84 

6 Pottery 6 4.61 21 Puppet 4 4.61 

7 Ecological balance 3 2.30 22 Hourglass 6 4.61 
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8 Foundation of a house 3 2.30 23 Blue 1 0.76 

9 Factory 5 3.84 24 Navigator 7 5.38 

10 Lighthouse 6 4.61 25 Orchestra 5 3.84 

11 Night light 2 1.53 26 Compass 8 6.15 

12 Travel program 3 2.30 27 Clock 4 4.61 

13 Sun 2 1.53 28 Venous blood vessel  1 0.76 

14 Solar system 1 0.76 29 Cook book 6 4.61 

15 Dough 3 2.30 30 Trip 5 3.84 

    Total  130 100 

 

Table 1 shows that pre-service music teachers produced 30 metaphors for the concept of a “music teaching 
program”. The first eight metaphors are: raising a child (f=7), sculptor (f=7), navigator (f=7), grandmother (f=6), 
pottery (f=6), lighthouse (f=6), hourglass (f=6) and cook book (f=6). The pre-service teachers used nine living 
things and 21 non-living things as metaphors. 

2) What categories can be created for the metaphors used by the pre-service teachers considering their shared 
aspects? 

In this section, the metaphors created in the study will be classified into six categories which are guide, shaping, 
systematic whole, milestone, illuminating and process. The categories will be tabulated for interpretation. 

 

Table 2. The distribution of pre-service teachers’ metaphors in the “guide” category 

Metaphor f % 

Grandmother 6 4.61 

Lighthouse 6 4.61 

Guide 5 3.84 

Navigator 7 5.37 

Compass 8 6.67 

Cook book 6 4.61 

Total 38 29.2 

 

Table 2 shows the metaphors included in the “guide” category, and the numbers and percentages of the students 
who created each metaphor. The pre-service teachers created six metaphors in this category. Compass and 
navigator were the two most common metaphors. Considering the metaphors in this category, the music teaching 
program adapts to certain situations including acting as a guide and showing the way. Here are some unmodified 
quotations of the participants’ responses: 

“The music teaching program is like a grandmother. Grandmothers guide families to raise their children. The 
music teaching program similarly guides us for our prospective professional lives in achieving our goals” 
(S:36F). (The metaphor of grandmother) 

“The music teaching program resembles a lighthouse because the program helps us learn about how to teach the 
subjects in our prospective professional lives. The music teaching program will illuminate the pre-service music 
teachers about how to teach subjects in the future like a lighthouse shows us the way in the dark” (S:68M). (The 
metaphor of lighthouse) 
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“The music teaching program is like a guide because we would not know how to teach the subjects when we 
become professional teachers. Each teacher would teach lessons in a different way, which would cause 
disconnections. In this regard, the music teaching program will show the way to pre-service music teachers in the 
future professional lives” (S:15M). (The metaphor of guide) 

“The music teaching program resembles a navigator. A navigator determines the point that we want to reach and 
helps us follow the way to it. Thus, the music teaching program will help pre-service teachers achieve the goals 
they set for themselves” (S:93M). (The metaphor of navigator) 

“The music teaching program resembles a compass because this program shows pre-service music teachers the 
direction they should follow. Therefore, we are trained in accordance with the music teaching program” (S13M). 
(The metaphor of compass) 

“The music teaching program resembles a cook book because a cook book informs us about the amount and 
sequence of the ingredients that we should use when we cook. Thus, the music teaching program will guide us 
about the way and time that we should teach subjects in our future professional lives” (S:38F). (The metaphor of 
navigator) 

 

Table 3. The distribution of pre-service teachers’ metaphors in the “shaping” category 

Metaphor f % 

Pottery 6 4.60 

Dough 3 2.30 

Sculptor 7 5.37 

Hair gel 5 3.84 

Puppet 4 3.07 

Total 25 19.2 

 

Table 3 shows the metaphors included in the shaping category, and the numbers and percentages of the students 
who created each metaphor. The pre-service teachers created five metaphors in this category. Sculptor and 
pottery were the two most common metaphors. The metaphors in this category indicate that the music teaching 
program helps teachers shape their students, give a form to them, which means creating a direction for their 
future lives. For this reason, the study claims that the music teaching program is related to training pre-service 
teachers as qualified music teachers that will be beneficial to society. Here are some unmodified quotations of 
the participants’ responses: 

“The music teaching program resembles pottery because teachers shape the current music teaching program just 
like shaping pottery, and we can shape the knowledge we learned during this program with our own studies. 
Therefore, the better the potter is, the more useful the product will be” (S:16M). (The metaphor of pottery) 

“The music teaching program resembles dough. We can reflect our own thoughts and opinions on the dough. In 
my opinion, this is just what the music teaching program is because the goals of programs are determined 
beforehand, and the products are aimed to be created in accordance with these targets” (S:45F). (The metaphor 
of dough) 

“The music teaching program resembles a sculptor. The music teaching program helps shape students just like a 
sculptor shapes clay” (S:88M). (The metaphor of sculptor) 

“The music teaching program resembles hair gel. The music teaching program shapes the school it is applied to 
just like hair gel gives form to hair. Music instruction can be given any form with music teaching program just 
like hair gel can give any form to hair” (S:11F). (The metaphor of hair gel) 

“The music teaching program resembles a puppet because the holder of the puppet has the strings that can give 
any form to it. It is the holder who animates the puppet behind the curtain. We have the chance to make any 
change and give any shape to a puppet with a certain mold. Thus, the music teaching program can be shaped by 
certain additions and revisions” (S:23F). (The metaphor of puppet) 
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Table 4. The distribution of pre-service teachers’ metaphors in the “systematic whole” category 

Metaphor f % 

Ecological balance 3 2.3 

Factory 5 3.83 

Travel program 3 2.3 

Solar system 1 0.76 

Orchestra 5 3.83 

Clock 4 3.06 

Total 21 16.1 

 

Table 4 shows the metaphors included in the “systematic whole” category, and the numbers and percentages of 
the students who created each metaphor. The pre-service teachers created six metaphors in this category. Factory 
and orchestra are the two most common metaphors. Based on the metaphors included in this category, the study 
claims that the music teaching program is planned and purposive, and it is a whole together with all its 
components. Here are some unmodified quotations of the participants’ responses: 

“The music teaching program resembles the ecological balance because all the elements within ecological 
balance are correlated to each other. Everything included in the ecological balance support and complete each 
other just like the parts of a systematic whole, and I believe that the music teaching program is similar to this 
function” (S:66B). (The metaphor of ecological balance) 

“The music teaching program resembles a factory because the music teaching programs enables processing the 
pre-service teacher (input) for a certain period, and trans him or her as a qualified music teacher (output). The 
program might be resembled to a factory regarding these differences” (S:28M). (The metaphor of factory) 

“The music teaching program resembles a travel program. The program initially sets its goals. Then, it indicates 
the way and time to achieve these goals. This is very similar to the pre-determination of the routes in travel 
programs. They decide on their destinations, set the dates for these trips, and evaluate their acquisitions from 
them” (S:15F). (The metaphor of travel program) 

“The music teaching program resembles the solar system. There is a systematized organization of the planets. 
For this reason, even 1 centimeter of change in the position of the sun might lead to undesired events in the earth. 
From this perspective, I believe that the music teaching program resembles the sun. The better planned and 
systematized the program is, the better it will function” (S:101M). (The metaphor of solar system) 

“The music teaching program resembles a orchestra. The musicians in an orchestra make effort to play their 
instruments in a harmonious and systematized way. The music teaching program, just like an orchestra, can 
perform its functions when it is planned and programmed” (S:10F). (The metaphor of orchestra)  

“The music teaching program resembles a clock. Clocks work in the most regular manner. We learn our location 
within time when we look at a clock. We can plan the process of music education with the music teaching 
program as we are able to plan our time using the clock” (S:31M). (The metaphor of clock) 

 

Table 5. The distribution of pre-service teachers’ metaphors in the “milestone” category 

Metaphor f % 

Root of a tree 5 3.85 

Brain  3 2.31 

Computer 5 3.85 

Foundation of a house 3 2.31 

Venous blood vessel 1 0.77 

Total 17 13.1 
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Table 5 shows the metaphors included in the “milestone” category, and the numbers and percentages of the 
students who created each metaphor. The pre-service teachers created five metaphors in this category. The root 
of a tree and a computer were the two most common metaphors. The metaphors in this category stipulate that 
there are essential themes that form the foundation of the music teaching program. For this reason, the researcher 
suggests that the music teaching program helps music education make quality progress. Here are some 
unmodified quotations of the participants’ responses: 

“The music teaching program resembles the root of a tree. Trees need their roots for healthy fruit production. 
Similarly, the music teaching program plays a major role in determining our needs and providing quality music 
education” (S:44M). (The metaphor of the root of a tree) 

“The music teaching program resembles a brain. The brain is vital among all body organs that form the human 
body, and the music teaching program is similarly important for music instruction. Hence, I think the music 
teaching program resembles the brain because music teaching program is a vital part of the music instruction 
system” (S:9B). (The metaphor of brain) 

“The music teaching program resembles a computer. We can use the computer productively when we upload 
beneficial programs to it. I think the music teaching program will be able to train successful music teachers as 
long as students are provided with quality information from the beginning” (S:66F). (The metaphor of computer) 

“The music teaching program resembles the foundation of a house because we cannot build the structure if there 
is no foundation. In this regard, the music teaching program plays an important role in music instruction” 
(S:76B). (The metaphor of the foundation of a house) 

“The music teaching program resembles a venous blood vessel. The music teaching program is as important to 
pre-service music teachers as a venous blood vessel is important to humans because the music teaching program 
collects and disintegrates the knowledge to be learned. Afterwards, the knowledge that is beneficial to the 
individual is again included in the process” (S:53M) (The metaphor of venous blood vessel) 

 

Table 6. The distribution of pre-service teachers’ metaphors in the “illuminating” category 

Metaphor f % 

Night Light 2 1.53 

Sun 2 1.53 

Light 2 1.53 

Blue 1 0.76 

Total 7 5.38 

 

Table 6 shows the metaphors included in the “illuminating” category, and the numbers and percentages of the 
students who created each metaphor. The pre-service teachers created four metaphors in this category. Night 
light, sun and light were the most common metaphors in this category. In other words, the pre-service teachers 
regard the music teaching program as the sun and as light. Here are some unmodified quotations of the 
participants’ responses: 

“The music teaching program resembles night light. It is just like a night light that tries to illuminate those who 
are eager to learn by informing them (S:13M). (The metaphor of night light) 

“The music teaching program is like the sun. The sun warms and illuminates the earth, the music teaching 
program similarly warms and illuminates students by providing information to them and makes their future 
brighter” (S:111F). (The metaphor of sun) 

“The music teaching program gives a light to students through knowledge. They learn more and gain more 
knowledge as they proceed in the program, which is just like a sunset” (S:99M). (The metaphor of light) 

“The music teaching program resembles the color blue. It is deep just like the sea and provides endless 
information. The color blue can illuminate a dark environment, and the music teaching program similarly 
illuminates music students with information” (S:128M). (The metaphor of blue) 
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Table 7. The distribution of pre-service teachers’ metaphors in the “process” category 

Metaphor f % 

To raise a child 7 5.37 

Human life 4 3.07 

Hourglass 6 4.60 

Trip 5 3.84 

Total 22 16.9 

 

Table 7 shows the metaphors included in the “process” category, and the numbers and percentages of the 
students who created each metaphor. The pre-service teachers created four metaphors in this category. Raising a 
child and an hourglass were the most common metaphors in this category. This means that the pre-service 
teachers consider the music teaching program to be deep and believe that the knowledge they should learn in 
framework of the program is endless. In addition, the pre-service teachers stressed the importance of teaching 
musical knowledge in an orderly and timely manner without any hurry. Here are some unmodified quotations of 
the participants’ responses: 

“The music teaching program resembles raising a child. Families apply certain methods when raising their 
children. When their children display an undesired behavior, parents make up for their mistakes and try not to 
repeat them with their other children. Thus, current mistakes and deficiencies are observed in practice in music 
teaching program and eliminated later on” (S:78F). (The metaphor of raising a child)  

“The music teaching program resembles human life. After individuals are born, they acquire certain 
characteristics in certain development stages. They adapt themselves to their environment at the beginning, and 
then start to get some satisfaction with their occupations later on. Music teaching program will similarly affect 
the musical behaviors that pre-service music teachers should learn at the end of certain processes and stages” 
(S:130F). (The metaphor of human life) 

“The music teaching program resembles an hourglass. It determines what information to be taught in what year 
of the program. This way all the knowledge will be accumulated in the minds of pre-service teachers. We will be 
able to use this knowledge in our prospective professional lives” (S:126F). (The metaphor of hourglass) 

“The music teaching program resembles a trip. It is like an endless road. It will renew itself all the way as well as 
the students included in it and support their continuous development” (S:103M). (The metaphor of trip) 

4. Discussion, Conclusion and Recommendations 

This study aimed to reveal pre-service music teachers’ perceptions of the concept of “a music teaching program” 
using metaphors, and classify the metaphors they produced into conceptual categories. The metaphors were used 
to get information about pre-service music teachers’ perspectives to their occupation, and interpret a variety of 
concepts including education (Aubusson, 2002; Mcdermott, 2003). Schmitt (2005) suggested that metaphors are 
used to make a clear presentation of qualitative study results, and reduce the complexity of the qualitative data. 
Patton (1990) said that metaphor is a creative strategical function that helps analyze and interpret study results. 
The pre-service teachers explained in this study their thoughts, perceptions, attitudes, beliefs, and past 
experiences about the concept of a music teaching program using metaphors. 

This study tells us about pre-service teachers’ perceptions of the concept of “a music teaching program”. When 
explaining the concept of “a music teaching program”, the pre-service teachers produced different metaphors 
such as “ecological balance, hair gel, the color blue and a venous blood vessel” in addition to familiar concepts 
such as “the root of a tree, grandmother, sculptor, a guide and a compass”. This proves that the concept of “a 
music teaching program” cannot be explained with a familiar metaphor. A previous study stated that the 
metaphors are purposive, and participants’ ways of completing the sentence “Because...” are different from each 
other (Saban et al., 2006). Thus, the metaphors created by pre-service teachers for the concept of “a music 
teaching program” in this study show that its findings are consistent with the relevant educational research in the 
literature (Saban, 2008; Yob, 2003).  

The wide range of the metaphors created by the participants is a proof of their perspectives, creativity and the 
richness of their cognitive structures. The most common metaphor in the study was “compass”. Raising a child 
(f=7), sculptor (f=7), navigator (f=7), grandmother (f=6), pottery (f=6), lighthouse (f=6), hourglass (f=6), and 
cook book (f=6) were the next most frequently chosen metaphors. The study evaluated the metaphors produced 
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by the pre-service teachers and found that they expressed positive aspects of the music teaching program. It is 
very important that the pre-service teachers created positive and not negative metaphors, for their program of 
study. 

The metaphors “brain, computer, factory, lighthouse, travel program, sun and compass” were also created in a 
study by Özdemir (2012). In a study by Taşdemir and Taşdemir (2011), the teachers produced 307 metaphors for 
dimensions of the primary and middle school curricula. In this study, the metaphors “the root of a tree” and 
“computer” hat the participants created for music teaching program were consistent with those created in 
Taşdemir and Taşdemir’s (2011) study. A relevant study is also consistent with this study in terms of the 
metaphors “the foundation of a house” and “compass” that were created for the music teaching program 
(Semerci, 2007). The researcher believes that the results of this study are consistent with the relevant literature; 
however, this study collected the results in a variety of categories in a more comprehensive manner. In addition, 
this study revealed that the pre-service music teachers produce positive metaphors for the concept of a music 
teaching program. On the other hand, the educational studies conducted with in-service and pre-service teachers 
usually find that they create negative metaphors (Aykaç & Çetin, 2011; Taşdemir & Taşdemir, 2011). The 
results related to the negative metaphors that were created by participants are not consistent with the findings of 
this study. 

According to the results of this study, the illumination and process categories included fewer metaphors than the 
other categories. This result implies that the pre-service teachers adopted the metaphors in the other categories 
more than these ones. The study formed six categories based on the metaphors that the pre-service teachers 
created for the music teaching program. These categories are “guide, shaping, a systematic whole, milestone, 
illuminating and process”. A relevant study found the categories “guide, process and a mold that shapes 
individuals”, which are similar to some categories in this study (Özdemir, 2012). In addition, “guide” and “a 
systematic whole” included the most categories of all the categories created by this study. The findings of this 
study support those of relevant research (Nalçacı & Bektaş, 2012). 

The research findings imply that the pre-service teachers emphasize the directing aspect of the music teaching 
program in the guide category. The most common metaphor in this category was “compass”. This indicates the 
fact that the pre-service teachers perceived the music teaching program as a supporting guide that shows them 
the way. The findings of a relevant study support the findings of this study (Gültekin, 2011; Günay, 2015). 
Cook-Sather (2003) said that the stereotypical thoughts that shape the structure of education systems focus on 
the basic metaphor, which is usually the guide. Another study found that guide or director was the first metaphor 
that was created by the students from different study areas for the concept of “teaching program” (Satan, 2013). 
The results of this study are consistent with that finding. 

Another finding of this study is the shaping category. The metaphors created by the pre-service teachers in this 
category also prove that the music teaching program is shaped in accordance with pre-determined goals. Thus, 
the researcher believes that participants regarded the shaping category as a mold that shaped students with 
similar knowledge and skills. A previous study supports this finding (Gültekin, 2011; Yıldırım, Ünal, & Çelik, 
2011). Saban (2004) stated that the pre-service teachers saw the figure of teacher as a sculptor. This finding also 
supports this study. In the systematic whole category, which was another finding of the study, the pre-service 
teachers compared the music teaching program to a systematic structure that involved certain elements as well as 
correlated, planned and purposive components. In this category, the pre-service music teachers indicated that the 
music teaching program was a whole that affected, distributed and formed its own parts just like a factory or the 
ecological balance. These results are consistent with the other studies in the relevant literature (Gültekin, 2011; 
Schubert, 1986; Wahyudi, 2007). 

The metaphors created by the pre-service teachers for the milestone category revealed that they emphasized the 
essential and foundational quality of the music teaching program for music education. In this context, the 
researcher believes that the pre-service teachers were fully aware of the importance of music teaching process in 
the education and training process. This shows the need to train pre-service teachers in a way that teaches them 
all they need to know to become qualified music teachers. A relevant study supports this finding (Koç, 2014). 
Another finding of the study is the illumination category, which pictures the purpose of the music teaching 
program as illuminating pre-service teachers and lighting their way. The “illumination” category, which is one of 
the conceptual categories created by Gür (2012), is included in the headings that were determined by this study. 
Therefore, the results of this study are consistent with that finding. 

Another finding of the study indicated that the pre-service music teachers regarded music teaching program as a 
process. In this category, the pre-service teachers made an attempt to build a correlation between the concept of 
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process and the need to learn the required knowledge, skills and competencies in certain stages in a certain 
timeframe. A relevant study found that the knowledge, skills and competencies that pre-service teachers learned 
during their undergraduate education played a primary role in the development of their professional identities 
(Thomas & Beauchamp, 2011). This result is consistent with this study’s findings. 

To conclude, metaphor is a conceptual tool that pre-service teachers use to make sense of their thoughts, which 
helps determine their beliefs (Mahlios, Massengill-Show, & Bary, 2010). This study has revealed that the 
metaphors that pre-service teachers produced for the concept of a music teaching program are important tools to 
learn about their perceptions. It also found that the pre-service teachers mainly correlated the concept of a music 
teaching program with non-living things and explained it with positive metaphors, and they had positive 
perceptions of the concept. Beck (2001) claims that metaphors make it easier to understand the subjects that are 
not comprehended well and focused on the importance of being informed about pre-service teachers’ thoughts 
and perceptions of the concept of education program. The results of this study are consistent with that finding. 
For this reason, pre-service teachers should understand and internalize the concept of metaphor and be capable of 
using it in their professional lives. A quality music teaching program is important for music teachers who will 
educate future generations. Based on these results, the researcher suggests that: 

 Researchers should attempt to develop pre-service and in service teachers’ thoughts with the use of 
metaphors, and metaphors should be used as supporting tools in the instruction of abstract subjects. 

 Similar studies should be conducted with pre-service teachers in various study areas, and their 
opinions about undergraduate teaching programs should be compared using metaphors. 

 Alumni monitoring programs should be planned to revise teacher training programs based on their 
suggestions. 

 Comparative studies should be planned to determine the opinions of music teachers who have 
graduated from the same music teaching program. 

 Future studies should be conducted with larger samples and include in-service teachers as well, 
which will presumably make an important contribution to this area of study. 
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