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Abstract  The purpose of this study was to determine 
the relationship between the manager trust and interactional 
justice perceptions and organizational silence behaviors of 
those teachers who work in primary and secondary schools. 
The research is based on the survey model and the 
population consists of 4761 teachers who worked in 
Samsun, Turkey. The sample of the study was chosen from 
195 primary and secondary schools through a multi-stage 
sampling method. The study findings revealed that there 
exists a positive and highly significant relationship among 
teachers’ interactional justice and their manager trust; a 
negative and mid-level significant relationship between 
their manager trust and their interactional justice; and a 
negative and mid-level significant relationship between 
their interactional justice and their manager trust, 
respectively. To list in order of importance, interactional 
justice and manager trust variables were found to be 
predictor variables for silence behavior and to represent 
17% of change in the organizational silence behavior.  

Keywords  Interactional Justice, Manager Trust, 
Organizational Silence, Manager, Teacher 

1. Introduction
Organizations, as communities of power and actions, 

which are coordinated in a planned manner to achieve their 
goals that stemmed from their needs but are beyond their 
personal capabilities [1, 2], have to activate resources of 
manpower in an efficient way. They are composed of various 
communities who work on a collective and sharing basis to 
achieve their goals. Organizations, the strength of which 
originates in the human capital within its own structure, feed 
on social components such as love, respect, commitment, 
understanding and communication created by human 
relations in order to be successful. These components are 
vital factors that ensure the development, improvement and  

survival of an organization in its own environment [3]. For 
this reason, determination of the effect of the concepts of 
trust, justice and silence, which are within the scope of this 
research and are highly influenced by human relations, on 
educational organizations may be regarded as beneficial.  

The concept of trust, which has been a topic of discussion 
in many studies, has increasingly become a vital issue for 
those organizations which are in search of adapting to 
advancements and changes in technology [4, 5, 6, 7, 8]. 

Organizational trust, which is a prerequisite for 
communication and cooperation within an organization, may 
be regarded as highly significant for organizational trust and 
the efficiency of the organization [9, 10, 11, 12, 13]. A high 
level of trust would ensure the employees and managers 
within an organization to do their best to fulfill their 
responsibilities as soon as possible. In addition, it would 
ensure them to be more free in sharing their ideas and more 
active in cooperation for achieving the organizational goals. 
In overall terms, those who work in environments with high 
levels of trust feel more comfortable when communicating 
their feelings, their thoughts and the differences they observe; 
and thereby, they increase the organizational efficiency [14, 
15, 16]. 

Efficiency and effective educational organizations are 
only possible through acting in cooperation and harmony for 
common purposes. This is closely related with the level of 
trust in educational organizations in which human relations 
are on the foreground [17,18,20]. Hence, eliminating a 
school atmosphere, which is devoid of trust and justice and is 
capable of leading to silence, is of high significance.  

Justice perception, which may be regarded as an internal 
dimension of the research, is also influenced by 
organizational trust [22, 24, 28, 29, 30]. Several studies point 
out that teachers’ justice perception about school managers’ 
practices affect their level of organizational trust. For this 
reason, school managers are required to act fairly in order to 
improve organizational trust levels [23, 24].  

Organizational justice is considered to be the major source 
of cooperative behaviors based on common activities within 
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the organization. Organizational justice, which is examined 
as a social concept in scientific studies, is described as the 
employees’ positive perception about managers’ practices 
and decisions about the organization and the employees who 
work for it [31, 32]. Organizational justice is not only about 
the gains and the distribution of these gains; it also provides 
the basis for the rules and their implementation and the 
interaction between people within an organization [33]. A 
new brand called interactional justice was added to the 
concept of organizational justice, which was initially 
examined under two brands as distributive justice and 
procedural justice. These brands, which are not independent, 
are different in terms of their function [34].  

Interactional justice, which emerges as a result of 
managers’ treatment of their employees, focuses on 
interpersonal communication and behaviors during the 
implementation of procedures [35, 36]. The term 
‘interactional justice’ was first introduced by Bies and Moag 
[37]. The concept, which is based on the interpersonal 
communication within an organization and focuses on the 
communication between the manager and the employees, is 
accepted as the social dimension of organizational justice 
[38, 39]. Within this context, interactional justice requires 
managers to treat their employees with respect, to listen to 
them with devotion, to make adequate explanations about 
their decisions, to be tolerant during hard times and to exhibit 
a sensitive posture in the social sense [40, 41].The more 
managers become respectful and kind to every employee 
without prejudice and the more they show that all employees 
are valuable during their communication, the more they will 
be perceived as fair [39, 42]. The explanatory dimension of 
interactional justice is seen as an interpersonal value of 
procedural justice and it may create reactions against the 
outcomes of decisions. For this reason, it would not be 
wrong to say that interactional justice affects other 
dimensions and it is influenced by them [38, 39].  

It may be observed that more studies have been conducted 
on organizational justice and organizational trust [25, 26, 28] 
and on the relationship between organizational trust and 
organizational silence [44, 45, 46, 47] whereas a lesser 
number of studies deal with the relationship between 
organizational justice and organizational silence [48, 49]. 
This reveals the fact that there is a strong need to conduct 
more scientific studies on the reasons for organizational 
silence, which is influenced by the employees’ trust and 
justice perception, and on its influences on organizations.  

Silence, which is generally described as hard-to-define, 
hard-to-understand and hard-to-interpret by its very nature, 
as a concept, took its place as a term in management 
literature as being silent, as the absence of sound in an 
environment, quietness [50] and as not talking or exhibiting 
a kind of behavior that could be understood clearly [51,52]. 
Silence was first seen as the absence of talk or speech and it 
became one of the rare topics of discussion because 
examining the concept of silence was thought to be more 

difficult than examining the behaviors, which were exhibited 
openly, due to silence behavior’s multi-dimensional drives 
and hardness of examining its changing structure. 

The concept of organizational silence is also highly 
significant in educational organizations. In schools, which 
are established to achieve educational goals, creating a 
democratic and a sincere atmosphere in which teachers, who 
assume responsibilities feel comfortable and safe, 
contributes to the enhancement of performance levels. Those 
employees, who have a sense of belonging within their 
organization; who feel an internal commitment to it and 
accept themselves as a citizen of it, are observed to be in 
search of an improvement for their organization, to support it 
and to reflect their ideas more openly [53,54]. A decrease in 
the trust in and commitment to an organization leads to an 
interruption in the information flow within the organization 
and results in the silence of the employees [43,53,55,56]. In 
organizations where organizational silence dominates, 
employees do not make any intellectual contribution to the 
organization [57]; as a result, they have a negative effect on 
administrative information sharing, on the sense of 
responsibility for organizational problems, and on 
innovativeness and creativity within the organization 
[58,59,60]. This may be accepted as one of the significant 
indicators of the fact that organizational silence constitutes 
an obstacle for organizational change and development and 
it prevents the high levels of performance and synergy within 
the organization [61, 62, 63, 64, 65]. Within this context, 
managers are required to create working environments in 
which employees feel free to express their thoughts; an 
awareness of organizational learning is existent; and 
cooperative activities are on the foreground. Within this 
context, it would not be wrong to say that interactional 
justice would contribute to the evaluation of the influence of 
manager behavior types on subjects such as determination of 
the relationship between manager trust and organizational 
silence; silence, internal motivation, efficient performance 
and support of teachers for their organization through their 
thoughts, ideas and creativity.  

2. Purpose 
The purpose of this study is to determine whether there is a 

relationship among interactional justice, manager trust and 
organizational silence behaviors of those teachers who work 
for primary and secondary schools. To that end, the 
following questions guided this study:  
1. Is there a relationship among interactional justice, 

manager trust and organizational silence behaviors of 
those teachers who work for primary and secondary 
schools? 

2. Are interactional justice and manager trust behaviors of 
those teachers who work for primary and secondary 
schools significant predictor variables of organizational 
silence behavior?  
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3. Material and Methods 

3. 1. Research Model 

This research is designed to use a relational screening 
model. Screening model is an approach which covers big 
groups and aims to describe the thoughts, feelings, 
perceptions and attitudes of individuals in these groups about 
and towards several incidents and phenomena in their past 
and present conditions [66]. Through this approach, primary 
and secondary school teachers’ interactional justice and 
manager trust perceptions and their organizational silence 
behaviors were evaluated.  

3. 2. Sampling 

The universe of the study includes those teachers who 
work for primary and secondary schools in İlkadım, Canik, 
Atakum and Tekkeköy districts of Samsun during the 
academic year 2014-2015. A total number of 4761 teachers 
work for 123 primary and 72 secondary schools located in 
districts of Samsun, Turkey. The sample of the universe was 
determined through multi-stage sampling.  

During the first stage, the sample was divided into four 
strata (İlkadım, Canik, Tekkeköy and Atakum) at district 
level through stratified sampling method. Stratified sampling 
is a sampling method which is aimed at determining and 
representing sub-groups in the sample with their ratio in the 
universe [67]. A quarter (one fourth) of the total number of 
public primary and secondary schools in each district is in 
the research sample. 

During the second stage, simple random sampling model 
was used. In simple random sampling, it is accepted that 
there is an equal and independent level of possibility for all 
units to be chosen as a sample in the universe. Random 
sampling is thought to be the one which represents the 
universe best and the choice made through this method is 
regarded as the most valid and the best of all [67]. Sample 
size formula was used to determine the number of teachers to 
be used as sample within the universe. As a result of the 
calculations made to determine the sample size, a minimum 
number of 355 teachers were accepted as the required 
number. At the beginning of the study researchers aimed to 
reach more than 355 teachers; however, later in order to 
decrease the influence of difficulties as much as possible and 
to increase the validity of the sample. To that end, 730 
teachers who worked for 50 randomly selected schools 
within the sample were handed out surveys and 625 surveys 
were collected and evaluated. Among those teachers who 
took part in the survey, more than half of them (61,1%) were 
female; approximately half of them were between the ages of 
31 and 40 (46,7%), more than three-fourth of them (87,5%) 
were married; more than half of them (64,2%) were subject 
matter teachers; more than one-fourth of them (26,1%) had 
16-20 years of service as teachers; and more than half of 
them (63,0%) had 1-5 years of service in the schools they 
worked for, respectively.  

3.3. Data Collection Tools 

Data collection tools were divided into two sections. The 
first section included “Personal Information Form” which 
covered biographical and demographic variables concerning 
teachers (sex, marital status, age, seniority, years of service 
and district) and the second section included “Manager Trust 
Scale” (MTS), “Interactional Justice Scale” (IJS) and 
“Organizational Silence Scale” (OSS).  

3.3.1. Interactional Justice Scale 
“Interactional Justice Scale” (IJS), which was developed 

by Elma as a sub-dimension of organizational justice scale, 
was used to determine the organizational scale [68]. It 
included the following phrases; “My school manager 
considers my opinions when making a decision,” “My 
school manager listens to my opinions when making a 
decision,” “My school manager observes my rights as a 
teacher,” “I believe that my school manager does his/her best 
for me,” “My school manager explains the reasons behind 
his/her decisions,” “My school manager is kind to me,” and 
“My school manager trusts me”. Interactional Justice Scale 
(IJS), which was determined as a five-point Likert scale, 
included the following options; “Never” (1), “Rarely” (2), 
“Sometimes” (3), “Mostly” (4) and “Always” (5). The 
highest rate was determined as “Always” and the lowest one 
as “Never” [68]. Cronbach’s Alpha internal consistency 
coefficient of the scale which consisted of a total number of 
seven phrases was found to be .94 while factor loading 
values were found to vary from .41 to .76 in the consequence 
of factor analysis. These values show that the scale is reliable 
and is highly distinctive. In this study, which was conducted 
with 625 teachers who work for primary and secondary 
schools, the reliability coefficient was found as .94.  

3.3.2. Manager Trust Scale (MTS) 
“Manager Trust Scale” (MTS), which was developed by 

Yılmaz [20] and was derived from the Organizational Trust 
Scale with three dimensions called “Manager Trust,” 
“Colleague Trust,” and “Shareholder Trust,” was used to 
determine the level of manager trust after obtaining the 
necessary permissions. The scale was accepted as a 
dimension of the research and it included seven items. It 
included the following phrases; “I trust in the school 
manager,” “I trust in the honesty of my school manager,” 
“The manager is interested in teachers’ problems in this 
school,” “The relationship between the manager and teachers 
in this school is stable,” “The manager in this school is good 
at what he does,” “The manager in this school keeps his/her 
promises,” and “The school manager shares personal 
information about teachers with others” as a negative item. 
“Manager Trust Scale” (MTS), which was determined as a 
five-point Likert scale, included the following options; 
“Never” (1), “Rarely” (2), “Sometimes” (3), “Mostly” (4) 
and “Always” (5). According to the validity and reliability 
analyses of the scale including seven items, factor loading 
values of the seven items included in manager trust 
dimension as the first factor were found as varying from .49 
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to 0.84. The total item correlation of this factor was 
determined as varying from 0.52 to 0.73; for this reason, it is 
possible to claim that the items are highly distinctive. 
Cronbach’s Alpha value of the scale was found as .89. The 
reliability coefficient of the scale used in this study, in which 
625 teachers who worked for primary and secondary schools 
took part, was determined to be .91.  

3.3.3. Organizational Silence Scale (OSS) 
“Organizational Silence Scale” (OSS), which was 

developed by Kahveci and Demirtaş [69] was used to 
determine the level of organizational silence after obtaining 
the necessary permissions. Organizational silence scale 
included eight items. According to exploratory factor 
analysis, the scale was composed of five factors. These 
factors were called (1) School Environment, (2) Feeling, (3) 
Source of Silence, (4) Manager and (5) Isolation. The results 
of the confirmative factor analysis made to determine the 
structure of five factors showed that first-level confirmative 
factor analysis result/df value is 3,07; GFI value is .912; CFI 
value is .920; and RMSEA value is 0,70. Based on the values 
obtained, the model may claim to have convenient adaptive 
values. Item loadings of the scale were observed to vary 
from .48 to .78. Items of OSS which were prepared based on 
five-point likert scale were (1) “Strongly Disagree”, (2) 
“Disagree”, (3) “Somewhat disagree”, (4) “Agree” and (5) 
“Strongly Agree”. Cronbach Alpha coefficients of the scale 
were found to be .74 for school environment; .81 for 
feeling; .80 for source of silence; .79 for manager and .83 for 
isolation, respectively. The reliability coefficient calculated 
for the whole scale in general was .89. In this study, which 
covers 625 primary and secondary school teachers, 
Cronbach Alpha coefficients were determined as .71 for 
school environment; .74 for feeling; .75 for source of 
silence; .82 for manager and .87 for isolation, respectively. 
The reliability coefficient calculated for the whole scale in 
general was .90.  

3.4. Data Analysis 

Teachers included in the sample were handed out the 
survey forms used for the purposes of the study. Data 
collection was conducted on a voluntary basis and teachers 
were informed of the process emphasizing that no personal 
phrase or information were included in the surveys. A total 
number of 65 surveys were analyzed.  

SPSS was used for the evaluation and analysis of the 
findings of the study. Whether there was a relationship 
between interactional justice, manager trust and 
organizational silence, which is the first sub-problem of the 
study, was considered; and; if there was a relationship, 
Pearson product-moment correlation coefficient was 
considered since the variables had normal distribution during 
determination of the direction and the level of the 
relationship. In evaluating the correlation relationship 
between the scales, values between 0.70 and 1.00 were 
reflected as a high-level; values between .30 and .70 were 
reflected as a mid-level, and values between 0.00 and 0.30 

were reflected as a low-level relationship [67]. The results 
were tested at p< 0.01 level.  

A multiple regression analysis was made because linearity 
and a normal distribution were observed during the analyses 
made to determine the influence of interactional justice and 
manager trust on organizational silence, which is the second 
sub-problem of the study. In the study, interactional justice 
and manager trust were set as independent variables whereas 
organizational silence was set as a dependent variable. In the 
consequence of statistical analysis, significance level was 
determined as =0.05.  

4. Findings 
In this study, a Pearson Correlation Analysis was made to 

determine the relationship among interactional justice, 
manager trust and organizational silence behaviors based on 
the perceptions of primary and secondary school teachers. In 
addition, a multiple regression analysis was made to find the 
influence of interactional justice and manager trust 
perceptions on organizational silence levels.  

Findings about the relationship among interactional 
justice, manager trust and organizational silence behaviors 
based on the perceptions of primary and secondary school 
teachers are presented in Table 1.  
Table 1.  Results of Correlation Analysis of the Relationship among 
Interactional Justice, Manager Trust and Organizational Silence Behaviors 
based on the Perceptions of Teachers 

 Interactional 
Justice 

Manager 
Trust 

Organizational 
Silence 

Interactional 
Justice  1 .863** -.403** 

Manager Trust .863** 1 -.401** 

Organizational 
Silence -.403** -.401** 1 

When Table 1 is considered, based on teachers’ 
perceptions, a positive and highly significant relationship 
between interactional justice and manager trust perceptions 
(r=.863; p<0.01); a mid-level negative significant 
relationship between interactional justice and organizational 
silence (r=-.403; p<0.01); and a mid-level negative 
significant relationship between manager trust and 
organizational silence (r=-.401; p<0.01) may be observed. 
These findings show that there is a direct proportion between 
interactional justice and manager trust perceptions whereas 
there is an inverse proportion interactional justice and 
organizational silence and manager trust and organizational 
silence perceptions.  

A multiple regression analysis was made to determine the 
influence of interactional justice and manager trust 
perceptions on organizational silence levels and the results 
were examined. Findings of the regression analysis about 
interactional justice and manager trust behaviors’ prediction 
of organizational silence are given in Table 2.  
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Table 2.  Results of Multiple Regression Analysis about Interactional Justice and Manager Trust Behaviours’ Prediction of Organizational Silence 

Variable B Standard Error Beta(β) t p Dual Correlation Partial Correlation 

Invariant 4.544 .119 - 38.058 .000 - - 

Interactional Justice -.176 .057 -.221 -3.068 .002 -.403 -.112 

Manager Trust -.175 .060 -.210 -2.902 .004 -.401 -.116 

R= .416 R2=.173 
F(2,622)= 65.182 p=.000         

 

When Table 2 is considered, teachers’ organizational 
silence perceptions, along with interactional justice and 
manager trust variables, are observed to have a mid-level 
significant relationship (R=.416; R2=.173; p<0.05). 
Interactional justice and manager trust represent 
approximately 17% of the total variance in organizational 
silence behavior. Relative order of importance of predictor 
variables on organizational silence in accordance with 
standardized regression coefficient is as follows; 
interactional justice (β=-.221) and manager trust (β=-.210). 
When results of t-test on the significance of regression 
coefficient are examined, both behaviors are seen to predict 
organizational silence behavior.  

5. Results and Discussion 
This study, which aims at revealing the relationship 

among interactional justice, manager trust and teachers’ 
organizational silence, has the following results; 
a. A high-level positive relationship between primary and 

secondary school teachers’ interactional justice and 
manager trust perceptions; a mid-level negative 
relationship between these teachers’ interactional 
justice perceptions and organizational silence; and a 
mid-level negative relationship between these teachers’ 
manager trust perceptions and organizational silence 
were determined. 

b. Interactional justice and manager trust perceptions were 
found to constitute %17 of organizational silence 
variance. Based on the t-test results, which reflect the 
significance of regression coefficient, manager trust 
and interactional justice variables were determined to 
be the significant predictor variables of organizational 
silence.  

c. Based on the standardized regression coefficient (β), 
order of significance of the predictor variables of 
organizational silence was found as manager trust and 
interactional justice, respectively.  

In this study, a highly positive relationship was found 
between teachers’ interactional justice and manager trust 
perceptions. Baş and Şentürk, who points out that the 
existence of organizational justice and organizational trust is 
vital [21], presents results indicating the fact that these two 

factors are two important components that affect teachers’ 
attitude towards their profession, their behaviors and success 
in school, which is a fact demonstrating the findings of this 
research. Özgan, in his study [27], reveals that in an 
environment with a high organizational trust level, a 
decrease in conflicts is expected; and as a result, teachers 
who have positive perceptions about managers have less 
conflict with managers. İşçan and Sayın [25] put an 
emphasis on the fact that inter-organizational relationships 
would worsen and organizational goals would not be 
achieved without trust because efficient relationships are 
based on this feeling.  

Yıldız stresses that the trust level of an individual is 
shaped by the manager’s attitude in his/her ethical and just 
practices and for this reason manager trust is examined 
within the scope of trust which is based on interpersonal 
relationships [30]. Managers who exhibit behaviors affecting 
the manager trust perception such as honesty, interest in 
teachers’ problems, and consistency in the relationship with 
teachers and keeping promises are perceived as just in their 
relationship with teachers. Folger and Konovsky also put an 
emphasis on the fact that justice of the manager not only 
creates respectability but also contributes to the development 
of trust [70].  

Justice perceptions in schools affect teachers’ 
commitment and trust towards to their managers. Moreover, 
justice in the gains is regarded as an indication of the fact that 
managers observe the rights and personal values of the 
employees. Celep and Polat state that school managers need 
to increase teachers’ equality and justice perceptions through 
treating them with justice because managers’ interactional 
justice perceptions increase employees’ trust at a significant 
level [23]. It is also possible to claim that employees may 
have a lack of trust in their manager and they may not see 
themselves as a member of the organization in the absence of 
interactional justice, which has a significant influence on 
organizational justice and which is about the interpersonal 
relationship dimension of justice [21]. Within this context, it 
may be said that if teachers, opinions are listened to carefully 
considered in decision process and had enough respect to 
their opinions in the schools their trust may increase towards 
to their schools and managers.  

Findings about the relationship between interactional 
justice perception and organizational silence behavior show 
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that there is a negative mid-level significant relationship 
between interactional justice perceptions of primary and 
secondary school teachers and organizational silence 
behavior. This finding indicates that teachers’ perception of 
managers high-level interactional justice would decrease 
teachers’ organizational silence behavior. Indeed, it would 
not be wrong to say that the decrease in teachers’ 
organizational silence behavior may change based on the 
increase in their perception of interactional justice of the 
manager. However, Taşkıran accepts interactional justice as 
a structure with two dimensions; that is, as distributive 
justice and procedural justice and he states that it has a 
mid-level positive relationship with organizational silence 
(in direct proportion/in the same direction) [49] whereas 
Güvenli emphasizes that interactional justice and 
organizational silence have a low-level non-significant 
relationship in reverse direction) [48]; which are both 
contradictory to the results of this study.  

A number of studies reveal that interactional justice, 
which is described as justice perception emerged as a result 
of interpersonal relations, has a mid-level effect on reducing 
organizational silence behavior [38, 39, 71]. Within this 
context, manager behaviors such as listening to and showing 
respect for teachers’ opinions during decision-making; 
choosing the best possible practices for teachers; and 
explaining honestly the reasons for decisions taken may 
contribute to reduction of teachers’ silence behaviors. For 
this reason, it may be claimed that interactional justice, 
which requires managers to have respect for, to appreciate, to 
listen to their employees with utmost care; to make adequate 
explanations about decisions; to be tolerant and sensitive 
against their personal negative traits in social sense [40,41], 
is one of the important determiners of the prevention of 
organizational silence behavior.  

Findings show that there is a negative mid-level 
significant relationship between interactional justice 
perceptions of primary and secondary school teachers and 
organizational silence behavior. This finding indicates that 
teachers’ perception of manager’s high-level interactional 
justice would decrease teachers’ organizational silence 
behavior. Thus, it is possible to say that the decrease in 
teachers’ organizational silence behavior may change based 
on the increase in their perception of interactional justice of 
the manager. The findings obtained from this study support 
the findings of the studies of Afşar (2013), Çakınberk, Dede 
and Yılmaz (2014) and Yanık (2012) [43, 46, 47].  

This study reveals that manager trust perception, which is 
regarded as the most significant predictor of the concept of 
trust that is generally described as one of the vital functions 
of organizations, has a positive effect on organizational 
silence behavior. Creating an environment open for 
communication, giving a chance to actively participate in 
decision-making processes, and sharing important 
information, feelings and thoughts about the organization 
have an important part in establishing trust, and managers 
have the most significant role in attaining these objectives [3, 
72]. Managers’ attitude and behaviors may be thought to be 

highly significant for creating an environment of trust. It is 
also possible to say that teachers may be more cooperative, 
more likely to express their thoughts and feelings, if the 
manager is perceived as honest, if he is interested in 
teachers’ problems, and if he acts consistently and keeps 
his/her promises.  

Taking the results into account, it may also be said that 
managers’ manners which give the impression that “they 
know best” have a negative influence on teachers and as a 
result this affects trust. Teachers may feel that no attention is 
paid to their feelings and thoughts and they may be reluctant 
to express their ideas. This, as a result, may lead to creation 
of an environment that is incompatible with management 
practice policies determined by modern organizations. An 
atmosphere of silence may prevent cooperation, team work 
and interaction-based practices and this may lead to 
environments in which teachers do not feel safe and easy 
about trusting their managers [9, 14, 19, 73, 74, 75].  

Interactional justice and manager trust variables have a 
mid-level negative significant relationship with silence 
perceptions of primary and secondary school teachers. 
According to the findings of this study, interactional justice 
and manager trust represent approximately 17% of the 
change in organizational silence behavior. The results of 
t-test reflecting the significance of regression coefficient 
show that manager trust and interactional justice are 
significant predictors of organizational silence behavior. 
These findings support the findings of researches made by 
Cerit (2009), Çakınberk, Dede and Yılmaz (2014) and Yanık 
(2012) [45, 46, 47].  

In line with the regression analysis made through 
teachers’ opinions about organizational silence behavior, 
first interactional justice perceptions and then manager trust 
perceptions have maximal influence on reduction of 
organizational silence behavior, respectively. Even though 
there is not critical difference between these influences, 
findings show that first interactional justice perceptions and 
then manager trust perceptions need to be changed. For this 
reason, it may be said that, first and foremost, managers are 
required to be just in order to reduce silence behavior within 
an organization.  

In recent conditions in which organizations consider and 
implement modern management practices, methods such as 
self-governing groups; popularizing democratic 
communication types and increasing the act of sharing are 
prioritized [63, 76, 77]. Communication and cooperation 
between the employees are attached importance during 
efforts to implement these practices. However, the fact that 
employees may be silent and indifferent to their organization 
also because of several negative situations and conditions is 
among the findings [64, 77, 78]. This study enables us to 
reflect some of these negative situations and conditions as 
manager trust and interactional justice perception. Cerit, in 
his study, found that manager trust has a significant role in 
cooperating with the manager [45]. It may be said that those 
teachers, who trust their manager and perceive him/her as 
just, are more positive and careful when expressing his/her 
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shortcomings and they feel more free to reflect their feelings 
and thoughts. It may be said that this, in result, contributes to 
the removal of obstacles in emergence of new ideas and 
thoughts, creativity and synergy within the organization [61, 
62, 64].  

The findings of this study show that only a part of silence 
behavior is affected by manager trust and interactional 
justice variables. Studies not only indicate that silence is 
multi-dimensional and complex [64] but also reveal that 
managers have significant responsibilities in controlling 
these variables, increasing cooperation and sharing within 
the organization, improving creativity and attaining goals 
particularly in educational organizations. It is an important 
fact that especially schools’ managers, who are the 
decision-makers and the executives of educational 
organizations, need to observe teachers’ rights; need to be 
more sensitive about their problems, and more successful in 
communication or chosen from people who are educated in 
this field.  

6. Recommendations 
With an end to prevent organizational silence, teachers 

should be encouraged to participate in decision-making 
processes; they should be made to feel that their ideas are 
important; and environments in which they could express 
their thoughts and ideas freely should be created. Managers 
should establish an open and democratic relationship with 
teachers and should be interested in their problems in order 
to integrate teachers into the school; to make them believe in 
the management’s fairness; and to increase their 
organizational trust levels.  

Even though there are many factors influencing teachers’ 
organizational silence, managers’ success in establishing 
trust-based relations and being fair would contribute to a 
decrease in organizational silence. Within this context, 
school managers should first focus on activities and 
behaviors that would increase teachers’ trust levels and they 
should be fair.  

A communication environment, which lacks sincerity and 
democracy, and which, as a result, prevents teachers from 
expressing their feelings and ideas, is a big obstacle for 
organizational development and progress. Ministry of 
National Education and local educational organizations 
should organize on-the-job training seminars that would 
raise awareness among managers and that would enable 
changes in their behaviors through improving their 
communication skills.  

More comprehensive qualitative and quantitative 
researches should be conducted in order to determine the 
reasons for and outcomes of teachers’ organizational silence 
in schools. The qualitative studies to be made should 
concentrate on manager behavior dimensions with high 
levels of organizational silence perception, as is also 
revealed in this study. Particularly interviews would be 
beneficial for a deep analysis on reasons for organizational 

silence due to the multi-dimensional, hard-to understand and 
hard-to-interpret nature of silence. 
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