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Abstract 
This article examines how Education undergraduates explored their creative processes through the 
planning and presentation of an artwork. In particular, it addresses how they negotiated the demands of 
an assessment method which focused on both the reflective process and the finished product. This 
investigation is part of a more extensive study of creativity and engagement in Higher Education; it is 
underpinned by the idea that all students have the potential to be creative if they are provided with 
innovative learning experiences and open-ended assessment tasks. The empirical data was obtained 
from semi-structured interviews (n=30), students’ reflective sketchbooks and observations. The findings 
support the view that students are more motivated and engaged when they have access to alternative, 
creative assessment opportunities which involve experimentation and risk-taking in a supportive 
learning environment. The data shows that they value assessment methods which enable them to 
demonstrate their knowledge, understanding and skills in different ways. However, concern about the 
perceived subjectivity of such an assessment process, and the emphasis placed on meeting the learning 
outcomes, initially presented a barrier to creative development. One implication is that the conflict 
between creativity and assessment might be partially resolved if students played a more active part in 
both the formulation of summative assessment criteria and the on-going formative assessment process. 
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Introduction  
With Higher Education (HE) experiencing so many rapid changes and challenges, including a shift to a 
‘market-driven’ system and a much larger and more diverse student population, there is a need to re-
evaluate the undergraduate experience. The rise of consumerism which, according to Scott (2010), is 
partly the result of deliberate policy interventions such as the National Student Survey (NSS), has meant 
that students have higher expectations of their HE experience and are more openly critical and 
demanding. Some student experience survey responses in the UK may be interpreted as responding 
directly to the ‘tumultuous’ changes in the sector (Gibney (2013); students appear to be reassessing 
issues that previously had been taken for granted. One example of this is the rise in the number of 
students asking for coursework to be second-marked, if they feel that the grades awarded do not reflect 
their expectations; what used to be a rare occurrence is becoming common practice. It is 
understandable that, following the introduction of higher tuition fees, students want a good return for 
their financial investment but, as evidenced by my own experience, there is a tendency for them to 
associate ‘value for money’ with high level degree classifications. There is much scope for the whole 
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student experience to be enhanced and developed (Dollinger et. al., 2005; Ramsden, 2003) but the 
assessment process, which is increasingly seen as an important measure of the quality of provision in HE 
institutions (Merricks, 2006), requires immediate attention. One of the key issues highlighted in the 
2003 Quality Assurance Agency (QAA) report was the narrow range of assessment methods used in HE, 
many of which were deemed inappropriate for such a wide-ranging student body. This supports the 
point made by Gibbs (2006) that many assignments fail to engage students with appropriate kinds of 
learning activities; he advocates the use of ‘larger, more complex and open-ended’ assignments that 
‘require performances of understanding’ (2006:33) and encourage a deeper approach to learning (Biggs, 
2003). Much has been written about the substantial shifts in assessment policy and practice over the 
last decade (Boud and Falchikov, 2006; Brown, 2003; Bryan and Clegg, 2006); as assessment greatly 
affects how students spend their time and where they focus their effort, innovations are not seen as 
merely desirable but as crucial and essential. It is beyond the scope of this paper to discuss the aims of 
HE – these are explored elsewhere (Dearing, 1997; Taras, 2002) – but, with increased emphasis being 
placed on the employability skills agenda and lifelong learning, students need to be able to demonstrate 
that they can plan and monitor their own learning. With the focus on measureable performance it is 
‘easy to lose sight of the pedagogic role that assessment can and should play in improving learning’ 
(Bryan and Clegg, 2006:3); as Dochy, Segers and Sluijsmans (1999) remark, assessment practices need to 
do far more than just produce very knowledgeable graduates.  
 
Creativity and assessment 
As Craft (2003) points out, ‘creativity is becoming part of a universalised discourse in the Western 
world’; its inclusion in educational policy documents and curriculum frameworks has given it relatively 
high status, particularly in schools. In a fast moving world of economic and technical change, there is an 
urgent need for a workforce which will respond creatively to innovative developments (Cunningham 
2005; Hartley, 2004) and question conventional ideas (Barell, 2003).  In addition to the political and 
economic imperatives, creativity is viewed as a significant aspect of personal and social development 
(Amabile, 1983; Jeffrey and Woods, 2003). However, although the importance of developing creative 
pedagogies and practices has been highlighted by many educationalists and researchers (Craft, 2006; 
Jackson, 2006; Kleiman, 2005; McWilliam, 2005), there is a feeling that creative initiatives in HE are 
often undervalued and even thwarted (Dollinger et al., 2005; Kuh, 1996). Kleiman (2005) points out that 
this may be partly due to the problems associated with defining creativity; despite the wealth of 
literature about creativity in education (Craft, 2003; Cropley, 2000; Jeffrey and Woods, 2003), there 
continues to be a lack of consensus about the meaning of this multi-faceted and complex term. Gardner 
(1995), for example, considers creativity to be a combination of subject knowledge, intrinsic motivation 
and specific cognitive skills, such as flexibility and a willingness to try out counter-intuitive approaches, 
whereas Byron (2007) defines it more broadly as a new and appropriate response to an open-ended 
task. Schools in the UK tend to support the National Advisory Committee on Creative and Cultural 
Education’s suggestion that creativity is ‘Imagined activity fashioned as to produce outcomes that are 
both original and of value’, (NACCCE Report, 1999), although what is considered ‘original’ and ‘valuable’ 
is open to question. The fact that assessment of student creativity is recognised as being both 
complicated and controversial (Beghetto, 2005: Elton, 2006; Loveless, 2002), also helps to explain some 
of the negativity towards creative practices in HE. In order to develop their creative thinking skills, 
students need to experience non-traditional teaching methods and approaches to assessment that 
‘challenge the habitual ways in which they approach their learning’ (Watson, 2012:443). As the creative 
process, which involves risk-taking, experimentation and freedom of choice, is unpredictable and 
difficult to capture, traditional assessment methods are not only unsuitable but counterproductive to 
creativity. It could be argued that the current policy priorities and assessment processes of 
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performance-driven HE institutions are in direct conflict with creative development (Watson, 2013). As 
Cole et al. (1999: 281) point out, ‘traditional education systems have allowed students to feel more 
comfortable by not being creative’; authentic, practice-oriented assessment tasks may be more 
engaging (Brown, 2003) but students are, understandably, unwilling to take risks that are perceived as 
having a negative impact on their final grade. Mindful of current recruitment issues and the focus on 
driving up standards, I would argue that practitioners should have opportunities to experiment with and 
discuss creative methods that enhance rather than replace existing assessment practices.   
 
The research study in context 
The study involves undergraduate students on a three year degree in Education at the research-
intensive University of East Anglia (UEA); although it is not marketed as a teacher training course, the 
majority of students aspire to be primary teachers. In recognition of the diverse employment 
opportunities in education and the highly-competitive nature of applying for Initial Teacher Training 
(ITT) places, the course aims to provide all undergraduates with a range of stimulating, challenging 
learning opportunities which encourage creative, critical and conceptual ways of thinking. The optional 
‘Creativity and Learning’ module, which was specifically designed to provide Year 3 students with 
alternative, creative learning experiences, reflects the view that everyone has the potential to be 
creative; this ‘democratic’ approach, referred to by Craft (2003) as ‘little c creativity’, supports the idea 
that creativity can be taught and developed. Rather than identifying and selecting ‘creative’ individuals 
to undertake the module, the focus is on introducing pedagogical approaches that aim to help students 
develop some of the characteristics and abilities associated with creativity. With reference to the four 
categories of personal creativity characteristics identified by Treffinger et al. (2002), students are 
encouraged to use their imagination to generate and explore ideas, respond to new situations in a novel 
way, make connections and become more aware of their creativeness (Watson, 2013). Over a twelve-
week period, students explore and gain insight into the theory and practice, philosophy and policy of 
creativity in education through formal lectures, interactive seminars and independent study. They also 
engage in practical, self-reflective creative learning activities and explore their own creative processes 
through the planning, creation and presentation of an art piece. The different, but complementary, 
modes of delivery reflect some of the multiple factors considered essential to the understanding of 
creativity (Amabile, 1983); these include subject knowledge, motivation, learning styles and personality 
traits. Drawing on definitions which focus on cognitive processes (Seltzer and Bentley, 1999; Torrance, 
1980), personal development and product (Gardner, 1995), the importance of addressing how these 
impact on the creative experience has been acknowledged.  
 
Aims and rationale 
In order to meet the module outcomes, students are required to submit both a traditional essay and a 
creative portfolio, each of which accounts for fifty per cent of the summative grade awarded. Debates 
about alternative, pluralistic approaches to assessment are well documented (Birenbaum and Dochy, 
1996; Craddock and Mathias, 2009) but there is a dearth of literature focusing on creative assessment 
practices in HE. This study aims to readdress the balance by examining how students responded to the 
open-ended art-based element of the assessment; this task, which culminates in the production of an 
art piece, is supported by the on-going documentation of ideas and a short reflective overview of the 
process. The whole portfolio is assessed on the last day of the module, when the students present their 
work as a peer group exhibition in the Art Centre studio.  
 
The shift from course development to research study was in response to positive module evaluations; 
comments such as ‘I found the work refreshingly stimulating and engaging – it was so different from 
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anything we had done before’ inspired me to delve deeper into the students’ perceptions of alternative 
approaches to learning and assessment. The study builds on the findings of two small-scale exploratory 
investigations that focused on: students’ responses to working in the creative learning environment of 
an art studio (Watson, 2012) and how they used the experience to interrogate their self-knowledge, 
construct new meanings and explore their personal and professional identities (Watson, 2013). It was 
evident from the data that ‘students benefit from being exposed to alternative learning and teaching 
approaches which put them under pressure and shake up their preconceived ideas about what it means 
to be an education undergraduate’ (Watson, 2012, 457), but the findings led to a reconsideration of the 
module outcomes and assessment criteria. The current study is predicated by the idea that all students 
have the potential to be creative if they are provided with innovative learning experiences and open-
ended assessment tasks; it is underpinned by the principles and vaues of experiential, reflective and 
collaborative learning (Jacobson and Ruddy, 2004; Moon, 2004). As Knight (1995) points out, how we 
choose to assess students’ work reflects what we value: I was keen to make the assessment process an 
active, integral part of the learning experience for both individuals and the whole group in a supportive 
setting. This supports the idea that creative processes and products are socially situated and constructed 
(Csikszentmihalyi, 1999) and that students should have opportunities for risk-taking and making 
mistakes in a non-threatening environment (Craft, 2003). These underlying pedagogical principles are 
reflected in the assessment criteria which required evidence of the following: exploration, 
experimentation and risk taking with ideas and materials; the development of a unique and personal 
line of enquiry through critical reflection; process documentation, content and execution; individual 
presentation and participation in peer critique and the exhibited art piece (idea and meaning, form and 
execution). 
 
Research methodology and data collection methods 
This qualitative investigation, which is part of a more extensive action research study of creativity and 
engagement in HE, was conducted within an interpretive social-constructivist conceptual framework. As 
in the previous study (Watson, 2013), the reflective methodology employed enabled participants to 
record and discuss their ‘lived experiences’ (Whitehead and McNiff, 2006) of working both individually 
and collaboratively in the Arts Centre studio. Twenty Year 3 ‘Creativity and Learning’ students and ten 
Primary ITT postgraduates, who had undertaken the module in the previous year, participated in the 
study. Having gained ethical approval from my institution, all participants were informed of the purpose 
and structure of the research study; before they signed the consent form, it was made clear to the 
undergraduates that the data collection process and findings would have no bearing on their summative 
assessment grades.  
 
The empirical data, obtained from preliminary questionnaires, semi-structured interviews, observations 
and students’ reflective sketchbooks, was collected over a fourteen week period between January and 
April 2013. The multi-method approach adopted reflects the definition of assessment proposed by 
Treffinger et al. (2002, 23): ‘a process of “taking stock” of an individual (or group) by drawing together 
information from a number of sources and attempting to organise and synthesise those data in a 
meaningful way’. As these authors point out, ‘the complex and multidimensional nature of creativity 
cannot be captured effectively and comprehensively by any single instrument or analytical procedure’ 
(2002, 25).  The questionnaires were administered at the beginning of the module in order to obtain an 
overview of students’ expectations about the practical element of the work; these initial responses 
helped to inform the interview questions. Early interviews with the undergraduates, which took place in 
a quiet room next to the studio, were incorporated into the practical sessions; this meant that 
participants were able to discuss how they approached and responded to the art-based assessment in 
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the context of the actual learning environment. Common themes and issues emerging from the 
transcripts were explored in the more in-depth interviews conducted at the end of the module; as this 
investigation focused on students’ perceptions of the assessment process, further interviews were 
carried out after they had received their final marks and summative feedback sheets. The two focus 
group interviews, which took place in February 2013, were conducted in an open conversational style 
(Kvale, 1996); former students were invited to reflect on and discuss their perceptions of being assessed 
in a different way and consider if the experience had impacted on their personal and professional lives. 
The observation notes provided a detailed overview of the practical sessions from a different 
perspective; it was interesting to compare these with the students’ reflective accounts and extrapolate 
issues to explore in the interviews. Although the experiences were unique to individuals, it was possible 
to identify common themes emerging from the data. 
 
Findings and discussion 
This section provides an overview of how students responded to the challenge of exploring their 
creative processes through the planning and presentation of an artwork; in particular, it examines how 
they negotiated the demands of a different type of assessment, which focused on both the reflective 
process and the finished product. With reference to literature focusing on creativity and assessment in 
HE, the discussion draws on empirical data, collected over the four month period. 
 
Although many students found the initial experience daunting and, in some cases, intimidating, there 
was an overwhelmingly positive response to the art-based task, once they gained in confidence. 
Evidence from the preliminary questionnaires and early interview transcripts showed that most students 
embarked on the module feeling more comfortable with a didactic, linear approach to learning: one 
said, ‘As we are used to being told what to do and having everything organised in advance of the taught 
sessions’, I found the whole idea of experimentation hard to accept at first’ and another commented on 
how previous ‘downplaying of self-discovery and risk-taking’ had made her feel ‘passive and 
demotivated but safe’. One student said, ‘I began to think more freely and creatively when I made a 
conscious effort to forget about the familiar ways of learning and become more open-minded to unusual 
ideas’ and another commented on how excited and motivated she felt when, ‘after a long period of self-
doubt and despondency’, she could see how her ‘random thoughts and ideas gathered from reading 
came together’. This participant went on to explain how she ‘felt on a roll’ – what Csikszentmihalyi 
(1999), refers to as ‘the flow’ – when she could see where she was going with her work but, like many 
others, had to experience periods of discomfort and uncertainty before reaching that stage. Several 
students admitted to having their most productive ideas when they felt vulnerable and unsure of 
themselves; this supports Maslow’s (1976) view that although many people fear self-knowledge, they 
are more likely to discover their true potential as they become more aware of their creative freedom, a 
point which emerged from previous studies (Watson, 2012; 2013). Others valued having the opportunity 
to explore ideas when they chose to do so; ‘if I was not feeling particularly creative in the studio’, 
remarked one student, ‘I would use the time for thinking, even daydreaming, and work on my art piece 
later’ and another said ‘As I often had my most inspirational ideas outside the timetabled sessions, it was 
frustrating not having access to the studio’. Kleiman (2005, 7) points out that those of us involved with 
educational provision need to be aware that ‘individual states of intuition, rumination, reverie, even 
boredom play a role in creativity and problem-solving’; this means allowing time and space for deep 
thinking and reflection. As students were encouraged to experiment with ideas and resources and 
explore tangential avenues of thought, most of them began to embrace uncertainty and ambiguity after 
a few sessions in the studio; this contradicts Sadler’s (1989) criticism of ‘trial and error learning’, which 
he considered to be random and inefficient. The evidence showed that some students were surprised to 
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find that creative learning experiences could be ‘well-structured, thought-provoking and intellectually 
challenging’; however, for those who had anticipated ‘a soft option’ this was not necessarily a welcome 
discovery. 
 
When asked about the task of producing an art piece, it was evident that the majority of students were 
pleased there would be an actual product to physically represent all their hard work; one said, ‘I think 
that having a final result will make me feel that I have achieved something worthwhile – it will mark the 
end of a long but worthwhile personal journey’ and another said she was proud of her final piece but 
regarded it ‘as more of a summary of [her] creative ideas and thought processes than as an item for the 
public to view’. The majority of students were aware that the artworks represented a culmination of the 
creative process – the following extract from a reflective sketchbook encapsulates the general feeling 
about the linking of process and product: ‘Creativity is about making connections between the ideas, 
thoughts and feelings explored over the last twelve weeks and turning these into something visual that 
others can interpret as they wish’. Evidence from the interview transcripts and observation notes 
indicated that having to work on the exhibition as a team encouraged a wider view of creative 
development; as one student remarked, ‘I used to think that creativity was just about improving certain 
skills and qualities but I now see it as part of a process that leads to a tangible outcome’. The following 
comment demonstrates the great sense of achievement felt by one student when she realised how her 
artwork contributed positively to the whole exhibition: ‘although the piece crystallised my own thoughts 
and feelings, it also reflected the creative ideas of the group and the influences of working in an art 
studio’. These remarks support the view that creative ideas and products need to be recognised by 
others and draw attention to how the actual learning environment plays such an important part in the 
creative development of individuals (Kleiman, 2005). Given the wide range of factors that influenced 
how individuals approached their work in the studio, including their experiences, interests, attitudes, 
strengths and emotions; the way in which they responded to their peers, the artist and the learning 
environment and the extent to which they drew on the theoretical sessions and research, it is not 
surprising that each piece of art represented a unique combination of process and product. However, 
the point that ‘Not all cultures regard creativity as an individualised response, some preferring to see it 
as a collective, collaborative phenomenon and as an event which may be publicly performed and 
evaluated’ (Carter, 2004: 48), is reflected in the findings. 
 
This leads on to an exploration of students’ perceptions of the demands of the assessment process at 
different stages of the investigation. Most of them felt that ‘it made a refreshing change to be 
challenged and assessed in a variety of ways’; they were pleased that ‘the different assessment methods 
respected [their] individual creative capabilities’ and enabled them to demonstrate a ‘wider knowledge 
and understanding of creativity in relation to their interests and experiences’. This reinforces the point 
that there needs to be ‘greater emphasis on assessment instruments that measure not just recall of 
facts, but also the students’ abilities to use the material they have learned in live situations’ (Brown, 
2004:82). However, some found the new approaches challenging; one student said, ‘It’s been such a 
shock to the system as the last two years have been very structured, with a focus on essays – we have 
had to adapt quite quickly to a different way of thinking’ and another remarked that she felt she would 
have benefited from being introduced to creative assessment methods earlier in the course. One of the 
postgraduates said, ‘I do think you should be able to learn for learning’s sake but, unfortunately, our 
society has created a situation where final results count for everything’; he went on to say, ‘I did want to 
be creative but was always thinking about what was going to get me a good mark – I was so driven by 
what I wanted to do (teaching) that I had to get that 2:1’. This participant, who has just secured a post in 
a primary school, freely admitted that he spent time in the practical sessions trying to work out what the 
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artist (as one of the assessors) appeared to value; this concurs with a point made by Gibbs (2006: 24) 
that, for some students, studying is ‘an exercise in selective negligence’, based on their perceptions of 
what the assessment system requires. Another student said, ‘although I was encouraged to explore my 
own ideas, I sometimes felt compelled to follow up the artist’s suggestions, in order to get a good mark’; 
although she went on to acknowledge that this uncertainty may have reflected her reluctance to take 
risks, the comment highlights the potential conflict between the aims of the pedagogical process and 
the pressure of grades. These remarks also draw attention to ‘hidden messages’ that underlie learning 
objectives and assessment criteria; as Gibbs (2006) points out, there may be a gap between what is 
presented in course documentation and what students actually experience in their studies. 
 
The findings showed that despite the assessment criteria and grade descriptors being made transparent 
and explicit, in relation to the learning outcomes, some students found it difficult to understand how 
these translated into practice. Comments like ‘I welcomed the open-ended nature of the task but was 
unsure of what to include in the sketchbook to achieve a high grade’ and ‘it was suggested that I 
critically engage with the work of artists who had studied my chosen theme but I didn’t really know what 
this entailed’, demonstrate that terms used freely in assessment documentation may be read and 
interpreted in different ways. Evidence from later interviews showed that the majority of students 
valued the individual tutorials that took place halfway through the module, as they were able to discuss 
ideas with the artist/assessor and use insights gained to make progress with their art pieces. This 
reinforces the importance of providing immediate feedback throughout the process (Black and Wiliam, 
1998; Hattie and Timperley, 2007) – feeding forwards rather than at the end of the module when is too 
late to act on constructive advice offered. However, some students responded negatively to advice, if 
they considered it to be a personal criticism; one student said, 'I was pleased with the direction my work 
was taking until the artist suggested I address wider issues' and another said that she 'felt deflated' 
when she was advised to move beyond her comfort zone and explore the work of an unfamiliar artist. 
Orr (2007) points out that, as creativity is linked to expressions of emotion, it is difficult to separate 
students’ artwork and their identities; urging them to change their usual ways of thinking, which may 
imply criticism of their thought and ideas, could have a negative impact on learning.  
 
Although the summative assessment task was generally well-received, there was some concern about 
the marking and grading process; one of the postgraduates, who had not performed as well as expected 
said, 'achieving a relatively low mark for my art-based work made me feel despondent and insecure as, 
despite the encouraging written comments, it implied that I was less creative than my peers'. Gibbs 
(2006, 27) makes the point that 'any feedback that focuses on an individual’s overall performance (in the 
form of a mark or grade), rather than on their learning, detracts from learning'; he feels that this kind of 
assessment practice may actually discourage creativity. Another participant in the focus group 
expressed concern about the perceived subjectivity of the assessment process; she said, 'as creativity is 
so individual, it must be difficult, if not impossible, to assess it against criteria – I enjoyed working 
alongside my peers but there was an element of tension and competitiveness on the day of the final 
assessment, as we wondered how final marks were awarded for such different pieces of work'. This 
concurs with the view that ‘creativity can be a contentious and confrontational as well as a cooperative 
and collaborative act’ (Carter, 2004, 210) and highlights that the 'tacit professional expertise' on which 
students' work was judged in the past (O'Donovan, Price and Rust, 2004) is open to question in the 
current HE climate.  
 
Evidence from the focus group interview transcripts indicated that some trainee teachers had regarded 
the assessment day as a transient experience, with the true value of the creative process only being 
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realised after they had graduated – what I have come to term ‘deferred creativity’. The following 
comment supports the view that creative assessment practices can enhance employability skills and 
help to foster life-long learning (Boud and Falchikov, 2006), even if this is not recognised at the time: 
 

‘Looking back, I suppose I just wanted to get a good grade and move on to something else - it was 
not until the middle of my teacher training year that I began to reflect on the creative experiences 
that led up to the final assessment and think about how I could make use of these in my teaching; 
it seems like I was putting my creative development on hold until I could see the relevance. ‘ 

 
One postgraduate remarked that, although she had not paid much attention to the summative feedback 
at the time, she found it useful to revisit the comments when applying for jobs:  
 

‘As I didn’t get a particularly good grade, I presumed I wasn’t considered to be a creative person’, 
she said, ‘on reflection, I should have paid more attention to the encouraging comments as I think 
going through the creative process made me a much more imaginative, open-minded person.’  

 
When asked to enhance on this, she said it was ‘unfortunate that so much importance is placed on the 
final grade when the emphasis in the studio was always on the process’; another member of the group 
thought that the situation could be improved by allowing students to draw up the assessment criteria 
and play an active part in the assessment process.  
 
Implications 
The findings support the view that students are more motivated and engaged with their learning when 
they have access to alternative, creative assessment opportunities which enable them to demonstrate 
their knowledge, understanding and skills in different ways. However, with so much emphasis placed on 
performance indicators, it is not surprising that some students are reluctant to pursue creative ideas, if 
they think these might have a negative impact on their final grades; the need to provide clear learning 
outcomes and specific, explicit assessment criteria at the beginning of the process, whilst encouraging 
creative experimentation and risk-taking, was highlighted as a paradoxical situation. This conflict could 
be partially resolved by embedding meaningful self-assessment tasks into the practical sessions and 
encouraging students to consider how the learning outcomes relate to their personal goals. It is evident 
from the data that those who had really thought about what they wanted to achieve from the module, 
in addition to getting a good degree, were more actively engaged in learning activities leading to the 
summative assessment. These students, who had high expectations and a clear sense of direction, 
demonstrated an ability to manage, direct and assess their own creative development in relation to the 
criteria. However, as Taras (2002) points out, placing more responsibility on the students requires 
careful consideration; it is unrealistic to expect them to have well-developed self-management and 
reflective skills, if these have not been taught throughout the course. Cunningham, O’Reilly and Lester 
(1999) feel that encouraging students to manage their own learning, and then subjecting them to a 
rigorous external assessment process, is contradictory; they make the point that attempts by HE 
institutions to support the idea of the self-managed learner are often undermined by inconsistent 
approaches to assessment. 
 
It is evident from the findings that more thought needs to be given to presenting and explaining the 
assessment criteria and standards; the fact that the number of students expressing concern about these 
increased when more detailed guidelines were provided, reflects the view that, on their own, these do 
not help to improve understanding (O'Donovan, Price and Rust, 2004; Ecclestone, 2001). The findings 
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support the idea that engaging in discussions about the criteria, in relation to personal learning goals, 
should encourage individuals to monitor and reflect on their progress in a more informed, meaningful 
way. For example, when discussing the documentation of the creative process, it would be helpful to 
enhance on specific elements of the assessment criteria and relate these to creative characteristics 
being developed. As students would be less likely to be surprised by their marks and comments, if levels 
of progress were made explicit throughout the process, this should result in fewer complaints about 
final grades. Moon 2004 (2006: 194) points out that assessment only contributes to learning ‘when 
learners and teachers share an understanding of the purposes of the assessment and the criteria for 
marking and grading’ but it is important to consider appropriate ways in which this knowledge may be 
transferred. Students need to have access to what Taras (2002) refers to as the 'guild knowledge' that is 
in the minds of their tutors, if they are to understand what is required to narrow the gap between their 
current performance and their goals; this may be partly achieved by building in opportunities to discuss 
feedback and identify next steps. However, as the students receive their final marks and comments 
weeks after the module has finished, there is no evidence that they read, let alone address, advice 
offered; this has implications for course design. Introducing modules that span the academic year would 
enable tutors to incorporate meaningful formative assessment tasks into their programmes and, as 
Claxton (2000) suggests, allow more time and space for students to experience different stages of the 
creative process and develop their ideas. 
 
This findings support a point made by Merricks (2006) that there is a need for staff development, if 
assessment is to be regarded as a useful part of teaching and learning. It is important that the 
appropriateness of new methods, such as those presented in this paper, are discussed in relation to 
different learning situations; as Carter (2004: 210) states, ‘Creativity is always contextually framed and 
conditioned’. Course tutors need time to engage in professional dialogues about creative pedagogy and 
practice as the definition of creativity adopted will help determine the characteristics to be assessed, 
and by what means (Treffinger et al., 2002). Inger (1995) points out that ‘performance’ assessment 
methods, such as art-based portfolios, are particularly useful in measuring outcomes that are not easy 
to quantify by traditional methods. However, if these are to be embraced by HE institutions, 
practitioners need to revisit learning objectives and work together to review the whole assessment 
process. Rather than just providing evidence for summative assessments, tasks relating to the on-going 
documentation of the creative process - what Brown (2003) refers to as ‘practice-oriented’ assessment- 
should actually count towards the final mark. Although this would have implications for staffing, making 
a pedagogical decision to involve more people in discussing and assessing students’ work would help to 
address the issue of subjectivity referred to earlier. Orr (2007) makes the point that moderation usually 
takes place for regulatory purposes and that anonymous marking demonstrates a lack of interest in 
individual students and their preferred ways of learning. Final grades will not disappear in the 
foreseeable future but it is important to stress to students that these do not represent a fixed 
classification of their creative abilities. 
 
Conclusion 
This study supports the view that ‘innovation in assessment is no longer an option in higher education’ 
(Taras, 2002, 501); in particular, it promotes the use of innovative, creative assessment tasks designed 
to improve students’ learning and engagement. However, as Craft (2001) points out, the relationship 
between promoting creativity and the bureaucratic arrangements for quality assurance needs to be 
investigated. As radical changes to current assessment policies and practice would necessitate a 
complete paradigm shift, the suggestion is to enhance rather than abandon traditional assessment 
methods. Providing opportunities for colleagues to engage in constructive professional dialogues about 
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creativity and assessment, and encouraging them to work together to provide meaningful, accessible 
information about the assessment process, should result in a more positive, consistent approach. 
Involving students in both the formulation of assessment criteria and the development of on-going 
formative assessment tasks throughout the course should help to resolve the conflict between creativity 
and assessment. 
 
As Craddock and Mathias (2009) state, there is a need to develop an evidence base for the impact of 
different types of assessment methods employed; the next stage of this research will involve 
interviewing a wider range of former students to find out to what extent the ‘Creativity and Learning’ 
module has impacted on their personal and professional lives. There are plans to build up case studies of 
individuals’ unique responses to the art-based assessment task which, hopefully, will strengthen 
educational policies and practices, in relation to creativity assessment, and demonstrate that creative 
development and high performance are not mutually exclusive. 
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