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Introduction

Bruce Homer

Min-Zhan Lu

The essays collected in this volume participate in an ongoing debate
over how best to represent basic writers and basic writing. Our essays
perform cultural materialist readings of discursive practices in basic
writing, foregrounding the specific sociopolitical and intellectual con-
texts of both the production and reception of a discourse dominating
the field ("Basic Writing") and the social and political effects of its op-
eration on a range of diverse research and teaching practices concerned
with the education of students labeled "basic writers."' We map the cen-
tral problematics, key terms, questions, and assumptions constituting
the "foundation" of that discourse, operating to give the field unity and
continuity by privileging some while marginalizing other practices. We
consider the ways in which cultural materialist readings of basic writ-
ing might inform present and future research and teaching practices
aimed at addressing the mediation of power relations in such practices.

In 1977, Mina Shaughnessy wrote, "Wherever the new students have
arrived in substantial numbers English teachers have begun to realize
that little in their background has prepared them to teach writing to
someone who has not already learned how to do it" (Errors and Expecta-
tions 121). Understanding themselves to be in a "new" situation, teach-
ers and researchers of writing have attempted to understand and ad-
dress the specific needs of their students. They have investigated the
characteristics of these students, developed pedagogies for them, and
subjected these characterizations and pedagogies to ongoing critical re-
view. Of a wealth of practices and projects addressing such concerns,
some have emerged as dominant, constituting a canon of research meth-
odology, pedagogies, and programs. Although critics have pointed out
that the history of remedial education did not begin with the Open Ad-
missions movements of the 1960s and 1970s, this discourse of Basic Writ-
ing has largely been treated as new, beginning with the founding of the

xi
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xii Introduction

Journal of Basic Writing in 1975 and identified with work disseminated
mostly in that journal and in NCTE publications and conferences. We
map this hegemonic process to investigate the problematics of Basic
Writing: how and why some questions and practices have come to seem
central and others peripheral or irrelevant to Basic Writing.

In our essays, we trace Basic Writing's selection of certain terms as
"key," certain questions to be pursued at the expense of others, certain
pedagogies as "practical" or "effective," and we examine the political
effects of such selections, showing how the New discourse denies the
interrelationship of its discursive practice with the specific social and
historical contexts of its production and reception. For this "New" dis-
course emerged in the context of a range of positions on the nature and
goal of higher education during the 1960s and '70s taken by public offi-
cials, college faculty, university administrators, college students, par-
ents of students and prospective students, figures in the public media,
and established "writers" from minority ethnic or racial groups. We ana-
lyze the "birth" of Basic Writing in relation to the spectrum of political
positions ranging from the far right to the far left, renewing, defending,
or challenging prior positions on college admissions standards,
"Bonehead English," and the role of higher education in society. The
New discourse of Basic Writing thus represents one among many in a
discursivefield, emerging in response to what Robert Lyons, describing
the genesis of Mina Shaughnessy's Errors and Expectations, has termed
"the most contentious issue in higher education in New York, . . . at a
college [City College] where feelings about this issue were particularly
intense" ("Mina Shaughnessy and the Teaching of Writing" 6).

The New discourse speaks to the efforts and success of teachers dedi-
cated to the education of "basic writers" to find a voice and establish
authority for themselves through gaining legitimacy as an academic dis-
cipline. Positioned within a constellation of discourses constituting other
fields within and without English Studies (literary studies, literacy stud-
ies, linguistics, sociology, educational psychology), it participates in the
general disciplinary project of producing and regulating the movement
of knowledge, the forms of language, and the training of minds. Specifi-
cally, it treats its statements as (purely) descriptive rather than (also)
constitutive of the subject Basic Writing, focusing attention on the need
to "get the job done," to understand the "meaning" of the writing pro-
duced by Basic Writers and to generate "new readings" of the students
and their writing, thus drawing attention away from its role in defining
the social and institutional position of Basic Writing. In seeming to try
merely to discover, define, and understand the needs and problems of
basic writers, it de-emphasizes the function of the teacher/researcher's
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Introduction xiii

choice of perspective, methods, and language in constructing those
"needs" and "problems," in controlling the judgments and responses of
students and teachers, and in aligning the teaching of Basic Writing with
other power formations within English studies, American higher edu-
cation, and society at large. However, the terms by which this discourse
establishes itself, while ensuring it a specific kind of legitimacy and au-
thority, simultaneously isolate it from the heterogeneity of positions and
forms of power in the larger discursive field. In establishing itself as an
"academic" discourse, it has risked becoming "merely academic"par-
ticipating in a tradition of separating the academic from the social and
historical. We use recent challenges to the dominance of this "New" dis-
course in the field of basic writing to illustrate the need for those of us
professing basic writing to attend to the ways in which social historical
discursive constraints mediate our efforts to challenge the hegemonic
position of Basic Writing within English Studies and American higher
education and society. We should neither underestimate opposition nor
overlook the full range of alliances which we might mobilize in our
struggle to challenge the existing distribution of power, nor the often
complex and contradictory pressures on our choice of alignments. By
recognizing the heterogeneity of basic writing at any given time and
place, teachers can draw on the full range of positions and forcesdomi-
nant, alternative, and oppositional as well as residual or emergent
with some of which we might align ourselves and with all of which we
must contend.

Our analyses are built upon several assumptions about the relation-
ship between language, power, and subjectivity: (1) a notion of discourse
as a form of material practice operating through a grid of terms and
questions to establish a body of knowledge, define a particular subject,
and construct particular relationships between those participating in the
discourse and various social institutions and systems of power; (2) the
notion that individual subjectivity is nonessentialized, emerging out of
a process of conflict and change each time a writer thinks, speaks, reads,
or writes; (3) a view of "education" as constituted by the social, politi-
cal, economic, and cultural structures of a given time as well as constitu-
tive of these structurescontributing to the renewal and transforma-
tion of existing structures; (4) a concept of "hegemony" or "domination"
that recognizes, on the one hand, the constraints which the dominant
social and political forces of a given time and place exert on individual
work, and, on the other, the range of alternative or directly oppositional
politics and culture existing as significant elements in society at any given
time: that is, the belief that the particular social conditions of a given
time and place can exert pressures on an individual to act not only in

14



xiv Introduction

ways that maintain and renew existing ways of distributing and orga-
nizing social power but also to transform those ways; (5) a notion of
human agency as "overdetermined," working for social change but in
circumstances not of one's choosing.' These assumptions lead us repeat-
edly to call attention to issues of difference and power inscribed in on-
going debate on the meaning of such concepts as learning, resolution,
development, self-expression, community, frontier. We do so by draw-
ing on images of negotiation, conflict, struggle, repositioning, and bor-
ders from the work of such feminist, post-colonial, and marginality crit-
ics as bell hooks, Gloria Anzaldila, and Mary Louise Pratt. These latter
terms recur in our arguments, for to us they accentuate what has tradi-
tionally been denied, muffled, or displaced: the operation of power, so-
ciety, and history on individuals, discourse, and institutions.

Two of the central aims of the essays collected here are to understand
all work in basic writing as social and historical, and thus to contest the
objectification of the researcher, research discourse, and the "object" of
research. It is therefore appropriate that an introduction to our own work,
represented by the writing collected here, locate that work in the condi-
tions of its own production and reception. This is not, of course, to pro-
vide the defining narrative for or defense of that writing. Indeed, to do
so would be counter to our own understanding of writing/history as
constitutive rather than reflective. But we offer our account of the intel-
lectual, historical, and institutional conditions of our work to invite in-
terrogation of the politics of our own representations of basic writing.

We see ourselves as part of a generation of compositionists trained in
the late 1980s whose experience of basic writing was shaped by the ca-
nonical reception of certain texts on basic writing in graduate programs
and professional journals. The gap between the official accounts of basic
writing and our day-to-day experience as writing teachers and students
resulted in a dissatisfaction with what we saw as the occlusion of atten-
tion from the social struggle and change involved in the teaching and
learning of basic writing, and representations of the "problems" of basic
writers and basic writing in ways that risked perpetuating their mar-
ginal position in higher education. This furthered our interest in and
desire to contribute to an emerging position in composition and literary
and cultural studies which relocated writing and the teaching of writ-
ing in society and history. By attempting to resituate texts as work per-
formed in specific social and historical contexts, we have hoped to ex-
plore how the study and teaching of writing might proceed in the present
and future. For us, this has involved delineating the parameters setting
and set by the production and reception of canonized texts in Basic Writ-
ingfor example, investigating how and why and to what effect CUNY's

15



Introduction XV

implementation of its SEEK and Open Admissions program during the
1960s and '70s has been constructed as the originating, authoritative cen-
ter of Basic Writing, the site of its "birth."

We come to this project in part as a response to the "lived experi-
ences" of family, friends, and ourselves negotiating cultural dissonance
along lines of ethnicity, race, class, gender, and sex as this gets played
out at the site of institutionalized education. Our interest in basic writ-
ing as an important site for our teaching and scholarship arises from our
understanding of this experience and of the historical role of basic writ-
ing as the only space in English which seriously investigates the chal-
lenges of students whose writing is explicitly marked as "not belong-
ing" to the academy. Simultaneously, this "lived experience" makes it
difficult for us to accept representations of "basic writers" as the "other."
It makes perspectives which foreground the politics of representation
acknowledging issues of power involved in the question of who is speak-
ing for whom, about whom, when, where, and whyboth relevant and
necessary. This in turn makes more apparent the marginalization of such
perspectives in dominant discourse on basic writing.

Our project is also a response to our experience of basic writing as
already institutionalized, however problematically. In our own experi-
ence, we first confronted courses called "Basic Writing" not as "new"
but as an established institutional fact, part of the undergraduate cur-
riculum in courses called "Basic Writing" and "Basic Reading and Writ-
ing" in a wide range of colleges and universities across the nation. In
graduate seminars, we encountered Basic Writing as an object of study
and field of research, with its canonical texts and figures. The construc-
tion of Mina Shaughnessy as an authorizing figure in Basic Writing per-
haps best illustrates the effects of this canonization. The dominant dis-
course of Basic Writing views critiques of the discourse with criticism of
individuals' integrity and character: in the case of Shaughnessy's writ-
ings, with criticism of Shaughnessy. It approaches "history" by attempt-
ing to trace causal influences among events or the "evolution" of ideas
whose "unity" and "origin" supposedly reside in the intentions and in-
tegrity of individual authors like Shaughnessy. In this discourse,
Shaughnessy becomes the originating author of Basic Writing; critiques
of texts associated with her thus become critiques of her. This has the
effect of silencing critique and authorizing the individual figure and those
who can then speak in that figure's name, having "known" her and, by
implication, her "true" intentions.

Our project responds by historicizing the canonizing process that pro-
duces these effects. Rather than recovering originating intentions of an
"author," we investigate the social and historical production, regula-

16



xvi Introduction

tion, and effects of dominant discourse. While our project clearly arises
from different theoretical assumptions, the difference in theoretical as-
sumptions intersects with a difference in institutional and historical po-
sitions. First, it speaks to the historically changing currency of theoreti-
cal assumptions about discourse, identity, and meaning. It speaks as well,
however, to different historical and institutional circumstances. Claims
of access to authorial intentions have simply not been readily available
to those of us studying, teaching, and writing in institutions such as the
University of Pittsburgh and Drake University during the late 1980s and
1990s. Our relationship with Basic Writing is not populated by memo-
ries of having personal contact with the Basic Writing "trailblazers." Simi-
larly, our perspective on the 1960s-1970s inception of basic writing pro-
grams speaks to our position as both institutional and historical "out-
siders" to such movements. This is not to grant greater "authority" to
those who might claim to have "been there," nor greater "objectivity"
for those "outside." Radical differences in the stories told by those who
might make such claims negate the attribution of any such authority to
any such individuals.' But our "distance" from those movements makes
it possible for us to engage in discursive analysis of those movements in
a manner less readily available to those writers who were "part of" them.
Simply put, we respond to a different set of interests and pressures by
virtue of the specific social and historical locations of our work. This is
perhaps most evident in our concern with the resurgence of New Right
attempts at retrenchment and attacks on "political correctness," a con-
cern obviously not available to earlier writers but which motivates our
interest in the strategies of Open Admissions and the academic retrench-
ment of the later 1970s.

We started our careers at institutions interested in exploring the im-
plications of poststructural theory and cultural materialism for the struc-
ture and work of English departments. We have been encouraged in our
work both at the graduate level and as English faculty to challenge dis-
tinctions traditionally maintained between English and other disciplines,
theory and practice, research and teaching, composition, literature, criti-
cism, and creative writing, and between "beginning" and "advanced"
performance. That institutional setting encouraged us to challenge the
distinction between "beginning" and "advanced" writing, aligning us
with the conclusions drawn by teachers in open admissions programs
as they confronted the limitations such distinctions placed on their work
as teachers, as researchers, and as administrators.4 We are the beneficia-
ries of such conclusions, which we encountered not as tentative formu-
lations but as established assumptions informing the programs, theo-
ries, and teaching to which we were introduced.

17



Introduction xvii

Finally, our work is made possible by other, very specific material
circumstances. We speak here not just of matters of time and money in
the form of grants for course release and research support, important
and necessary as these are and as important as we believe it is to ac-
knowledge these bases for intellectual work. We mean as well the free-
dom given us to work with a variety of students and to design our own
courses with appropriate enrollments that make certain kinds of work
with students possible. We mean, also, conditions in which our work in
"composition" receives institutional encouragement and is accorded sta-
tus at least equal to work in other areas of English, while not being viewed
as separate from those areas. In short, our work is made possible and
thus indebted to the institutionalization of basic writing as an academic
field, which we problematize.

The writing of the essays collected here did not follow any simple,
linear narrative of research and report. Rather, while all emerge out of
the assumptions described above, each adopts a somewhat different
angle and focus toward thinking through the problematics of represent-
ing basic writing. We have therefore not arranged these in the chrono-
logical order in which they were either written or first appeared. In-
stead, we present them in two clusters. The first five essays"The 'Birth'
of 'Basic Writing'," "Conflict and Struggle," "Importing Science," "Re-
defining the Legacy of Mina Shaughnessy," and "Mapping Errors and
Expectations"situate Basic Writing in various discursive fields and his-
toric moments to examine the complex material conditions mediating
its production and reception. The first of these situates the emergence of
the discourse of Basic Writing in the context of political and institutional
struggles surrounding the adoption and implementation of CUNY's
Open Admissions policy in the late 1960s and early 1970s. It approaches
some of the key terms dominating Basic Writing's representations of
itself as "new" and on the "frontier," and of students as "new," apoliti-
cal beginners hoping to join mainstream American life, as active re-
sponses to the discourse on open admissions opposing "academic ex-
cellence" to "political activism" and social concerns, and linking aca-
demic unpreparedness with minority identity and political interests.

"Conflict and Struggle" further locates dominant discourse on Basic
Writing among competing ways of representing and addressing the
"needs" of student writers to negotiate with cultural dissonance. It ex-
amines the hegemony of two views of education as acculturation or ac-
commodation in culturally authorized narratives of the experience of
"minority" students. It argues that these operate to dissolve rather than
make productive use of conflict and struggle in the teaching and learn-
ing of writing. Just as "Conflict and Struggle" shows Basic Writing dis-
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course to participate in ongoing debates on education, "Importing Sci-
ence: Neutralizing Basic Writing" shows how research in that dominant
discourse actively participates in an "expressive realism" pervasive
across mainstream composition, literary criticism, education, linguis-
tics, and various other social sciences during the 1970s. It approaches
Basic Writing's success in establishing itself as a legitimate academic
field in terms of its ability to use "science" to promote the "objectivity"
of teaching, research, and writing at an historical period and in class-
rooms where the dominant found issues of diversity and power most
difficult to contain.

"Redefining the Legacy of Mina Shaughnessy: A Critique of the Poli-
tics of Linguistic Innocence" shows how such alignments operate in
Shaughnessy's reading of error to occlude attention to issues of power
and subject positioning in the process of learning to master "correct"
English. "Mapping Errors and Expectations for Basic Writing" identi-
fies the conceptual dilemmas in which Basic Writing discourse has been
trapped through its attempts to understand and justify the teaching of
basic writing by imagining basic writers either as beginners growing
cognitively or as aliens becoming initiated into a specific discourse com-
munity.

In one way or another, all these work to locate basic wriiing in his-
tory: a response to, produced and sustained by, and altering specific
social and historical conditions and thus as never fixed but always pro-
visional and strategic, continually involving individuals in renegotiat-
ing their positions and their work. The remaining pair of essays"Re-
thinking the 'Sociality' of Error: Teaching Editing as Negotiation" and
"Professing Multiculturalism"apply this understanding to the class-
room, specifically to the question of how to present and address "error,"
the issue that, perhaps more than any other, has defined basic writing
for many. Uniting both is an understanding of the work of writing
including deviations from conventions of "correct" Englishas not an
"object" to be consumed but as a practice, with the material writing un-
derstood as notations part of a larger process of production and recep-
tion and thus liable to changing forms of social relationship (see Raymond
Williams, Problems in Materialism and Culture 46-47). In this understand-
ing, "error" represents not a phenomenon located on the page but a ne-
gotiated social power relationship between specific readers and writers.
Contrasting this view with theories that explain error as evidence of
writers' cognitive development or discourse habits, "Rethinking" argues
for a pedagogy highlighting the negotiating process between readers
and writers that produces work as either in "error" or not.
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"Professing Multiculturalism" describes a pedagogy that
problematizes the distinction traditionally maintained between "error"
and "style" in approaches to the writing of "student" and established
authors. It demonstrates how errortraditionally the province of basic
writing alone and proof that it deserves its "low status"represents a
zone for the reconfiguring of discursive practices traditionally compart-
mentalized by definitions of low and high ranking literature, literary
criticism, creative writing, "advanced composition," and "basic writ-

"Some Afterwords" offers our sense of ongoing debates now domi-
nant in discourse on basic writing and in composition studies generally:
the possibility of eliminating basic writing through "mainstreaming" or
other strategies; the relevance of contact zone pedagogies to basic writ-
ing; intersections between basic writers and other writers; the continu-
ing distinction between matters of "style" and matters of "content"; femi-
nist and post-colonial critiques of composition work; and the perduring
textual bias of research in composition. By delineating what we see as
intersections and divergences between our work and such debates, we
hope both to further the location of the work that we have begun in this
Introduction and to suggest directions we and others might take to ad-
dress the specific gaps and strengths we identify in the struggles now
confronting us all.

The pieces in this book are all separately authored, with Min-Zhan
Lu writing chapters 2, 3, 4, and 7, and Bruce Homer chapters 1, 5, 6, and
"Some Afterwords." Rather than reworking these into a unified voice,
in the form of the "we" speaking here, we have chosen to retain the
differences between and among the multiple "I's" appearing in the chap-
ters. We hope to use these disjunctions in the speaking voices to acknowl-
edge two aspects of this collaborative project. First, it is a project span-
ning nine years of extensive discussion between the two authors over
the texts each of us was reading and writing. Drafts and revisions of
each chapter were composed by one of us in response to questions raised
by the other. Moreover, the inception of many of these chapters has arisen
from questions provoked in one of us by reading the other 's work. For
example, Homer 's critique of an earlier version of Lu's essay on "Pro-
fessing Multiculturalism" led Lu toward a further exploration of the
intersection as well as differences between the "contact zone" approach
to error she describes and pedagogies described earlier by Epes, Tricomi,
and Lees. Homer responded to Lu's "Redefining the Legacy of Mina
Shaughnessy" by contextualizing the construction of basic writing as an
academic field M "The 'Birth' of 'Basic Writing. Similarly, in "Profess-



xx Introduction

ing Multiculturalism," Lu places the approach to teaching editing Homer
presents in "Rethinking the 'Sociality' of Error" in the context of
multicultural approaches to style in both literature and composition class-
rooms.

The second aspect of this collaborative project we would highlight is
the fact of differences in the personal, social, and academic conditions
each of us has brought to the project at different moments through the
years. The direction of the project bears traces of the different trajecto-
ries in which the teaching and scholarship of each of us has developed.
This is perhaps most obvious in Homer's use of historical studies of
literacy practices and Lu's use of feminist, post-colonial, and Marxist
criticism. Shifts in the "I" appearing in the chapters by each of us also
bear traces of changes in the vocabularies used and questions raised in
dominant discourse on composition studies and traces of our specific,
varied experiences in teaching. The book thus presents the changing
ways in which we have engaged and re-engaged the issues of the teach-
ing of writing, as the conditions, pressures, and possibilities of our re-
spective academic careers and teaching experiences shift. For example,
Chapter 4, originally a part of Lu's 1989 dissertation, aims at applying
theories of language to a canonical text in the field, while Chapter 7
revisits the field (in 1994) and her dissertation from the perspective of
her experience attempting to develop a "multicultural" pedagogy for
teaching both composition and literature. In "Some Afterwords," writ-
ten in 1996, Homer revisits issues of the politics of pedagogy first ad-
dressed in 1992 in relation to the teaching of editing (Chapter 6) from
the perspectives afforded by subsequent work on authorship and con-
tact zone pedagogies.

We have found these disjunctions in our work and between our con-
cerns and interests a constructive resource. We hope that by leaving these
visible, our project might invite different ways of imagining how we
might follow, respond to, and intervene productively in one another's
work. And we hope the presence of these differences will enable readers
working in a range of sites and conditions to pursue the intersections of
their work with Basic Writing.

21



I Discoursing asic Writing



1 The "Birth" of "Basic Writing"

Bruce Homer

The teaching of basic writing occupies a peculiar position in composi-
tion studies. It is the specialty of some of the leading figures in composi-
tion studies and, simultaneously, the province of teachers and students
placed at the bottom of the academic institutional hierarchy. The emer-
gence of basic writing as an academic field in the early 1970s has been
cited as crucial historically in the development of composition. John
Trimbur, noting that "[m]any of the teaching and research projects we
[composition teachers] now take for granted began in the wake of open
admissions and educational opportunity programs in the late sixties and
early seventies," attributes "a number of remarkable innovations in the
study and teaching of writing" to basic writing ("Cultural Studies" 14).
James Slevin identifies the period as the time of Composition's "rise," a
"writing movement" addressing "broad questions about the aims of
education and the shape of various educational institutions" and hav-
ing as its focus "the revitalizing of the teaching of writing" (12). Ira Shor
likewise describes this time as one when teachers faced "a creative and
exciting frontier of cultural democracy" (Critical Teaching 269).

Trimbur, Slevin, and Shor all identify the lessons and insights of teach-
ing from this period in political terms: a "movement" for "cultural de-
mocracy" that explicitly called into question the social and political role
of educational institutions and the politics of representing students, or
prospective students, and their writing in particular ways, e.g., as "liter-
ate" or "illiterate," "college material" or "remedial," "skilled" or "un-
skilled." It is significant, however, that all three writers identify such
lessons and insights as at risk of being lost or forgotten. We need, Trimbur
notes, to "relearn" the insights of open admissions ("Cultural Studies"
14-15). Slevin worries that the training of writing teachers typically does
not include investigation of the history of writing instruction and its
role in socializing those new student populations historically called "re-
medial" (14). Shor offers his own account of teaching in Open Admis-

3
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4 Representing the "Other"

sions "as a means to resist the erasure of memory" (Critical Teaching 269,
my emphasis).

In what follows, I explore why and how such insights of basic writ-
ing got lost to such an extent that they now need to be "relearned," in
order that they not be "re-lost." I analyze a dominant discourse on basic
writing whose meanings and forms are central to such works as Mina
Shaughnessy's Errors and Expectations, the Journal of Basic Writing, the
1987 Sourcebook for Basic Writing Teachers and various bibliographies on
basic writing. I refer to this discourse as Basic Writing to highlight both
its institutional power and its selective representation of the wealth of
practices and projects in teaching basic writing! I argue that Basic Writ-
ing represents a response to another, powerful public discourse on higher
education and students deemed underprepared for college. I map the
formation of that discourse by analyzing the key terms and assump-
tions operating in a range of public debate on open admissions in gen-
eral and Open Admissions at City University of New York (CUNY) in
particular, the institution most closely associated with texts shaping much
of Basic Writing discourse. I argue that public discourse on higher edu-
cation and Open Admissions perpetuates the hegemonic denial of the
location of the academy in material, political, social, and historical con-
texts. The success of Basic Writing in legitimizing the institutional place
of basic writing courses and students cannot be separated from the ways
in which it works within the framework of public discourse on higher
education and Open Admissions, particularly its silence about the con-
crete material, political, institutional, social, and historical realities con-
fronting basic writing teachers, students, and courses. The costs of such
a strategy, however, have been the erasure of the sort of critical insights
that first propelled practices and projects in basic writing and the near
permanent institutional marginalization of basic writing courses, teach-
ers, and students.

This exploration should interest not just basic writing teachers but all
those involved in the teaching of college writing. Not only has the emer-
gence of Basic Writing contributed significantly to the field of Composi-
tion; basic writing students, teachers, and courses represent
Composition's problems of academic institutional status "writ large."
Like college composition generally, basic writing has long been perceived
as marginal at best: expendable, temporary, properly the responsibility
of the high schools and therefore a "drain" on English departments spe-
cifically and colleges and universities in general. Basic Writing's efforts
to work within and against public discourse on higher education dra-
matically highlight the ideological and material constraints with which
all teaching of "entry-level" students has had to contend. Examining

,24



The "Birth" of "Basic Writing" 5

the strategic value and limitations of Basic Writing's response to these
constraints suggests how and why college composition as a whole has,
as Susan Miller puts it, "formed a continuing special circumstance" (81).

Addressing two possible objections to my focus may help clarify my
project. It can be and has been argued that the teaching of basic writing
(and the practice of open admissions) long pre-dates the term Basic Writ-
ing, discourse associated with that term, and CUNY's late-1960s-1970s
Open Admissions policy. While this is true, my interest is in exploring
how and why Basic Writing discourse has effectively eclipsed that other
extensive, fluid, and heterogeneous work. My aim is to contest such a
displacement by highlighting the conditions leading to it. Second, and
relatedly, some may object that restricting my focus to dominant Basic
Writing discourse as I have defined it perpetuates the silencing of alter-
native discourses and practices that transgress institutional boundaries
of the discipline of basic writing, or any composition, teaching, whether
by those involved in basic writing or by others, at CUNY or elsewhere.
Patricia Laurence, for example, argues that exclusive attention to Mina
Shaughnessy's published writings ignores what once had to be "sub-
merged," noting that "in reading Errors and Expectations, we are reading
only part of a conversation in an urban educational institution at a cer-
tain historical moment" and we need to read it with such "historical
specificity" in mind, as one of a plurality of voices ("Vanishing Site" 22,
27). While I would echo Laurence's subsequent call for the emergence of
stories once submerged, her criticism begs the question of how and why
some stories have been kept "submerged" while others have been el-
evated. We need to know how and why this has happened, and with
what consequences for teachers' understanding and practice as "profes-
sionals" in their work as teachers, scholars, administrators. Examining
this process thus should serve not to repress other stories but to make
their emergence more likely, to provoke, if you will, their recovery, cir-
culation, and application.

Many of the texts constituting Basic Writing discourse were produced
in response to a dominant public discourse on open admissions pro-
grams, and particularly Open Admissions at CUNY. On July 9, 1969, the
New York City Board of Higher Education adopted a policy of open
admissions for the senior and community colleges making up the City
University of New York system. Noting in its statement the significant
attention given the "Five Demands" made by the Black and Puerto Rican
Student Community of City College (originally known as the Commit-
tee of Ten), the Board charged the chancellor of CUNY with producing
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the plan for open admissions by October 1969, four months later (Board
of Higher Education). In adopting this policy, the Board shortened by
five years a "Master Plan" it had adopted in 1964. That Master plan had
called for implementing a policy by 1975 that would grant admission to
CUNY to all New York City high school graduates.

Participants in the heated debate that followed read the Board's deci-
sion as a response to specific political, budgetary, and labor pressures.
For example, links were made between the decision and the violent con-
frontations that accompanied various stages of the negotiations of the
"Five Demands," including the burning of one of the City College build-
ings and the closing of the College, the most senior and arguably the
most illustrious college of the CUNY system (see "CUNY Opening
Doors," Hamalian and Hatch). These events at City College were lik-
ened by some to student takeovers at nearby Columbia University and
to other campus disturbances to reinforce a sense that the Open Admis-
sions policy represented an appeasement of student militants, black and
Puerto Rican students, and political agendas of the student Left (see
Heller 12, 24; Wagner, chapter 3). The Board's decision was also linked
to city politics. For example, Mayor Lindsay's endorsement of the policy
during that year's New York City mayoral election was widely seen as
an attempt to buy votes (see "New Era for CUNY").

The fact that the Board in its statement did not address in explicit
terms the budgetary demands implied by its policy decision also led to
the view that the policy was an indirect means of applying pressure on
both New York City and New York State to increase CUNY's budget
allocation (see Right 16). It was estimated that implementing the Open
Admissions policy would cost a minimum increase the first year of $35.5
million ("Record Budget"). And it was unclear how CUNY was to find
the additional space and faculty to meet the needs of the estimated four-
teen thousand additional students ("City U. Gets Braced," "City U. in a
Crusher"), especially how it was to find them within a year. Yet at the
time of the Board's statement, the state allocation for the CUNY budget
was in doubt. Albert Bowker, then Chancellor of CUNY, had gone so far
as to threaten that there would be no 1969 freshman class at CUNY be-
cause of budget restrictions (Right 11).

The Board's decision also brought back the contention between the
CUNY administration and the faculty union over increased workloads
and strains on the physical plant, expected to be exacerbated by imple-
mentation of open admissions (see Barasch 15). During a heated union
election a year prior to the Board's policy, the CUNY chancellor, in urg-
ing faculty not to vote for union representation, had identified the move-
ment toward collective bargaining with resistance to "flexibility, both
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The "Birth" of "Basic Writing" 7

for the buildup of the institution with many new programs and for the
rapid expansion of the enrollment of disadvantaged minorities" (quoted
in Polishook 379-80). Faculty interests were thus pitted against not the
administration per se but such programs, suggesting that those inter-
ests would be in competition with such programs for limited resources.

Debate on CUNY's Open Admissions policy was decidedly not con-
fined to educational administrators or those in city or state government,
nor did the debate cease after 1970, when open admissions was put into
place. Not only faculty but college and high school students, parents,
civic organizations, and the media were active participants. In addition,
because of CUNY's reputation, media coverage of the student unrest
preceding the policy, and the sheer size of the CUNY system (the third
largest system in the United States), the policy attracted national atten-
tion. Further, the association of the policy with campus violence, and
the magnitude of the demands which the implementation of the policy
made on existing faculty and facilities, had the effect of polarizing the
debate on open admissions so that certain issues and terms became codes
for one's position on Open Admissions (see Quinn and Kriegel 413, 414;
Kaplan 219; Lyons 1980, 6-7; Resnik 4-5). For example, because those
opposed to Open Admissions frequently raised questions about the
material demands of implementing the policywho was going to pay,
how much, where would the many new classes be held, who would
teach themany mention of such questions came to be recognized as
signalling opposition to Open Admissions and was dismissed out of
hand by those favoring the policy. For such questions called attention to
what the policy denied or attempted to silence.

This polarization of debate on Open Admissions operated on a series
of binaries that was part of a dominant discourse on education. We can
see in that discourse a binary opposing student activism to academic
excellence, identifying the former with lack of academic preparation and
the latter with political disinterestedness. This is most evident in the
charges against Open Admissions, but it also pervades the discourse as
a whole. In the debate, it was charged that the policy rewarded student
violence and politicized the curriculum, and that the policy would dis-
place intellectually deserving students with the undeserving. Operat-
ing from the assumption of both limited resources and CUNY's educa-
tional integrity prior to Open Admissions, it was charged that the policy
was a "quota" system discriminating against students not black or Puerto
Rican by depriving the former of the limited commodity of higher edu-
cation. On the assumption that the new students could only take from,
rather than contribute to, CUNY's academic excellence, it was also
charged that as a "quota" system, Open Admissions would dilute stan-
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dards by letting in all those "unqualified" blacks and Puerto Ricans and
so undermine the value of the college degree. Finally, it was charged
that the policy made unrealistic demands on CUNY's budget and physi-
cal and staff resources.

The discourse in which such charges participate posits two types of
students set in opposition to one another: the open admissions students,
associated with politics and minority activism, and the ideal college stu-
dents, assumed to be interested in and capable of pursuing academic
excellence because they were not distracted by political interests (see
also Chapter 5). This binary made invisible to most commentators those
students who crossed the division between political activism and aca-
demic excellence: those students who had met traditional admissions
requirements but who were politically active. Indeed, public images of
student activists regularly neglected the strong correlation of campus
activism with highly selective admission standards (Keniston 120). In-
stead, student activism was regularly equated with illiteracy, as when
Lewis Mayhew claimed that

[d]issenting youth ... all too frequently seem unable to say or write
a simple English sentence. Their concerns are expressed . . . in a . . .

flow of words possessing neither syntax nor grammatical effective-
ness. . . . So pronounced are these linguistic failures that I have be-
gun to wonder whether or not they might represent a pathology
worthy of some further study. (92-93)

In a widely publicized speech, Vice President Agnew went so far as to
claim that the intrusion into universities of "those unqualified for the
traditional [university] curriculum" was "a major cause of campus . . .

unrest" (110). Such lumping of student activism with lack of academic
preparation is further exemplified by frequent references to such stu-
dents as the "new barbarians," a phrase which links difference in lan-
guage (as in "barbarism") with a threat to (the speaker 's own) civiliza-
tion.

A second, related myth marked open admissions students not only
as being activists but as belonging to ethnic minorities. For example, all
evidence showed that the majority of CUNY Open Admissions students
were whites of working-class background ("Report Card" 27; "Open
Enrollment' Results Told"; "CUNY Open-Admissions Plan Found Ben-
efiting Whites Most"; "Open Admission Found of Benefit to Whites,
Too"). Yet the myth persisted in popular media discourse that all or most
Open Admissions students at CUNY were black or Puerto Rican (Healy,
"New Problems"; Kaplan 220; Stoerker 1014; "Open Admissions,"
WNBC-TV). Unimaginable within the framework of the binary were
the so-called "white ethnics": working-class whites, many of them at
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The "Birth" of "Basic Writing" 9

CUNY of Italian or Irish Catholic background, and many of them con-
servative in their political views. While the invisibility of white work-
ing-class ethnics speaks most obviously to the pervasive blindness of
Americans to social class and the persistence of racism, it speaks also
and more specifically to the constitutive power within and outside the
academy of the public discourse linking minority students, political ac-
tivism, and academic underpreparedness, a power which made invis-
ible students who might lack both academic preparation and interest in
political activism.

These myths pervaded the general debate on open admissions from
both the left and right. For example, a statement of 18 June 1969 by what
came to be known as the "Weathermen" splinter of the SDS asserted,
"any kind of more open admissions means . . . there are more militant
blacks and browns making more and more fundamental demands on
the schools" ("You Don't Need" 282). A Washington Post editorial by con-
servatives Rowland Evans and Robert Novak critiquing open admis-
sions as the "Wrecking of a College" identifies open admissions stu-
dents strictly as Negro or Puerto Rican youth. William F. Buckley Jr.,
drawing heavily on writings from City College English professor
Geoffrey Wagner, seconded the Weathermen's perception that the bulk
of the CUNY Open Admissions students were militant, describing them
as an "ignorant and disruptive" contingent ("Among the Illiterate"). This
association of Open Admissions with the student New Left extended to
teachers of Open Admission students. Wagner himself described teach-
ers favoring open admissions as "the balding, bearded guerrillas with
tenure" (136), and he accused Basic Writing teachers of "teaching more
about the injustices of society outside the classroom than the use of punc-
tuation within it" (143).

The binary opposing academic pursuits to the pursuit of social goals
was maintained not only by those who opposed Open Admissions but
those making the case for it. For example, a 1973 editorial in Change
magazine presenting "The Case for Open Admissions" asserts that the
American university "was once more thoroughly dedicated than it can
be now to the academic pursuit of knowledge. The challenge of open
admissions . . . is to find an equivalent more suitable to the needs of its
students and of the city of New York" ("Case" 10). The editorial thus
maintains the distinction between "academic" and other pursuits even
as it argues for the others toward which it claims open admissions works.
The more general debate over the "politicization" of the university en-
capsulated this distinction. Conservatives warned against the increas-
ing politicization of the university. As Miro Todorovich put it in explain-
ing actions of the faculty group University Centers for Rational Alterna-
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tives, "All available energies had to be mobilized in support of . . . the
survival of a nonpoliticized, free, and open-minded university" defended
against the "forcible incursions of the 'barbarians of virtue' into the acad-
emy" (xivxv). Those on the left retorted that the university had already
been politicized, albeit with the politics of liberalism. For example, in a
1966 SDS position paper explaining the purpose of working toward
university reform, Carl Davidson, like Todorovich, warns of an inva-
sionnot of "barbarians"but of "corporate liberalism," whose "pen-
etration into the campus community is awesome" (42). In either case,
however, at least in the more common arguments, any politicization was
viewed as a taint to be avoided or washed out rather than something
inherent in university activity of which one ought to be aware.

Arguments for open admissions claimed to resolve these opposed
goals by accommodating all. That is, they claimed to maintain the role
of the university in preserving and reproducing "academic excellence"
but to add to that a different role for the university accommodating a
different kind of student. Such arguments thus maintained the terms of
the binary while offering a narrative of resolution. The New York City
Board of Higher Education's July 9, 1969, policy statement on Open
Admissions itself enunciates the key terms dominating discourse on
Open Admissions:

The issues with which the Board was confronted transcended the
immediate concerns of City College, and in fact the University it-
self. They are the basic issues of our City and of our society. In deal-
ing with these issues, the Board was faced with the necessity of re-
examining our programs and structures so as to meet legitimate
needs and aspirations of all the City's youth, while at the same time
preserving the educational integrity of the University, without which
we would be perpetrating a cruel hoax upon all those who desire
and deserve a higher education of true excellence. We believe that
the actions we are directing meet both of these requirements. . . .

(a) [The plan] shall offer admission to some University program to
all high school graduates of the City.

(b) It shall provide for remedial and other supportive services for
all students requiring them.

(c) It shall maintain and enhance the standards of academic excel-
lence of the colleges of the University.

(d) It shall result in the ethnic integration of the colleges.
(e) It shall provide for mobility for students between various pro-

grams and units of the University.
(f) It shall assure that all students who would have been admitted

to specific community or senior colleges under the admissions
criteria which we [the Board] have used in the past shall still be
so admitted. In increasing educational opportunity for all, at-
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The "Birth" of "Basic Writing" 11

tention shall also be paid to retaining the opportunities for stu-
dents now eligible under present Board policies and practices.
(3-4)

Most remarkable is how the Board's statement either explicitly or im-
plicitly opposes ethnic integration to academic excellence, the academi-
cally prepared and those needing remediation (presumed to be students
hitherto restricted from CUNY), the sociopolitical interests of the "City
and society" and academic interests (represented, for example, by the
reference to "the immediate concerns of City College"). In the Board
statement, the goal of "preserving the educational integrity of the Uni-
versity" is set off as distinct from and in competition with the goals of
meeting "the legitimate needs and aspirations of all the City's youth"
and achieving "the ethnic integration of the colleges." The issues with
which the Board has wrestled are described not as those of the Univer-
sity but ones which "transcend" it. If only by implication, Open Admis-
sions is assumed to threaten the educational integrity of the University,
whether or not such a risk is justified by political exigencies.

This set of assumed oppositions becomes more evident if we imagine
alternative ways the Board could have framed the issues. For example,
the Board could have justified re-examining its programs and structures
and admitting the new students as a means by which to achieve "educa-
tional integrity" rather than presenting the admission of the new stu-
dents as something threatening that integrity. That the University should
"provide for remedial and other supportive services for all students re-
quiring them," as the Board advises in its statement on Open Admis-
sions, could be taken as a policy directive appropriate to any school re-
gardless of its admissions policy rather than one made necessary strictly
by a policy of open admissions, and it could be described as one integral
to rather than distinct from maintaining and enhancing academic excel-
lence. Issues of social justice could be presented as co-terminous with
rather than as distinct from and potentially a threat to the academy and
its "educational integrity." But the Board statement instead works to
represent prior practices and students admitted under earlier admis-
sions pblicies as normal, possessing educational integrity and academic
excellence, and to represent those students to be newly admitted as a
threat to these. The university would add to its roles that of "change
agent," but the change was to be enacted on neither the definition of the
university's integrity as it had existed in the past nor on society but on
the new students.

In keeping with this argument, students to be admitted were cast in
the role of those desiring not to overthrow society but to join and be-
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come more productive members of it. In CUNY Chancellor Robert
Kibbee's 1971 testimony to the New York State joint legislative commit-
tee on higher education, Kibbee distinguished even protesters at CUNY
in this way. Observing that in 1969 on some American campuses the
"prime target may have been the war, racism, the system," he claimed,
"Here at City University, the focal point of protest was admission to the
system" (4, my emphasis). As a Change editorial put it, the purpose of
open admissions was "to give the poor and working-class people of New
York City a chance to get into the mainstream of the city's economic life.
It is to qualify them for jobs that are more than marginal to the vitality of
the cityto give them some purchase on what is called the American
dream" ("Case" 9). Then vice-chancellor Timothy Healy put the case
more negatively. Noting the steady decrease in the number of manufac-
turing jobs in the city, he predicted a vast increase in the number of poor
"without a significant increase in our pools of educated men and women"
("Will Everyman"). But CUNY's Open Admissions, he argued, can serve
"as poverty interrupter for New York," and in so doing "short circuit
the terrible rhythm of disappointment and rage . . . [of] inner-city youth
. . . that can create a new race of barbarians" ("Will Everyman"). That is,
Open Admissions, by training people for service industry jobs, was rep-
resented as a measure preventing the poor from becoming barbarians
rather than an appeasement of already existing barbarians. But in either
case, the social change was to be enacted not on the "mainstream of the
city's economic life," possibly the source of city residents' "terrible
rhythm of disappointment and rage," but on the residents themselves.

In keeping with the emphasis on higher education as a means of
changing students into more "productive" workers, stories promoting
the "success" of Open Admissions took the form of "before-after" por-
traits, usually of students whose education at CUNY promised to help
them secure employment in service sector work. CUNY press releases
of 18 September 1970 highlighted the stories of new students whose high
school experience hadn't marked them as "college" material but who
had enrolled at CUNY under Open Admissions and aspired to careers
in business and civil service ("News: Open Admissions"). Subsequent
press releases on CUNY graduates who had entered CUNY under Open
Admissions compared the students' high school grade records with their
college grade point averages, showing significant change in their aca-
demic performance from high school to college. As a result of their col-
lege education, the releases emphasized, the students were now pre-
pared for work in teaching, medical records administration, and "such
diverse fields as accounting, data processing, physical therapy, psychi-
atric social work, social welfare and speech pathology" ("News from
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Hunter College"; "Brooklyn College Graduates," 6 June 1974; "Open
Admissions," WNBC-TV). In place of the image of Open Admissions
students as militant activists, the students were portrayed as well-ad-
justed and well-placed citizens, modern day Horatio Algers, in such sto-
ries as "Hard Work Pays Off" and "Lad Finds Open Way to Degree."
CUNY's identification of the goal of social "service" as one additional to
its goal of preserving academic excellence maintained a hierarchy be-
tween the goals that privileged the latter while placing it in opposition
to but not in competition with the former. Such arguments rendered
Open Admissions vulnerable to attack from conservatives like Evans
and Novak, who acknowledged that Open Admissions might be effec-
tive in "taking slum youth off the street" but doubted that this result
merited the financial cost and the "high price of drastically lowered aca-
demic standards." In short, the strategy of accommodation rendered
Open Admissions vulnerable by representing it as additional to and a
potential drain on programs assumed to be integral to the university
and its "standards." Those adopting this strategy were thus necessarily
circumspect regarding financial costs of open admissions programs, con-
flicts among and between those programs and students and other pro-
grams and students, and any political interests motivating such pro-
grams, their students, and their teachers.

[I]t is not . . . political stances which determine people's stances on
things academic, but their positions in the academic field which in-
form the stances that they adopt on political issues in general as
well as on academic problems.

Pierre Bourdieu, Homo Academicus xviixviii.

The writings of CUNY basic writing teachers and of Mina Shaughnessy
in particular have been perceived as crucial in constituting Basic Writ-
ing discourse. Shaughnessy is credited with christening the field with
the term "Basic Writing" and with founding its flagship academic pub-
lication, the Journal of Basic Writing (Gray; Kasden 4; Moran and Jacobi
2; Bartholomae, "Writing" n. 3). Her book Errors and Expectations has
been described without irony as the "gospel" of basic writing (Horning)
and as having "almost on its own established basic writing as an impor-
tant subfield within composition" (Faigley, Fragments 61). If one's posi-
tion in the academic field informs the stances one adopts on political
issues in general as well as on academic problems, as Bourdieu sug-
gests, then these teachers' representations of basic writing students, pro-
grams, and pedagogies need to be understood in part by the knowledge
that the positions they occupied were institutionally marginal and highly
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vulnerable: their academic status and political motives were in ques-
tion, many lacked job security, and they taught students whose own
political leanings were also questioned, whose worthiness for college
admission was constantly challenged, and whose demands on institu-
tional resources were constantly lamented and scrutinized. That posi-
tioning both required that they contend, and shaped how they contended,
with terms of the public discourse prevailing in debate on the educa-
tional rights and capacities of their students.

As I've shown above, the larger public discourse on open admissions
most commonly described open admissions students as "barbarians":
outsiders by virtue of their racial and /or ethnic identity and illiteracy
who threatened the universityWestern civilization's palace of ratio-
nalitywhether by their mere physical presence and demands, with
"politicization," and/or simply by virtue of lacking the qualifications
for university work. In response, while Basic Writing discourse accepted
the identification of basic writers as "outsiders," it characterized them
as nonthreatening, apolitical, would-be immigrants. Specifically, it rep-
resented them as beginners and / or foreigners seeking and able to join
the American mainstream. For example, Sarah D'Eloia, in defending
"Teaching Standard Written English," the first essay appearing in the
first issue of the Journal of Basic Writing, argues that the decision of "most
students, including those at City College . . . to enter college and their
perseverance in pursuing their degrees indicate a desire to participate
in mainstream American culture" (9). Shaughnessy describes Basic Writ-
ing students at CUNY in similar terms, claiming these students "were in
college now for one reason: that their lives might be better than their
parents', that the lives of their children might be better than theirs so far
had been," and explaining that "BW students write the way they do, not
because they are slow or non-verbal, indifferent to or incapable of aca-
demic excellence, but because they are beginners and must, like all be-
ginners, learn by making mistakes" (Errors 3, 5). Such images argued for
allowing these students in college by emphasizing their educability, de-
fining both them and their difficulties with writing as not fixed but in
process, and aligning them with the mainstream and its standards in their
aspirations if not their current status (Homer, "Mapping" 31-32). It thus
"naturalized" them both in a cognitive developmental and a civic sense,
locating them at a particular stage in a natural sequence of learning and
attributing to them the aspiration to join with rather than disrupt main-
stream American society.

At the same time, these images consolidated the dominance of the
binary of political activism and academic excellence by sidestepping the
specific circumstances in which the students found themselves: most
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obviously, the historical circumstances leading to their arrival in
schoolsthe disruptions and negotiations leading to CUNY Open Ad-
missions in the first placeand more generally, the economic, social,
political, and technological pressures in the United States making col-
lege education a requirement for social, economic, and political survival.
Moreover, they left unchallenged particular notions of "academic excel-
lence" and how the achievement of such excellence by basic writing stu-
dents and their teachers was ultimately to be measured.

A City College English Department memorandum by Shaughnessy
illustrates the institutional pressures confronting teachers concerned to
defend the education of such students:

There is . . . a kind of pressure . . . to do a quick job of producing
correct writing since the ability to manage Standard English is often
unconsciously accepted as proof of educability, and this kind of proof
is sought after by most critics and some well-wishers of open ad-
missions.

Yet our sense of our students and of the skill we are trying to
teach suggests that our priorities ought to be different from those
pressed upon us by the exigencies of open admissions... . Students
and teachers both feel the urgency, but they are caught in a kind of
Catch-22 dilemmaa student can use up so much energy master-
ing the mechanics of English that he misses the chance of learning
how to write, but if he doesn't master the mechanics he may not
have a chance to write. . . .

I am not of course suggesting that it is debasing education to
help a student gain control of Standard English and the mechanics
of formal writing but only that the effort to do this quickly can lead
to doing it exclusively, which means almost inevitably the neglect,
at a crucial point, of the deeper and ultimately more important re-
sources our students bring to the classroom.

I see no immediate solution to this problem of conflicting
goals. . . . Meanwhile . . . it seems to me we must try to develop
more efficient and challenging ways of teaching grammar and me-
chanics so that we have some time left over to do something else.
("Basic Writing and Open Admissions" 3-4, 5)

The memo highlights a tension between the "conflicting goals" of what
teachers perceive as ideal for their students and what the institution
demands. While it rejects the idea that "the ability to manage Standard
English" constitutes "proof of educability" and stresses "the deeper and
ultimately more important resources our students bring to the class-
room," it accepts that, at the moment, the goal of meeting such debased
"proof" must take precedence over the goal of attending to those other
resources, or else the students will lose any chance of learning how to
writethey will no longer be admitted to class.
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The devotion of the first issue of the Journal of Basic Writing to the
subject of "Error" speaks to the effect of these pressures on Shaughnessy
and the contributors to that issue, all of them, significantly, Shaughnessy's
colleagues at City College. In that and subsequent work, the conflict
between the demand to "develop more efficient and challenging ways
of teaching grammar and mechanics" and to acknowledge and draw on
the resources students bring to the classroom is resolved by exploring
how those same "resources" can inform the mastering of standard En-
glish. The power of Errors and Expectations can be attributed to just such
a resolution: showing how students' errors in many ways result from
those resources and thus speak not to their illiteracy but their educabil-
ity. At the same time, the strategy of such a resolution operates within
the dominant conceptual framework on education positing the ability
to be educated as a cognitive rather than political matter, and it accepts,
in however qualified a manner, traditional definitions of that educabil-
ity. The focus resulting from such a strategy is on pedagogical technique,
the designing of "more efficient and challenging ways of teaching gram-
mar and mechanics" rather than on questioning the legitimacy of such
measures of educability or the possibility of political resistance to their
imposition. The Catch-22 within which such a strategy participates is
that those measures continue unabated, and thus, as Shaughnessy pre-
dicts in her memo, "the effort to [teach students to produce 'correct'
writing] quickly" not only can but does in fact all too often "lead to
doing it exclusively" A 1986 survey of Basic Writing courses cites a
teacher complaint that largely echoes Shaughnessy's quoted above:

The problem . . . is that surface amenities are given far more atten-
tion than the actual writing process. For example, the departmental
syllabus is directed towards the error count for comma splices, mis-
use of semicolons, and the like. (quoted in Gould and Heyda 18)

Just as Basic Writing discourse defined basic writers as beginners, it
defined the enterprise of teaching basic writing as new, "frontier terri-
tory," "unmapped" (Errors and Expectations 4) and the teachers as "pio-
neers" of a "new profession." Such definitions helped legitimize Basic
Writing in several ways. First, the enterprise of Basic Writing was aligned
with a depoliticized conception of educational practices and goals. The
frontier imagery invoked was utopian, a purely intellectual rather than
political space. In contrast to the American frontier experience, on this
frontier no natives were displaced or herded into special reservations,
no territory was conquered from others, and people's appearance on
the scene was compelled by no obvious social, political, economic, or
historical force (see Horner, "Mapping"). Rather, teachers ventured into
uninhabited territory as so many pedagogical Eves and Adams, pursu-
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ing a mysterious, divinely ordained destiny. Introducing a list of "Sug-
gested Readings" for teachers, Shaughnessy claimed in Errors and Ex-
pectations that each title "offers a place to begin in a field where almost
everything remains to be done" (298). The introduction to the first issue
of the Journal of Basic Writing (1975) characterized the aims of the journal
as beginning a "new discussion about teaching writing," a discussion
which the journal's editors hoped would enlarge the experience of what
it labeled "a new profession" (Shaughnessy, Introduction 3, 4). The pur-
ported "newness" of the dominant discourse, its subject, and its practi-
tioners had the further advantage of defining both the teachers and the
problems they addressed as "new." For, cast as frontier pioneers, Basic
Writing teachers could be granted both credibility as "professionals"
and leeway to experiment with what practices might "work" and even
with those that might not "work" while exploring a "pedagogical West"
that, as new, poached on no one's turf. In so doing, teachers aligned
themselves to CUNY administration arguments which emphasized the
magnitude of the numbers of "new" students Open Admissions prom-
ised to bring into the mainstream to explain away particular blunders.
Regarding CUNY's Open Admissions program as a whole, for example,
CUNY Vice Chancellor Healy had announced, "We're going to get more
and bigger results and make more and bigger mistakesbecause we're
moving faster and farther than anyone else" (quoted in "Open Admis-
sions: American Dream or Disaster?" 66).

While defining the field of basic writing as a "new frontier" has had,
as I have argued, strategic uses, it is nonetheless worth recalling warn-
ings about frontiers. Shor accepts designating college as the site of a
"new frontier" but reminds us that a frontier "gets developed by settlers
who use tools and ideas from old sectors of society. Their material and
ideological resources create the character of what emerges.. . . The same
forces which propel development also limit it" (Critical Teaching 14).
Shaughnessy similarly warns teachers heading to the "pedagogical West"
that they "are certain to be carrying many things . . . that will clog their
journey as they get further on" (Errors 4). These warnings point to sev-
eral related blind spots consequent on conceptualizing basic writing, or
indeed any work on the teaching of writing, as new, "frontier" territory:
blindness to history; blindness to the politics of such imagery; blindness
to the politics of the "new" tools that seem closest at hand. Most obvi-
ously, constructing Basic Writing as a "pedagogical West" has prevented
teachers and administrators of basic writing programs from learning
from past endeavors. As critics have begun to point out, the history of
remedial writing instruction, though not labeled "basic writing," began
long before the 1970s (Connors; Lunsford, "Politics"; Rose, "Language").

roil
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Acknowledging the history of remedial writing instruction would not
only enable teachers "not to make the same old mistakes over and over
again" (Lunsford, "Politics" 252); it would enable them to counter dam-
aging representations of their own work and of their students as tempo-
rary, marginal, and therefore easily expendable. The divorce of Basic
Writing from the history of "remedial" writing instruction effected by
its claims to "newness" has prevented teachers from arguing for the his-
torical centrality of their teaching of writing. "New" programs tend to
be viewed as experimental, responses to "crises" by definition "tempo-
rary" and so worthy of only temporary, and limited, funding. And as
"new," they are automatically defined as non-central, add-ons to what
is imagined to be an already integrated system. Defenders of CUNY's
Open Admissions frequently complained that the "experiment" had not
yet been given a chance to succeed. But their language allowed critics to
demand constant evaluation of the program, defined as an "experiment,"
and to challenge its funding to an extent that would be unimaginable
for programs conceived of as "central" or "traditional." In fact, how-
ever, there is a long tradition of "remedial" college writing instruction
in America, however problematic the methods and aims employed, to
which teachers might point in refuting attempts to exclude basic writ-
ing from the academy, to remove its "credit," or to place or keep it on
the periphery. Miller has observed of college composition instruction in
the United States that,

defined as the field around a freshman course, [it] began in a politi-
cal moment that was embedded in ambivalence about how to as-
similate unentitled, newly admitted students in the late nineteenth-
century "new university," which was in turn formed to address its
era's social, economic, and political changes. (79)

By substituting the term "nineteenth-century" with "twentieth-century,"
one could easily say the same of Basic Writing. But talk of Basic Writing
as a "new" field or "frontier" and of students as themselves "new," "be-
ginners," or "foreigners," ignores this tradition. And while such talk
may have secured a place for Basic Writing in the academy, it has also
insured that place securely on the academy's margins, and with a lease
that, if perennial, is also perennially short-term.

More damaging, naturalizing basic writing and basic writing students
by positing them as "new" and "beginning" erases the ties of both to
history and society. Bourdieu, writing of the discourse of geopolitical
borders, notes that

Regionalist discourse is a performative discourse which aims to im-
pose as legitimate a new definition of the frontiers. . . . The act of
categorization, when it manages to achieve recognition or when it
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is exercised by a recognized authority, exercises by itself a certain
power: 'ethnic' or 'regional' categories . . . institute a reality by us-
ing the power of revelation and construction exercised by objectifica-
tion in discourse. (Language 223)

It is thus that, as he puts it earlier, "The frontier . . . produces cultural
difference as much as it is produced by it" (Language 222). Defining Ba-
sic Writing as frontier territory effectively constructs the differences be-
tween those students labeled Basic Writers and those not, establishing
the legitimacy of the distinction. As Bartholomae has described the situ-
ation,

As a profession, we have defined basic writing .. . by looking at the
writing that emerges in basic writing courses. We begin, that is, with
what we have been given, and our definition is predetermined by a
prior distinction, by a reflex action to sort students into two groups
(groups that look "natural" or "right").... We know who basic writ-
ers are, in other words, because they are the students in classes we
label "Basic Writing." ("Writing on the Margins" 67)

Such categorizing, stripped of its politics, ends up instituting "Basic
Writing" as an objective reality rather than a set of social practices. Rather
than describing basic writers and basic writing in historical, social, and
political terms, the binary of academic /political is maintained, so that
statements about basic writing are presented as objective, scientific truths
descriptive of facts about who the Basic Writersthis new breed of stu-
dentare, what they need, what works for them and what doesn't. As
the dominated members of the dominant, teachers can use such repre-
sentations to negotiate their own interests and those of their students, as
I have shown above, establishing by traditional measures of academic
worth a legitimized place for basic writing and basic writers in the acad-
emy. But this "objectification" of basic writing also masks the role of
basic writing instruction in the larger ongoing social, economic, and
political drama of history. Though in one sense that drama can seem
sufficiently removed from the immediate demands of the classroom to
be safely ignored, in fact its force inevitably mediates the values, beliefs,
and actions of students and teachers in the classroom, the location and
conditions of that classroom, and the aims and performance of all con-
cerned with the course, day by day, year by year. Recovering the "prac-
tical" operation of that force in our teaching would be a start toward
theorizing our practice and practicing our theory, locating both in soci-
ety and history.

Such a recovery would counter the alliance of much Basic Writing
discourse with the ideology of equal opportunity, an ideology behind
Open Admissions itself. That ideology has long been subject to dispute

3 9



20 Representing the "Other"

(Karabel 42-43; Shor, Critical Teaching xxiixxiii, 2; Stuckey; Fox, "Stan-
dards" 41-43). But less obviously, that ideology has tended to equate
the work of basic writing, like the work of composition teaching gener-
ally, with the provision of skills (to ensure equal opportunity). The seem-
ing innocuousness of that equation stems from its denial of social and
political oppression, substituting the provision of politically innocent
"skills" for political means of fighting such oppression and thus renam-
ing oppression as cognitive lack. Though such a substitution may ren-
der composition teaching more politically palatable to some, it has also
contributed significantly to the marginal position of composition in the
academy and so to the material impoverishment of composition pro-
grams. Mike Rose has shown how the identification of the teaching of
"remedial" writing with skills acquisition has led to its marginalization
in the academy. But ignoring the ideology and the social and political
forces underlying that marginalization has prevented teachers from
doing more than decrying it, as in Barbara Kaplan's lament, in a 1972
critique of CUNY's implementation of Open Admissions, that, "skill
development work has not been treated with the respect it deserves"
(217).

Aligned to the depiction of the work of basic writing as provision of
"skills" is the "practical" bent of much Basic Writing discourse. The Jour-
nal of Basic Writing has for a number of years included a warning in its
"Call for Articles" that the editors "seek manuscripts that are .. . clearly
related to practice." Shaughnessy has described the literature in basic
writing as "a miscellany of articles on what has been working, or ap-
pears to the teacher to have been working, in a variety of places with a
variety of teachers and pedagogies" ("Basic Writing" 147). Shor has noted
that in response to the "pedagogical confusion" resulting from "the per-
manence of mass higher education," there has appeared "a prodigious
number of publications . . . spew[ing] forth no end of tonics and cure-
alls for bewildered teachers" (Critical Teaching 19).

What makes this "practical" bent problematic is what it excludes or
discourages from consideration in pursuit of its "practical" results.
Raymond Williams, writing on the term "realistic," observes that it of-
ten

shares the implicit impatience of one sense of practical. 'Let's be re-
alistic' probably more often means 'let us accept the limits of this
situation' (limits meaning hard facts, often of power or money in their
existing and established forms). (Keywords 217-18)

The "practical" bent in much Basic Writing discourse accepts the "limits
of this situation" in two ways. First, and this seems to have earned it the
most criticism, is its neglect of the whys and wherefores of work in basic
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writing. Stephen North observes that Practitioner inquiry is fundamen-
tally "reactive: The Practitioner needs to decide what to do as a means
to an end determined by someone or something else . . . imposed from
outside, beyond the bounds of [teachers] immediate relationship with
the students" (37). Like the articles Shaughnessy describes as concen-
trating on "what works," practitioners and their lore are "concerned with
what has worked, is working, or might work in teaching, doing, or learn-
ing writing" (North 23). However,

Practitioners need to know what to do, not necessarilyother than
"It works"why. This bedrock pragmatism is habit-forming. Prac-
titioners tend to become habitually impatient with complicated
causal analyses, which in turn makes them relatively cavalier about
such analyses even for the purposes of inquiry. (North 40)

Errors and Expectations fits North's model in documenting Shaughnessy's
need, as North puts it, "to come to grips with this radically new situa-
tion [of Open Admissions at CUNY], and to invent new ways to deal
with it, as well" (North 34). The book does not investigate the policy
itself or how it has been implemented but simply finds ways to deal
with the conditions to which that policy has led. As Shor observes of
Shaughnessy's work, Shaughnessy, while taking a "sympathetic and
inside view" of students' writing, "did not investigate the question of
critical literacy, or writing for what?" (Culture Wars 98). Instead, the pres-
ence of the students and the need for them to work on their writing to
meet conventional expectations of it are taken largely as givens. While
this can serve to secure the place of both basic writing students and
teachers in the university, as Shaughnessy argues in the report cited
above, it also accepts a particularly marginal position for both to occupy
there and a limited notion of the work they are to carry out. That is,
while historically the enterprise of basic writing can be seen as
foregrounding the politics of how and why one teaches, such a potential
is suppressed by the quest for the practical/realistic, which occludes
attention to the political through its focus on "skills."

Second, and less noticed, this "practicality" tends to accept as "giv-
ens" the material constraints on the work of basic writing. I refer here to
such seemingly mundane but nonetheless crucial mattersespecially
at the time of Open Admissions, but also at presentas salaries, job
security, teaching loads, class size, classroom facilities, office space, and
secretarial support; also to the conditions giving rise to the problems
many basic writing students bring with them to college, such as health
problems, lack of child care, inadequate financial aid, and a history of
inadequate schooling; and finally to the immediate historical circum-
stances leading to the presence of these students in college and the on-
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going family, economic, and social pressures on those students. No one
teaching basic writing, at the time of Open Admissions or since, can be
unaware of the power those constraints exert on the work both students
and teachers produce, yet Basic Writing discourse gives little space to
addressing such issues as intrinsic to teaching and learning. In her re-
port cited above, for example, Shaughnessy acknowledges political pres-
sures on basic writing teachers and students, doubts their legitimacy,
and yet turns her attention in the (long) "meanwhile" to accommodat-
ing those pressures, calling for the development of more efficient meth-
ods of teaching grammar and mechanics. When references to material
and institutional constraints do appear in the literature, they generally
do so as asides, presented as seemingly unalterable facts about which
one might joke, curse, or grieve but not as the subject of analysis.

For example, in a 1977 address in which she considers why most En-
glish professors fail to take an interest in teaching writing, Shaughnessy
includes among her reasons the fact that

as writing instruction is presently organized, the teacher who wishes
to give his best energies to the instruction of ill-prepared freshmen
must be ready to forego many of the rewards and privileges of his
profession. He must be resigned to being an altruistic teacher. . . .

[though] the fact remains that systems do not function efficiently on
altruism, and the educational system must offer the same sorts of
prizes and incentives that energize people in other systemsmoney,
time, security, and working conditions that encourage excellence
if the teaching of writing is to advance beyond its present state. ("En-
glish Professor's Malady" 95)

This has the makings of a manifesto on working conditions, and what
follows at least suggests why writing instruction is "presently organized"
as it is in spite of public outcries about the "literacy crisis" (96-97). But
the general effect of the argument is to warn teachers of the conditions
they should expect for the foreseeable future: such teachers "must be
resigned" to working altruistically. It thus echoes a similar call for altru-
ism, mixed jarringly with appeals for better working conditions, sounded
in the conclusion to a 1970 essay by Howard Weiner on "The Instructor
and Open Admissions":

While funds, temporary buildings, counselors, technology, tutors,
and grand plans are essential, the fate of open admissions, perhaps,
will be determined most by the amount of motivation, sensitivity,
and hard work the instructor can muster and the presence of plau-
sibly small classes. (293)

Shaughnessy seems to have had just such ideal instructors in mind
when she refers to her discovery of "the number of [CUNY] teachers
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who, without fanfare or remissions and with heavy class loads, have
been at work developing imaginative new materials for our students"
("Miserable Truth" 114). Shaughnessy says teachers have been "peda-
gogically radicalized" by the experience, through teaching CUNY Open
Admissions students, of "what it means to be an outsider in academia,"
by which she seems to mean that teachers have come to reject the "tradi-
tional meritocratic model of a college" ("Miserable Truth" 114). But that
"radicalization" does not seem to have affected a basic position of ac-
commodation to the conditions about which Shaughnessy complains in
"The Miserable Truth," the conditions of retrenchment at CUNY in the
mid-1970s. Instead, as Shor has noted of this period, "Low-cost basics
made students and teachers settle for less at the very moment they were
in schools running on austerity budgets" (Culture Wars 94).

Such "settling" is pervasive in the literature, from Weiner's 1970 com-
plaint, cited above, to the present. "Survival of the Fittest," an unusual
description of a university writing program from 1976 to 1987 by six
successive directors, illustrates the constancy of that settling (Roskelly).
The essay is a series of mini-histories by each of the program's directors
during a ten-year span, who tell tales of cockroaches, flooding, tiny and
precarious budgets, and budget staffing requiring constant attempts to
economize. Though the program undergoes several changes as direc-
tors attempt to implement different theories about writing instruction,
the "basic," basement conditions under which the program operates (in
an actual basement) prevail throughout the ten years. Hephzibah
Roskelly, one of the directors, notes that one of the difficulties for the
program lay in the fact that all of the directors were graduate students,
requiring them to assume "a strangely subordinate-but-equal role in
administrative politics" (14). But the practice of hiring graduate students
as directors itself both speaks to and ensures the continuing subordi-
nate status of the program. In sometimes humorous fashion, the direc-
tors recount heroic efforts to secure paychecks due them, acquire a mim-
eograph machine, and fight floodwaters. But those efforts operate within
delimitations that virtually guarantee the ongoing necessity of similar
efforts to "survive." The Orwellian "subordinate-but-equal" position of
the graduate student/directors, as one of the "conditioning" delimita-
tions, makes any challenge to those limitations unlikely, since such a
challenge would put the individual director's own position at risk. More-
over, those conditions define the "fittest" sort of graduate student/
teacher / administrator precisely as someone who can learn to endure
under such conditions: someone who "fits."

Those conditions are not restricted to ten years at one university. Nor
are such discursive moves unusual for basic writing teachers and ad-
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ministrators. For example, "The COMP-LAB Project," one of the essays
appearing in the 1979 issue of the Journal of Basic Writing devoted to
"Programs," describes an experimental Basic Writing program at CUNY's
York College that combines particular classroom activities with the use
of autotutorial lab work, the latter focusing mostly on editing problems.
This program, the authors argue, is both "a better way to solve the most
serious writing problems of nontraditional students at CUNY and else-
where" and "a cheaper way to do that in face of shrinking budgets for
remedial courses" (Epes et al. 19). Under a section entitled "Cost-Sav-
ings," they suggest that their course "can save instructional dollars for
our college" and also cut indirect institutional costs by providing "con-
siderable administrative and staffing flexibility, and higher student re-
tention and pass rates" (35, 36). And they end with the hope that through
their program "at least the basics of this skill [of writing in standard
English] may be acquired by many students in one semester, and within
current budgetary restrictions on remedial education" (37).

It's clear from other statements the authors make that one of their
purposes in developing the program has been to protect basic writing
students from unjust derision and, more generally, to argue for the edu-
cability of such students against those who confound "illiteracy with
stupidity" in rejecting the admission of basic writing students into col-
leges (36-37). They thus can be seen as participating in what Shaughnessy
describes as teachers' efforts to "develop more efficient and challenging
ways of teaching grammar and mechanics so that we have some time
left over to do something else" in order that basic writing students can
stay in college (Shaughnessy, "Basic Writing and Open Admissions" 5,
3-4). In short, they are driven by unquestionable and impressive devo-
tion to their students. As their essay also makes clear, they are moti-
vated as well by particular understandings of writing and how it is
learned. In other words, not good intentions alone but also careful
thought informs the program. But they appear to have been placed in a
position whereby their laudable desire to serve students and their pro-
fessional attention to the problems of learning to write are channeled in
a way that effectively reinforces instead of challenging the legitimacy of
the conditions of "shrinking budgets" under which they work. The tech-
nical solution that the program offers to accomplishing work under those
conditions, to the extent that it is "successful," might well be used to
justify the size of those budgets and the shrinking of budgets in excess
of those. Indeed, it seems likely that from some viewpoints the program's
success would be defined only in terms of its cheapness rather than what
it enables teachers to teach and students to learn. In other words, the
required foregrounding of the "practical"what "works" or might
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workunder particular budgetary restrictions pushes into the back-
ground any challenging of those restrictions. "Practicality," while emi-
nently understandable and valuable, enables such conditions to remain
as unalterable "givens" that will require continued "practicality." This
"channeling," it is worth emphasizing again, speaks not to the inten-
tions or the expertise of the authors but to the delimitations of the field
of basic writing within which they and others work, the effect a form of
discursive positioning of teachers in that field can have in shaping the
kind of statements possible and impossible for them to make. Within
dominant discourse on Basic Writing, to challenge budgetary conditions
would require, in effect, re-imagining and recreating one's position as a
teacher of basic writing, and to attempt to do so would be to risk losing
one's positionin all sensesas a "teacher of basic writing" and thus
to be silenced altogether.' For CUNY teachers facing retrenchment, to
challenge such conditions would be to give additional fodder to critics
of Open Admissions who decried its expense and so to anger adminis-
trators ostensibly "supportive" of Basic Writing. Such teachers could
thus be "successful" only to the extent that they could accommodate the
demands of both those who sought results and those who tabulated the
budget.

Material constraints thus come to constitute mere "background" in
Basic Writing. Given the combined oppressiveness and pervasiveness
of such conditions, it might seem surprising how few references to them
one finds in the texts instrumental in establishing Basic Writing as an
academic field. However, given the vulnerability of the teachers' posi-
tion and the dominance of a discourse that defines academic work in
opposition to material and political considerations, their rarity is not
surprising, nor is the fact that, when such references do appear, their
presence is often muffled, set off in conditionals, asides. Indeed, "The
COMP-LAB Project" and "Survival of the Fittest," though they present
such matters primarily as "background," are unlike most essays describ-
ing basic writing programs in mentioning them at all. This tendency
dominates even descriptions of those programs that have enjoyed sub-
stantial institutional support. David Bartholomae and Anthony
Petrosky's description of their program in Facts, Artifacts, and Counterfacts,
for example, mentions the considerable institutional support given their
program only in the Preface.

Though Shaughnessy herself and others speak more critically of such
matters in unpublished work, even in these unpublished documents they
are presented as "background," and a similar acquiescence to them ap-
pears in place of the questioning one might expect. For example, in a
January 1972 intradepartmental report on Open Admissions,
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Shaughnessy, after speculating on the social and economic pressures
affecting basic writing students, concludes:

But for whatever the reasons, here [the students] are . . . and [City
College] is assuming, or learning to assume, their educability at the
college level and moving on to the question of what, given harsh
limits on time, space, and money, can be done to make Open Ad-
mission succeed. ("A Second Report" 6)

Though the "question" she alludes to might suggest an interest in chal-
lenging the "harsh limits on time, space, and money," the possible chal-
lenges are represented as unrealistic:

An experiment that proves, for example, that ten students working
with two exceptional teachers four hours a day can make impres-
sive gains in writing is of no use to us. It tells us what we know but
can't afford. We are working, in Basic Writing, with about 3500 stu-
dents a semester, and our innovations must be feasible on that scale.
(6)

Thus, while the report mentions a variety of conditions imposed by and
on Open Admissions and basic writing, this passage has the effect of
closing discussion of those conditions with its mock suggestion and its
series of assertions of "givens," and it aligns teachers with current insti-
tutional policies: "here they are . . . City College has chosen. . . . given
harsh limits on time, space, and money. . . . We are working." Later in
the report, Shaughnessy warns, "Certainly the greatest peril we face at
City [College] is the limitations not of our students but of our budget,"
but she then ends on this note: "In three semesters, under grotesquely
inadequate conditions, we have begun to see how Open Admissions
might be made to work. The decision of whether it will be allowed to
work now rests with those who have the power to set public priorities"
(7, 8). We can see Shaughnessy walking a kind of tightrope here, argu-
ing for the effectiveness of the work done by her and her colleagues,
aligning herself with the institution while simultaneously pleading for
better treatment from it. Unfortunately, her note can serve not only as a
call to improve conditions but also as a reminder of what it is possible to
accomplish "under grotesquely inadequate conditions," and its accep-
tance of a crucial distinction between teachers and "those who have the
power to set public priorities" reinforces the position of teachers as pow-
erless altruists who work to achieve under grotesque conditions. As a
consequence, the note has the force less of a demand for improvement
of those conditions but more of a plea for sympathy (which comes much
cheaper). That it had such an effect is suggested by evidence that the
complaint was one of many preceding and following it which went un-

4 6



The "Birth" of "Basic Writing" 27

heeded. In December 1971 the department as a whole wrote a letter to
City College Dean Chavarria-Aguilar protesting appalling classroom
facilities and increased class size for sections of Basic Writing (Faculty).
In October 1975, roughly four years later, Theodore Gross, then himself
Dean of the City College Humanities Division, in a letter to City College
Provost Egon Brenner, complained, "Our real attempt to be helpful, to
take on a task of huge proportions . . . has not been supported even
minimally by the central administration" (Letter, 3 October 1975). Ac-
companying Gross's letter is a letter from then English department chair
Edward Quinn to Gross, in which Quinn himself complained, "the lack
of cooperation in regard to the large basic writing sections is really gall-
ing. . . . The sense we are developing here is that teaching writing has
the lowest priority of any instructional activity at the College. Morale is
sinking fast and along with it our hope for success" (Quinn, Letter). Later
letters to Brenner from Gross corroborate this sense of low priority and
morale: "Language instruction at the City College, especially under the
conditions of a continuing fiscal crisis, is a critical problem" (16 October
1975); "[members of the English department] feel that any cooperation
on their part will be taken out of their hides" (27 October 1975). But the
1971 letter of protest from the department had already marked English
faculty for such exploitation in a Catch-22. That letter ends with the fac-
ulty refusing to take the responsibility "for diluting the Basic Writing
program," but they also avow, "We will do our jobmore than our job
because we believe in the concept of Open Admissions" (Faculty).

Unfortunately, pedagogies labeled "effective" at producing results
within the constraints of degrading material conditions work in tandem
with such reports and protests to legitimize those conditionscondi-
tions of "crisis" that seem somehow never to be relieved. Silence about
such conditions in much Basic Writing discourse further legitimizes such
conditions by its lack of protest or guidance. Teachers of basic writing
seeking advice on improving their marginal institutional positions will
find nothing on such matters in Shaughnessy's Errors and Expectations,
despite her noted administrative expertise, nor in much of the other Basic
Writing literature. The denigration of basic writing teachers and stu-
dents which those material conditions both speak to and maintain posi-
tion the "subject" of Basic Writing as tied to those conditions. Teachers
are cast into the position of being hard-working servants doing service,
devoted and underpaid to the point of being altruistic volunteers; stu-
dents are expected to be grateful for their chance to get ahead, being
presumably in no position to complain. Paradoxically, defining the "prac-
tice" of Basic Writing in "academic"i.e., nonmaterial, nonpolitical
terms, is eminently impractical, leaving undeterred the ways in which
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material constraints, rather than academic theories, come to determine
the how and what as well as the why of teaching.

Educational historian Michael Katz has warned that while educational
institutions and structures represent choices that "reflected circumstances
at the time of their origin and the priorities of their founders. . . . the
reification of these historical products has become one of the great ob-
stacles to change. For it casts them as inexorable, transcending history,
even natural, and, as a result, it limits the terms of the debate" (Recon-
structing 1). The construction of Basic Writing provides an exemplary
instance of compositionists' need to heed Katz's warning. Indeed, in an
eerie echo of Katz, Bartholomae has recently expressed concern that the
"provisional position" which the term "Basic Writing" once represented
has become "fixed, naturalized," suspecting that calling certain courses
and the students in them "Basic Writing" no longer has "strategic value"
("Tidy House" 21). Of course, the "success" of Basic Writing discourse
in becoming "fixed" speaks to its "strategic value," especially during
the early years of Open Admissions. The price of that success, however,
has been the loss of what some teachers now identify as the crucial les-
sons of Open Admissions.

Bartholomae argues that, at best, basic writing should "continue to
mark an area of contest, of struggle, including a struggle against its sta-
bility or inevitability," a "contested area in the university community, a
contact zone, a place of competing positions and interests" ("Tidy House"
8, 21). For this to happen will involve giving voice to different, and sup-
pressed, stories, finding and sharing in our specific experiences and those
of our students as yet untold tales of struggle, defeats, victories, and
resistance, thereby teaching and learning from strategies of resistance
and outright opposition. But to engage in that sort of "frontier" work,
we will have to abandon the naturalization and fixing of basic writers,
or any writers, on a developmental scale, and we will have to acknowl-
edge, in our teaching, administering, and our professional discourse,
the place of teaching writing in immediate, ongoing history, part of a
larger education not only of students but of teachers and institutions
about the place, purpose, and practice of higher education in the life of
society.

Shaughnessy has noted that "Mestricted notions of what writing is
for" caused by the lack of understanding of the history of "what has
gone on in the name of freshman composition over the past hundred
years or so" "encourage us to accept current ways of organizing and
assessing writing instruction ... lock[ing] us into convictions about what
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is most important to learn, who should learn what, or who should teach
whom at a point when the uses of literacy in this society need to be re-
examined" ("English Professor 's Malady" 93). Slevin has argued that to
be fully prepared for their profession, teachers of writing ought to know
not just "how to teach writing, but the history of writing instruction"
(14). The literacy historian Harvey Graff has promised that "the proper
study of the historical experience of literacy.. . . has much to tell us that
is ... relevant to policy analysis and policy making in the world in which
we live today" (77). But until discourse on the teaching of writing recov-
ers the specific historical, material, institutional, and political context of
that teaching and that discourse, it will be difficult for us to hear what
study of the historical experience of literacy has to say, including the
historical experience of basic writing, forcing us to re-learn what that
history should have taught us long ago.
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2 Conflict and Struggle: The
Enemies or Preconditions of
Basic Writing?

Min-Zhan Lu

Harlem taught me that light skin Black people was better look, the
best to suceed, the best off fanicially etc this whole that I trying to
say, that I was brainwashed and people aliked.

I couldn't understand why people (Black and white) couldn't
get alone. So as time went along I began learned more about myself
and the establishment.

Sample student paper, Errors and Expectations

. . . Szasz was throwing her. She couldn't get through the twelve-
and-a-half pages of introduction. . . .

One powerful reason Lucia had decided to major in psychology
was that she wanted to help people like her brother, who had a psy-
chotic break in his teens and had been in and out of hospitals since.
She had lived with mental illness, had seen that look in her brother's
eyes. . . . The assertion that there was no such thing as mental ill-
ness, that it was a myth, seemed incomprehensible to her. She had
trouble even entertaining it as a hypothesis. . . . Szasz's bold claim
was a bone sticking in her assumptive craw.

Mike Rose, Lives on the Boundary

In perceiving conflicting information and points of view, she is sub-
jected to a swamping of her psychological borders.

Gloria Anzaldda, Borderlands/La Frontera: The New Mestiza

In the Preface to Borderlands, Gloria Anzaldtla uses her own struggle
"living on borders and in margins" to discuss the trials and triumphs in
the lives of "border residents." The image of "border residents" cap-
tures the conflict and struggle of students like those appearing in the
epigraphs. In perceiving conflicting information and points of view, a
writer like Anzaldüa is "subjected to a swamping of her psychological
borders" (79). But attempts to cope with conflicts also bring "compensa-
tion," "joys," and "exhilaration" (Anzalthia, Preface). The border resi-
dent develops a tolerance for contradiction and ambivalence. She learns
to sustain contradiction and turn ambivalence into a new conscious-
ness"a third element which is greater than the sum of its severed parts":
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"a mestiza consciousness" (79-80; emphasis mine). Experience taught
Anzaldüa that this developing consciousness is a source of intense pain.
For development involves struggle which is "inner" and is played out
in the outer terrains (87). But this new consciousness draws energy from
the "continual creative motion that keeps breaking down the unitary
aspect of each new paradigm" (80). It enables a border resident to act on
rather than merely react to the conditions of her or his life, turning aware-
ness of the situation into "inner changes" which in turn bring about
"changes in society" (87).

Education as Repositioning

Anzalchia's account gathers some of the issues on which a whole range
of recent composition research focuses, research on how readers and
writers necessarily struggle with conflicting information and points of
view as they reposition themselves in the process of reading and writ-
ing. This research recognizes that reading and writing take place at sites
of political as well as linguistic conflict. It acknowledges that such a pro-
cess of conflict and struggle is a source of pain but constructive as well:
a new consciousness emerges from the creative motion of breaking down
the rigid boundaries of social and linguistic paradigms.

Compositionists are becoming increasingly aware of the need to tell
and listen to stories of life in the borderlands. The CCCC Best Book Award
given Mike Rose's Lives on the Boundary and the two Braddock Awards
given to Glynda Hull and Mike Rose ("This Wooden Shack Place") for
their research on students like Lucia attest to this increasing awareness.
College Composition and Communication recently devoted a whole issue
(February 1992) to essays which use images of "boundary," "margin,"
or "voice" to re-view the experience of reading and writing and teach-
ing reading and writing within the academy (see also Lu, "From Silence
to Words"; Bartholomae, "Writing on the Margins"; and Mellix). These
publications and their reception indicate that the field is taking seriously
two notions of writing underlying these narratives: the sense that the
writer writes at a site of conflict rather than "comfortably inside or pow-
erlessly outside the academy" (Lu, "Writing as Repositioning" 20) and a
definition of "innovative writing" as cutting across rather than confin-
ing itself within boundaries of race, class, gender, and disciplinary dif-
ferences.

In articulating the issues explored by these narratives from the bor-
derlands, compositionists have found two assumptions underlying vari-
ous feminist, Marxist, and poststructuralist theories of language useful:
first, that learning a new discourse has an effect on the re-forming of
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individual consciousness; and second, that individual consciousness is
necessarily heterogeneous, contradictory, and in process (Bizzell, "Be-
yond"; Flynn, "Composing"; Harris, "The Idea"; Lunsford, Moglen and
Slevin; Trimbur, "Beyond"). The need to reposition oneself and the posi-
tive use of conflict and struggle are also explored in a range of research
devoted to the learning difficulties of Basic Writers (Bartholomae, "In-
venting"; Fox, "Basic Writing"; Horner,"Rethinking"; Hull and Rose,
"This Wooden Shack Place"; Lu, "Redefining"; Ritchie; Spellmeyer;
Stanley). Nevertheless, such research has had limited influence on Basic
Writing instruction, which continues to emphasize skills (Gould and
Heyda) and to view conflict as the enemy (Schilb, Brown). I believe that
this view of conflict can be traced in the work of three pioneers in Basic
Writing: Kenneth Bruffee, Thomas Farrell, and Mina Shaughnessy. In
what follows, I examine why this view of conflict had rhetorical power
in the historical context in which these pioneers worked and in relation
to two popular views of education: education as acculturation and edu-
cation as accommodation. I also explore how and why this view persists
among Basic Writing teachers in the 1990s.

Although Bruffee, Farrell, and Shaughnessy hold different views on
the goal of education, they all treat the students' fear of acculturation
and the accompanying sense of contradiction and ambiguity as a deficit.
Even though stories of the borderlands like Anzaldna's suggest that
teachers can and should draw upon students' perception of conflict as a
constructive resource, these three pioneers of Basic Writing view evi-
dence of conflict and struggle as something to be dissolved and so pro-
pose "cures" aimed at releasing students from their fear of acculturation.
Bruffee and Farrell present students' acculturation as inevitable and
beneficial. Shaughnessy promises them that learning academic discourse
will not result in acculturation. Teachers influenced by the work of these
pioneers tend to view all signs of conflict and struggle as the enemy of
Basic Writing instruction. In perpetuating this view, these teachers also
tend to adopt two assumptions about language: (1) an "essentialist" view
of language holding that the essence of meaning precedes and is inde-
pendent of language (see Lu, "Redefining" 26); (2) a view of "discourse
communities" as "discursive utopias," in each of which a single, uni-
fied, and stable voice directly and completely determines the writings
of all community members (see Harris, "The Idea" 12).

In the 1970s, the era of open admissions at CUNY, heated debate over
the "educability" of Basic Writers gave these views of language and of
conflict exceptional rhetorical power. The new field of Basic Writing was
struggling to establish the legitimacy of its knowledge and expertise,
and it was doing so in the context of arguments made by a group of
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writersincluding Lionel Trilling, Irving Howe, and W. E. B. Du Bois
who could be viewed as exemplary because of their ethnic or racial back-
grounds, their academic success, and the popular view that all Basic
Writers entering CUNY through the open admissions movement were
"minority" students. The writings of Bruffee, Farrell, and Trilling con-
cur that the goal of education is to acculturate students to the kind of
academic "community" they posit. Shaughnessy, on the other hand, at-
tempts to eliminate students' conflicting feelings toward academic dis-
course by reassuring them that her teaching will only "accommodate"
but not weaken their existing relationship with their home cultures.
Shaughnessy's approach is aligned with the arguments of Irving Howe
and W. E. B. Du Bois, who urge teachers to honor students' resistance to
deracination. Acculturation and accommodation were the dominant
models of open admissions education for teachers who recognized teach-
ing academic discourse as a way of empowering students, and in both
models conflict and struggle were seen as the enemies of Basic Writing
instruction.

This belief persists in several recent works by a new generation of
compositionists and "minority" writers. I will read these writings from
the point of view of the border resident and through a view of education
as a process of repositioning. In doing so, I will also map out some di-
rections for further demystifying conflict and struggle in Basic Writing
instruction and for seeing them as the preconditions of all discursive
acts.

Education as Acculturation

In Errors and Expectations, Mina Shaughnessy offers us one way of imag-
ining the social and historical contexts of her work: she calls herself a
trailblazer trying to survive in a "pedagogical West" (4). This metaphor
captures the peripheral position of Basic Writing in English. To other
members of the profession, Shaughnessy notes, Basic Writing is not one
of their "'real' subjects"; nor are books on Basic Writing "important
enough" either to be reviewed or to argue about ("English Professor 's
Malady" 92). Kenneth Bruffee also testifies to feeling peripheral. Recall-
ing the "collaborative learning" which took place among the directors
of CUNY writing programsa group which included Bruffee himself,
Donald McQuade, Mina Shaughnessy, and Harvey Wienerhe points
out that the group was brought together not only by their "difficult new
task" but also by their sense of having more in common with one an-
other than with many of their "colleagues on [their] own campuses"
("On Not Listening" 4-5).
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These frontier images speak powerfully of a sense of being in but not
of the English profession. The questionable academic status of not only
their students (seen as "ill-prepared") but also themselves (Basic Writ-
ing was mostly assigned to beginning teachers, graduate students,
women, minorities, and the underemployed but tenured members of
other departments) would pressure teachers like Shaughnessy and
Bruffee to find legitimacy for their subject. At the same time, they had to
do so by persuading both college administrators who felt "hesitation
and discomfort" toward open admissions policies and "senior and ten-
ured professorial staff" who either resisted or did not share their com-
mitment (Lyons 1985, 175). Directly or indirectly, these pioneers had to
respond to, argue with, and persuade the "gatekeepers" and "convert-
ers" Shaughnessy describes in "Diving In." It is in the context of such
challenges that we must understand the key terms the pioneers use and
the questions they considerand overlookin establishing the
problematics of Basic Writing.

One of the most vehement gatekeepers at CUNY during the initial
period of open admissions was Geoffrey Wagner (Professor of English
at City College). In The End of Education, Wagner posits a kind of "uni-
versity" in which everyone supposedly pursues learning for its own
sake, free of all "worldly"social, economic, and politicalinterests.
To Wagner, open admissions students are the inhabitants of the "world"
outside the sort of scholarly "community" which he claims existed at
Oxford and City College. They are dunces (43), misfits (129), hostile
mental children (247), and the most sluggish of animals (163). He de-
scribes a group of Panamanian "girls" taking a Basic Writing course as
"abusive, stupid, and hostile" (128). Another student is described as sit-
ting "in a half-lotus pose in back of class with a transistor strapped to
his Afro, and nodding off every two minutes" (134). Wagner calls Basic
Writing courses offered at City a form of political psychotherapy (145),
a welfare agency, and an entertainment center (173). And he calls
Shaughnessy "the Circe of CCNY's remedial English program" (129).
To Wagner, Basic Writers would cause "the end of education" because
they have intellects comparable to those of beasts, the retarded, the psy-
chotic or children; and because they are consumed by non-"academic"
i.e., racial, economic, and politicalinterests and are indifferent to "learn-

Unlike the "gatekeepers," Louis Heller (Classics professor, City Col-
lege) represents educators who seemed willing to shoulder the burden
of converting the heathens but disapproved of the ways in which CUNY
was handling the conversion. Nonetheless, in The Death of the American
University, Heller approaches the "problems" of open admissions stu-
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dents in ways similar to Wagner's. He contrasts the attitudes of open
admissions students and of old Jewish City College students like him-
self:

In those days rdecades agol there was genuine hunger, and dep-
rivation, and discrimination too, but when a child received failing
marks no militant parent group assailed the teacher. Instead parent
and child agonized over the subject, placing the responsibility
squarely on the child who was given to know that he had to mea-
sure up to par, not that he was the victim of society, a wicked school
system, teachers who didn't understand him, or any of the other
pseudosociological nonsense now handed out. (138)

According to Heller, the parents of open admissions students are too
"militant." As a result, the students' minds are stuffed with
"pseudosociological nonsense" about their victimization by the educa-
tional system. The "problem" of open admissions students, Heller sug-
gests, is their militant attitude, which keeps them from trying to "ago-
nize over the subject" and "measure up to par."

Wagner predicts the "end of education" beCause of the "arrival in ur-
ban academe of large, indeed overwhelming, numbers of hostile mental
children" (247; emphasis mine). As the titles of Heller's chapters sug-
gest, Heller too believes that a "death of the American University" would
inevitably result from the "Administrative Failure of Nerve" or "Ca-
pitulation Under Force" to "Violence on Campus," which he claims to
have taken place at City College. The images of education's end or death
suggest that both Wagner and Heller assume that the goal of education
is the acculturation of students into an "educated community." They
question the "educability" of open admissions students because they
fear that these students would not only be hostile to the education they
promote but also take it overthat is, change it. The apocalyptic tone of
their book titles suggests their fear that the students' "hostile" or "mili-
tant" feelings toward the existing educational system would weaken
the ability of the "American University" to realize its primary goalto
acculturate. Their writings show that their view of the "problems" of
open admissions students and their view of the goal of education sus-
tain one another.

This view of education as a process of acculturation is shared by Lionel
Trilling, another authority often cited as an exemplary minority student
(see, for example, Howe, "Living" 108). In a paper titled "The Uncertain
Future of the Humanistic Educational Ideal" delivered in 1974, Trilling
claims that the view of higher education "as the process of initiation
into membership" in a "new, larger, and more complex community" is
"surely" not a "mistaken conception" (The Last Decade 170). The word
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"initiation," Trilling points out, designates the "ritually prescribed stages
by which a person is brought into a community" (170-71). "Initiation"
requires "submission," demanding that one "shape" and "limit" one-
self to "a self, a life" and "preclude any other kind of selfhood remain-
ing available" to one (171, 175; emphasis mine). Trilling doubts that con-
temporary American culture will find "congenial" the kind of "initia-
tion" required by the "humanistic educational ideal" (171). For contem-
porary "American culture" too often encourages one to resist any doc-
trine that does not sustain "a multiplicity of options" (175). And Trilling
admits to feeling "saddened" by the unlikelihood that "an ideal of edu-
cation closely and positively related to the humanistic educational tra-
ditions of the past" will be called into being in contemporary America
(161).

The trials of "initiation" are the subject of Trilling's short story "Notes
on a Departure." The main character, a young college professor about to
leave a university town, is portrayed as being forced to wrestle with an
apparition which he sometimes refers to as the "angel of Jewish soli-
tude" and, by the end of the story, as "a red-haired comedian" whose
"face remained blank and idiot" (Of This Time 53, 55). The apparition
hounds the professor, often reminding him of the question "What for?'
Jews did not do such things" (54). Toward the end of the story, the pro-
fessor succeeds in freeing himself from the apparition. Arriving at a state
of "readiness," he realizes that he would soon have to "find his own
weapon, his own adversary, his own things to do"findings in which
"this red-haired figure . . . would have no part" (55; emphasis mine).

This story suggestsparticularly in view of Trilling's concern for the
"uncertain future" of the "humanistic educational ideal" in the 1970s
that contemporary Americans, especially those from minority cultural
groups, face a dilemma: the need to combat voices which remind them
of the "multiplicity of options." The professor needs to "wrestle with"
two options of "selfhood." First, he must free himself from the authority
of the "angel" / "comedian." Then, as the title "Notes on a Departure"
emphasizes, he must free himself from the "town." Trilling's represen-
tation of the professor's need to "depart" from the voice of his "race"
and of the "town" indirectly converges with the belief held by Wagner
and Heller that the attitudes "parents" and "society" hand out to open
admissions students would pull them away from the "university" and
hinder their full initiationacculturationinto the "educated" commu-
nity.

Read in the 1990s, these intersecting approaches to the "problems" of
"minority" students might seem less imposing, since except perhaps for
Trilling, the academic prestige of these writers has largely receded. Yet,
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we should not underestimate the authority these writers had within the
academy. As both the publisher and the author of The End of Education
(1976) remind us within the first few pages of the book, Wagner is not
only a graduate of Oxford but a full professor at City College and au-
thor of a total of twenty-nine books of poetry, fiction, literary criticism,
and sociology. Heller's The Death of the American University (1973) indi-
cates that he has ten years' work at the doctoral or postdoctoral level in
three fields, a long list of publications, and years of experience as both a
full professor of classics and an administrator at City College (12). Fur-
thermore, their fear of militancy accorded with prevalent reactions to
the often violent conflict in American cities and college campuses dur-
ing the 1960s and '70s. It was in the context of such powerful discourse
that composition teachers argued for not only the "educability" of open
admissions students but also the ability of the "pioneer" educators to
"educate" them. Bruffee's and Farrell's eventual success in establishing
the legitimacy of their knowledge and expertise as Basic Writing teach-
ers, I believe, comes in part from a conjuncture in the arguments of the
two Basic Writing pioneers and those of Wagner, Heller, and Trilling.

For example, Thomas Farrell presents the primary goal of Basic Writ-
ing instruction as acculturationa move from "orality" to "literacy."
He treats open admissions students as existing in a "residual orality":
"literate patterns of thought have not been interiorized, have not dis-
placed oral patterns, in them" ("Open Admissions" 248). Referring to
Piaget, Ong, and Bernstein, he offers environmental rather than biologi-
cal reasons for Basic Writers' "orality"their membership in "commu-
nities" where "orality" is the dominant mode of communication. To
Farrell, the emigration from "orality" to "literacy" is unequivocally ben-
eficial for everyone, since it mirrors the progression of history. At the
same time, Farrell recognizes that such a move will inevitably be ac-
companied by "anxiety": "The psychic strain entailed in moving from a
highly oral frame of mind to a more literate frame of mind is too great to
allow rapid movement" (252; emphasis mine). Accordingly, he promotes
teaching strategies aimed at "reducing anxiety" and establishing "a sup-
portive environment." For example, he urges teachers to use the kind of
"collaborative learning" Bruffee proposes so that they can use "oral dis-
course to improve written discourse" ("Open Admissions" 252-53; "Lit-
eracy" 40-41). He reminds teachers that "highly oral students" won't
engage in the "literate" modes of reasoning "unless they are shown how
and reminded to do so often," and even then will do so only "gradu-
ally" ("Literacy" 40).

Kenneth Bruffee also defines the goal of Basic Writing in terms of the
students' acculturation into a new "community." According to Bruffee,
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Basic Writers have already been acculturated within "local communi-
ties" which have prepared them for only "the narrowest and most lim-
ited" political and economic relations ("On Not Listening" 7). The pur-
pose of education is to "reacculturate" the studentsto help them "gain
membership in another such community" by learning its "language,
mores, and values" (8). However, Bruffee believes that the "trials of
changing allegiance from one cultural community to another" demand
that teachers use "collaborative learning" in small peer groups. This
method will "create a temporary transition or 'support' group that [one]
can join on the way" (8; emphasis mine). This "transition group," he main-
tains, will offer Basic Writers an arena for sharing their "trials," such as
the "uncertain, nebulous, and protean thinking that occurs in the pro-
cess of change" and the "painful process" of gaining new awareness
("On Not Listening" 11; "Collaborative Learning: Some Practical Mod-
els" 640).

Two points bind Bruffee's argument to Farrell's and enhance the rhe-
torical power of their arguments for the Wagners, Hellers, and Trillings.
First, both arguments assume that the goal of education is acculturation
into a "literate" community. The image of students who are "changing
allegiance from one cultural community to another" (Bruffee), like the
image of students "moving" from "orality" to "literacy" (Farrell), posits
that "discourse communities" are discrete and autonomous entities
rather than interactive cultural forces. When discussing the differences
between "orality" and "literacy," Farrell tends to treat these "discourses"
as creating coherent but distinct modes of thinking: "speaking" vs. "read-
ing," "cliches" vs. "explained and supported generalizations," "addi-
tive" vs. "inductive or deductive" reasoning. Bruffee likewise sets "co-
herent but entirely local communities" against a community which is
"broader, highly diverse, integrated" ("On Not Listening" 7; emphasis
mine). Both Farrell and Bruffee use existing analyses of "discourse com-
munities" to set up a seemingly nonpolitical hierarchy between academic
and nonacademic "communities." They then use the hierarchy to justify
implicitly the students' need to be acculturated by the more advanced
or broader "community." Thus, they can be construed as promising "ef-
fective" ways of appeasing the kind of "hostility" or "militancy" feared
in open admissions students. The appeal of this line of thinking is that it
protects the autonomy of the "literate community" while also profess-
ing a solution to the "threat" the open admissions students seem to pose
to the university. They provide methods aimed at keeping students like
Anzalchia, Lucia, and the writer of Shaughnessy's sample paper from
moving the points of view and discursive forms they have developed in
their home "communities" into the "literate community" and also at
persuading such students to willingly "move" into that "literate com-
munity."
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Second, both Bruffee and Farrell explicitly look for teaching methods
aimed at reducing the feelings of "anxiety" or "psychic strain" accom-
panying the process of acculturation. They thus present these feelings
as signs of the students' still being "on the way" from one community to
another, i.e., as signs of their failure to complete their acculturation or
education. They suggest that the students are experiencing these trials
only because they are still in "transition," bearing ties to both the old
and new communities but not fully "departed" from one nor comfort-
ably "inside" the other. They also suggest that these experiences, like
the transition or support groups, are "temporary" (Bruffee, "On Not
Listening" 8). In short, they sustain the impression that these experi-
ences ought to and will disappear once the students get comfortably
settled in the new community and sever or diminish their ties with the
old. Any sign of heterogeneity uncertainty or instability is viewed as
problematic; hence conflict and struggle are the enemies of Basic Writ-
ing instruction.

This linkage between students' painful conflicts and the teacher 's ef-
fort to assuage them had rhetorical power in America during the 1970s
because it could be perceived as accepting rather than challenging the
gatekeepers' and converters' arguments that the pull of non-"academic"
forces"society" (Wagner), "militant parents" (Heller), and minority
"race" or "American culture" at large (Trilling)would render the open
admissions students less "educable" and so create a "problem" in their
education. It feeds the fear that the pulls of conflicting "options,"
"selfhoods," or "lives" promoted by antagonistic "communities" would
threaten the university's ability to acculturate the Basic Writers. At the
same time, this linkage also offers a "support system" aimed at releas-
ing the gatekeepers and converters from their fear. For example, the teach-
ing strategies Farrell promotes, which explicitly aim to support students
through their "psychic strain," are also aimed at gradually easing them
into "interiorizing" modes of thinking privileged by the "literate com-
munity," such as "inductive or deductive" reasoning or "detached, ana-
lytic forms of thinking" ("Literacy" 39, 40). Such strategies thus provide
a support system for not only the students but also the kind of discur-
sive utopia posited by Trilling's description of the "humanistic educa-
tional ideal," Heller's "American University," and Wagner's "education."
Directly and indirectly, the pedagogies aimed at "moving" students from
one culture to another support and are supported by gatekeepers' and
converters' positions toward open admissions students.

The pedagogies of Bruffee and Farrell recognize the "psychic strain"
or the "trials" experienced by those reading and writing at sites of con-
tradiction, experiences which are depicted by writers like Trilling ("Notes
on a Departure"), Anzaldila, and Rose and witnessed by teachers in their
encounters with students like Lucia and the writer of Shaughnessy's
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sample paper. Yet, for two reasons, the approaches of Bruffee and Farrell
are unlikely to help such students cope with the conflicts "swamping"
their "psychological borders." First, these approaches suggest that the
students' primary task is to change allegiance, to "learn" and "master"
the "language, mores, and values" of the academic community presented
in the classroom by passively internalizing them and actively rejecting
all points of view or information which run counter to them (Bruffee,
"On Not Listening" 8). For the author of Shaughnessy's sample student
paper, this could mean learning to identify completely with the point of
view of authorities like the Heller of The Death of the American University
and thus to reject "militant" thoughts about the "establishment" in or-
der to "agonize over the subject." For Lucia, this could mean learning to
identify with the Trilling of "Notes on a Departure," viewing her ability
to forget the look in her brother 's eyes as a precondition of becoming a
psychologist like Szasz. Yet students like Lucia might resist what the
classroom seems to indicate they must do in order to achieve academic
"success." As Rose reminds us, one of the reasons Lucia decided to ma-
jor in psychology was to help people like her brother. Students like these
are likely to get very little help or guidance from teachers like Bruffee or
Farrell.

Second, though Bruffee and Farrell suggest that the need to cope with
conflicts is a temporary experience for students unfamiliar with and lack-
ing mastery of dominant academic values and forms, Rose's account of
his own education indicates that similar experiences of "confusion, an-
ger, and fear" are not at all temporary (Lives 235-36). During Rose's high
school years, his teacher Jack MacFarland had successfully helped him
cope with his "sense of linguistic exclusion" complicated by "various
cultural differences" by engaging him in a sustained examination of
"points of conflict and points of possible convergence" between home
and academic canons (193). Nevertheless, during Rose's first year at
Loyola and then during his graduate school days, he continued to expe-
rience similar feelings when encountering texts and settings which re-
minded him of the conflict between home and school. If students like
Rose, Lucia, or the writer of Shaughnessy's sample paper learn to view
experiences of conflictexclusion, confusion, uncertainty, psychic pain
or strainas "temporary," they are also likely to view the recurrence of
those experiences as a reason to discontinue their education. Rather than
viewing their developing ability to sustain contradictions as heralding
the sort of "new mestiza consciousness" AnzaldUa calls for (80), they
may take it as signaling their failure to "enter" the academy, since they
have been led to view the academy as a place free of contradictions.
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Education as Accommodation

Whereas the gatekeepers and converters want students to be either barred
from or acculturated into academic culture, Irving Howe (Distinguished
Professor of English, Graduate Center of CUNY and Hunter College),
another City graduate often cited by the public media as an authority
on the education of open admissions students (see Fiske), takes a some-
what different approach. He believes that "the host culture, resting as it
does on the English language and the literary traditions associated with
it, has . . . every reason to be sympathetic to the problems of those who,
from choice or necessity, may live with the tension of biculturalism" ("Liv-
ing" 110; emphasis mine).

The best way to understand what Howe might mean by this state-
ment and why he promotes such a position is to put it in the context of
two types of educational stories Howe writes. The first type appears in
his World of Our Fathers, in which he recounts the "cultural bleaching"
required of Jewish immigrants attending classes at the Educational Alli-
ance in New York City around the turn of this century. As Eugene Lyons,
one immigrant whom Howe quotes, puts it, "We were 'Americanized'
about as gently as horses are broken in." Students who went through
this "crude" process, Lyons admits, often came to view their home tra-
ditions as "alien" and to "unconsciously resent and despise those tradi-
tions" (Howe, World 234). Howe points out that education in this type of
"Americanization" exacted a price, leaving the students with a "nag-
ging problem in self-perception, a crisis of identity" (World 642). Read in
the context of Howe's statement on the open admissions students cited
above, this type of story points to the kind of "problems" facing stu-
dents who have to live with the tension between the "minority subcul-
tures" in which they grow up and a "dominant" "Western" "host cul-
ture" with which they are trying to establish deep contact through edu-
cation ("Living" 110). It also points to the limitations of an educational
system which is not sympathetic to their problems.

The "Americanization" required of students like Eugene Lyons, Howe
points out, often led Jewish students to seek either "a full return to reli-
gious faith or a complete abandonment of Jewish identification" (642).
But Howe rejects both such choices. He offers instead an alternative
storythe struggle of writers like himself to live with rather than es-
cape from "the tension of biculturalism." In A Margin of Hope, he re-
counts his long journey in search of a way to "achieve some equilibrium
with that earlier self which had started with childhood Yiddish, my lan-
guage of naming, and then turned away in adolescent shame" (269). In
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"Strangers," Howe praises Jewish writers like Saul Bellow and the con-
tributors to Partisan Review for their attitudes toward their "partial
deracination" (Selected Writings 335). He argues that these writers dem-
onstrated that being a "loose-fish" (with "roots loosened in Jewish soil
but still not torn out, roots lowered into American soil but still not fixed")
is "a badge" to be carried "with pride" (335). Doing so can open up a
whole "range of possibilities" (335), such as the "forced yoking of oppo-
sites: gutter vividness and university refinement, street energy and high-
culture rhetoric" Howe sees these writers achieving (338). This suggests
what Howe might mean by "living with the tension of biculturalism."
The story he tells of the struggle of these Jewish writers also proves that
several claims made in the academy of the earlier 1970s, as Howe points
out, are "true and urgent": (1) students who grow up in "subcultures"
can feel "pain and dislocation" when trying to "connect with the larger,
cosmopolitan culture"; (2) for these students, "there must always be some
sense of 'difference,' even alienation"; (3) this sense of difference can
"yield moral correction and emotional enrichment" ("Living" 110). The
story of these writers also suggests that when dealing with students from
"subcultures," the dominant culture and its educational system need,
as Howe argues, to be more "sympathetic to" the pain and alienation
indicated by the first two claims, and at the same time should value
more highly the "infusion of vitality and diversity from subcultures"
that the third claim suggests these students can bring (110).

Howe believes that the need for reform became especially urgent in
the context of the open admissions movement, when a large number of
"later immigrants, newer Americans" from racial as well as ethnic "sub-
cultures" arrived at CUNY ("A Foot"). He also believes that, although
the dominant culture needs to be more "responsive" and "sympathetic"
toward this body of students, it would be "a dreadful form of intellec-
tual condescensionand social cheating" for members of the "host cul-
ture" to dissuade students from establishing a "deep connection" with
it. The only possible and defensible "educational ideal" is one which
brings together commitments to "the widespread diffusion of learning"
and to the "preservation of the highest standards of learning" (109).

However, as Howe himself seems aware throughout his essay, he is
more convinced of the need to live up to this ideal than certain about
how to implement it in the day-to-day life of teaching, especially with
"the presence of large numbers of ill-prepared students in our class-
room" ("Living" 110, 112). For example, the values of "traditionalism"
mean that teachers like Howe should try to "preserve" the "English lan-
guage and the literary traditions" associated with "the dominant cul-
ture we call Western" (109, 110). Yet, when Howe tries to teach Clarissa
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to his students, he finds out that he has to help students to "transpose"
and "translate" Clarissa's belief in the sanctity of her virginity into their
"terms." And he recognizes that the process of transposing would "nec-
essarily distort and weaken" the original belief (112). This makes him
realize that there is "reason to take seriously the claim" that "a qualita-
tive transformation of Western culture threatens the survival of litera-
ture as we have known it" (112).

Although Howe promotes the images of "loose-fish" and "partial
deracination" when discussing the work of Jewish writers, in his dis-
cussion of the education of "ill-prepared" students, he considers the
possibility of change from only one end of the "tension of bi-
culturalism"that of "Western culture." His essay overlooks the possi-
bility that the process of establishing a deep connection with "Western
culture," such as teaching students to "transpose" their "subcultural"
beliefs into the terms of "Western culture," might also "distort and
weaken"transformthe positions students take toward these beliefs,
especially if these beliefs conflict with those privileged in "Western cul-
ture." In fact, teachers interested in actively honoring the students' deci-
sions and needs to "live with the tension of bi-culturalism" must take
this possibility seriously (see Lu, "Redefining" 33).

In helping students to establish deep connections with "Western cul-
ture," teachers who overlook the possibility of students' changing their
identification with "sub-cultural" views are likely to turn education into
an accommodationor mere toleranceof the students' choice or need
to live with conflicts. This accommodation could hardly help students
explore, formulate, reflect on, and enact strategies for coping actively
with conflicts as the residents of borderlands do: developing a "toler-
ance for" and an ability to "sustain" contradictions and ambiguity
(Anzaldüa 79). Even if teachers explicitly promote the image of "partial
deracination," they are likely to be more successful in helping students
unconsciously "lower" and "fix" their roots into "Western culture" than
in also helping them keep their roots from being completely "torn out"
of "subcultures."

Two recurring words in Howe's essay, "preserve" and "survival,"
suggest a further problematic, for they represent the students as "pre-
servers" of conflicting but unitary paradigmsa canonical "literary tra-
dition" and "subcultures" with "attractive elements that merit study
and preservation" ("Living" 110). This view of their role might encour-
age students to envision themselves as living at a focal point where "sev-
ered or separated pieces merely come together" (Anzaldita 79). Such
perceptions might also lead students to focus their energy on "accom-
modating" their thoughts and actions to rigid boundaries rather than
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on actively engaging themselves in what to Anzaldua is the resource of
life in the borderlands: a "continual creative motion" which breaks en-
trenched habits and patterns of behavior (Anzalchia 79). The residents
of the borderlands act on rather than react to the "borders" cutting across
society and their psyches, "borders" which become visible as they en-
counter conflicting ideas and actions. In perceiving these "borders," the
mestizas refuse to let these seemingly rigid boundaries confine and com-
partmentalize their thoughts and actions. Rather, they use these "bor-
ders" to identify the unitary aspects of "official" paradigms which "set"
and "separate" cultures and which they can then work to break down.
That is, for the mestizas, "borders" serve to delineate aspects of their
psyche and the world requiring change. Words such as "preserve" and
"survival," in focusing the students' attention on accommodation rather
than change, could not help students become active residents of the bor-
derlands.

The problematics surfacing from Howe's writingsthe kind of
"claims" about students from "subcultures" that he considers "true and
urgent," the kind of "problems" he associates with students living with
the tension of conflicting cultural forces, and the questions he raises as
well as those he overlooks when discussing his "educational ideal"
map the general conceptual framework of a group of educators to whose
writings I now turn. The writings of Leonard Kriegel, another member
of the CUNY English faculty, seem to address precisely the question of
how a teacher might implement in the day-to-day teaching of "reme-
dial" students at City College the educational ideal posited by Howe.

In Working Through: A Teacher's Journey in the Urban University, Kriegel
bases his authority on his personal experience as first a City undergradu-
ate and then a City professor before and during the open admissions
movement. Kriegel describes himself as a "working-class Jewish
youth"part of a generation not only eager to "get past [its] back-
grounds, to deodorize all smells out of existence, especially the smells
of immigrant kitchens and beer-sloppy tables," but also anxious to emu-
late the "aggressive intellectualism" of City students (32, 123). Kriegel
maintains that in his days as a student, there existed a mutual trust be-
tween teachers and students: "My teachers could assume a certain intel-
ligence on my part; I, in turn, could assume a certain good will on theirs"
(29).

When he was assigned to teach in the SEEK program, Kriegel's first
impression was that such a mutual trust was no longer possible. For
example, when he asked students to describe Canova's Perseus Holding
the Head of Medusa, a student opened his paper, "When I see this statue it
is of the white man and he is holding the head of the Negro" (176). Such
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papers led Kriegel to conclude that these students had not only "elemen-
tary" problems with writing but also a "racial consciousness [which]
seemed to obscure everything else" (176). Yet working among the SEEK
students gradually convinced Kriegel that the kind of mutual trust he
had previously enjoyed with his teachers and students was not only
possible but necessary. He discovered that his black and Puerto Rican
students "weren't very different from their white peers": they did not
lack opinions and they did want in to the American establishment (175,
178). They can and do trust the "good will" of the teacher who can hon-
estly admit that he is a product of academic culture and believes in it,
who rids himself of the "inevitable white guilt" and the fear of being
accused of "cultural colonialism," and who permits the students to de-
fine their needs in relation to the culture rather than rejecting it for them
(180). Kriegel thus urges teachers to "leave students alone" to make their
own choices (182).

Kriegel's approach to his journey falls within the framework Howe
establishes. The university ought to be "responsive to the needs and points
of view of students who are of two minds about what Western culture
offers them" ("Playing It Black" 11; emphasis mine). Yet, when summa-
rizing the lessons he learned through SEEK, Kriegel implies that being
"responsive" does not require anything of the teacher other than
"permit[ting] the student freedom of choice, to let him take what he felt he
needed and let go of what was not important to him" (Working Through
207; emphasis mine). Kriegel ultimately finds himself "mak [ing] deci-
sions based on old values" and "placing greater and greater reliance on
the traditional cultural orientation to which [he] had been exposed as an
undergraduate" (201-2). The question he does not consider throughout
his book is the extent to which his reliance on "old values" and "tradi-
tional cultural orientation" might affect his promise to accommodate
the students' freedom of choice, especially if they are of "two minds"
about what Western culture offers them. That is, he never considers
whether his teaching practice might implicitly disable his students' ability
to exercise the "freedom" he explicitly "permits" them.

Kriegel's story suggests that business in the classroom could go on as
usual so long as teachers openly promise students their "freedom of
choice." His story implies that the kind of teaching traditionally used to
disseminate the conventions of the "English language or literary tradi-
tion" is politically and culturally neutral. It takes a two-pronged ap-
proach to educational reform: (1) explicitly stating the teacher's willing-
ness to accommodatei.e., understand, sympathize with, accept, and
respectthe students' choice or need to resist total acculturation; (2)
implicitly dismissing the ways in which particular teaching practices
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"choose" for studentsi.e., set pressures on the ways in which students
formulate, modify, or even dismisstheir position toward conflicting
cultures (for comparable positions by other City faculty, see Quinn,
"We're Holding," and Volpe). This approach has rhetorical currency
because it both aspires to and promises to deliver the kind of education
envisioned by another group of minority writers with established au-
thority in 1970s America, a group which included black intellectuals
W. E. B. Du Bois and James Baldwin. Using personal and communal
accounts, these writers also argue for educational systems which ac-
knowledge students' resistance to cultural deracination. Yet, because their
arguments for such an educational reform are seldom directly linked to
discussion of specific pedagogical issues, teachers who share Kriegel's
position could read Du Bois and Baldwin as authorizing accommoda-
tion.

For example, in The Education of Black People, Du Bois critiques the
underlying principle of earlier educational models for black students,
such as the "Hampton Idea" or the Fisk program, which do not help
students deal with what he elsewhere calls their double-consciousness
(12, 51). Instead, such models pressure students to "escape their cultural
heritage and the body of experience which they themselves have built-
up." As a result, these students may "meet peculiar frustration and in the
end be unable to achieve success in the new environment or fit into the
old" (144; emphasis mine).

Du Bois's portrayal of the "peculiar frustration" of black students,
like Howe's account of the "problems" of Jewish students, speaks pow-
erfully of the need to consider seriously Howe's list of the "claims" made
during the open admissions movement ("Living" 110). It also supports
Howe's argument that the dominant culture needs to be more "sympa-
thetic" to the "problems" of students from black and other ethnic cul-
tures. Du Bois's writings offer teachers a set of powerful narratives to
counter the belief that students' interests in racial politics will impede
their learning. In fact, Du Bois's life suggests that being knowledgeable
of and concerned with racial politics is a precondition to one's eventual
ability to "force" oneself "in" and to "share" the world with "the own-
ers" (Education 77).

At the same time, Du Bois's autobiography can also be read as sup-
porting the idea that once the teacher accepts the students' need to be
interested in racial politics and becomes "sympathetic to"acknowl-
edgestheir "peculiar frustration," business in the writing classroom
can go on as usual. For example, when recalling his arrival at Harvard
"in the midst of a violent controversy about poor English among stu-
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dents," Du Bois describes his experiences in a compulsory Freshman
English class as follows:

I was at the point in my intellectual development when the content
rather than the form of my writing was to me of prime importance.
Words and ideas surged in my mind and spilled out with disregard
of exact accuracy in grammar, taste in word or restraint in style. I
knew the Negro problem and this was more important to me than
literary form. I knew grammar fairly well, and I had a pretty wide
vocabulary; but I was bitter, angry and intemperate in my first the-
sis. . . . Senator Morgan of Alabama had just published a scathing
attack on "niggers" in a leading magazine, when my first Harvard
thesis was due. I let go at him with no holds barred. My long and
blazing effort came back marked "E"not passed. (Autobiography
144)

Consequently, Du Bois "went to work at" his English and raised the
grade to a "C." Then, he "elected the best course on the campus for En-
glish composition," one which was taught by Barrett Wendell, "then the
great pundit of Harvard English" (144-45; emphasis mine).

Du Bois depicts his teacher as "fair" in judging his writing "techni-
cally" but as having neither any idea of nor any interest in the ways in
which racism "scratch[ed] [Du Bois] on the raw flesh" (144). Du Bois
presents his own interest in the "Negro problem" as a positive force;
enabling him to produce "solid content" and "worthy" thoughts. At the
same time, he also presents his racial/political interest as making him
"bitter, angry, and intemperate." The politics of style would suggest that
his "disregard of exact accuracy in grammar, taste in word or restraint
in style" when writing the thesis might have stemmed not only from his
failure to recognize the importance of form but also from the particular
constraints this "literary form" placed on his effort to "spill out" bitter
and angry contents against the establishment. Regard for "accuracy in
grammar, taste in words or restraint in style" would have constrained
his effort to "let go at [Senator Morgan] with no holds barred" (empha-
sis mine). But statements such as "style is subordinate to content" but
"carries a message further" suggest that Du Bois accepts wholeheart-
edly the view that the production of "something to say" takes place be-
fore and independent of the effort to "say it well" (144; emphasis mine).
Nor does Du Bois fault his teachers for failing to help him recognize and
then practice ways of dealing with the politics of a "style" which privi-
leges "restraint." Rather, his account suggests only that writing teachers
need to become more understanding of the students' racial/political
interests and their tendency to view "the Negro problem" as more im-
portant than "literary form." Thus, his account allows teachers to read it
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as endorsing the idea that once the teachers learn to show more interest
in what the students "have to say" about racism, they can continue to
teach "literary form" in the way Du Bois's composition teachers did.

Neither do the writings of James Baldwin, whom Shaughnessy cites
as the kind of "mature and gifted writer" her Basic Writers could aspire
to become (Errors 197), provide much direct opposition to this two-
pronged approach to reform. In "A Talk to Teachers" (originally pub-
lished in the Saturday Review, 21 December 1963), Baldwin argues that
"any Negro who is born in this country and undergoes the American
educational system runs the risk of becoming schizophrenic" (Price 326;
see also Conversations 183), thus providing powerful support for Howe's
call for sympathy from the dominant culture. Baldwin does offer some
very sharp and explicit critiques of the view of literary style as politi-
cally innocent. In "If Black English Isn't a Language, Then Tell Me, What
Is?" Baldwin points out that "the rules of the language are dictated by
what the language must convey" (Price 651). He later explains that stan-
dard English "was not designed to carry those spirits and patterns" he
has observed in his relatives and among the people from the streets and
churches of Harlem, so he "had to find a way to bend it [English]" when
writing about them in his first book (Conversations 162). These descrip-
tions suggest that Baldwin is aware of the ways in which the style of one
particular discourse mediates one's effort to generate content or a point
of view alien to that discourse. Yet, since he is referring to his writing
experience after he has become what Shaughnessy calls a "mature and
gifted writer" rather than to his experience as a student in a writing class-
room, he does not directly challenge the problematics surfacing in dis-
cussions of educational reform aimed at accommodation without change.

The seeming resemblances between minority educators and Basic
Writerstheir "subculture" backgrounds, the "psychic woe" they ex-
perience as a result of the dissonance within or among cultures, their
"ambivalence" toward cultural bleaching, and their interest in racial/
class politicsmake these educators powerful allies for composition
teachers like Shaughnessy who are not only committed to the educa-
tional rights and capacity of Basic Writers but also determined to grant
students the freedom of choosing their alignments among conflicting
cultures. We should not underestimate the support these narratives could
provide for the field of Basic Writing as it struggled in the 1970s to es-
tablish legitimacy for its knowledge and expertise. I call attention to this
support because of the intersection I see between Shaughnessy's ap-
proach to the function of conflict and struggle in Basic Writing instruc-
tion and the problematics I have sketched out in discussing the writings
of Howe, Kriegel, Du Bois, and Baldwin.
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Like Howe and Du Bois, Shaughnessy tends to approach the prob-
lems of Basic Writers in terms of their ambivalence toward academic
culture:

College both beckons and threatens them, offering to teach them
useful ways of thinking and talking about the world, promising even
to improve the quality of their lives, but threatening at the same
time to take from them their distinctive ways of interpreting the
world, to assimilate them into the culture of academia without ac-
knowledging their experience as outsiders. (Errors 292)

Again and again, Shaughnessy reminds us of her students' fear that
mastery of a new discourse could wipe out, cancel, or take from them
the points of view resulting from "their experience as outsiders." This
fear, she argues, causes her students to mistrust and psychologically re-
sist learning to write. And she reasons that "if students understand why
they are being asked to learn something and if the reasons given do not
conflict with deeper needs for self-respect and loyalty to their group
(whether that be an economic, racial, or ethnic group), they are disposed
to learn it" (Errors 125; emphasis mine).

Shaughnessy proposes some teaching methods toward that end. For
example, when discussing her students' difficulty developing an "aca-
demic vocabulary," she suggests that students might resist associating a
new meaning with a familiar word because accepting that association
might seem like consenting to a "linguistic betrayal that threatens to
wipe out not just a word but the reality that the word refers to" (Errors
212). She then goes on to suggest that "if we consider the formal (rather
than the contextual) ways in which words can be made to shift meaning
we are closer to the kind of practical information about words BW stu-
dents need" (212). Shaughnessy's rationale seems to be that the "for-
mal" approach (in this case teaching students to pay attention to pre-
fixes and suffixes) is more "practical" because it will help students mas-
ter the academic meaning of a word without reminding them that doing
so might "wipe out" the familiar "reality"the world, people, and mean-
ingspreviously associated with that word.

As I have argued elsewhere, the "formal" approach can be taken as
"practical" only if teachers view the students' awareness of the conflict
between the home meaning and the school meaning of a word as some-
thing to be "dissolved" at all costs because it will make them less "dis-
posed to learn" academic discourse, as Shaughnessy seems to believe
(Lu, "Redefining" 35). However, the experiences of Anzaldila and Rose
suggest that the best way to help students cope with the "pain," "strain,"
"guilt," "fear," or "confusions" resulting from this type of conflict is not
to find ways of "releasing" the students from these experiences or to
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avoid situations which might activate them. Rather, the "contextual"
approach would have been more "practical," since it could help stu-
dents deal self-consciously with the threat of "betrayal," especially if
they fear and want to resist it. The "formal approach" recommended by
Shaughnessy is likely to be only a more "practical" way of preserving
"academic vocabulary" and of speeding the students' internalization of
it. But as Rose's experiences working with students like Lucia indicate,
it is exactly because teachers like him took the "contextual" approach
"encouraging her to talk through opinions of her own that ran counter
to these discussions" (Rose, Lives 184-85)that Lucia was able to get
beyond the first twelve pages of Szasz's text and learn the "academic"
meaning of "mental illness" posited by Szasz, a meaning which literally
threatens to wipe out the "reality" of her brother's illness and her feel-
ings about it.

Shaughnessy's tendency to overlook the political dimensions of the
linguistic choices students make when reading and writing also points
to the ways in which her "essentialist" view of language and her view
of conflict and struggle as the enemies of Basic Writing instruction feed
on one another (see Lu, "Redefining" 26, 28-29). The supposed separa-
tion between language, thinking, and living reduces language into dis-
crete and autonomous linguistic varieties or sets of conventions, rules,
standards, and codes rather than treating language as a site of cultural
conflict and struggle. From the former perspective, it is possible to be-
lieve, as Shaughnessy seems to suggest when opting for the "formal"
approach to teaching vocabulary, that learning the rules of a new "lan-
guage variety""the language of public transactions"will give the
student the "ultimate freedom of deciding how and when and where he
will use which language" (Errors 11, 125). And it makes it possible for
teachers like Shaughnessy to separate a "freedom" of choice in "linguis-
tic variety" from one's social beingone's need to deliberate over and
decide how to reposition oneself in relationship to conflicting cultures
and powers. Thus, it might lead teachers to overlook the ways in which
one's "freedom" of cultural alignment might impinge on one's freedom
in choosing "linguistic variety."

Shaughnessy's approach to Basic Writing instruction has rhetorical
power because of its seeming alignment with positions taken by "mi-
nority" writers. Her portrayal of the "ambivalent feelings" of Basic Writ-
ers matches the experiences of "wrestling" (Trilling) and "partial
deracination" (Howe), "the distinctive frustration" (Du Bois), and
"schizophrenia" (Baldwin) portrayed in the writings of the more estab-
lished members of the academy. All thus lend validity to each other's
understanding of the "problems" of students from minority cultures and
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to their critiques of educational systems which mandate total accultura-
tion. Shaughnessy's methods of teaching demonstrate acceptance of and
compassion toward students' experience of the kind of "dislocation,"
"alienation," or "difference" which minority writers like Howe, Du Bois,
and Baldwin argue will always accompany those trying by choice or
need to "live with" the tensions of conflicting cultures. Her methods of
teaching also demonstrate an effort to accommodate these feelings and
points of view. That is, because of her essentialist assumption that words
can express but will not change the essence of one's thoughts, her peda-
gogy promises to help students master academic discourse without forc-
ing them to reposition themselvesi.e., to re-form their relationto-
ward conflicting cultural beliefs. In that sense, her teaching promises to
accommodate the students' need to establish deep contact with a "wider,"
more "public" culture by "releasing" them from their fear that learning
academic discourse will cancel out points of view meaningful to their
non-"academic" activities. At the same time, it also promises to accom-
modate their existing ambivalence toward and differences from academic
culture by assuming that "expressing" this ambivalence and these dif-
ferences in academic "forms" will not change the "essence" of these
points of view. The lessons she learns from her journey in the "peda-
gogical West" thus converge with those of Kriegel, who dedicates his
book to "Mina Shaughnessy, who knows that nothing is learned sim-
ply." That is, when discussing her teaching methods, she too tends to
overlook the ways in which her methods of teaching "linguistic codes"
might weaken her concern to permit the students freedom of choice in
their points of view. Ultimately, as I have argued, the teaching of both
Shaughnessy and Kriegel might prove to be more successful in preserv-
ing the traditions of "English language and literature" than in helping
students reach a self-conscious choice on their position toward conflict-
ing cultural values and forces.

Contesting the Residual Power of Viewing Conflict and Struggle as
the Enemies of Basic Writing Instruction: Present and Future

The view that all signs of conflict and struggle are the enemies of Basic
Writing instruction emerged partly from a set of specific historical con-
ditions surrounding the Open Admissions movement. Open Admissions
at CUNY was itself an attempt to deal with immediate, intense, some-
times violent social, political, and racial confrontations. Such a context
might have provided a "logic" for shifting students' attention away from
conflict and struggle and toward calm. However, the academic status
which pioneers like Bruffee, Farrell, and Shaughnessy have achieved
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and the practical, effective cures their pedagogies seem to offer have com-
bined to perpetuate the rhetorical power of such a view for Basic Writ-
ing instruction through the 1970s to the present. The consensus among
the gatekeepers, converters, and accommodationists furnishes some Basic
Writing teachers with a complacent sense that they already know all
about the "problems" Basic Writers have with conflict and struggle. This
complacency makes teachers hesitant to consider the possible uses of
conflict and struggle, even when these possibilities are indicated by later
developments in language theories and substantiated both by accounts
of alternative educational experiences by writers like Anzaldlia and Rose
and by research on the constructive use of conflict and struggle, such as
the research discussed in the first section of this essay.

Such complacency is evident in the works of compositionists like Mary
Epes and Ann Murphy. Epes's work suggests that she is aware of recent
arguments against the essentialist view of language underlying some
composition theories and practices. For example, she admits that error
analysis is complex because there is "a crucial area of overlap" between
"encoding" (defined by Epes as "controlling the visual symbols which
represent meaning on the page") and "composing (controlling meaning
in writing)" (6). She also observes that students are most likely to expe-
rience the "conflict between composing and decoding" when the "norms
of the written code" are "in conflict" with "the language of one's nur-
ture" (31). Given Epes's recognition of the conflict between encoding
and composing, she should have little disagreement with compositionists
who argue that learning to use the "codes" of academic discourse would
constrain certain types of meanings, such as the formulation of feelings
and thoughts toward cultures drastically dissonant from academic cul-
ture. Yet, when Epes moves from her theory to pedagogy, she argues
that teachers of Basic Writers can and ought to treat "encoding" and
"composition" as two separate areas of instruction (31). Her rationale is
simple: separating the two could avoid "exacerbating" the students'
experience of the "conflict" between these activities (31). The key terms
here (for me, at any rate) are "exacerbating" and "conflict." They illus-
trate Epes's concern to eliminate conflict, disagreement, tension, and
complexity from the Basic Writing classroom (cf. Homer, "Rethinking"
179-83).

Ann Murphy's essay "Transference and Resistance" likewise demon-
strates the residual power of the earlier view of conflict and struggle as
the enemies of Basic Writing instruction. Her essay draws on her knowl-
edge of the Lacanian notion of the decentered and destabilized subject.
Yet Murphy argues against the applicability of such a theory to the teach-
ing of Basic Writing on the ground that Basic Writers are not like other
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students. Basic Writers, Murphy argues, "may need centering rather than
decentering, and cognitive skills rather than (or as compellingly as) self-
exploration" (180). She depicts Basic Writers as "shattered and destabi-
lized by the social and political system" (180). She claims that "being
taken seriously as adults with something of value to say can, for many
Basic Writing students, be a traumatic and disorienting experience" (180;
emphasis mine). Murphy's argument demonstrates her desire to elimi-
nate any sense of uncertainty or instability in Basic Writing classrooms.
Even though Murphy is willing to consider the implications of the
Lacanian notion of individual subjectivity for the teaching of other types
of students (180), her readiness to separate Basic Writing classrooms from
other classrooms demonstrates the residual power of earlier views of
conflict and struggle.

Such a residual view is all the more difficult to contest because it is
supported by a new generation of minority educators. For example, in
"Teacher Background and Student Needs" (1991), Peter Rondinone uses
his personal experiences as an open admissions student taking Basic
Writing 1 at CCNY during the early '70s and his Russian immigrant
family background in the Bronx to argue for the need to help Basic Writ-
ers understand that "in deciding to become educated there will be times
when [basic writers] will be forced to . . . reject or betray their family and
friends in order to succeed" ("Teacher" 42). Rondinone's view of how
students might best deal with the conflict between home and school
does not seem to have changed much since his 1977 essay describing his
experience as a senior at City College (see Rondinone, "Open Admis-
sions"). In his 1991 essay, this time writing from the point of view of an
experienced teacher, Rondinone follows Bruffee in maintaining that
"learning involves shifting social allegiances" ("Teacher" 49). My quar-
rel with Rondinone is not so much over his having opted for complete
deracination (for.I honor his right to choose his allegiance even though
I disagree with his choice). I am, however, alarmed by his unequivocal
belief that his choice is the a priori condition of his academic success,
which reveals his conviction that conflict can only impede one's learn-
ing.

Shelby Steele's recent and popular The Content of Our Character sug-
gests similar assumptions about experiences of cultural conflict. Using
personal experiences, Steele portrays the dilemma of an African Ameri-
can college student and professor in terms of being caught in the famil-
iar "trap" bound by "two equally powerful elements" which are "at odds
with each other" (95). Steele's solution to the problem of "opposing
thrusts" is simple: find a way to "unburden" the student from one of the
thrusts (160). Thus, Steele promotes a new, "peacetime" black identity
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which could "release" black Americans from a racial identity which re-
gards their "middle-class" values, aspirations, and success as suspect
(109).

To someone like Steele, the pedagogies of Bruffee, Farrell, and
Rondinone would make sense. In such a classroom, the black student
who told Steele that "he was not sure he should master standard En-
glish because then he 'wouldn't be black no more" (70) would have the
comfort of knowing that he is not alone in wanting to pursue things "all
individuals" want or in wishing to be drawn "into the American main-
stream" (71). Furthermore, he would find support systems to ease him
through the momentary pain, dislocation, and anxiety accompanying
his effort to "unburden" himself of one of the "opposing thrusts." The
popular success of Steele's book attests to the power of this type of think-
ing on the contemporary scene. Sections of his book originally appeared
in such journals as Harper's, Commentary, the New York Times Magazine,
and The American Scholar. Since publication of the book, Steele has been
touted as an expert on problems facing African American students in
higher education, and his views have been aired on PBS specials,
Night line, the MacNeil/Lehrer News Hour, and in Time magazine. The popu-
larity of his book should call our attention to the direct and indirect ways
in which the distrust of conflict and struggle continues to be recycled
and disseminated both within and outside the academy. At the same
time, the weight of the authority of the Wagners and Hellers should
caution us to take more seriously the constraints the Rondinones and
Steeles can exert on Basic Writing teachers, a majority of us still occupy-
ing peripheral positions in a culture repeatedly swept by waves of new
conservatism.

But investigating the particular directions taken by Basic Writing pio-
neers when establishing authority for their expertise and the historical
contexts of those directions should also enable us to perceive alternative
ways of conversing with the Rondinones and Steeles in the 1990s. Be-
cause of the contributions of pioneers like Bruffee, Farrell, and
Shaughnessy, we can now mobilize the authority they have gained for
the field, for our knowledge as well as our expertise as Basic Writing
teachers. While we can continue to benefit from the insights into stu-
dents' experiences of conflict and struggle offered in the writings of all
those I have discussed, we need not let their view of the cause and func-
tion of such experiences restrict how we view and use the stories and
pedagogies they provide. Rather, we need to read them against the grain,
filling in the silences left in these accounts by re-reading their experi-
ences from the perspective of alternative accounts from the borderlands
and from the perspective of new language and pedagogical theories.
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For many of these authors are themselves products of classrooms which
promoted uncritical faith in either an essentialist view of language or
various forms of discursive utopia that these writers aspired to preserve.
Therefore, we should use our knowledge and expertise as
compositionists to do what they did not or could not do: re-read their
accounts in the context of current debates on the nature of language,
individual consciousness, and the politics of basic skills. At the same
time, we also need to gather more oppositional and alternative accounts
from a new generation of students, those who can speak about the suc-
cesses and challenges of classrooms which recognize the positive uses
of conflict and struggle and which teach the process of repositioning.

The writings of the pioneers and their more established contempo-
raries indicate that the residual distrust of conflict and struggle in the
field of Basic Writing is sustained by a fascination with cures for psychic
woes, by two views of educationas acculturation and as accommoda-
tionand by two views of languageessentialist and utopian. We need
more research which critiques portrayals of Basic Writers as belonging
to an abnormaltraumatized or underdevelopedmental state and
which simultaneously provides accounts of the "creative motion" and
"compensation," "joy," or "exhilaration" resulting from Basic Writers'
efforts to grapple with the conflict within and among diverse discourses.
We need more research analyzing and contesting the assumptions about
language underlying teaching methods which offer to "cure" all signs
of conflict and struggle, research which explores ways to help students
recover the latent conflict and struggle in their lives which the domi-
nant conservative ideology of the 1990s seeks to contain. Most of all, we
need to find ways of foregrounding conflict and struggle not only in the
generation of meaning or authority but also in the teaching of conven-
tions of "correctness" in syntax, spelling, and punctuation, traditionally
considered the primary focus of Basic Writing instruction.
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3 Importing "Science": Neutralizing
Basic Writing

Min-Zhan Lu

When discussing the "support" sociolinguistic research provided for
composition, Lester Faigley observes that Shaughnessy's "landmark"
study of error "almost on its own established basic writing as an impor-
tant subfield within composition" (Fragments 61). This paper
contextualizes Shaughnessy's contribution to composition by sketching
the discursive terrain shaping Basic Writing's institutional birth.' I ar-
gue that the birth of Basic Writing cannot be separated from its success
in constructing "science" as a means for neutralizing the politics of writ-
ing, teaching, and research at a timethe 1970sand an educational
sitethe basic writing classroomwhen the dominant found issues of
difference and power most difficult to contain. One way of understand-
ing Basic Writing's ability to establish itself as one of the ten topics "cen-
tral to the teaching of composition" (Tate viii) during the seventies is to
examine its active participation in a move across a range of academic
disciplines and fieldsincluding composition, literary studies, educa-
tion, linguistics, sociology, and psychologyto maintain the "scientific"
objectivity of the researcher/critic/teacher's language, methods, and
knowledge. That is, we need to examine Basic Writing's venture outside
English into "science" in terms of the teacher/researcher's often contra-
dictory concerns to know the "aliens" in more realistic/neutral terms
and to know the "aliens" with the language and from the perspective of
a "settler."

Importing "Science": Errors and Expectations and "Basic Writing"

Critics have long observed the "seminal influence" of Shaughnessy's
writing on Basic Writing (Courage 247). As Robert Lyons points out, in a
field often marked by controversy and division, her work was invari-
ably accorded attention and respect ("Mina Shaughnessy" 172). We might
contextualize this phenomenon by analyzing the empiricist, idealist as-

56
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sumptions concerning language underlying the story of "science" told
in two of Shaughnessy's most widely read writings, Errors and Expecta-
tions and her 1976 bibliographical essay on Basic Writing. "Science" in
these texts works to align Basic Writing with dominant views on the
neutrality of research, writing, and teaching, including the ideals of
"scientism" in social sciences and composition (Phelps), the myth of
"natural literacy" in higher education (Phelps 108; Scribner), a subject
position of the "writer" centered on a New Critical "creative inward-
ness" (Miller) or "flight from politics" (Ohmann, English), and the ex-
pressive/ empiricist metaphor of language underwriting the process
approach to composition as well as realism, romanticism, and New Criti-
cism (Faigley, Fragments 112). It operates to focus attention on the real-
ism of the knowledge of the teacher/researcher/critic and to shift atten-
tion away from the politics of her perspective and language.

In Composition as a Human Science, Louise Wetherbee Phelps argues
that the ideals of "scientism" often find their way into summaries of the
"scientific method" offered in the social disciplines and composition (11,
12). She characterizes "scientism" as practices assuming an equation of
"knowledge, truth, and proof," thus promoting a "logical empiricism"
with its philosophical bases in "sense data" and "universal reason" (9).
One of the consequences of such premises is, of course, the idealization
of the "objective" attitude of the neutral scientist and of a neutral"ex-
act, formal, literal, and univocal"observation language (10). "Science"
in Shaughnessy's bibliographical essay "Basic Writing" is fixed within
the parameters of "scientism." The relevance of "science" to Basic Writ-
ing, Shaughnessy maintains, resides in the validity not only of what the
scientist said but also "the way he observed" and the way "thought is
communicated in his work" (154). I read her to be urging basic writing
teachers and researchers to look to "the documents of science" not only
for truth but also methods of producing as well as presenting it (154,
emphasis mine). In reviewing the "highly circumscribed literature" (142)
on basic writing, Shaughnessy laments that "in English there is no tradi-
tion of observation and cumulative publication, as there is in the sciences"
(142, 141, my emphasis). By calling this literature "information .. . tempt-
ing us to premature judgments" (142), she implies that "the tradition of
observation and cumulative publication" yields "truth": produces "docu-
ments" (154) grounded in sense data"files of student writing" or "case
studies of student writers" (141).

A neutral observational perspective and language is also an ideal
Shaughnessy aspires to for Basic Writing. For example, in her biblio-
graphical essay, she justifies her preference for the designation "basic
writer" by ranking various forms of identificationdisadvantaged,
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handicapped, remedial, developmental, basic, severely unprepared
in terms of which is "more neutral" (137). She thus implies that a "neu-
tral" approach to and presentation of the "new" students is not only
possible but also preferablethe rightful goal of Basic Writing. As Lyons
has cogently pointed out, Errors and Expectations strives to enact in its
language, structure, and tone the academic ideal of "fairness, objectiv-
ity, and formal courtesy" (1980,9-10).

This emphasis on observation and more fair, objective, longitudinal
descriptions of actual students and their writing and learning is unques-
tionably subversive, representing the interest of basic writing teachers
to acknowledge the intelligence of students deemed unfit by the
gatekeepers, whose prejudices, ignorance, and arrogance toward basic
writing teachers and students were repeatedly captured and critiqued
in Shaughnessy's work, including "Diving In," "The English Teacher's
Malady," and Errors and Expectations. On the one hand, given the au-
thority of "science" on the discursive horizons of the gatekeepers, the
move to deploy the story of "science" to producepublish and make
publishablealternative, more in-depth and complex portraits of the
"aliens" can be perceived as purely "rhetorical." That is, it could be per-
ceived as an effort to shift the debate on the institutional place of basic
writing students and teachers by casting alternative knowledge in a
framework familiar to and deemed acceptable by the dominant. In writ-
ing without "a trace of revolutionary rhetoric," Shaughnessy is, and has
succeeded historically in, making "a political statement" (Lyons, "Mina
Shaughnessy" 185): the need to "uphold" and welcome the new stu-
dents "within" the academic tradition (Lyons, "Mina Shaughnessy and
the Teaching of Writing" 7). On the other hand, given the constitutive
power of language, such a move can never remain purely "rhetorical"
or escape other equally political statements and consequences. Rather,
invoking the prevalent faith in logical empiricism and the neutrality of
teaching, writing, and research signified by "science" also works to oc-
clude attention (on the part of both the writer and reader) to the histori-
cal, political situatedness of the teacher /researcher: the complex and
often contradictory interests motivating the observation and descrip-
tion. As a result, a set of "new" knowledge is perceived as replacing old
prejudices as the objective Truth of basic writing rather than as provi-
sional truths inscribed in specific social political motives and having
specific social, historical consequences.

This might particularly be the case during Basic Writing's birth be-
cause of the residual power of the New Critical approach to writing on
the discursive horizon of the gatekeepers in English studies, Basic
Writing's home. For an essentialist view of language conjoins New Criti-
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cism with scientism. The assumed equation of knowledge, truth, and
proof underlying scientism inevitably endows language with a "linguistic
innocence," implying that it is a transparent medium for sensing reality
and reasoning rather than being itself a site of social conflict and struggle
(Lu, "Redefining"). Therefore, a venture into a "science" dominated by
the ideals of scientism is but a "new" route back into the center of an
English dominated by the master plots of expressive realism. As
Catherine Belsey argues in Critical Practice, an expressive realism runs
through dominant approaches to literature in English Studies from the
nineteenth century to the 1970s: romanticism, Realism, and New Criti-
cism. Both the mimetic and expressive views of art assume that the world
of natural objects is unproblematically given and that the mind of the
spectator is ready to perceive and re-present these natural objects (9).
Thus, both the mimetic and expressive metaphors of language assume
that language exists outside of history and is innocent of politics (Faigley,
Fragments 112). The New Critics, in failing to recognize that meaning
exists only within a specific language, "are forced back on" the naive
empiricism-idealism conjoining romanticism and realism (Belsey 19).
The same can be said about Basic Writing's venture outside of "English."
The essentialist view of language conjoining scientism and New Criti-
cism suggests that we need to read Basic Writing's participation in what
Connors has termed composition's "yearning" toward scientific status
not only in terms of what Elizabeth Flynn has described as a "defense in
the struggle against its chief adversary, literary studies" (Flynn, "Femi-
nism" 355); we need also to approach it in terms of its ability to establish
Basic Writing's allegiance with New Critical projects within literary stud-
ies and mainstream composition. We need to examine the ways in which
the figure of the "scientific" researcher conjoins the figure of the New
Critic to ground the teacher's knowledge in the object of studythe text
and /or the writerand to render irrelevant attention to the teacher /
critic/researcher 's choice of language and perspective.

It is not coincidental but a logical consequence of the expressive real-
ism conjoining scientism and New Criticism that Shaughnessy's
"groundbreaking" approach to error would simultaneously deploy the
knowledge of "sciences"namely linguistics and cognitive psychol-
ogyand the "literary" method of close reading that critics have seen
in her work (Miller 116-17; Bartholomae, "Writing" 70-71). For the same
reason, the institutional currency of Errors and Expectations cannot be
separate from its success in using the figure of the "scientific" researcher
to authorize the neutrality of the New Critical scholar /teacher at a time
when, as Miller observes, the hold of New Criticism in literary studies is
"relaxing" (118). "Science" operates to justify not only the need for

7 9



60 Representing the "Other"

teacher/researchers to abandon some of the old beliefs and practices
inherited from home (such as prejudice against non-standard English
and the intelligence of its speakers) but also the need to renew other
familiar beliefs and practices, including the myths of the political inno-
cence of "writing" and "teaching" underlying the New Critical approach.
Therefore, the efficacy of "the tradition of observation and cumulative
publication .. . in sciences" for Basic Writing is not just, as Shaughnessy
presents it, to legitimizepublish and make publishablenew knowl-
edge about the new students ("Basic Writing" 141) but could also often
work to legitimizeobjectify and neutralizefamiliar ways of know-
ing the Other and evading the politics of intellectual efforts.

Furthermore, we need to keep in mind that the neutralizing power of
"science" is invoked at a historical junction and educational site where
issues of power and differences are at the center of all debates. In the
context of illustrating the "academic" underpreparedness of the teach-
ers, Shaughnessy points to the "urgent conditions, both political and
economic," that led to the rash institution of "remedial wings" in col-
lege campuses during the late sixties ("Basic Writing" 140). To argue for
the need for teachers to read up on literature on "language in various
social settings," Shaughnessy again admits that the basic writing class-
room is simply one of the places where the fact of diversity has become
not merely an "academic" topic but a complex and troubling issue af-
fecting what English teachers teach and how they teach it (159). If issues
of diversity and power are at the center of debate on the who, what, and
how of teaching, then the status of "documents of science" can work to
absolve the teacher/researchers from the need to reflect on the politics
of their choice of perspective and language. For example, in Errors and
Expectations, one "science"linguisticsis used to provide support for
a notion of writing and teaching which dissolves the political content of
linguistic differences and which encourages students to approach dif-
ferences through acculturation and accommodation rather than nego-
tiation (Lu, "Redefining," "Conflict and Struggle"). Yet, the expressive
realism authorizing the teacher/researcher's knowledge of the who,
what, and how of teaching renders attention to the politics of such a
resolution to differences and power irrelevant.

However, if we are to understand such pioneering work as
Shaughnessy's writings on basic writing as not an example of an indi-
vidual feat in instituting a professional field, we need to also reject see-
ing it as an example of individual bad faith or conceptual failure. Rather,
we need to approach the dominance of expressive realism in
Shaughnessy's view of "science" and its political efficacy in terms of
what Pierre Bourdieu has termed the dilemma of progressive intellectu-
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als, i.e., the role of a "dominated among the dominant." The work of the
basic writing teacher/researcher is inevitably riven by her identifica-
tion with the dominated, generated by a commitment to the education
of students deemed by the academy as aliens, and her inscription within
the dominant in her function as a teacher and intellectual. In Fragments
of Rationality, Faigley argues that the changing politics of composition
studies during the 1970s cannot be separated from the political Right's
exploitation of the anxiety of the professional middle class over the pos-
sibilities of "falling down the social incline" (54-63). His discussion of
the various challenges and possibilities posed for the process approach
by the right wing back-to-basics movement might be used to sketch the
social, historical scene shaping Shaughnessy's interest in "scientific"
knowledge, methods, and language. On the one hand, the so-called lit-
eracy crisis posed real threats to the institutional place of teachers and
students associated with academic underpreparedness, presenting them
as the villains personifying the invasion of "politics" (radical or guilt-
ridden liberalism) on American education. The back-to-basics movement
fueled an accountability movement during the early 1970s. States started
to require schools to publish achievement test scores and passed laws
requiring exit exams and frequent performance testing (Faigley, Frag-
ments 63). These mandates generated extra pressure on English teach-
ers, driving them to follow in step the drills-and-skills curriculum pack-
ages supplied by textbook publishers. For basic writing teachers like
Shaughnessy, the conviction that the drills-and-skills curriculum does
not work with their students and that standardized testing fails to do
justice to the students' expertise and intelligence would motivate them
to articulate an alternative approach. At the same time, the hegemony of
the Right delimited how such an approach could be posed. Negatively,
as Faigley reminds us, the marginalized status of many writing teachers
led most to shy away from taking public political stands even when
they disagreed with prevailing attitudes toward literacy (Fragments 66).
This concern to pose one's alternative approach to literacy with a seem-
ingly neutral knowledge base and language would be even more urgent
for teachers like Shaughnessy since the institutional places of both the
basic writing teachers and the students were even more precarious.
Therefore, the interest in scientism surfacing in Shaughnessy's writing
is intellectualan indication of her inscription in New Critical expres-
sive realismas well as sociohistorical. Faigley also reminds us that,
positively, the back-to-basics movement brought favorable conditions
for writing teachers in their struggle to change their marginalized status
in English (66). New positions for writing specialists were created and
new resources of funding became available (67). But in their effort to
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take advantage of such possibilities, composition teachers would again
need to place their research and teaching within the dominant views of
"research" and "teaching" held by those with authority to grant such
funding (see Homer, "Discoursing" 208-10). Therefore, Shaughnessy's
deployment of "science" also needs to be read alongside the institutional
reception of research and pedagogy which maintains and/or challenges
the neutrality of writing, teaching, and research across disciplines.

In the following sections, I map the discursive terrain shaping the
institutional birth of Basic Writing by delineating a pervasive move in
composition to shift attention from the politics of writing, teaching, and
research. I do so by tracing the story of "science" recurring across a range
of canonical texts in composition, including Janet Emig's The Composing
Processes of Twelfth Graders (1971), Peter Elbow's Writing Without Teachers
(1973), Young, Becker, and Pike's Rhetoric: Discovery and Change (1970),
Frank O'Hare's Sentence Combining (1973), James Moffett's Teaching the
Universe of Discourse (1968), the Conference on College Composition and
Communication's Statement on "Students' Right to Their Own Lan-
guage" (1974), and I. A. Richards's Practical Criticism (1929). I argue that
although quite a few of the texts enact stances toward "academic" dis-
course significantly different from Shaughnessy's Errors and Expectations
both in their style (e.g., the "anti-academic" tone and language of Writ-
ing Without Teachers) and argument (e.g., the CCCC resolution on stu-
dents' "right" to their "own" language), the concern to maintain the
political "innocence" of teaching and research runs through them? I fur-
ther map the constraints such a concern poses for basic writing teachers
and researchers by examining the ways in which U.S. educators impute
"scientific" status to texts across English, education, and the social sci-
ences which have been often cited by compositionists as useful resources,
including the writings of Kenneth Burke, Paulo Freire, Basil Bernstein,
Richard Ohmann, William Labov, and Lev Vygotsky. I argue that the
pervasive move to separate these writers' thinking on the relations of
language, subjectivity, differences, and power from their "scientific"
knowledge of linguistic and cognitive structures and then to dismiss
the former as "irrelevant" might likewise route Basic Writing's venture
into "science" back into an English dominated by New Critical close
reading.

Objectifying Process Research

One way of mapping the discursive terrain shaping Basic Writing's birth
is to examine the story of "science" in what Shaughnessy calls a "pio-
neering study" capable of "saving us from false dichotomies," Janet
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Emig's 1971 The Composing Processes of Twelfth Graders ("Basic Writing"
165-66, my emphasis). This monograph has generally been perceived
as having played an "influential" or "precedent"-setting role in turning
"process" into a key term and composition into a "legitimate" discipline
(Faigley, Fragments 58, Miller 143). In "Competing Theories of Process,"
Faigley calls attention to the "mixture of social science and literary idi-
oms" in Emig's writing (532). I'd like to argue that, as in Shaughnessy's
work, this mixture needs to be examined in relation to the essentialist
view of language underlying both Emig's definition of "phenomeno-
logical" research and the New Critical notion of writing. Composing Pro-
cesses is "pioneering" not only because it gives composition a way into
mainstream education and cognitive psychology but also because it gives
composition a "fresh" way out: it proffers an "objective" rationale for
composition to "entrench itself," as Miller puts it, in the dominant En-
glish subject/subject positioning at a time when "liberal" education is
having difficulty maintaining the myth of its separation from politics
(118; see also Ohmann, English in America).

"Process" in Emig's work is used interchangeably with words such
as "phenomena," "entities," (The Web of Meaning 159), "actuality" (Web
160), or "behavior." Thus, "process" is essentialized into an indepen-
dent entity inherent in the referent, an object which "we" (teachers and
researchers) investigate, explain, perceive, select, gather, arrange (Web
159). Emig's characterization of "phenomenology," a tradition within
which she places her case study (Web 163), illustrates the way in which
"science" in Emig's work operates to free the construction and teaching
of "process" from issues of power and difference. Quoting Elliot G.
Mishler, Emig notes that "phenomenologists" assume that the "[phe-
nomenon] contains multiple truths, each of which will be revealed by a
shift in perspective, method, or purpose" (Web 162). The words "con-
tain" and "reveal" ground the knowledge of the teacher /researcher in
the "phenomenon" and make attention to the politics of the researcher's
choice of how, when, and where to "shift" irrelevant even as she ac-
knowledges the partiality of phenomenological knowledge.

Emig's goal in performing a "naturalistic examination" (Web 163) is
to formulate universal constants: "delineating the, even a, writing pro-
cess" and "ascertain[ing] whether the process has constant characteris-
tics across writers" (Composing 15). However, the politics of her search
for constants is made irrelevant by words such as "data" and "finding,"
which she uses consistently in association with verbs such as "elicit,"
"collect," or "reveal," which imply that the characteristics are essences
inherent towithinthe "phenomenon" (4-5,33). "Objectivity" is fur-
ther invoked by presenting her method of research, "composing aloud,"
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as a means to "ascertain" and "externalize" (5) and as "reflect[ing], if not
parallelling], [the student's] actual inner process" (40, emphasis mine).
In establishing the expressive realism of the "process," these verbs shift
attention to what is within the object of study and away from the ways
in which the researcher's "shift" of perspective, method, or purpose
mediates the kind of truth she produces.

However, such discursive choices, such as the binary of "fact" and
"feelings," significantly mediate both the data she gathers and her evalu-
ation of such data. The following is an exchange between an Investiga-
tor and Lynn, one of the eight students studied by Emig, which is in-
cluded in the appendix:

Investigator: Ah, you were saying that, ah, you felt more comfort-
able when your writing concerned facts, or the organization of facts,
rather than some expression offeelings, why do you think this is so?

Lynn: I really have no idea. That is, this is just something about me.
I would rather . . . I'm a great organizer, and I'm going to run into
trouble maybe on the yearbook this year . . . I've always . . . I've
always had trouble talking to people about my feelings on some-
thing. I can quote from other people I can . . . talk about, ahm . . I
can talk about facts more easily than I can talk about abstract things
. . . . (Composing 123, my emphasis)

In a chapter entitled "Lynn: Profile of a Twelfth-Grade Writer," Emig
summarizes the above exchange as follows:

[The investigator asks Lynn why she thinks she feels more com-
fortable writing about facts rather than feelings. At first, she claims
she has no idea and changes the subject; later she admits that she
finds expressing her feelings painful:

I've always . . . I've always had trouble talking to people about,
my feelings on something. . . .

(Composing 49, my emphasis)

Emig's summary highlights the binary of fact/feeling and glosses over
the reference to "organization" in both the investigator's question and
Lynn's reply. It also ranks the validity of the "data" Lynn yields through
the contrast between "claim" and "admit." The truth value of what Lynn
"claimed" is made suspect in comparison to what she "admits" (46).
The word "admit," in invoking the equation of reality-truths-(self)-
knowledge, shifts attention away from the ways in which the language
of the researcher (the Investigator as well as Emig) mediates the way
Emig, the Investigator, and Lynn construct the composing process. No-
tice the Investigator's qualification, "or the organization of facts," when
posing the binary of "fact" and "feeling." This qualification momen-
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tarily signals to Lynn that "organization," another standard approach in
writing pedagogy, is also an appropriate approach to "her" composing
process. The fact that Lynn promptly took up that option to talk about
her experience editing the yearbook illustrates the ways in which the
language of the Investigator mediates the kind of "data" produced by
the research. Likewise, Emig's depiction of that exchange as "claim"
making and digression illustrates the extent to which the researcher 's
choice of perspective mediates her evaluation of the data. Furthermore,
Lynn's eventual ability to get back to the issue of fact/feeling also sug-
gests that the externalization of "her" composing process is mediated
by both her familiarity with the language and perspective of the re-
searcher and her willingness to view and talk about her composing pro-
cess with that language. As Lynn points out, the "kids" at the "institute"
she once attended had repeatedly told her that she "never seem[s] to be
talking about [her]self, about [her] own feelings. .. " (123). In other words,
Lynn might have "proved an exceptionally interesting subject" to the
researcher because of "her ability to verbalize the process of her think-
ing and writing" (46) with the language and from the perspective of the
researcher. However, the objective rhetoric underwriting Emig's mono-
graph renders attention to the mediating power of the researcher's dis-
cursive choices irrelevant.

We might examine the politics of preempting attention to such medi-
ating power by considering the white, middle-class alignment estab-
lished by the criteria this study uses when selecting its cases. Emig states
that the eight twelfth graders are chosen because they have above aver-
age and average "ability" (3) and "intelligence" (29). The criteria she
uses for judging "intelligence"school records, grades, scores on Col-
lege Entrance Board Examinations and the comments of teachers (Com-
posing 29)are procedures which, as Ohmann has argued in English in
America, represent the interests of white middle-class America. Yet, the
"scientific" rhetoric overwriting the study renders moot reflection on
the politics of using such criteria, which turn Lynnthe daughter of a
lawyer and a high school history teacher, a student in the top five per-
cent of her class, co-editor of the yearbook and a study hall monitor
into a representative case in a "truly cross-cultural district" consisting
of "Jewish doctors, dentists, and professors" and workers at steel mills,
including "blacks and newly arrived Mexicans, and Puerto Ricans" as
well as "second generation Polish- and Serbian-Americans" (45). Like-
wise, it enables the researcher to state as self-explanatory why out of
communities and schools with different "sociological characteristics"
she has chosen eight cases from families with "marked likenesses in cer-
tain formal characteristics of their families," even though, as research
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by Bernstein and Heath has indicated, "formal" characteristics such as
"verbal interaction with adults as an only child" and being "read to fre-
quently" (76) are class specific. The announced purpose of the study is
"to describe how student writers usually or typically behave as they
write" (21) with the hope that "the" process presented by the study can
be used to draw implications for how writing is to be taught "across"
American high schools (97). In short, the goal of this "scientific" search
for the typical writing behavior is to dissolve differences in writing be-
havior through teaching. The political efficacy of such a "scientific" en-
deavor therefore resides exactly in its ability to make the teacher /
researcher 's depiction of the behavior of student writers like Lynn "typi-
cal," i.e., "scientific" or "objective," rather than socially and historically
situated. Given the currency of neutrality in the United States of 1971,
when "education" was daily being forced to confront its participation
or complicity in racial and class inequality, the popularity of Emig's "pro-
cess" research seems predictable. It offers composition, mainstream and
basic, "fresh" ways for dissolving issues of differences and power in
research, teaching, and writing.

Attention to the politics of teaching and research is further dissolved
in Emig's writing through her construction of a "we"members of the
composition "community"as people living in a world consisting solely
of "intellectual ancestors," an "explanatory matrix," and "academic fields
or disciplines" (Web). Choices of perspective are confined by "intellec-
tual" and "academic" traditions that are seemingly unrelated to specific
social and political conflicts. To detach the knowledge of these "intellec-
tual ancestors" from the social contexts of their work, Emig reduces their
work into one-liners. Vygotsky is mentioned as one of the "ancestors"
yielding "observations" on "gesture" as the "origin of writing" (Web
166). Freire gets mentioned as one of the six "phenomenologists" work-
ing in philosophy, social sciences and literacy education (Web 161). Such
sweeping generalizations enable Emig to group the work of Vygotsky
and Freire with that of Piaget and Bruner (Web 160, 165) within the same
"intellectual" tradition and to detach all of them from the particular and
drastically different political contexts in which the four "ancestors" work
(more of this later). Two types of teacher inhabit Emig's "educational
system" in "disarray." The bad guys are the "dinosaurs, with their dis-
maying ratio of tail to brain" (Web 171), who "do not write" (Composing
98), "underconceptualize and oversimplify the process of composing"
(Composing 98), are consumed by the "neurosis" over "peripherals" such
as spelling, punctuation, or length, and hold on to a "teacher-centered
presentation of composition." This type of portrait turns the conflict
between the so-called process and product approaches or the teacher-
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centered and student-centered approaches into a struggle solely between
haves and have-nots of particular "intellectual" traits: size of brain and
brawn, real "writing" experience, or true knowledge of the process.

Attention to issues of difference and power is also displaced by Emig's
deployment of the binary of the social vs. human/natural, a binary which
critics have argued has hegemonic power in an English studies domi-
nated by the New Critical approach (Ohmann, Miller, Lentricchia). The
writing process is portrayed as "interrupted" in "major" ways by inter-
veners and interventions (Composing 40). Emig defines the interveners
as "persons who enter into the composing process of another" (40, em-
phasis mine). The phrase "enter into" sets "the process" up as a self-
evident "phenomenon" with independent proceedings. In Emig's other
and later work, a developmental frame is deployed to cast the "writing"
process into something "natural" and "innate" in all people. "[A]s evi-
dence from many disciplines now suggests, writing is developmentally
a natural process" (Web 136). One essay, "The Tacit Tradition," concludes
with a Credo which claims that "not writing or not wanting to write is
unnatural; that, if either occurs, something major has been subverted in
a mind, in a life" (Web 155). In turning "writing" into a natural phenom-
enon rather than a culturally constructed practice, Emig turns all teach-
ing based on her definition of the writing process into practices sanc-
tioned by natural laws. By the same token, differences in teaching can
be evaluated in terms of their ability to enable a natural, human process
rather than in terms of difference in socially, historically specific posi-
tions. Furthermore, such differences are decontextualized by the plot of
human evolution: "the teacher-centered presentation of composition .. .
is pedagogically, developmentally, and politically an anachronism" (Com-
posing 100). Thus, politics of the process approach is presented as moti-
vated by the natural course of ontogenic and phylogenic progression
rather than also as shaped and shaping historically and socially specific
relations of power within and outside the academy.

Yet, we arrive at a very different reading of the "natural" good of
"process" research if we approach it in terms of its alignment with vari-
ous hegemonic positions within and outside higher education during
the 1970s. Emig presents "writing" defined through the process knowl-
edge as a means to "freedom" on two levels: a freedom of mobility in
society and a freedom to fully realize one's innate, "human" potential: a
"way up, a way out, a way in" (Web 176, my emphasis). This faith in the
myth of functional literacy and natural literacy is clearly political in its
silence on the political interests shaping and shaped by its particular
definition of literacy, its silence on other non-"literacy" conditions for
individual social and political freedom or survival, and its deterministic

7



68 Representing the "Other"

portrayal of the individual as one acting passively according to social or
natural laws. It also aligns Emig's process approach solidly with the
dominant positions on the nature and function of literacy critiqued by
such theorists as Scribner and Stuckey.

Emig's bi-modal approach to writingextensive vs. reflexivealso
sets up alignments with two power bases within English: the New Criti-
cal approach in literary studies and the "expressive" approach in com-
position. Emig's account of the "reflexive" mode suggests that writing
in it allows students to be more "expressive" and natural: the choice of
audience in that mode is the self or a trusted peer, it utilizes one's own
experience and style, and it is affective, personal, and exploratory. In
comparison, the extensive mode is repressive for setting "rigid param-
eters to students' writing behaviors"; assigning them "abstract," i.e.,
social topics such as the draft, drug addiction, the ABM missile system;
and keeping the student from writing about "self" and "human rela-
tions" (Composing 92, 93). These opposing chains align Emig's "process"
approach with "expressivists" such as Elbow and Macrorie in their shared
emphasis on the personal and their anti-establishment sentiments, a
move which, in its romantic valorization of the natural expression of
authentic voice, is in keeping with the New Critical privileging of po-
etry as the medium for true experience. Emig suggests that we think of
the "reflexive" in terms of the "contemplative role" of the writing self
exploring the question "What does this experience mean?" The self writ-
ing in the extensive mode, by contrast, takes an "active role" motivated
by the question of "How.. . . do I interact with my environment?" (Com-
posing 37). The distinction between introspection and interaction over-
laps with a concern Richard Ohmann delineates in his analysis of the
"cultural values inherent in close reading" (English 70-71). It teaches
readers to view "aesthetic experience" in terms of "intransitive atten-
tion" and "emphatically not by acting to change the society that gives
rise to experience" (Ohmann, English 74, 77). Thus, it sanctions a "flight
from politics" for American "liberal humanists" during the post-war
period (79). Ohmann points to the politics of such a subject positioning
by contextualizing it in a range of social conditions exerting pressures to
divorce "academic" work from politics, including the political repres-
sion of the McCarthy era (80), the enormous growth of American uni-
versities in the post-war period (86), and the accompanying improve-
ment in income among English professors with its "almost-earned up-
per middle-class self-image" (81). He thus suggests that the New Criti-
cal approach to "writing" gains power in English because the material
conditions of the time give it social and historical relevance. Likewise,
the popularity of Emig's work for composition, mainstream and Basic
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Writing, cannot be separated from its ability to renew the relevance of
the New Critical subject positioning, especially since it joins other "popu-
lar" pedagogies, such as Elbow's 1973 Writing Without Teachers, in pro-
moting a "creative inwardness" (Miller 91). As Faigley points out, the
move to emphasize the value of autonomy, anti-authoritarianism and a
personal voice in approaches such as Elbow's (and, we might add,
Emig's) needs to be understood in view of what he calls the "anxiety of
the middle class," the fear that "the dreaded loss of individualism un-
der communism had occurred in the midst of capitalist prosperity," the
anti-establishment sentiments of the 1960s, student activism during the
Vietnam War years, and the crossfire of the right and the left on the
political function of education (Fragments 56-57). In short, Emig's choice
of purpose, method, and perspective must be perceived as an active re-
sponse to very specific social, historical conflicts within and outside
higher education. Therefore, the efficacy of Emig's "pioneering study"
for Basic Writing resides not merely in the "fresh," "scientific" data and
methods it brings to Basic Writing's understanding of its subject but
also in its creative use of "science": its ability to provide methods and
knowledge for making a neutralized New Critical subject positioning
relevant to the teaching of the "aliens."

Humanizing Writing and Teaching

In this section, I map the discursive terrain shaping Basic Writing's birth
by analyzing the ways in which the assumptions of expressive realism
conjoining scientism and New Criticism work to neutralizehuman-
izediverse canonical approaches to writing and teaching during the
1970s. I argue that the landmark status of texts like Errors and Expecta-
tions is in part ensured by the story of science it shares with a whole
range of well-received texts on the teaching of writing, including Teach-
ing the Universe of Discourse (1968), Sentence Combining (1970), Rhetoric:
Discovery and Change (1970), Writing Without Teachers (1973), A Concep-
tual Theory of Rhetoric (1975), and the College Composition and Commu-
nication policy statement "Students' Right" (1974). Historians of com-
position theory have offered several frameworks for identifying the dif-
ferences across these texts: forms of rhetoric (Berlin), perspectives of
composing (Faigley, "Competing"), modes of making knowledge (North)
and diverse combinations of componentsaxiological, procedural, peda-
gogical, and epistemological (Fulkerson). Richard Fulkerson argues when
commenting on the formation of composition studies before 1980 that
"genuine and extensive conflicts existed" across expressivism, formal-
ism, mimeticism, and the rhetorical approach on the question of what
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constituted good writing (411-14). In the following section, I examine
the ways in which a story of "science" conjoins a whole range of compo-
sition texts by establishing a common thread across the differences in
the definition of good writing they pose. I argue that in different ways,
"science" in these texts works to empty writing of the social and histori-
cal, operating to authorize a notion of "good" writing structured on the
binary of "human" universality vs. social, historical differences. At a
time in U.S. history when issues of differences and power are at the
center of all public and academic debate, these texts reach canonical sta-
tus in composition partially because they offer "new," "scientific" justi-
fications for maintaining the neutrality of "good" writing and thus, the
teaching of "writing."

Although Elbow has been traditionally housed in a different camp
from Emig, identified as a "practitioner" rather than a "researcher"
(North 22, 197) and as an "expressionist" rather than a "cognitivist" (Ber-
lin 485-87 and Faigley, "Competing" 530), Writing Without Teachers in-
tersects with The Composing Processes of Twelfth Graders in its concern to
neutralize teaching and writing. Elbow markets his pedagogy as a means
for the "people" to claim, through writing, more personal and political
control (vii, 182). However, if we examine the expressive realism under-
lying Writing Without Teachers, we might argue that instead of empow-
ering the little people, it can work to provide a seemingly "nice or so-
ciable" or "easier and more natural" (176, 187) means for hegemonic
power to control differences through writing and teaching.

At the core of Writing Without Teachers is the "believing game," which,
according to Elbow, "yields the truth" (176). The pedagogy of believing
is built on the assumption that there is "real""hard, commonsense,
empirical" truth "about" the object of study, whether it is an utterance,
text, dog, tree, or community (157, 159, 162, my emphasis). The associa-
tion of truth with the empirical and hard invokes the plot of scientism
through the equation of knowledge, truth, and facts. The link of the
"hard" and "empirical" with "commonsense" ought to instruct us on
the politics of the believing game. Writing Without Teachers defines com-
mon sense as that which "conforms to," "grows out of" or is "permitted
by" the community rules (157, 170). Such a definition ensures that the
search for truth would conform to rather than contest the interests of
those within or across communities in positions of power to prescribe
rules. However, the politics of such a subject positioning is effectively
neutralized by the "scientific" rhetoric built on the equation between
common sense and hard, empirical facts.

Expressive realism is also at the heart of another foundation to the
believing game: an unequivocal faith in an "organism" within the writer
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to guarantee unmediated access to truth. "Your organism," Writing With-
out Teachers assures the students, "can do a lot of sifting that you cannot
do consciously" (177). Therefore, the writer, "like the owl eating the
mouse" (177), ought to "trust his organism to make use of what's good
and get rid of what isn't" (103). By implication, the pedagogy of believ-
ing is neutral: it merely facilitates a natural process innate in all life forms.
It helps us to access "a believing muscle in our head" (162) or "the or-
ganic, developmental process" (43). To further neutralize such a peda-
gogy, Writing Without Teachers grounds the teacherless class in a "para-
digm" imported from "science": the "fetus going through all its stages,"
Freud's model of psychic unfolding, Erikson's seven-stage model,
Piaget's cognitive growth (43).

However, the neutrality of writing-without-teachers crumbles as soon
as we consider how it might work for students with different subject
positionings cutting along lines of race, gender, class, or sex (see Jarratt
110-11). For example, the "writing" process requires writers to respond
to competing ideas in "an atmosphere of acceptance and trust" (Writing
185). It seems that requirements such as "sleep[ing] with any idea that
comes down the road" and becoming "someone who can be made to
believe anything. A large opening that anything can be poured into. Force-
fed. Raped" (185) would bring different challenges to a student aligned
with racist and sexist positions (I'll call this student Student A) and a
student (Student B) determined to fight racism and sexism. As the guru
himself admits, the teacherless classroom is a "game" room with a "sur-
real, underwater vision of social reality" (121). To play successfully in
the believing game, the students would have to willfully forget that dif-
ferent ideas are inscribed with unequal social, historical powers in the
United States in which they live. Student B's awareness that "sleeping
with" the ideas of a sexist or a racist is not only an unpleasant "game"
but has resulted and still can result in real violence toward people of
minority race and gender outside the game room would make course
requirements to perceive the believing game as a "game" ("not real life")
and to participate in it wholeheartedly suspect (175). On the other hand,
Student A's awareness that within the context of today's United States,
for a racist or sexist to play at "being taken over" by oppositional ideas
could remain nothing more than an intellectual "game" would make
such course requirements both viable and "pleasurable" for him (185,
175). However, within the organic/empiricist frame of Writing Without
Teachers, Student B's hesitance to accept and trust opposing ideas could
only be interpreted as a sign of her failure to get in touch with, or her
alienation from, "organic" traits or processes supposedly inherent in all
life forms, including herself.
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Consider also the kind of resolution to differences likely to be fos-
tered by the believing game. Given the unqualified celebration of the
innate organism for discriminating truth, it is highly unlikely that the
"game" process of "listening, silence, agreeing" and "yielding" would
produce any real change in the writers' goals or subject positionings.
Even the guru admits to having "really changed [his] mind" on "too
few" occasions (184). Most likely, the "teacherless classroom" would be
more successful in delivering its promise of helping the student reach
that "blessed state of not worrying" when she would feel free to make
her "own" decisions as to what is good and bad, using the responses of
others to help her fulfill her "own goals" or "own private purposes"
(126,140). Yet, the empirical/organic rhetoric would have taught teach-
ers and students to view these decisions as authorized by innate laws
within the writer and the referent rather than constructed by specific
class, race, gender, sex and/or intellectual alignments. Thus, it would
also keep them from investigating the political motivations and conse-
quences of such decisions.

How would such game rules work differently for Students A and B?
The "teacherless classroom," in asking the student to play at being "non-
aggressive," allows both students the privilege of viewing themselves
as open-minded and cooperative (179). In telling the students to listen
to the heart, it teaches both to turn inward when dealing with differ-
ences and seeking political control. However, such teaching would work
differently for the two students once they take that "writing" outside
the classroom. For Student A in today's United States, the political and
personal "control" he gained through "good," "free writing" will re-
main "real" as well as "intellectual." Not arguing or not knowing how
to argue within or outside the classroom alone would not decrease the
hegemonic power of "his" racist and sexist ideas. Rather, it would in-
crease his complacency over his open-mindedness. Student B, however,
would gain the illusion of having gained personal and political control:
the rules of the game would make her feel that she had been listened to
and lead her to believe that she is calling the shots when "writing." This
kind of "control" could not prepare her for negotiating power outside
the game room where the rules of believing do not prevail. As James
Berlin argues, the ideology of expressivist rhetoric is likely to be pleas-
ing to the ruling elites and debilitating for effective resistance (487). Or,
as David Bartholomae puts it, expressivist rhetoric "makes [students]
suckers and . . . it makes them powerless, at least to the degree that it
makes them blind to tradition, power and authority as they are present
in language and culture" ("Reply" 128-29).

9 2



Importing "Science": Neutralizing Basic Writing 73

For an educational site where the "fact of diversity" is at the center of
all pedagogical decisions (Shaughnessy, "Basic Writing" 159), writing-
without-teachers can have political currency in several respects. The rules
of the believing game can be used to turn the classroom into a conflict-
free space where different ideas are toleratedvoiced and "listened" to
without "arguing," nor effecting any change on the others (Writing With-
out Teachers 179). In teaching the writer to view her discursive decisions
as dictated by laws innate in the writer and the referent, the pedagogy
continues to shift attention from the ways in which subject positioning
mediates thinking and writing and the ways in which the rules of the
believing game endorse subject positionings which confirm rather than
contest "community rules" and personalize the social and historical con-
tents of goals and values. Such a seemingly neutral resolution to social
conflict and power would seem to be especially valuable for educational
sites such as the basic writing classroom, where the students' heteroge-
neous discursive practices and positionings make issues of diversity and
power particularly difficult to contain. We might argue that Elbow's
model is perceived as having "effect" upon basic writing teaching par-
tially because in teaching the "art of getting started" it is also instructing
in the art of dissociating power from differences, writing conflict and
struggle out of Basic Writing (Shaughnessy, "Basic Writing" 151). The
popularity of Writing Without Teachers cannot be separated from its em-
pirical/organic rhetoric, a rhetoric proferring "human" justifications for
believing in an introspective flight from differences and thus consoli-
dating composition's alignment with both scientism and New Criticism.

The pedagogy of believing, contrary to what Elbow would have us
believe, is socially and historically constructed rather than a purely per-
sonal and organic expression of the author's "own" beliefs and pur-
poses, nor is it a product of an author trusting his "organism" for shift-
ing the good from the bad. We can make this case by contextualizing
Writing Without Teachers in the discursive scene of its production and
reception, such as examining the empirical/organic rhetoric of another
popular pedagogy, Rhetoric: Discovery and Change by Young, Becker, and
Pike (1970). Several of the essays in Tate's Teaching Composition identify
Discovery and Change as one of the most important texts in "new" rheto-
ric (Tate 57, 228, 234). This "new" rhetoric projects a "writer" living in a
"new" worldan "extraordinarily diverse and disturbed world"and
conducting arguments in situations that involve "confrontations between
old and young, East and West, white and black" (Young et al. 8, 9, 274).
According to the authors, "human differences" are the cause of "misun-
derstanding" and must be "overcome," "resolved," or "reduced" until
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communication can take place (26, 30). The pedagogy of "discovery and
change" promises to do just that by teaching students to reach "an accu-
rate image of the world" as well as the "elimination of conflict between
writer and reader" (275). Sustaining this promise are a set of rules
"heuristic procedures" and "Rogerian strategies." Although, as Berlin
has argued, the approach of Rhetoric: Discovery and Change is more
"social-epistemic" than expressionistic (173), I'd argue that the rules of
"new" rhetoric, like the rules of Elbow's "teacherless classroom," would
work to dissolve differences in the name of "human" empathy and truth.

Rhetoric: Discovery and Change posits a set of heuristic procedures sup-
posedly authorized by the "observations" of linguists and anthropolo-
gists (26). Efforts to deploy the authority of "science" to neutralize these
procedures is most explicit in the authors' defense of the validity of
tagmemics, the "basis" of the book (xi). One of the authors, Kenneth
Pike, maintains that his is "a theory of the structure of human behavior
which is grounded in a set of axioms about human nature" (quoted in
Young, "Invention" 31). Another author, Richard Young, likewise as-
serts that tagmemics "embodies psychological universals." Their "uni-
versality" rests on their "demonstrated usefulness in analysis of highly
diverse linguistic data" and "on the mind's inability to function without
them" (Young, "Invention" 31). Such assertions imply that teaching the
"heuristic procedures" is neutral because these procedures are devel-
oped in accordance with the universal laws of human behavior and hu-
man nature.

However, the particular meanings these procedures generate suggest
that they are social constructs rather than inherent structures. The pro-
cedures teach students to objectify ideas, values, experiences, people,
communities, or cultures into repeatable "units" with identifiable fea-
tures which can be "isolated and studied" (225). The power relationship
between the writer and the reader is dissolved by the images of "sepa-
rate human particles" (225) and of society as "a bag of marbles" (176). In
short, these procedures work to ensure that the student would approach
different ideas, people, or cultures as fixed and discrete entities rather
than also in terms of power conflict and struggle across competing so-
cial forces. A similar move is made in Young's reading of Burke's
dramatistic method in his bibliographical essay (Young, "Invention" 13).
Treating Burke's dramatistic method as "a clear instance" of the "heu-
ristic procedure," he presents it as a means of "discovering essential fea-
tures of the behavior of groups or individuals" (15). This interpretation
presents "motive" as an essence within the "individual" and "group"
and downplays Burke's concern with the sociopolitical structure of the
"scene" of writing (I discuss this below).
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To ensure that the meaning "discovered" by the heuristic procedures
would be accepted by"change" the minds ofpeople with different
viewpoints, the pedagogy poses a set of Rogerian strategies supposedly
based on an "image of man" authorized by theory and practice in "psy-
chotherapy" (6-7). From Carl Rogers, Rhetoric: Discovery and Change bor-
rows the assumption that "man has free will, but his ability to consider
alternative positions is limited if he feels threatened" (8). Based on such
an assumption, the pedagogy poses a set of strategies to "reduce" the
reader's sense of threat. One rule, like the rule of never arguing in the
believing game, is to "convey" to the reader that he is understood (275).
Another is to "induce him to believe that he and the writer share similar
moral qualities (honesty, integrity, and good will) and aspirations (the
desire to discover a mutually acceptable solution)" (275). Yet another is
the requirement that "opponents confront each other as equals in an
atmosphere of mutual trust" (280). The Rogerian model turns the writ-
ing classroom into the kind of "surreal" vision of social reality the
"teacherless" classroom aspires to reinforce. It places decisions to resist
or accept alternative positions solidly within the realm of a "personal"
("psychological") divested of social and historical content: a "free will"
inherent in "man" and his "senses" of trust. And the Rogerian strategies
place such decisions in the realm of the "textual" by implying that the
reader's senses of threat can be reduced by nothing more than a set of
"writing" gestures. In placing decisions to "change" in the realm of the
"personal" and the "textual," Rhetoric: Discovery and Change joins the
New Critical project in defining writing as an inward flight from the
social and historical. It implies that "confrontations between young and
old, East and West, White and Black" can be dissolved by nothing more
than a set of thinking and writing strategies. The political efficacy of the
pedagogy of "discovery and change" is of course its implication that
"senses of threat" resulting from competing ideas are purely formal (per-
ceptual or conceptual) and psychological (private and instinctual) and
thus can be treated"reduced"through formal strategies. That is, so-
cial and historical differences can be treated"reduced" and resolved
textually by a "content" of writing discovered through heuristic proce-
dures and a "style" of writing modeled after group therapy, without
any effort to tackle the existing socioeconomic structures leading to and
sustained by such differences. Therefore, the "new" rhetoric of Young,
Pike, and Becker is not likely to offer teachers of basic writing a different
route outside English than Emig's composing process or Elbow's writ-
ing without teachers. Likewise, the popularity of Emig and Elbow as
well as Young et al. must be understood in the context of their deploy-
ment of "science" to offer English "new /neutral" rationales for continu-
ing established positions.
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Interest in importing "science" to "humanize" teaching and writing
can also be seen operating in another popular text on the discursive scene,
Moffett's Teaching the Universe of Discourse (1968). Teaching the Universe of
Discourse is not only cited by Shaughnessy for "its insights into the forms
of discourse and the readiness of students at different ages to produce
and enjoy them" (305) but also reviewed in two other essays in Teaching
Composition for its "new way of classifying discourse" and its "value" in
setting up a curriculum at "almost any level of education" (Tate 126-29,
230). North distinguishes Moffett as a "philosopher" (94,104-05) from
"practitioners" like Elbow (22) or "researchers" like Emig (97). None-
theless, North observes, Moffett "seems to want to grant [the philosophi-
cal premises of his argument] special status because of their empirical
origins [in psychological research on child development]" and so to make
his argument "into knowledge of a different order... unassailable" (104).
I'd like to take this observation a step further to argue that Moffett's
move to authorize the philosophical premises of his argument with their
empirical origins indicates a concern to use "science" to neutralize the
particular resolution to differences promoted by his premises.

The foundation of Teaching the Universe of Discourse is the claim that a
correspondence exists across "modes of discourse," "levels of abstrac-
tion" and "stages of growth" (v, 13). A pedagogy which hierarchizes
diverse forms of abstraction necessarily resolves differences through
privileging certain forms over others. For example, the "concentric
circles" representing various "rhetorical contexts" posed in the book
privilege thinking and writing from the "biological" perspective by de-
picting it as not only the "largest" and most "universal" but also as the
"determining" context for all the other contexts, including the "cultural,"
"national or ethnic," "social sub-group" and "family" (68). Teaching stu-
dents to move up the hierarchy of abstraction thus involves teaching
them to shift their perspective from the specific social and historical con-
ditions of their life towards the "universal"biological. Thus, "teach-
ing the universe" participates in the construction of creative inwardness
dominating English studies during the late '60s and '70s. However,
Moffett claims to have "recast" or "assimilated" elements of "English"
(rhetoric, grammar, literary technique) into the "psychological" terms
of human growth (vivii, 14,15). The "scientific" frame thus neutralizes
the political of teaching "writing" which turns students away from the
social/historical toward the "universal" /biological, casting it instead
into a pedagogy of "liberation" rather than "acquisition" (28), "natural-
istic" teaching (159), or "organic learning" (178).

A similar move to "recast"psychologize /neutralize writing and
teaching is made in Moffett's reading of Bernstein and Piaget (58). Al-
though Moffett acknowledges that Bernstein's restricted and elaborated
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codes are intended to describe social class differences in the use of lan-
guage and not developmental differences, he maintains that differences
between the two codes are "remarkably parallel to general growth irre-
spective of class" (58) and suggestive of "how much the language of
disadvantaged students seems to be arrested at a stage that middle-class
children go easily beyond" (59, emphasis mine). Reading Bernstein in
terms of Piaget's developmental frame enables Moffett to present differ-
ent family and class backgrounds as having different effects on the child's
"normal" growth, with some (working-class) disadvantaging the child
by "arresting" that growth.

This reading points to the social content of Moffett's interest in "psy-
chology." This tendency to use a developmental frame to hierarchize
class differences is, ironically, also articulated in Moffett's effort to com-
bat racial and class segregation among school children (157). According
to Moffett, the "disadvantaged" urban children can benefit from the
"mixing" by learning "new" uses of language while the "advantaged
children" of the suburbs can benefit by "relearn[ing]" the emotive and
communal uses of language that middle-class upbringing tends to de-
stroy (94, my emphasis). By implication, the socially "advantaged" have
already had, although lately having lost, the skills possessed by the "dis-
advantaged," while the latter have yet to acquire the skills the former
possess. Even though both the "familial" and "cultural" are here seen as
"contexts" which restrict rather than expand the fullest development of
the children, they seem to restrict in different ways, some keeping the
child from "higher" and some from "lower" levels of development (94).
At a time when, as Shauglmessy put it, the War on Poverty put head-
ings such as "cultural deprivation" and "cultural differences" in the
Education Index ("Basic Writing" 138) and given the dominance of em-
pirical/organic rhetoric on the discursive scene, the popularity of Teach-
ing the Universe of Discourse cannot be separated from its ability to recast
into "scientific""biological," "natural," and "universal"terms a
pedagogy which hierarchizes class differences.

Frank J. D'Angelo's A Conceptual Theory of Rhetoric (1975) is another
work repeatedly cited in Teaching Composition for its "original" discus-
sion of customary methods of development in writing (57, 100, 230).
The concern to locate a totalizing structure inherent in the "human" mind
in both D'Angelo's rhetorical study and Moffett's study on forms of dis-
course again points to the political currency of expressive realism on the
discursive scene. D'Angelo presents his "new" rhetoric as "invigorated"
by the insights of the "new sciences": linguistics, psycholinguistics, se-
mantics, neuropsychology, psychotherapy, anthropology, biology (162).
Deploying the authority of the "new sciences," D'Angelo projects a "uni-
verse" in which the process in every area (of composing, psychological
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or physiological) has its "counterparts" in every other area (16), and
each "mirrors" or "repeats" in microcosm the larger "evolutionary pro-
cess" of the universe (vivii). The equation of knowledge, truth, and
data is evoked through characterizing modern linguistics, the founda-
tion of Rhetoric, as "descriptive" (18). Furthermore, D'Angelo maintains
that his "theory" is grounded in "empirical testing," has "empirical evi-
dence for hypotheses" and some sort of correlation between "observ-
able facts and the constructs of the logical system" (24). Not surpris-
ingly, the empirical rhetoric works hand in hand with an organic rheto-
ric. He depicts the patterns of discourse he "describes" as "symbolic
manifestations of underlying mental processes" (57, 102) which are "ge-
netically inherited" and innate in every "human organism" (26). By im-
plication, the concern to "describe" essentializeduniversal and innate
structures (26, 27, 57), which D'Angelo presents as crossing disciplines
such as linguistics, anthropology, and literary criticism, is driven by the
"realities" of human nature and therefore neutral rather than social and
historical.

The empirical/natural rhetoric exempts D'Angelo from the need to
reflect on the politics of confining research and the teaching of writing
to "recurring," "formal" patterns (19). More specifically, it occludes at-
tention from the power relations and struggle inscribed in the "recur-
ring" formal patterns or the social and historical forces sustaining their
power to recur. Rather, it allows D'Angelo to claim that in "describing"
only the "recurring" patterns, he is merely making more self-conscious
and more economical operations and properties innate in all "human
organisms" and universally practiced (47). And it absolves D'Angelo
from the need to justify the politics of a pedagogy which dissolves dif-
ferences in forms of discourse by urging teachers to "direct" students to
"observe" and "imitate" recurring formal patterns (158). Given this rheto-
ric, it should not be surprising that he presents his pedagogy as comple-
mentary to pedagogies which are "related to" the exploration of "psy-
chologists" and "psychotherapists" including Freud and Carl Rogers
(158-59). It is indeed the recurring attempt to use "science" to detach
"writing" and "teaching" from issues of power and differences that
makes texts as seemingly diverse as A Conceptual Theory of Rhetoric, Writ-
ing Without Teachers, and Rhetoric: Discovery and Change compatible to
one another and useful for a composition eager to establish its institu-
tional place.

The hegemony of expressive realism on the discursive scene of Basic
Writing's birth can also be construed from the story of "science" in
O'Hare's Sentence Combining, another popular text cited in five of the
ten essays in Teaching Composition and praised by Shaughnessy as one of
the "most useful sources of information on sentence combining as a
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method of instruction" for Basic Writing (Tate 157, 105, 206, 267). Al-
though North classifies O'Hare as a "researcher" rather than a "practi-
tioner" (Elbow) or "philosopher" (Moffett) and as an "experimental"
rather than a "clinical" (Emig) researcher (143, 97), an objective/natural
rhetoric aligns O'Hare's monograph with all the texts I discuss in this
section. This rhetoric might also explain how this monograph can share
canonical status with other texts that explicitly critique sentence-com-
bining, most notably Moffett's Teaching (see Moffett, Chapter Five).

The central question organizing O'Hare's study is "Whether sentence-
combining practice will enhance the normal growth of syntactic matu-
rity" (20). "Science" again functions as direct and indirect "support" for
this move to recast hegemonic definitions of "mature" sentence struc-
ture into a "natural" and "universal" developmental frame. O'Hare
markets his study as providing an "objective" measure which can be
used to "describe" in "quantifiable terms" or to "readily identify" and
"objectively verify" what English teachers have always been vaguely
aware of (19, 20). Thus, the researcher /teacher 's definitions of "normal
growth" and "syntactic maturity" are presented as facts innate in the
objects of studythe students and their writingand independent from
the perspective and language of the researcher / teacher.

The works of "leading linguists" and "behavioral scientists" are also
cited to authorize the pedagogy (v). The link between T-unit length and
embedded sentences and syntactic/cognitive "maturity" is presented
as legitimized by "language development studies" (24) or cognitive theo-
ries (31). The "scientific" base works to shift attention away from the
study's tendency to dismiss differences across the students chosen by
the study and to ignore the social consequences of subjecting all stu-
dents to the rules of "mature" syntax. O'Hare seems to admit to at least
two factors leading to a correlation between "normal growth" and "syn-
tactic maturity": the "child's" cognitive development and "his"
enculturation through reading and schooling (24). Yet, he quickly shifts
attention from the latter factor by zeroing in on the "developmental trend:
the increase with age." O'Hare consistently refers to his subjects in terms
of "biological growth," as older or younger or as an adult or child, rather
than in terms of their place in the educational system (23-24). Such ref-
erences occlude attention to their enculturation, even though the stu-
dents under study are selected because of the grades they are ini.e.,
they appear to be in the same "age" group because specific social con-
ventions result in all "children" in the United States beginning school-
ing at the same age.

A similar move to neutralize one's position on how and what to teach
is also articulated in another text with a seemingly opposite stance on
the importance of written syntactic forms to O'Hare's Sentence Combin-
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ing: the 1972 resolution by the Executive Committee of the Conference
on College Composition and Communication, "Students' Right to Their
Own Language." This position statement also seems to differ from texts
such as Errors and Expectations on the question of whether academic dis-
course should be the means and goal of writing classrooms. However,
an explanation of the "linguistic and social knowledge" grounding the
1972 resolution drafted by the Committee in 1974 suggests that "sci-
ence" serves a similar neutralizing function in all three texts ("Students'
Right" 3). The "scientific" status of "linguistics" is invoked by references
to the "actual available linguistic evidence" (1) and "insight from lin-
guistic study" (6). The committee's interest in "actual available linguis-
tic evidence" (1, my emphasis) seems to reside strictly in the binary of
deep structure vs. surface details and the "new" rationale this binary
offers for maintaining the neutrality of teaching and writing, a move
conjoining the CCCC policy statement with pedagogies as seemingly
disparate as Shaughnessy's error study, O'Hare's sentence-combining
exercises, and Elbow's believing game.

For example, one of the "insights from linguistic study" grounding
the policy statement is the assertion that "differences among dialects
are always confined to a limited range of surface features that have no
effect on what linguists call deep structure" (1, 6). The committee
"roughly" translates, for composition, "deep structure" as "meaning"
(6). Such a translation separates "meaning" from "linguistic forms" or
"dialectal features" and turns it into an essence existing beyond the realm
of "controversy" over differences and diversity.3 In reducing discursive
differences to a "limited range of surface features," the teaching of "mean-
ing" is divested of its social, historical content. Composition finds a
"new""scientific"rationale for maintaining education's transcen-
dence over social and historical power struggle.

This "linguistic" knowledge allows the committee to maintain a "new
understanding of the English teacher's function" (7): the official func-
tion of English teachers is to teach skills which help students "acquire"
meaning and help students "gain confidence in communicating in a
variety of situations" in a variety of forms (11) and not to "reproduce
meaning" in any given surface forms, such as the forms of a "dialect"
called Edited American English (EAE) (7). On the one hand, this "new"
understanding can help relieve the back-to-basics right wing pressure
on writing teachers convinced that drills on "correct" form cannot im-
prove students' ability as readers and writers. On the other hand, this
understanding allows for a continual separation of the transmission of
"meaning" from issues of differences and power through the imagery
of "coding" and "decoding" (7). That is, it enables the committee to ar-
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gue that issues of diversity are present only in the teaching of "dialectal
features." Defining diversity as a mere surface feature further allows
the committee to pose a binary pedagogical solution: either "obliterat-
ing" (2) or "eliminating" differences by forcing students to read and
write only in EAE (10) or upholding diversity by allowing students to
read and write in any dialect.

The imagery of a "deep structure" or stable "meaning" thus effec-
tively frees all processes of meaning-makingwhether structured on
the rules of believing, heuristic procedures, or the universe of discourse
from issues of power and difference. Of course, the neutrality of mean-
ing-making processes cannot stand on its own without the support of
an equation between the "deep," the "innate," and the "universal," which
is established by claims such as "it follows" that if all languages are the
product of the same "instrument"the "human brain"then "all dia-
lects are essentially the same in their deep structure" (9). By implication,
"meaning" remains stable because it has its origin in the "biological"
rather than social and historical. Among the criteria the committee ex-
plicitly points to as the basis for teaching reading and writing is the
discovery of meaning through both "logic and metaphor" (8). Taken
outside the frame of biological law, we can argue that notions of "logic
and metaphor" are social and historical constructs. Particular definitions
of "logic" and "metaphor"as in the case of Young, Becker, and Pike's
heuristic procedures and of New Critical definitions of poetic language
can significantly control the kind of "meaning" these help to discover.
However, attention to the politics of promoting particular processes of
meaning-making is rendered moot by the "scientific" authority of "lin-
guistic" knowledge. In short, the efficacy of "linguistics" for composi-
tion resides not only in its support for the "students' right to their own
language" but also in its support for the teachers' right to teach pro-
cesses of meaning-making supposedly backed by "natural," "human"
laws. That is, the separation of meaning and form ensures that English
teachers preserve the power to control the process of meaning-making
without having to address the politics of their choice of approach to
writing and teaching.

Another dictum imported from "science," "no dialect is inherently
good or bad" (5), is also used to neutralize the teaching of "linguistic"
forms. While it serves to deconstruct social prejudices toward nonaca-
demic discourses, it also works to turn EAE into just another "dialect"
which can be used to transmit "meaning" without mediating its pro-
duction (see Lu, "Redefining"). Teachers can claim that in teaching stu-
dents to "experiment" with new dialectal forms such as EAE, they are
upholding diversity, offering students "additional options" or "greater
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flexibility and versatility in the choices they make" (11) rather than me-
diating the student's subject positioning across competing discursive
powers. Such a rhetoric is seductive because it invokes both liberal plu-
ralism and the myth of functional literacy. It presents the teaching of
academic discourse as in keeping with a "nation proud of its diverse
heritage and its cultural and racial variety" (3). Since our "pluralistic
society requires many varieties of language to meet our multiplicity of
needs" (5), teaching of EAE is motivated by the students' "need" and
"want": their being and desiring to be functioning citizens of a "plural-
istic" nation (15). At the same time, an implicit hierarchy is established
in the document's depiction of language variety: only "the written dia-
lect" is viewed as serving the "larger, public community" and meant to
carry information about our "representative problems and interests" (3,
5). The binary of public/private, larger/narrow, as I have argued, en-
sures that efforts to respect diversity will and can only result in everyone's
"needing" and "wanting" to learn and use EAE (15). Again, the efficacy
of "linguistics" for composition is its ability to neutralize the dissemina-
tion of hegemonic linguistic forms as well as to find new reasons for
perpetuating myths of pluralism and functional literacy.

The move to import "science" to neutralize writing and teaching in
the name of innate "human" linguistic or cognitive laws across texts I
examine in this section has institutional currency for composition be-
cause it can work to confirm the place of composition within English
Studies. It renews the story of "science" in New Critical projects such as
I. A. Richards's Practical Criticism, one of the texts cited by Shaughnessy
as useful for Basic Writing (Shaughnessy, "Basic Writing" 164; Errors
208). Practical Criticism presupposes a story of a "natural" tendency in
"man" toward, on the one hand, greater complexity and finer differen-
tiation of responses and, on the other, increased order (268-69). Since
"poetry" is supposedly that unique instrument by which "our minds
have ordered their thoughts, emotions, and desires," in making such a
technique "accessible," the "new" criticism becomes by implication one
of those "deliberately contrived artificial means of correction" needed
for the well-being of "human mentality" (301). This organic plot enables
Practical Criticism to market a "new," clearly socially and historically
situated technique of reading and writing as a neutral means for con-
tainingordering and controllingdifferences. On one hand, Practical
Criticism explicitly calls attention to several aspects of the "contempo-
rary social and economic conditions" the "new" technique is interested
to contain: an increasing heterogeneity of ideas, feelings, and perspec-
tives; "more troubling still, our handling of these materials varies" and
"vehicles of tradition, the family and the community, for example, are
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dissolved" (301, 318). The move to uphold the figure of a poet /critic,
one who handles difference through "exposing" ambiguities to "observe"
and "analyze" them "systematically" rather than ignoring them through
stereotyping and standardizing interpretations (319, 320) is therefore also
a move to contain different ways of handling differences across class
"descending from the scholar's level to the kitchen-maids" (318)and
institutional sites, such as literature, science, politics, and commerce (253
54). Yet, reflection on the politics of this "poetic" resolution to differ-
ences is rendered moot within the frame of the story of "a too sudden
diffusion of indigestible ideas" disturbing the "order of human mental-
ity" (301, my emphasis).

This story of the law of "human mentality" is likewise grounded in
the authority of "scientific" knowledge and methods. For example, em-
phasis on order, organization, and coherence is grounded in "scientific"
knowledge of living "organisms": "a good idea of some of the possibili-
ties of order and disorder in the mind may be gained from Pavlov's
Conditioned Reflexes" (268, footnote 8). Statements such as "[our] minds
have developed with other human beings" are supported by reference
to Piaget's The Language and Thought of the Child along with a verse from
Wordsworth's Prelude (191, note 4). An empirical/organic rhetoric also
runs through statements such as "central, most stable, mass of our ideas
has already an order and arrangement fixed for it by the facts of Nature"
(260). The hegemony of scientism also surfaces in Richards's faith in the
"empirical" foundation of meaning. He asserts that "every interesting
abstract word (apart from those that have been nailed down to phenom-
ena by the experimental sciences) is inevitably ambiguous" (319). By
implication, the meaning of words "nailed down to phenomena" by
"experimental sciences" is transparent and stable. Thus, the meaning of
key words such as "human mentality" is unequivocal since it has been
nailed down by "sciences." The equation of truth, knowledge, and data
is also evoked in Richards's effort to ground his "practical" criticism in
the authority of "scientific methods." It can hardly be coincidental that
he presents close reading as a break from the "history of criticism"
arriving from "research" rather than "argument" (7). The technique of
close reading is a "corrective" based upon an "investigation" of how
actual readers read"protocols" gathered from "several hundreds of
opinions upon particular aspects of poetry." He indicates being "anx-
ious" to meet as far as may be the objections of the best psychologists
over whether the protocols "supply enough evidence" (9).

The story of science emerging from Practical Criticism indicates that
the popularity of the pedagogies I discuss in this section have to do not
merely with the institutional power of science over the humanities but
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also with the residual power of an empirical/expressive view of lan-
guage within English. As both Phelps and Faigley have pointed out, the
hegemony of scientism in fields such as linguistics during the 1970s,
like that of New Criticism in English, is being actively challenged by
emerging perspectives and practices. The dominance of scientism in these
canonical texts indicates that composition's venture into "science" is in
part driven by a concern to maintain the neutrality of the scholar/
teacher/researcher at a time when the presumed separation of the aca-
demic from the social and political was under fire both within and out-
side U.S. higher education. Therefore, the contribution of the
compositionists I have been discussing to the institutional status of Com-
position in general and Basic Writing in particular must also be reviewed
from the stance they take on issues of differences and power. Likewise,
the difficulties of breaking the hegemony of empirical/expressive views
of language on the discursive scene of Basic Writing's birth is not only
intellectual in the narrow sense but deeply social and historical.

Dissolving Attention to the Social and Historical: Translating
Knowledge across Disciplines and Continents

To further explore the pervasive move to naturalize writing and teach-
ing on the discursive terrain shaping Basic Writing's birth, we need to
also examine composition's appropriations of the work of researchers
and critics across disciplines which to various degrees explicitly ad-
dresses the relations of language, power, and subjectivity. In the follow-
ing section, I will read the works of authorities frequently cited in com-
positionKenneth Burke, William Labov, Basil Bernstein, Richard
Ohmann, Lev Vygotsky, and Paulo Freireto highlight the ambivalence
of each toward, and/or oftentimes pronounced critiques of, essentialist
views of language and the myth of the neutrality of teaching writing. I
discuss the ways in which composition during Basic Writing's birth ef-
fectively glossed over such elements in these works through various
forms of excerpting and translating. I argue that the social, historical
nature of the hegemony of expressive realism across science and En-
glish can be illustrated by U.S. educators' effort to maintain the "objec-
tivity" of the knowledge posited by these authority figures when trans-
lating, editing, introducing, and citing their works. This effort takes two
directions: on one hand, zeroing on aspects of the text which can appear
to support the essentialist framework, and, on the other, dismissing as-
pects of the studies where writing is presented as mediated by rather
than transcending its social, historical contexts.
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Treatment of Kenneth Burke's work is exemplary in this regard. Sev-
eral of the composition texts I discuss above perceive Burke's pentad to
be one of the most influential "literary" resources for the "new" rheto-
ric. The Burke appearing in these texts is often someone interested in
upholding the objectivity of his structural knowledge. This reading of
Burke, however, dissolves a tension marking Burke's writing. As Frank
Lentricchia puts it cogently in Criticism and Social Change, in Burke's work,
a desire to move to a perch above historical process in an effort to find a
single master structure is consistently contradicted by a concern to be
critical of such a "structuralist" project (56). The essentialist impulse is
most evident in A Grammar of Motives, where Burke posits "dramatism"
five key terms supposedly exhausting the structural possibilities of tex-
tual expression (Lentricchia 66-67). Using other sections from Burke's
Grammar, Lentricchia argues that even in the process of formulating this
ur-form, Burke introduces theoretical qualifications that open up his
method to a level of historical analysis (Lentricchia 69). Lentricchia con-
cludes that as a reader of history, Burke is a "critical structuralist," one
who investigates ruthlessly his own terminological resources (71). On
one level, "man" in Burke is the autonomous subject of liberal human-
ism, with its corollary values of freedom, creativity, self-possession, and
self-presence. On another level, this autonomy is deconstructed because
the "agent" and his "action" are located within a system, as having a
constraining context (Lentricchia 71). In Burke's own words, the actor is
"motivated," acting as well as being "acted upon by his state of being
acted upon" (cited in Lentricchia 73). Meaning is made and unmade,
enforced and subverted, assented to and resisted in collective acts of
will, where nothing (or very little) is natural, fixed, and eternal
(Lentricchia 69). This line of Burke's thinking presents writing as consti-
tutive of rather than transcending the hegemonic process in the
Gramscian sense (Lentricchia 76). By implication, Burke the critical struc-
turalist would perceive all intellectual acts, including the act of positing
the pentad, as involved in power in every way.

However, as Lentricchia points out, Burke the critical structuralist
"has consistently slipped through" the attention of critics and modern-
ist writers because of the hegemony of the New Critical flight from poli-
tics between the two world wars (86). This selective reading of Burke
seems to have continued in composition's appropriation of Burke dur-
ing Basic Writing's birth. For example, D'Angelo's reading of Burke cen-
ters on passages which allow D'Angelo to dissolve Burke's ambivalence
toward universalizing structures and to conclude, "for Burke, it matters
not whether these patterns are psychological universals or merely con-
ventional or acquired forms, the idea being that once we have obtained
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them, they can become the means of organizing discourse" (D'Angelo
19, emphasis mine). A similar move is made by Young in his bibliographi-
cal essay on "Invention" (13). Young refers us to passages where Burke
presents the "pentad" as "never to be abandoned" since "all statements
that assign motives can be shown to arise out of them and to terminate
in them." Foregrounding the essentialist impulse marking Burke's work
enables Young to present the dramatistic method as a means of "discov-
ering essential features of the behavior of groups or individuals" (15), a
procedure which "shares features" with essentialist programs such as
Pike's tagmemics (30-31).

Young does acknowledge that compositionists such as W. Ross
Winterowd and William Irmscher have turned the pentad into "a heu-
ristic independent of the context of Burke's theory" ("Invention" 16)
and, in doing so, have made it lose some of its power, intelligibility, and
reason. But he quickly maintains that this "excerpting" of Burke's work
has "adequate justifications": it does "us" service in making even part
of the theory available to "composition" (16). Given the domination of
expressive realism in composition, we might say that the service per-
formed by the strategy of excerpting is to make it possible for "composi-
tion" to overlook Burke's position on the politics of intellectual activity
such as the posing and disseminating of structural laws, and thus to
avoid reckoning with the challenge Burke's work poses for the concern
of "us" to neutralize writing and teaching.

Of course, the move to excerpt Burke's pentad is largely made pos-
sible because of Burke's own concern to stage a scientist/critic/writer
capable of transcending the social and historical entrapping "man" that
conjoins the author and his disciples. This concern is latent in both ar-
ticles Burke wrote explicitly for the composition teaching community:
"Questions and Answers about the Pentad" (College Composition and
Communication 1978) and "RhetoricOld and New" (1950, Journal of
General Education). Before turning to Burke's attempt to write his own
work outside history, let me begin by mapping out the move to
contextualize writing and teaching embedded in Burke's discussion of
the implications of his "literary" theory for the teaching of "composi-
tion" and "communication." Burke distinguishes his "dramatism" from
the more "positive" use of the pentad in Irmscher by rehearsing themes
such as "attitude" ("Questions" 330), "identification" ("Rhetoric" 203),
"gods quarreling" and "contracts" with gods ("Questions" 333). As
Lentricchia's reading of Burke suggests, these themes are central to
Burke's critical structuralist views. They highlight the relationship be-
tween form, rhetoric, and power, thus pointing to the social and histori-
cal context of the production, dissemination, and deployment of struc-
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tural knowledge, including "dramatism." That is, these themes invoke
passages in Burke that Lentricchia has recalled to our attention where
Burke examines the production of structural laws in relation to "bu-
reaucratization of the imaginative" (Lentricchia 61), where the "imagi-
native" is depicted as "embodied in the realities of a social texture, in all
the complexities of language and habits, in the property relationships,
the methods of government, production and distribution, and in the
development of rituals that re-enforce the same emphasis" (Burke, Atti-
tudes Towards History 225-26). And they recall passages depicting the
"gods contract[ing]" the "dispossessed person" by making him feel that
"he 'has a stake in' the authoritative structure that dispossesses him"
(Attitudes 329-30). Attention to these themes in Burke would lead us to
view all discursive structures, the "'dramatistic' nomenclature" ("Ques-
tions" 334) as well as the "various specialized nomenclatures (of phys-
ics, chemistry, biology or the like)" ("Questions" 335)as social, his-
torical forces and the teaching of such structures, the act of "contract-
ing" for "gods."

Burke's critical structuralist position is also operative in his claim that
his "new' rhetoric" is reinvigorated by fresh insights of the "new sci-
ences" ("RhetoricOld and New" 203). Part of the use of "new sciences"
for Burke, contrary to their use for Elbow's "believing game" or Young,
Becker, and Pike's "new" rhetoric, is the insights these disciplines shed
on the social, historical content of the psychological and biological. Burke
depicts "psychosomatic medicine" as concerned with the ways in which
our "physiques are led to take on attitudes in keeping with the rhetori-
cal or persuasive aspects of ideas" ("Rhetoric" 203). This suggests that
the "new sciences" interest Burke because they shed insight on the ways
in which ideas are "worked into the very set of nerves, muscles, and
organs" (203), i.e., the extent to which the hegemonic process "bureau-
cratizes" our unconscious and physical body as well as the conscious.
Thus, to Burke, a "new' rhetoric" reinvigorated by the "new sciences"
would acknowledge rather than deny the social and historical in the
"psychological" and "biological" origin of meaning.

At the same time, the challenge to composition's concern to find sup-
port for neutralizing writing and teaching posed by these passages can
be easily glossed over because they coexist with passages clearly driven
by Burke's concern to write himselfthe "literary," "structuralist"
criticoutside the historical process in which he depicts the acting of
other agents of writingthe "writer" of the texts he analyzes. He pre-
sents his "job" as helping a "critic perceive what was going on in a text"
by "asking of the work the explicit questions to which its structure had
already implicitly supplied the answers" ("Questions" 332,335). In de-
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picting the pentad as a means of making explicit what is implicit in the
structure of the object of study, Burke endows his structural knowledge
with an empirical base. The "objective" rhetoric exempts the Author of
the pentad from the kind of historical analysis of the rhetorical motive
and grammar of writing he applies to other writers. In moving the critic
and his knowledge outside the historical process to a transcendental
plane, it renders moot all attention to the politics of teaching that finds
support from the "pentad."

However, the grammar and motive of maintaining the objectivity of
"dramatism" is socially and historically situated. As Lentricchia argues,
this desire to write the critic outside history cannot be separated from
the sociocultural matrix of the 1930s, indicating alignment with
formalism's concern to "escape" the worst socioeconomic crisis this coun-
try has known and to contest the hegemony of the aesthetic of social
realism (56, 64). Likewise, the political efficacy of Burke's pentad for
composition resides in the dominant role formalism has played in En-
glish from the 1930s to the 1970s and in composition's search for a new/
neutral rationale for its existence at a time when issues of power and
difference are most difficult to contain in academic as well as public
debate. It is composition's alignment with a certain kind of reception
theory dominating modernism and humanist literary theory that makes
composition's excerpting of Burke viable and a "service" to composi-
tion. That is, the move to excerpt Burke puts composition at the center
of an intellectual enterprise dominated by "a concern for the abiding
patterns of human subjectivity whose universal structures bind us all
across the ages, cultures, and societies" (Lentricchia 93).

Composition's importation of William Labov's study of "nonstand-
ard English" also illustrates its tendency to dissolve the tension between
a concern to essentialize structural knowledge and a concern to situate
discursive practices in the social and historical. Using the Chomskian
distinction between competence and performance, Labov studies the
"abstract and complex" organization of "language rules" in varieties of
English (9). His defense of the systematic nature of "nonstandard" En-
glish has served as support for composition teachers interested in argu-
ing for recognition of the intelligence and competence of students whose
home English is "nonstandard." For example, his study is featured in
Shaughnessy's bibliographical essay as one of the texts which basic writ-
ing teachers ought to read illustrating "basic differences" in languages
(159). Labov's research suggests that knowledge of the "vernacular" can
help teachers to perceive the student's seeming "mistakes" and "misbe-
haviors" as signs of the "difference" between the rules in nonstandard
and standard English (of pronunciation [44], grammar [48], modes of
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mitigation and politeness [51], vocabulary [46]) rather than as signs of
the student's lack of intelligence or her resistance to learning.

Ironically, in his concern to pin down the structures of nonstandard
English, Labov and his team come up with a rich collection of data on
the dialogical nature of discursive practicesthe ways in which power
mediates our perception and performance of linguistic rules. He notices
that the informants' perception and enactment of the rules of the non-
standard English are always "shifting" toward the standard: the re-
searcher has difficulty catching them in situations when these two sys-
tems are not in "interaction." Labov cautions us to consider the ways in
which "social forces," including the social prestige of the language and
the power relationship between the researcher and informants, "affect
linguistic behavior" (11). He laments that languages are not so carefully
partitioned from each other in the speakers' heads that the right hand
does not know what the left hand is doing: their rules "are bound to
interact" (36). However, these references to the ways in which power
relations mediate our knowledge and application of "linguistic rules" is
overwritten by a concern to naturalize the author's structural knowl-
edge.

Expressive realism in Labov's work is most explicitly demonstrated
by the assumption that the "sociolinguistic investigator" can and ought
to "obtain a record of the subjects' natural speech" (50, emphasis mine):
"The grammars we are concerned with must be grammars of a language
which is actually used for communication within the speech commu-
nity" (39, emphasis mine). Imagery of the "real" neutralizes the
investigator's structural knowledge by grounding it within the referent,
the "speech" of the "speech community." However, when evaluating
the quality of information and informants, Labov demonstrates a clear
interest in erasing differences across discursive practices to stabilize the
"grammars" of that speech community. For example, he depicts infor-
mation as having a "major defect" (42) if it does not allow us to distin-
guish regular rule-governed behavior from rare or variable behavior (42).
Informants are "poor" or "unreliable" (36, 11) when diverse systems
interact on the scene of the interview or in their minds (11, 36). The con-
cern for regularity and purity articulates Labov's alignment with mod-
ern linguistics' desire to posit a "speech community"a unified and
"maximally homogeneous" social worldas the object of its study (see
Pratt, "Linguistic Utopias" 50). In positing such a "speech community,"
the rules surfacing in the exchange between people of least linguistic,
social, political difference in most monodialectal situations are construed
as the "norm." In homogenizing the discursive practices of a "commu-
nity," such a construct also reinforces the hegemonic power of those at
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the center of individual discursive sites. As feminist critic Deborah
Cameron argues, it marginalizes the less powerful of the group, includ-
ing its female members. That is, such an approach to "community" and
linguistic norms is not neutral, as implied by the rhetoric of the "natu-
ral" and "actual," but situated in the power struggle across lines of class
and gender as well as race and ethnicity.

We may argue that it is the expressive realism underlying Labov's
study which makes it possible for "authorities" like Labov and Moffett
with seemingly directly opposite takes on Bernstein's work to both serve
as useful sources for composition. As I have argued earlier, Moffett reads
Bernstein's research on the different codes of middle-class and work-
ing-class students as evidence of differences in the students' cognitive
skills. Labov refutes that position in his critique of Carl Bereiter and his
program for preschool children (Labov 47). In spite of the differences,
the service both offer composition is the support for isolating the for-
mulation and dissemination of "forms" of discourse"abstraction" in
the case of Moffett, "linguistic rules" in the case of Labovfrom their
social and political contexts.

A similar move to dissolve an ambivalence toward the neutrality of
writing and teaching in the conceptual horizon of the writer also takes
place in composition's excerpting of the work of Richard Ohmann. Be-
ing the editor of College English, Ohmann could not be easily dismissed.
He is cited in five of the ten bibliographical essays in Teaching Composi-
tion (Tate 75, 88, 97, 325, 227, 249). On the one hand, there seems to be a
concerted effort in these essays to present Ohmann as a trailblazer in
English's venture into linguisticsone of the representatives of "linguis-
tic-analysts" in America (75), a "transformationalist" (88), and a "speech
act" theoristand, on the other, to ignore his cultural analysis of the
professional ethos of English departments, especially those articles (pub-
lished before 1973) which serve as the basis of much of his argument in
English in America. That is, these leading voices in composition seem to
suggest that the only Ohmann relevant to composition is the Ohmann
who is, in Ohmann's own words, "intending" to write "professional
books" "advancing 'our ' knowledge and my career" (English in America
4). At the same time, the Ohmann who admits to feeling "uncomfort-
able about where careers were taking me and the people I worked with"
and beginning to "give strident talks, criticizing the profession and pro-
posing reforms" is unanimously dismissed (5).

Let me examine the essentialist strain in Ohmann's writing from the
earlier part of the 1960s to understand how such an amputation of
Ohmann's work is possible. Among Ohmann's articles cited as useful
resources in Teaching Composition is "In Lieu of a New Rhetoric" (1964),
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in which Ohmarm sketches out the assumptions of a New Rhetoric to
which he admits to "adhere" ("In Lieu" 20). Ohmann depicts the writer
as holding "the mirror up, not only to nature or to the audience, but to
himself," which indicates an alignment with expressive realism (19). Like
other promoters of the "new" rhetoric, Ohmarm naturalizes the "new"
writing as helping readers to "share . . . a way of being human" (22).
Likewise, he maintains that postulating a hierarchy of world views is
"easy" if we start from those "conceptual modes . . . dictated by our bio-
logical makeup" and move through the "smaller" ones of nation and
culture down to the "smaller subgroups" of profession and class (19). In
"Literature as Sentence" (1966), another article cited in Teaching Compo-
sition, Ohmann uses the Chomskian binary of deep and surface struc-
ture to encourage efforts to "anchor" our "elusive intuition" of form
and content in the framework of generative grammar and study the "cog-
nitive and emotional processes" literary work sets in motion (261, 265,
267). In "Speech, Action, and Style" (1971), a third article endorsed by
the contributors to Teaching Composition, Ohmannuses speech act theory
to argue that we study the rules for illocutionary acts (246-47) and ac-
tions "basic to the continuity of human society" or "norm of human
interactions" (248) which are performed by illocutionary acts. And he is
concerned to find correlations between styles of ilocutionary action and
"fundamental literary types" (252). In none of these articles does Ohmann
reflect on the politics of his "professional" interest in "deep" rules and
structures in the context of the academic, cultural, and social conditions
of the 1960s, as he does a decade later in English in America.

It is worth spending some time analyzing Ohmann's critique of the
politics of English in two essays ignored by the bibliographical essays.
In "The Size and Structure of an Academic Field: Some Perplexities"
(1967), Ohmann evinces an uneasy tension between an unequivocal faith
in the neutrality of "science" and a concern to acknowledge the politics
of English. The history and forum of its presentation (firstas a talk at the
1966 NCTE convention and then as an essay published in College En-
glish ) and its topic (the relationship between English and science) make
it unlikely that any of the compositionists I discuss here would have
missed encountering it. In the essay, Ohmann makes the argument that
"science" is a "bad," "inappropriate" model for English because the
former is neutral while the latter has its cultural functions (362, 366).His
definition of "science" illustrates the hegemony of scientism on the in-
ternal as well as external scene of his writing. Ohmann makes no quali-
fication when stating that "science seeks to achieve a neutrality towards
particular events" and the "activity of theorizing is essentially neutral"
(364). He maintains that "scientific inquiry has a certain ethicthat of
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disinterestedness," and "its results are morally neutral""it maintains
a moral neutrality towards the objects of its attention" (365). In short, to
Ohmann in this article, "science" is a bad model for "English" because
the latter cannot be "science" but not also because Ohmann questions
the master plots of scientism. On the other hand, "English" cannot be
neutral because it is interested in "the fostering of literary culture and
literary consciousness"the building of a "corporate identity" (363).
Given the pervasive concern to turn composition into a "science" and
the tendency to think of English/science or literature/composition in
binary oppositions on the discursive horizon, it is conceivable that lead-
ing compositionists might view Ohmann's comment on the social func-
tion of "English" as relevant only to the other component of English
those committed to "literary" culture and consciousnessand therefore
as having little to do with those of "us" committed to "science" and the
fostering of universal, natural "literacy."

In another essay ignored by the bibliographies, "Teaching and Study-
ing Literature at the End of Ideology" in The Politics of Literature (1970),
which serves as the foundation of his chapter on the "Professional Ethos"
in English in America, Ohmann launches an even more cogent and ex-
tended analysis of the politics of English through unpacking the "cul-
tural values inherent in close reading" (135). He not only calls attention
to the "flight from politics" (143) it promotes but also puts New Critical
"reading" in the context of a general evasion of social conflict in Ameri-
can culture in its two-hundred-year history (143), the particular social
historical conditions of the 1950s (144), and the myth of "academic free-
dom" dominating education (152). The word "literature" in the title of
both the essay and the book might again be used to justify
"composition's" silence on Ohmann's view of the politics of reading
and teaching. However, composition's reception of English in America,
in which Ohmann explicitly points to composition's participation in the
New Critical flight from politics, suggests that this silence needs to be
examined in relation to the history of composition's concern to main-
tain its neutrality. As John Trimbur argues in his 1993 review of English
in America, "the field [composition] had collectively misplaced its copy
of English in America" by 1980, only three years after its publication (389).
Composition's reception of English in America during the birth of Basic
Writing suggests that the excerption of Ohmann the structuralist lin-
guist from Ohmann the social critic would have taken place even if he
had explicitly demystified the neutrality of composition in his earlier
essays.

This case is likely given the comparable U.S. reception given
Bernstein's elaborated and restricted codes. Bernstein's own review of
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his research from 1956 through 1987 puts in cogent terms an ambiva-
lence toward the neutrality of structuralist knowledge marking his work.
Bernstein maintains that there has been a "movement" in his thinking
and research "from the giving of definitions in terms of general linguistic
indices" to emphasizing the "relation between meanings, realizations,
and context" ("Elaborated" 101, emphasis mine). He feels it "important
to point out (because it is normally ignored)" that this movement has
been "continuous," beginning from a series of papers in 1964 (98). After
1971, it has led him to put more emphasis on the linkage between the
"macro power relations and micro practices" (119). It is this emphasis,
he argues, which distinguishes his code theory from the deficit and lan-
guage variety / difference position (118). In emphasizing the "movement"
in his research, Bernstein repeats his reservations, voiced as earlyas 1969
in a paper delivered at Columbia (Class 1: 191), concerning how U.S.
educators have "used (and more often abused)" his work, by drawing
"only upon very early work" (18) or amputating his concern to define
linguistic indices from his developing interest in the link between codes,
meaning, and power. Moffett's reading of Bernstein via Piaget, which I
have analyzed in the previous section, exemplifies the kind of "abuse"
Bernstein has in mind.

As Bernstein argues in the Introduction to the 1971 edition of a collec-
tion of his writings, this form of amputation has to be "ideological" since
"research in the social sciences arises out of the social context, is orga-
nized within a social context and, of critical significance, is given its
various meanings by receiving social contexts" (1: 18). The social con-
text constraining the U.S. reception of Bernstein's work, Bernstein goes
on to argue, is the domination of the deficit model in both the left and
right wing position on what Shaughnessy has depicted as issues giving
birth to Basic Writing: the War on Poverty and the debate on "cultural
deprivation" and "difference" during the 1960s (Shaughnessy, "Basic
Writing" 138). In calling the U.S. amputation of his work "inadvertent"
(Class 1: 194), Bernstein suggests that it is a comment on the "receiving
social contexts" rather than the social contexts producing his research.
However, we can argue that the U.S. "abuse" of his earlier writings is
also made possible by a contradictory impulse toward the figure of the
researcher operating in his work, which speaks to the hegemony of
scientism in the "social science" shaping his research context. As Ohmann
has argued, the concepts of class and code in Bernstein's work, as in
mainstream social science, are "structural and static" ("Reflections" 11).
They are heuristic concepts obtained by "calibrating" factors and look-
ing for correlations across variables (8-9).4 Furthermore, Bernstein's
choice of adjectives for distinguishing the two codes participates in the
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empirical, natural rhetoric dominating "science" across the continents.
Words such as "universalistic" (vs. "particularistic") orders of meaning,
"meta (vs. "descriptive") languages of control and innovation, and
"public" (vs. "private") knowledge (Class 1: 196-97) implicitly privilege
the codes of the middle class while explicitly arguing for the educability
of those socialized to the "restricted" codes. Furthermore, this cluster
works to displace attention from the politics of teaching in arguments
such as the following:

The introduction of the child to the universalistic meanings of pub-
lic forms of thought is not compensatory educationit is educa-
tion. It is in itself not making children middle class. (Class 1: 199, my
emphasis)

In implying that there is a form of education which transcends the so-
cial and historical, this cluster of words sustains the myth of natural
literacy M much the same way expressive realism neutralizes Emig's
composing process, Richards's "close reading," Elbow's writing with-
out teachers, or the "new" rhetoric of Young et al. This aspect of
Bernstein's thinking makes his work susceptible to his U.S. (ab)users.

However, Bernstein's insistence that the U.S. refusal to acknowledge
the "movement" in his work illustrates the ideological framework of his
U.S. readers is nevertheless to the point, especially if put alongside the
U.S. importation of the work of Vygotsky and Freire during Basic
Writing's birth. Vygotsky's "linguistic knowledge" is cited by
Shaughnessy as a valuable source for basic writing in both Errors and
Expectations and "Basic Writing." U.S. exposure to Vygotsky's work was
mostly confined to the 1962 publication of his Thought and Language
(Hanfmann and Vakar), which remained until the late 1970s his only
work available in English to U.S. readers. In the "Translators' Preface,"
Hanfmann and Vakar state that "in favor of straightforward exposition,"
they have eliminated "certain polemical discussions that would be of little
interest to the contemporary reader" (Hanfmann and Vakar xii, my em-
phasis). The dichotomy between "exposition" and "polemical discus-
sion" posits an ideal reader who perceives "research" as separate from
and above "politics." This "reader" is materialized by Jerome S. Bruner
in his "Introduction" to the translation, in which he uses the dichotomy
between a "Marxist theorist" and a reader like himself to undercut
Vygotsky's view on the relation between language, thought, and power
(Bruner, Introduction x). Bruner praises Vygotsky for his "mediational"
point of view and for introducing an "historical perspective" to the de-
velopment of thought: depicting "man as shaped by the tools and in-
struments that he comes to use" and having the "capacity to create higher
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order structures" (ix). The "striking fact" about Vygotsky's developmen-
tal theory, Bruner claims, is its description of the "many roads to indi-
viduality and freedom" (x): turning "the effort to learn and master" vari-
ous "mediating structures" into "a mechanism whereby one becomes
free of one's history" (ix). Bruner 's reading suggests that he is interested
in an "historical"i.e., transhistoricalperspective, one which neutral-
izes the teaching of specific linguistic and cognitive "mediating struc-
tures" in the name of "human" development and transcendence of "his-
tory." To justify his move to translate Vygotsky's book into a support for
such a transhistorical perspective, Bruner has to make irrelevant
Vygotsky's recognition of the role of "one's history"society and social
specificities giving shape to mediating structures. Bruner does so by in-
voking the equation of "Marxist" and the "political" with the "nonsci-
entific." Portraying Vygotsky as a "theorist of the nature of man" who
"transcends" rather than participates in "ideological rifts" dividing "our
world so deeply today" (x), Bruner marks that portion of Vygotsky's
thinking which does not fit into Bruner's transhistorical perspective as
"what pleases Marxist theorists" (x). By implication, the portion of
Vygotsky's work which can be read as coming from the "theorist of the
nature of man" can and ought to be excerpted from that portion of his
work which pleases the "Marxist theorists" in Stalin's totalitarian U.S.S.R.
and the United States. Such a rationale can work only if "contemporary
readers" share with Bruner and the translators a belief in the transcen-
dental power of "scientific" research and the myth of the West as "a
pluralistic world where each comes to terms with the environment in
his own style" (x). Since, as I have argued in the previous sections, such
readers populated composition during Basic Writing's birth, it is not
surprising that only the "scientific" Vygotsky was effectively translated
and introduced into U.S. education during the late sixties.

In hindsight, we might argue that Vygotsky became a "useful" source
for Basic Writing precisely and only because his Thought and Language
had been so effectively amputated by Bruner and the translators of the
1962 edition. That is, Vygotsky's use for composition and Basic Writing
partially rests on the fact that U.S. readers had to wait for more than a
decade for different introductions, as set forth by the publications of
Mind in Society (1978) and the 1986 edition of Thought and Language. The
Introductions in both of these later publications urge us to approach
Vygotsky's developmental theory in the context of his interest in apply-
ing a dialectical and historical materialist frame to psychology. These
readings call attention to Vygotsky's concern with "the consequences of
human activity as it transforms both nature and society" (Mind 129).
Situating Vygotsky in the tradition of Marx and Engels, Cole and Scribner
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argue that for Vygotsky, "the mechanism of individual developmental
change is rooted in society and culture" (Introduction 7), and the focus
of Vygotsky's theory and research is "the historically shaped and cul-
turally transmitted psychology of human beings." However, given the
power of expressive realism on the discursive terrain shaping Basic
Writing, it is doubtful that U.S. readers would have received Thought
and Language with the same enthusiasm if the book was first imported
in such terms.

Predictably, U.S. (ab)use of Thought and Language often glosses over
Vygotsky's critique of "old schools of psychology" (Thought and Lan-
guage [1986] 212) and of Piaget. Vygotsky explicitly distinguishes his
view of language from the "associationists' view," which Vygotsky ar-
gues assumes a bond between meaning, a certain sound, and a certain
object or referent and a bond between meaning and the transcendental
laws of the spirit or soul (Thoughts and Language [19861212-14). Further-
more, in a chapter called "Piaget's Theory of the Child's Speech and
Thought," Vygotsky explicitly criticizes the intersection between Piaget's
theory and "psychoanalysis" in perceiving the relationship between "the
biological and social factors of development" as a "breakdown"in
terms of a dichotomy of "inherent" and "external, 'alien," forces (44
45). A field concerned to neutralize notions of linguistic and cognitive
processes cannot afford to hear this portion of Thought and Language,
even though Piaget himself explicitly acknowledges a difference between
his theory of "cognitive egocentrism" and Vygotsky's notion of "inner
speech" in a short pamphlet titled "Comments." As Trimbur argues in
his reading of Piaget's response to Vygotsky in "Comments," the core of
the difference between the two is their different attitudes toward the
social and historical. Piaget cannot accept Vygotsky's view "that the
egocentric and communicative functions of language are equally social-
ized and that intellectual life is therefore social throughout its develop-
ment" (Trimbur, "Beyond Cognition" 214). The differences between
Piaget's cognitive egocentrism and Vygotsky's inner speech reside in
Piaget's reliance on the "inner/outer" polarity and Vygotsky's concern
to dismantle it (Trimbur 212). Vygotsky views "inner speech" in the
Bakhtinian sense, as inscribed in and contributing to socially and his-
torically specific power struggles (Trimbur 218; see also Wertsch). To
Piaget, speech and cognition develop "from the inside out, from cogni-
tive egocentrism to social cooperation," while for Vygotsky, the binary
of irmer and outer is deconstructed because the "outer world of public
discourse has already entered as a constitutive element into the inner
world of verbal thought" (Trimbur 215). However, given the hegemony
of expressive realism and the myth of "scientific" neutrality on the dis-
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cursive terrain during Basic Writing's birth, readings like Trimbur 's
would have little political currency even if they had been produced.
Rather, Emig's move to group Vygotsky and Piaget within the same
matrix would appear more reasonable.

U.S. amputation of Vygotsky's work also takes the form of removing
his research from its social, historical contexts, even though Vygotsky
explicitly calls attention to both the political content and contexts of re-
search in his critique of Piaget. As Cole and Scribner argue in their intro-
duction to Mind in Society, "historical materialism," the assumption that
historical changes in society and material life produce changes in "hu-
man nature" (consciousness and behavior), plays a fundamental role in
Vygotsky's thinking (Introduction 7). Viewing Vygotsky as a "Marxist
theorist" as well as a "theorist of the nature of man" would help us hear
Vygotsky's critique of Piaget's tendency to stay within the "safe ground"
of "pure empiricism" (Thought and Language [1986] 14) differently than
if we were to follow the direction set by Bruner. Vygotsky argues that
"facts are always examined in the light of some theory and therefore
cannot be disentangled from philosophy" (15). Piaget's effort to keep
his work within "the bounds of pure factual science" and to deliberately
avoid philosophy "is itself philosophical" (Vygotsky 41). Attention to
Vygotsky's historical materialist perspective would lead us to read him
as saying that the perspective and language of research is never neutral
because the choice of "philosophy" is always social and political. That
is, the differences between the research of Vygotsky and Piaget reside
not only in the insights each constructs concerning the nature of linguis-
tic and cognitive practices but also on the perspective of each on the
neutrality of "science." Given the hegemony of the Politburo in Stalin's
U.S.S.R., situating experimental cognitive psychology within a Marxist
framework was imperative for all intellectual practices during Vygotsky's
time (Cole and Scribner 6). We need to view Vygotsky's choice of a his-
torical materialist frame as an active responsean attempt to cope with
the constraints of "official" interpretations of Marxism dictating "scien-
tific" research by revising and challenging its dogmatism. However, this
reading is unlikely in the West given the cold-war mentality, the ten-
dency to essentialize knowledge, and the myth of a "free" West fighting
"Marxism" in the minds of contemporary readers in the 1960s and early
1970s. Rather, the equation between Marxism, communism, and Stalin's
U.S.S.R. upheld by the 1962 translation of Thought and Language would
have more currency and therefore was more likely to shift attention from
the ways in which Vygotsky's deployment of the historical materialist
framework illustrates a creative response to the social, historical con-
texts constraining his research.
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Ironically, in dismissing the social and historical contexts of Vygotsky's
research, the 1962 translation might also have led us to overlook a shared
constraint pressuring the work of Vygotsky, Bruner, Piaget and readers
such as Shaughnessy or Emig: namely, the shared need to negotiate with
the pressure of fitting "research" within a totalizing narrative of "hu-
man" history: the "Marxist" narrative dominating Stalin's Soviet Union
of historical progression through the feudal-capitalist-socialist-commu-
nist economic structures and the story in "our" so-called pluralistic so-
ciety of the road to bourgeois individual autonomy. To put it another
way, we can see in both the need to find creative ways of responding to
the domination of expressive realism across the Marxist discourse dic-
tating Stalin's U.S.S.R. and the liberal humanistic discourse of the West.
In choosing a "historical materialist" interpretation of Marxism, Vygotsky
can be perceived as implicitly challenging the universalizing story of
"human" progress toward "proletarian" dictatorship by situating the
production of all knowledgehistorical, linguistic, or psychological
in the social and historicalas socially and historically constructed
thought or language. At the same time, Thought and Language also bears
the mark of the official "Marxist" plot dictating all areas of life in Stalin's
U.S.S.R. For example, the move to displace attention from differences
along lines of race, gender, class, and ethnicity conjoins Thought and Lan-
guage with the work of Bruner and Piaget. Vygotsky, too, labels the "three
hundred" subjects of his experimental study in terms of "biological"
and "pathological" differences: as "children, adolescents, and adults,
including some with pathological disturbances of intellectual and lin-
guistic activities" (Thought and Language [1986] 105). This indicates that
no research of "the nature of man," whether by Vygotsky or Piaget, could
absolutely rise above but is always inscribed in the "ideological rift" of
a particular time and place. At the same time, given the power of
scientism, this aspect of Vygotsky's work would not be viewed in terms
of the social, historical conditions of research but more likely as an ex-
pression of the ability of the "scientist" to transcend the political con-
straints of his time.

We might further contextualize composition's (ab)use of Vygotsky's
Thought and Language by situating it alongside U.S. educators' metonymic
reading of Freire's Pedagogy of the Oppressed (1970) (Aronowitz 9). As
both Henry Giroux and Stanley Aronowitz have argued, U.S. readers
during the seventies tended to "denude" Freire's work of its most im-
portant political insights (Giroux, "Paulo Freire" 177; Aronowitz 8; see
also Bizzell, "Marxist"). The prevailing interest is to extrapolate a series
of teaching "tools" from Pedagogy of the Oppressed which can be effec-
tively used by democratic and humanist teachers to motivate students
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to imbibe the curriculum with enthusiasm instead of turning their backs
on schooling (Aronowitz 11). Such an importation of Pedagogy of the
Oppressed is bound to dismiss the echo of the humanist Marxism
(McLaren and Leonard 3) in Freire's thoughts on history and human
nature even though readersincluding Aronowitz, Ira Shor, bell hooks,
and Girouxhave argued in Paulo Freire: A Critical Encounter that his
"understanding of subjectivity, experience, and power bears some re-
semblance to certain strains of poststructuralist thought," readings for
which Freire himself has expressed appreciation (Freire, Foreword, x).

Given the hegemonic concern to neutralize composition during Basic
Writing's birth, it seems hardly surprising that U.S. educators "human-
ize" Freire's social theory, i.e., turn it into a pedagogy concerned with
individual salvation from dehumanizing social forces involving no fun-
damental social transformation. Indeed, it is possible to excerpt the fol-
lowing statements from Pedagogy of the Oppressed and appropriate them
within the frame of composition's "new" knowledge of universal "hu-
man" cognitive and linguistic laws to assume a convergence between
Freire's pedagogy of the oppressed and much of the "new" pedagogy I
examine above:

[Problem-posing education] affirms men as beings who transcend
themselves (72);

The humanist, revolutionary education must be imbued with a pro-
found trust in men and their creative power (62).

Taken out of context, neither passage would look out of place in the
work of Emig, Elbow, or Young et al. However, if we re-read these pas-
sages in the context of Freire's discussion of the nature of consciousness
and the goal of problem-posing education, we would have to acknowl-
edge a drastic difference between the meaning of the word "human" in
Freire's pedagogy and in the "new" pedagogy of composition. The "man"
empowered by problem-posing education and the "human" potential it
facilitates is not the bourgeois subject of liberal humanism. "Humanist"
education is "revolutionary" in the context of Freire's work not because
it liberates "man" from the alien forces of "society" through "intellec-
tual" flight but because it helps man to fight injustice and transform all
relations of domination operating on the social, historical scene and in
one's mind. This difference is most obvious if we consider Freire's ex-
plicit attention to the political content of individual consciousness and
of problem-posing education. The consciousness of the oppressed, Freire
argues, is "divided." Having "internalized" the consciousness of the
oppressor, their ideal is to be "man"the oppressor (Pedagogy 32). At
this stage, their vision of the new man is individualistic, and they tend
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to be more interested in "private revolution": reverse their place and
role while leaving oppression unchanged (30-31). Freire calls this the
"tragic dilemma of the oppressed" (33). Such descriptions of conscious-
ness indicate that human subjects in Freire's Pedagogy of the Oppressed
are, "as in Marx, rooted in historical struggle" (Pedagogy 3). Human cog-
nitive and linguistic practices are implicated in the relations of domina-
tion played out in the social, historical scene. Human consciousness is
not a shelter against alien social forces but a site where socially and his-
torically specific power struggle takes place.

Because of the power struggle within the consciousness of the teacher
and students, neither can the classroom in Freire's work be seen as tran-
scending the social and historical. As Freire reminds us, the "practice of
problem-posing education" only "entails at the outset that the teacher-
student contradiction be resolved" (Pedagogy 67). It only resolves the
oppressor-oppressed contradiction at the "outset" because in creating a
space for "cognitive actors to cooperate" (67) through the format of teach-
ing, it has not resolved "the oppressor-oppressed contradictions" on the
external scene of cognitionthe "concrete situation" in which "the op-
pressor-oppressed contradiction is established" (35)nor on the inter-
nal scene of cognitionthe consciousness of the cognitive actor. There-
fore, the "vocation" of problem-posing is helping students and teachers
struggle against the oppressors by struggling to "eject" the oppressor
from within, which cannot be achieved without fundamental change in
the distribution of power on the social and historical scene (33). These
descriptions of the social content of human consciousness and problem-
posing education remind us that pedagogies which help students to
exercise believing muscles and heuristic procedures in the name of in-
herent human laws cannot liberate students from relations of domina-
tion because it is not involving them in "incessant struggle against the
structure of oppression within" their consciousness (33). They are not
"liberatory" in the Freirean sense. The implicit but sharp criticism this
aspect of Freire's pedagogy performs on composition's effort to neutral-
ize "human" consciousness and the teaching of "human" cognitive and
linguistic processes suggests that it would not be to the interest of au-
thors whose work I examine in the previous sections to read Freire's
social theory carefully. Rather, Pedagogy of the Oppressed can only be use-
ful to composition in general and Basic Writing during its "birth" when
it is denuded of its insights on the politics of humanistic education.

At the same time, the effort to "humanize" Freire's pedagogy is made
possible by the tradition of separating the production and reception of
knowledge from its social, historical contexts and the myth of a "free"
West. Together, that tradition and myth operate to endorse a dismissal
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of Freire's social theory as the product of, as Aronowitz points out, a
"local [Brazilian] phenomenon" therefore not relevant to the "core of
Freire's teaching" (Aronowitz 10). By the same token, given the "thor-
oughly democratic context" marking the political systems of North
America and Western Europe, the "core" of Freirean teaching can be
practiced in its essence free from the encumbrance of local politics.

The Politics of Re-telling Basic Writing's "Birth" via "Science" in
the 1990s

In constructing a recurring story of "science" dominating the discursive
terrain of Basic Writing's birth, I have tried to portray the teacher /re-
searcher of basic writing in her function as a dominated within the domi-
nant: riven by her commitment to the interests of students labeled as
academic "aliens" and her professional inscription within the dominant.
My purpose for re-telling this story is to argue that historically, our com-
mitment to posing fairer and more objective portraits of these students
has been mediated by social, historical pressures to treat such alterna-
tive knowledge as neutral, universal Truth grounded solely in the "real-
ity" inherent in the objects we study and teachthe students and their
writing. The "scientific" rhetoric, in occluding our attention to the con-
tradictory political motives and consequences of our research and teach-
ing, has exempted us from the need to rigorously struggle against our
alignments with the dominant when addressing issues of differences
and power. While commitment to a fairer and more objective represen-
tation of the dominated is central to the work of basic writing, we need
always to keep in mind, as we demand of our opponents, that "objectiv-
ity" and "fairness" are socially, historically constructed concepts and
cannot be isolated from the question of who is speaking to whom, for
whom, why, when, and where. That is, if we are to rigorously address
issues of differences and power in our research and teaching, we must
refuse the tendency to essentialize knowledge, new and alternative or
established and hegemonic.

This attempt to re-search the history of Basic Writing's participation
in neutralizing research, teaching, and writing is itself not politically
innocent but motivated by a specific reading of the current discursive
terrain. It is my concern that the pressure to depoliticize the perspective
of the teacher/researcher in the 1990s has not lessened. On one hand,
the emerging authority of theories of language which acknowledge is-
sues of power and differences in discursive practices in composition,
literary studies, linguistics, and the sciences increasingly makes pub-
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lishable and published "new" representations of students and teachers
labeled "basic," legitimizing alternative knowledge which contests the
Truth of expressive realism. On the other hand, the neoconservative move
to renew its hegemony in the United States of today is increasingly mak-
ing any attempt to call attention to the politics of teaching, writing, and
research vulnerable to the terrorism of labels such as "political correct-
ness."

The emergence of alternative representations of students and teach-
ers labeled as "basic" since the late 1970s can be illustrated by the differ-
ences in the style and content of Shaughnessy's bibliographical essay
and some of the bibliographical essays in the 1990 Research in Basic Writ-
ing. Andrea Lunsford and Patricia Sullivan's essay "Who Are Basic Writ-
ers?" begins by acknowledging the circularity of definitions of basic
writers as students in basic writing courses and the "more complete and
richer definitions" provided by scholars of basic writing (18). Their re-
view of the literature aimed at defining basic writers, however, leads
them to conclude not only that "in a real sense, [they] do not know"
who basic writers are but also that, in a different sense, the questions
themselves are wrong: "trying to answer these questions . . . only led us
to new ways of asking the questions and even to questions about ques-
tions. . . . to explore the rich complexities of the questions rather than to
search for certain or simple answers" (27). This tentative questioning at
the end of the bibliographical survey destabilizes the hegemony in Ba-
sic Writing research and teaching of questions such as who are the basic
writers and what are their writings, questions which often work to focus
attention on the realism of "new" knowledge about the object of study
and teaching while exempting attention to the politics of the researcher/
teacher 's choice of language, perspective, and methods. Thus the con-
clusion implicitly legitimizes questions about these questions, poten-
tially including questions about the expressive realism embedded in the
posing of these questions in existing research and pedagogy.

Donna Haisty Winchell's essay "Developmental Psychology and Ba-
sic Writers," included in the same volume, reviews researchers' attempts
to place basic writers at particular "stages" of cognitive development. It
similarly ends by calling such attempts into question, noting the "prob-
lem of dictating values" that results from such efforts. Citing critiques
of the "cognitive" approach to understanding writing by Patricia Bizzell,
Mike Rose, and others, Winchell warns that "when teachers attempt to
accelerate their students' cognitive development, . . . [t]hey are asking
their students to accept a value system" (43). Although she maintains
that "a background in developmental psychology is an essential part of
the training of teachers of basic writers," she nonetheless accompanies
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this statement with an extensive reference to Rose's cautionary note
warning that such research encodes "social and political hierarchies . . .

in sweeping cognitive dichotomies" (43).
In their essay on "Literacy Theory and Basic Writing," Mariolina

Salvatori and Glynda Hull adopt a more radical position. Insisting at
the outset that "[literacy] is permanently and deeply ideological, and
teaching it necessarily means inculcating and reproducing a specific set
of values and evaluations," they reject the possibility even of writing a
politically neutral bibliographical essay on literacy and basic writing.
As they put it in explaining their categorizations of the literature they
review, they intend their categorizations to

set up a context where theory and practice interrogate, test, and
monitor each other, where different theories and practices read their
own and each other's differences critically, where researchers, theo-
rists, and teachers create for themselves and measure up to the re-
sponsibility that literacy thrusts upon them. (52)

They thus renounce at the outset the assumptions of scientism by call-
ing attention to the politics of their own choice of language, perspective,
and methods.

In thus explicitly challenging the "academic" tone characterizing
Shaughnessy's bibliographical essay, researcher/teachers like Salvatori
and Hull risk becoming the target of current Right charges of academic
"political correctness." To a great extent, the hegemony of the binary of
academic vs. political dominating the birth of Basic Writing is still with
us, as attested to by conservative moves to kill the so-called "politicized"
composition curriculum at the University of Texas at Austin. Economic
retrenchment in states like New York likewise takes the form of target-
ing teachers, students, and programs viewed as most "expendable"
the most marginal and least resistant to "academic" cooptationcom-
parable to recent attacks on U.S. welfare programs. In such a climate,
the pressure to ground one's alternative knowledge (including repre-
sentations of the students' need to negotiate differences and power when
writing and learning) solely in the authority of "reality" inherent in the
objectthe students and their writingand to shift attention away from
the politics of one's choice of language, perspective, and methods (in-
cluding one's preferences for theories which acknowledge the relation
of power, subjectivity, and language) is real: social, historical, as well as
intellectual. For no academic project in today's United States, including
this one, can transcend concerns over student admission and support
services as well as teachers' own job security, tenure, and promotion.
We might even regard calls within composition to eliminate first-year
composition courses or to mainstream basic writing, rather than being
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motivated purely by new perspectives on students' needs, to be responses
as well to newly imposed financial constraints on English departments
and writing teachers' fatigue from long institutional exploitation.

Re-searching the history of Basic Writing's alignment with "intellec-
tual" traditions such as scientism and New Criticism in the context of
similar "professional" pressures during the late 1970s can help us grasp
the differences in the social, historical contexts of basic writing teaching
and research then and now, so that we might explore different strategies
for wrestling with these pressures. I hope to illustrate in this version of
that history that the desire to authorize the perspective and knowledge
of the dominated cannot benefit from the assumptions of expressive re-
alism, for only the dominant has the power to objectifyneutralize and
universalizetruth. In order to not lose sight of our concern to identify
with the dominated, we must be willing to grapple with our inscription
in the dominant and rigorously contextualize our knowledge with the
question of who is speaking for whom, when, where, and why. That is,
we have no option but to meet head-on the Right terrorist accusations of
"political correctness." On the one hand, we need to more actively take
advantage of the differences in the conditions of work during the late
1970s and the 1990s: the emerging power of "academic" discourses which
recognize the relation of power, subjectivity, and language offers us an
alternative "intellectual" tradition and the legitimacy of Basic Writing
as an academic field. On the other hand, we must nevertheless be vigi-
lant toward the pressure to objectify the knowledge produced from such
alternative discursive and institutional positions. Most of all, we should
keep in mind that this history of Basic Writing's birth is deeply social
and historical. It is provisional and strategic, serving as a point of depar-
ture for re-searching ways of contextualizing new knowledge in basic
writing in the social, historical specificity of not only the students we
study and teach but more important, of the teacher/researcher produc-
ing and receiving that knowledge.
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4 Redefining the Legacy of Mina
Shaughnessy: A Critique of the
Politics of Linguistic Innocence

Min-Zhan Lu

The aim of this paper is to critique an essentialist assumption about lan-
guage dominant in the teaching of basic writing. This assumption holds
that the essence of meaning precedes and is independent of language,
which serves merely as a vehicle to communicate that essence. Accord-
ing to this assumption, differences in discourse conventions have no
effect on the essential meaning communicated. Using Mina
Shaughnessy's Errors and Expectations as an example, I examine the ways
in which such an assumption leads to pedagogies which promote what
I call a politics of linguistic innocence: that is, a politics which preempts
teachers' attention from the political dimensions of the linguistic choices
students make in their writing.

My critique is motivated by my alignment with various Marxist and
poststructuralist theories of language.' In one way or another, these theo-
ries have argued that language is best understood not as a neutral ve-
hicle of communication but as a site of struggle among competing dis-
courses. Each discourse puts specific constraints on the construction of
one's stancehow one makes sense of oneself and gives meaning to the
world. Through one's gender; family; work; religious, educational, or
recreational life, each individual gains access to a range of competing
discourses which offer competing views of oneself, the world, and one's
relation with the world. Each time one writes, even and especially when
one is attempting to use one of these discourses, one experiences the
need to respond to the dissonance among the various discourses of one's
daily life. Because different discourses do not enjoy equal political power
in current-day America, decisions on how to respond to such dissonance
are never politically innocent.

From the perspective of such a view of language, Shaughnessy's stated
goal for her basic writersthe mastery of written English and the "ulti-
mate freedom of deciding how and when and where" to use which lan-
guage (11)should involve at least three challenges for student writers.
First, the students need to become familiar with the conventions or "the
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stock of words, routines, and rituals that make up" academic discourse
(198). Second, they need to gain confidence as learners and writers. Third,
they need to decide how to respond to the potential dissonance between
academic discourse and their home discourses. These decisions involve
changes in how they think as well as how they use language. Yet, most
pedagogies informed by the kind of essentialist assumption I defined
earlier, including the one Shaughnessy presents in Errors and Expecta-
tions, tend to focus attention on only the first two of these challenges.

I choose Errors and Expectations as an example of such pedagogies
because, following Robert Lyons, I interpret the operative word in that
book to be "tasks" rather than "achievements." As Robert Lyons cogently
points out, Shaughnessy's work "resists closure; instead, it looks to the
future, emphasizing what needs to be learned and done" (Lyons, "Mina
Shaughnessy" 186). The legacy of Shaughnessy, I believe, is the set of
tasks she maps out for composition teachers. To honor this legacy, we
need to examine the pedagogical advice she gives in Errors and Expecta-
tions as tasks which point to the futureto what needs to be learned
and donerather than as providing closure to our pedagogical inquiry.
One of the first tasks Shaughnessy sets up for composition teachers is
that of "remediating" ourselves ("Diving In" 238). She urges us to be-
come "students" of our students as well as of new disciplines. Reading
Errors and Expectations in light of current theories of language is one way
of continuing that "remediation." Shaughnessy also argues-that a good
composition teacher should inculcate interest in and respect for linguis-
tic variety and help students attain discursive option, freedom, and
choice. She thus maps out one more task for us: to carry out democratic
aspirations in the teaching of basic writing.2 Another task she maps out
for composition teachers is the need to "sound the depths" of the stu-
dents' difficulties as well as their intelligence ("Diving In" 236). If, as I
will argue, some of her own pedagogical advice indicates that an essen-
tialist view of language could impede rather than enhance one's effort
to fulfill these tasks, then the only way we can fully benefit from the
legacy of Shaughnessy is to take the essentialist view of language itself
to task.

In Errors and Expectations, Shaughnessy argues that language "is vari-
ously shaped by situations and bound by conventions, none of which is
inferior to the others but none of which, also, can substitute for the oth-
ers" (121). Using such a view of language, she makes several arguments
key to her pedagogy. For example, she uses it to argue for the "system-
atic nature" of her students' home discourses, the students' "quasi-for-
eign relationship" with academic discourse, and thus, the logic of some
of their errors. She also uses this view of language to call attention to



Redefining the Legacy of Mina Shaughnessy 107

basic writers' existing mastery of at least one variety of English and thus,
their "intelligence and linguistic aptitudes" (292). She is then able to
increase the confidence of both teachers and students in the students'
ability to master a new variety of Englishacademic English.

Shaughnessy's view of language indicates her willingness to
"remediate" herself by studying and exploring the implications which
contemporary linguistic theories have for the teaching of basic writing.3
However, in looking to these fields for "fresh insights and new data,"
Shaughnessy seems to have also adopted an essentialist assumption
which dominates these theories of language: the assumption that lin-
guistic codes can be taught in isolation from attention to the production
of meaning and from attention to the dynamic power struggle within
and among diverse discourses.4

We see this assumption operating in Shaughnessy's description of a
writer's "consciousness (or conviction) of what [he] means":

It seems to exist at some subterranean level of languagebut yet to
need words to coax it to the surface, where it is communicable, not
only to others but, in a different sense, to the writer himself. (80)

The image of someone using words to coax meaning "to the surface"
suggests that meaning exists separately from and "at some subterra-
nean level of language." Meaning is thus seen as a kind of essence which
the writer carries in his or her mind prior to writing, although the writer
might not always be fully conscious of it. Writing merely serves to make
this essence communicable to oneself and others. As David Bartholomae
puts it, Shaughnessy implies that "writing is in service of 'personal
thoughts and styles" ("Released" 83). Shaughnessy does recognize that
writing is "a deliberate process whereby meaning is crafted, stage by
stage" (Shaughnessy, Errors 81), even that "the act of articulation refines
and changes Rhoughtl" (Errors 82). But the pedagogy she advocates sel-
dom attends to the changes which occur in that act. Instead, it presents
writing primarily as getting "as close a fit as possible between what [the
writer] means and what he says on paper," or as "testing the words that
come to mind against the thought one has in mind" (Errors 79, 204).
That is, "meaning is crafted" only to match what is already in the writer's
mind (Errors 81-82).

Such a view of the relationship between words and meaning does
not allow for attention to the possibility that different ways of using
wordsdifferent discoursesmight exercise different constraints on
how one "crafts" the meaning "one has in mind." This is probably why
the pedagogical advice Shaughnessy offers in Errors and Expectations
seldom considers the possibility that the meaning one "has in mind"
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might undergo substantial change as one tries to "coax" it and "com-
municate" it in different discourses. In the following section, I use
Shaughnessy's responses to three student writings to examine this ten-
dency in her pedagogy. I argue that such a tendency might keep her
pedagogy from achieving all the goals it envisions. That is, it might teach
students to "write something in formal English" and "have something
to say" but can help students obtain only a very limited "freedom of
deciding how and when and where" to "use which language" (11, em-
phasis mine).

The following is a sentence written by one of Shaughnessy's students:

In my opinion I believe that you there is no field that cannot be
effected some sort of advancement that one maybe need a college
degree to make it. (Errors 62)

Shaughnessy approaches the sentence "grammatically," as an example
of her students' tendency to use "fillers" such as "I think that . . . " and
"It is my opinion that . . . " (62). She argues that these "fillers" keep the
writers from "making a strong start with a real subject" and make them
lose their "bearings" (62, my emphasis). The distinction between a "real
subject" and "fillers" suggests that in getting rid of the "fillers," the
teacher is merely helping the writer to retrieve the real subject or bear-
ings he has in mind. I believe Shaughnessy assumes this to be the case
because she sees meaning as existing "at some subterranean level of
language." Yet, in assuming that, her attention seems to have been oc-
cluded from the possibility that as the writer gets rid of the "fillers," he
might also be qualifying the subject or bearing he originally has in mind.

For instance, Shaughnessy follows the student's original sentence with
a consolidated sentence: "A person with a college degree has a better
chance for advancement in any field" (63). Shaughnessy does not indi-
cate whether this is the student's revised sentence or the model the
teacher might pose for the student. In either case, the revised sentence
articulates a much stronger confidence than the original in the belief
that education entails advancement. For we might read some of the
phrases in the original sentence, such as "in my opinion," "I believe that
you," "some sort of," and "one maybe need," as indications not only of
the writer 's inability to produce a grammatically correct sentence but
also of the writer 's attempt to articulate his uncertainty or skepticism
toward the belief that education entails advancement. In learning "con-
solidation," this student is also consolidating his attitude toward that
belief. Furthermore, this consolidation could involve important changes
in the writer's political alignment. For one can well imagine that people
of different economic, racial, ethnic, or gender groups would have dif-
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ferent feelings about the degree to which education entails one's ad-
vancement.

In a footnote to this passage, Shaughnessy acknowledges that "some
would argue" that what she calls "fillers" are "indices of involvement"
which convey a stance or point of view (62 n. 4). But her analysis in the
main text suggests that the sentence is to be tackled "grammatically,"
without consideration to stance or point of view. I think the teacher
should do both. The teacher should deliberately call the student's atten-
tion to the relationship between "grammar" and "stance" when teach-
ing "consolidation." For example, the teacher might ask the student to
consider if a change in meaning has occurred between the original sen-
tence and the grammatically correct one. The advantage of such an ap-
proach is that the student would realize that decisions on what are "fill-
ers" and what is one's "real subject" are not merely "grammatical" but
also political: they could involve a change in one's social alignment. The
writer would also perceive deliberation over one's stance or point of
view as a normal aspect of learning to master grammatical conventions.
Moreover, the writer would be given the opportunity to reach a self-
conscious decision. Without practice in this type of decision making, the
kind of discursive options, freedom, or choice the students could obtain
through education is likely to be very limited.

Attention to this type of deliberation seems just as necessary if the
teacher is to help the student who wrote the following paper achieve
the style of "weav[ing] personal experience into analytical discourse"
which Shaughnessy admires in "mature and gifted writers" (198):

It can be said that my parents have led useful live but that useful-
ness seems to deteriorate when they fond themselves constantly
being manipulated for the benefit of one and not for the benefit of
the community. If they were able to realize that were being manipu-
late successful advancements could of been gained but being that
they had no strong political awareness their energies were consumed
by the politicans who saw personal advancements at the expenses
of dedicated community workers. And now that my parents have
taken a leave of abscence from community involvement, comes my
term to participate on worthwhile community activities which well
bring about positive results and to maintain a level of conscious-
ness in the community so that they will know what policies affect
them, and if they don't quite like the results of the policies I'll make
sure, if its possible, to abolish the ones which hinder progress to
ones which well present the correct shift in establishing correct leg-
islation or enactments. In order to establish myself and my life to
revolve around the community I must maintain a level of aware-
ness to make sure that I can bring about positive actions and to keep
an open mind to the problems of the community and to the possible
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manipulation machinery which is always on the watch when pro-
gressive leaders or members of the community try to build effective
activities for the people to participate. (197)

Shaughnessy suggests that the reason this writer has not yet "mastered
the style" is because he has just "begun to advance into the complexity
of the new language" and "is almost certain to sound and feel alien with
the stock of words, routines, and rituals that make up that language"
(198). The "delicate task" of the teacher in such a situation, Shaughnessy
points out, is to "encourag[e] the enterprise and confidence of the stu-
dent" while "improving his judgment about both the forms and mean-
ings of the words he chooses" (198).

I believe that there is another dimension to the teacher's task. As
Shaughnessy points out, this writer might be "struggling to develop a
language that will enable him to talk analytically, with strangers, about
the oppression of his parents and his own resolve to work against that
oppression" (197). If what Shaughnessy says of most of her basic writ-
ers is true of this writerthat he too has "grown up in one of New York's
ethnic or racial enclaves" (3)then the "strangers" for whom he writes
and whose analytical discourse he is struggling to use are "strangers"
both in the political and linguistic sense. To this writer, these "strang-
ers" are people who already belong to what Shaughnessy calls the world
of "public transactionseducational, civic, and professional" (125), a
world which has traditionally excluded people like the writer and his
parents. These "strangers" enjoy power relationships with the very
"politicans" and "manipulation machinery" against whom this writer
is resolved to fight. In trying to "talk analytically," this writer is also
learning the "strangers" way of perceiving people like his parents, such
as viewing the oppression of his parents and his resolution to work
against that oppression with the "curiosity and sentimentality of strang-
ers" (197-98). Thus, their "style" might put different constraints than
the student's home discourse on how this writer re-views "the experi-
ences he has in mind" (197). If all of this is so, the teacher ought to ac-
knowledge that possibility to the students.

Let me use the writings of another of Shaughnessy's students to illus-
trate why attention to a potential change in point of view might benefit
students. The following are two passages written by one of
Shaughnessy's students at the beginning and the end of a semester:

Essay written at beginning of semester
Harlem taught me that light skin Black people was better look,

the best to suceed, the best off fanicially etc this whole that I trying
to say, that I was brainwashed and people aliked.
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I couldn't understand why people (Black and white) couldn't
get alone. So as time went along I began learned more about myself
and the establishment.

Essay written at end of semester
In the midst of this decay there are children between the ages of

five and ten playing with plenty of vitality. As they toss the football
around, their bodies full of energy, their clothes look like rainbows.
The colors mix together and one is given the impression of being in
a psychadelic dream, beautiful, active, and alive with unity. They
yell to eachother increasing their morale. They have the sound of an
organized alto section. At the sidelines are the girls who are shy,
with the shyness that belongs to the very young. They are
embarrased when their dresses are raised by the wind. As their feet
rise above pavement, they cheer for their boy friends. In the midst
of the decay, children will continue to play. (278)

In the first passage, the writer approaches the "people" through their
racial and economic differences and the subject of childhood through
racial rift and contention. In the second paper, he approaches the "chil-
dren" through the differences in their age, sex, and the color of their
clothes. And he approaches the subject of childhood through the "unity"
among children. The second passage indicates a change in how this writer
makes sense of the world around him: the writer has appeased his an-
ger and rebellion against a world which "brainwashed" children with
discriminatory perceptions of blacks and whites. Compared to the ear-
lier and more labored struggle to puzzle out "why people (Black and
white) couldn't get alone [sic]," the almost lyrical celebration of the
children's ability to "continue to play" "in the midst of the decay" seems
a much more "literary" and evasive form of confronting the world of
"decay."

Shaughnessy characterizes this writer as a student who "discovered
early in the semester that writing gave him access to thoughts and feel-
ings he had not reached any other way" (278, my emphasis). She uses
these essays to illustrate "the measure of his improvement in one se-
mester." By that, I take Shaughnessy to have in mind the changes in
length and style. By the end of the semester, the student is clearly not
only finding more to say on the subject but also demonstrating better
control over the formal English taught in the classroom. This change in
length and style certainly illustrates the effectiveness of the kind of peda-
gogical advice Shaughnessy gives.

Yet, these two passages also indicate that the change in the length
and style of the student's writing can be accompanied by a change in
thinkingin the way one perceives the world around one and relates to
it. This latter change is often political as well as stylistic. I think that
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Shaugimessy's responses to these student writings overlook this poten-
tial change in thinking because she believes that language will only help
the writers "reach" but not change how they think and feel about a cer-
tain subject or experience. Thus, attention to a potential change in one's
point of view or political stance seems superfluous.

If mastery of academic discourse is often accompanied by a change
in one's point of view, as my reading of these three student writings
suggests, then it ought to be the teacher's task to acknowledge to the
students this aspect of their learning. However, teachers may hesitate to
do so because they are worried that doing so might confirm the stu-
dents' fear that education will distance them from their home discourses
or communities and, as a result, slow down their learning. As
Shaughnessy cogently points out, her students are already feeling over-
whelmed by their sense of the competition between home and college:

Neglected by the dominant society, [basic writers] have nonethe-
less had their own worlds to grow up in and they arrive on our
campuses as young adults, with opinions and languages and plans
already in their minds. College both beckons and threatens them,
offering to teach them useful ways of thinking and talking about
the world, promising even to improve the quality of their lives, but
threatening at the same time to take from them their distinctive ways
of interpreting the world, to assimilate them into the culture of
academia without acknowledging their experience as outsiders. (292)

Again and again, Shaughnessy reminds us of her students' fear that col-
lege may distance them from "their own worlds" and take away from
them the point of view they have developed through "their experience
as outsiders." She argues that this fear causes her students to mistrust
and psychologically resist learning to write (125). Accordingly, she sug-
gests several methods which she believes will help students assuage
that fear.

For example, when discussing her students' difficulty in developing
an "academic vocabulary," Shaughnessy points out that they might re-
sist a new meaning for a familiar word because accepting it would be
like consenting to a "linguistic betrayal that threatens to wipe out not
just a word but the reality that the word refers to" (212). She then goes
on to suggest that "if we consider the formal (rather than the contex-
tual) ways in which words can be made to shift meaning we are closer
to the kind of practical information about words BW students need"
(212). This seems to be her rationale: if a "formal" approach (in this case,
teaching students to pay attention to prefixes and suffixes) can help stu-
dents learn that words can be made to shift meaning, then why not avoid
the "contextual" approach, especially since the "contextual" approach
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will only activate their sense of being pressured to "wipe out not just a
word but the reality that the word refers to"?

But taking this "formal" approach only circumvents the students' at-
tention to the potential change in their thinking and their relationship
with home and school. It delays but cannot eliminate their need to deal
with that possibility. As a result, students are likely to realize the change
only after it has already become a fact. At the same time, because the
classroom has suggested that learning academic discourse will not af-
fect how they think, feel, or relate to home, students are also likely to
perceive their "betrayal" of home in purely personal terms, the result of
purely personal choices. The sense of guilt and confusion resulting from
such a perception is best illustrated in Richard Rodriguez's narrative of
his own educational experience, Hunger of Memory. Rodriguez's narra-
tive also suggests that the best way for students to cope constructively
with their sense of having consented to a "betrayal" is to perceive it in
relation to the politics of education and language. The long, lonely, and
painful deliberation it takes for Rodriguez to contextualize that "betrayal"
suggests that teachers might better help students anticipate and cope
with their sense of "betrayal" if they take the "contextual" as well as the
"formal" approach when teaching the conventions of academic dis-
course. In fact, doing both might even help students to minimize that
"betrayal." When students are encouraged to pay attention to the ways
in which diverse discourses constrain one's alignments with different
points of view and social groups, they have a better chance to deliberate
over how they might resist various pressures academic discourse exer-
cises on their existing points of view. As Shaughnessy points out, "En-
glish has been robustly inventing itself for centuriesstretching and
reshaping and enriching itself with every language and dialect it has
encountered" (13). If the teacher acknowledges that all practitioners of
academic discourse, including those who are learning to master it as
well as those who have already mastered it, can participate in this pro-
cess of reshaping, then students might be less passive in coping with the
constraints academic discourse puts on their alignments with their home
discourses.

In preempting Shaughnessy's attention from the political decisions
involved in her students' formal or linguistic decisions, the essentialist
view of language also seems to have kept her from noticing her own
privileging of academic discourse. Shaughnessy calls formal written
English "the language of public transactionseducational, civic, and
professional"and the students' home discourse the language one uses
with one's family and friends (125). Shaughnessy insists that no variety
of English can "substitute for the others" (121). She reassures her stu-
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dents that their home discourses cannot be substituted by academic dis-
course, but neither can their home discourses substitute for academic
discourse. Thus, she suggests that academic discourse is a "necessary"
and "advantageous" language for all language users because it is the
language of public transaction (125, 293). This insistence on the
nonsubstitutive nature of language implies that academic discourse has
been, is, and will inevitably be the language of public transaction. And
it may very well lead students to see the function of formal English as a
timeless linguistic law which they must respect, adapt to, and perpetu-
ate rather than as a specific historical circumstance resulting from the
historically unequal distribution of social power and as a condition which
they must recognize but can also call into question and change.

Further, she differentiates the function of academic discourse from
that of the students' home discourses through the way she characterizes
the degree to which each discourse mobilizes one's language learning
faculty. She presents the students' efforts to seek patterns and to dis-
criminate or apply rules as "self-sustaining activities" (127, emphasis
mine). She argues that the search for causes, like the ability to compare,
is "a constant and deep urge among people of all cultures and ages" and
"part of an unfolding intellective power that begins with infancy and con-
tinues, at least in the lives of some, until death" (263, emphasis mine).
Academic discourse and the students' home discourses, Shaughnessy
suggests, unfold their "intellective power" differently. The home dis-
courses of basic writers are seen as allowing such power to remain
"largely intuitive," "simplistic" and "unreasoned" (263), while the con-
ventions of written English are seen as demanding that such power be
"more thoroughly developed," "more consciously organized" (261).
Thus, academic discourse is endowed with the power to bring the "na-
tive intelligence" or the "constant and deep urge" in all language learn-
ers to a higher and more self-conscious level.

This type of depiction suggests that learning academic discourse is
not a violation but a cultivation of what Basic Writers or "people of all
cultures and ages" have in and of themselves. Shaughnessy thus sug-
gests basic writers are being asked to learn academic discourse because
of its distinctive ability to utilize a "human" resource. Hence, her peda-
gogy provides the need to learn academic discourse with a "human,"
and hence with yet another seemingly politically innocent, justification.
It teaches students to see discursive decisions made from the point of
view of academic culture as "human" and therefore "innocent" deci-
sions made absolutely free from the pressures of specific social and his-
torical circumstances. If it is the student's concern to align himself with
minority economic and ethnic groups in the very act of learning aca-
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demic discourse, the politics of "linguistic" innocence can only pacify
rather than activate such a concern.

Shaughnessy's desire to propose a pedagogy which will inculcate
respect for discursive diversity and freedom of discursive choice articu-
lates her dissatisfaction with and reaction to the unequal social power
and prestige of diverse discourses in current-day America. It also dem-
onstrates her belief that education can and should attempt to change
these prevailing unequal conditions. However, the essentialist view of
language which underlies her pedagogy seems also to have led her to
believe that a vision of language which insists on the equality and
nonsubstitutive nature of linguistic variety, and an ideal writing class-
room which promotes such a view, can stand in pure opposition to soci-
ety, adjusting existing social inequality and the human costs of such in-
equality from somewhere "outside" the sociohistorical space which it is
trying to transform. As a result, her pedagogy enacts a systematic de-
nial of the political context of students' linguistic decisions.

The need to critique the essentialist view of language and the poli-
tics of linguistic innocence it promotes is urgent when viewed in the
context of the popular success of E. D. Hirsch Jr.'s proposals for educa-
tional "reforms." Hirsch argues for the "validity" of his "vocabulary"
by claiming its political neutrality. Hirsch argues that "it is used to sup-
port all conflicting values that arise in public discourse" and "to com-
municate any point of view effectively" or "in whatever direction one
wishes to be effective" (Cultural Literacy 23, 102, 103; my emphasis).
Hirsch thus implies that the "vocabulary" one uses is separate from one's
"values," "point of view," or "direction." Like Shaughnessy, he assumes
an essence in the individuala body of values, points of view, a sense
of directionwhich exists prior to the act of "communication" and out-
side of the "means of communication" (Cultural Literacy 23).

Like Shaughnessy, Hirsch also argues for the need for everyone to learn
the "literate" language by presenting it as existing "beyond the narrow
spheres of family, neighborhood, and region" (Cultural Literacy 21). Fur-
thermore, he assumes that there can be only one cause of one's failure to
gain "literacy": one's unfamiliarity with "the background information
and the linguistic conventions that are needed to read, write, speak ef-
fectively" in America (Cultural Literacy 22, "Primal Scene" 31). Thus,
Hirsch also denies the students' need to deal with cultural differences
and to negotiate the competing claims of multiple ways of using lan-
guage when writing. He thereby both simplifies and depoliticizes the
challenges facing the student writer.

Hirsch self-consciously invokes a continuity between Shaughnessy's
pedagogy and his "educational reforms" ("Culture and Literacy" 27;
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Cultural Literacy 10). He legitimizes his New Right rhetoric by remind-
ing us that Shaughnessy had approved of his work. For those of us con-
cerned with examining writing in relation to the politics of gender, race,
nationality, and class, the best way to forestall Hirsch's use of
Shaughnessy is to point out that the continuity resides only in the essen-
tialist view of language underlying both pedagogies and the politics of
linguistic innocence it promotes. Critiquing the essentialist view of lan-
guage and the politics of linguistic innocence in Shaughnessy's work
contributes to existing criticism of Hirsch's New Right rhetoric (see
Armstrong; Bizzell, "Arguing"; Moglen; Scholes; Sledd and Sledd). It
makes clear that if, as Hirsch self-consciously maintains, there is a conti-
nuity between Shaughnessy's work and Hirsch's ("Culture and Literacy"
27; Cultural Literacy 10), the continuity resides only in the most limiting
aspect of Shaughnessy's pedagogy. Recognition of some of the limita-
tions of Shaughnessy's pedagogy can also be politically constructive for
the field of composition by helping us appreciate Shaughnessy's legacy.
Most of the lessons she taught us in Errors and Expectations, such as stu-
dents' "quasi-foreign relationship" with academic discourse, their lack
of confidence as learners and writers, their desire to participate in aca-
demic work, and their intelligence and language-learning aptitudes,
continue to be central to the teaching of basic writing. The tasks she
delineates for us remain urgent for those of us concerned with the poli-
tics of the teaching of writing. Recognizing the negative effects that an
essentialist view of language has on Shaughnessy's own efforts to ex-
ecute these tasks can only help us identify issues that need to be ad-
dressed if we are to carry on her legacy: a fuller recognition of the social
dimensions of students' linguistic decisions.
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5 Mapping Errors and Expectations
for Basic Writing: From the
"Frontier Field" to "Border
Country"

Bruce Homer

Through Errors and Expectations and the founding, in 1975, of the Journal
of Basic Writing, Mina Shaughnessy is largely credited with establishing
both the field and the term "basic writing" (Gray, Troyka). Yet
Shaughnessy ends Errors and Expectations by warning that the errors and
expectations to which she refers are teacher errors and expectations, clos-
ing her study with the hope that "our enterprising new students will
somehow weather our deficiencies and transcend our yet cautious ex-
pectations of what they can accomplish in college" (294). Describing the
field of basic writing as a "frontier, unmapped, except for a scattering of
impressionistic articles and a few blazed trails," she likens Errors and
Expectations to a "frontier map" "certain to have the shortcomings of
other frontier maps, with doubtless a few rivers in the wrong place and
some trails that end nowhere" (4).

Much of the subsequent discourse in the field of basic writing can be
located on the "maps" provided by Shaughnessy and some of her col-
leagues at CUNY These maps identify basic writers in terms drawn from
theories of cognitive development and from theories of discourse and
second language acquisition. But such maps tend to place BW students
at particular stages of cognitive development or language acquisition in
ways that, unfortunately, continue what Susan Miller has observed as
composition's tendency to treat students as "emerging, or as failed, but
never as actually responsible 'authors,' . . . as only tentative participants
in consequential learning about writing" (196). In such models, as David
Bartholomae has recently complained, basic writing risks becoming "a
reiteration of the liberal project of the late 60s early 70s, where in the
name of sympathy and empowerment, we have once again produced
the 'other ' who is the incomplete version of ourselves, confirming exist-
ing patterns of power and authority, reproducing the hierarchies we had
meant to question and overthrow" ("Tidy House" 18).

The growing field of basic writing in this way recapitulates the his-
tory of writing instruction given students of all ages, who have been
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similarly identified as always "emerging" and/or "other" by their place-
ment at a particular stage of cognitive development and literacy acqui-
sition. However, recent work by teachers and researchers of the writing
of "established" writers, college students, high school students, and even
children offers an alternative model for locating students and their writ-
ing. For example, Harste et al., working with young children, call into
question the validity of notions of "developmental stages," "readiness"
and "emergent reading" for understanding how children learn to read
and write, finding that "one must approach all children as if they know
quite a bit about reading and writing" in order to "build upon the knowl-
edge they have already acquired about literacy" (44). Boomer et al., ar-
guing for educational programs that involve both teachers and students
in negotiating curricula, ask that we recognize children (K-12) "as deci-
sion makers, intenders, owners of their own ideas, willing partners with
their teachers in the active pursuit of their own learning" (15).

Such work, loosely categorized as the study of "border" writing and
"border" pedagogy for its attention to the negotiation of power and iden-
tities in writing and teaching, offers a way to resolve the conceptual and
ethical dilemmas on the horns of which basic writing teachers have found
themselves caught. For such work suggests a redefinition of the situa-
tion faced by basic writers as the situation of any writer. "Literacy," Harste
et al. argue, "is [for us as for the young] neither a monolithic skill nor a
now-you-have-it/now-you-don't' affair" (69). By adopting this view, we
can see the phenomenon of "basic writing" as a representative instance
of the history, theory, and practice of literacy instruction generally.

In this essay, I first trace the surfacing of the dilemmas posed by ear-
lier conceptions of basic writing and then examine how "border"
conceptualizations of basic writing respond to those dilemmas. To illus-
trate the differences between earlier and more recent conceptualizations,
I discuss theoretical and pedagogical approaches to written "error" cor-
responding to each. I argue that redefining the "territory of basic writ-
ing" as "border" territory and writing as negotiation, while introducing
new difficulties for teachers and students, effectively resolves the di-
lemmas posed by earlier conceptions of basic writing by identifying both
students and teachers as active participants in negotiations of power
and thus improving the expectations of both for the work they face in
confronting one another.

Shaughnessy has urged two sets of terms to account for the writing
difficulties of her students. In an oft-quoted passage from the Introduc-
tion to Errors and Expectations, Shaughnessy states that "BW students
write the way they do, not because they are slow or non-verbal, indiffer-
ent to or incapable of academic excellence, but because they are begin-
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ners and must, like all beginners, learn by making mistakes" (5, my em-
phasis). Consistent with her use of geographic metaphors to describe
basic writing as a "frontier," however, she also describes BW students as
foreigners, "true outsiders," "students whose difficulties with the writ-
ten language seemed of a different order from those of the other groups
[of students admitted to CUNY], as if they had come, you might say,
from a different country," "strangers in academia" (2, 3). In such a view,
the task confronting basic writers is to "move across the territory of lan-
guage" (10) presumably through the uncharted territory of basic writ-
ing and in the direction of the land and language of the academy.

In the last half dozen years, compositionists have identified signifi-
cant problems with conceiving of BW students, and those deemed illit-
erate generally, as either "beginners" or "true outsiders." Nonetheless,
it is important to recognize the real advantages accruing from such con-
ceptions. Most important, they allow us to see both the intelligence and
educability of BW students (Lyons, "Mina Shaugnessy"). Viewing the
writing of BW students as akin to either beginners or foreigners encour-
ages, first, an acknowledgment of the students' educability or "linguis-
tic aptitude"; second, a far more tolerant attitude toward students' er-
rors (though not a dismissal of the importance of errors); and third, a
model for discovering patterns in those errors, or the "logic" of the stu-
dents' errors, and for addressing them (Lyons, "Mina Shaughnessy and
the Teaching of Writing"). Just as foreign speakers and beginners make
characteristic mistakes and go through characteristic stages in the pro-
cess of learning an unfamiliar language, so BW students can be under-
stood to make characteristic errors and to go through characteristic stages
in the process of improving their writing. In short, both conceptions of
BW students present the students and their writing as not fixed but in
process. As Shaughnessy, describing "the view a teacher is more likely to
have toward a foreign student learning English," explains,

[The student's] errors reflect upon his linguistic situation, not upon
his educability; he is granted by his teacher the capability of master-
ing English but is expected in the course of doing so to make errors
in English; and certain errors, characteristic errors for natives of his
language who are acquiring English as a second language, are tol-
erated far into and even beyond the period of formal instruction
simply because they must be rubbed off by time. (Errors 121)

Much of the research on basic writers since 1975 represents attempts
to understand them in at least one of these ways. Those viewing basic
writers chiefly as beginners have looked especially to theories of cogni-
tive development to explain such students' difficulties (Berg and
Coleman; Elifson and Stone; Goldberg; Hays, "Development"; Kroll;
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Lunsford, "Cognitive"; Tremblay). Basic writers, such research suggests,
are somehow stuck at a lower level of cognitive development, unable to
engage at a "formal-operational" level of thought (Berg and Coleman;
Lunsford, "Cognitive"), or occupy a lower position on William Perry's
scheme of intellectual and ethical development (Hays, "Socio-cognitive
Development"; see Bizzell, "William Perry"; Slattery). Those viewing
basic writers primarily as "foreign" or "outsiders" have looked espe-
cially to ethnographic studies, second-language acquisition, and dis-
course theory (Bartholomae, "Inventing"; Bizzell, "What Happens";
Kogen; Martinez and Martinez, "Who Is Alien"; Trimbur, "Beyond Cog-
nition"). The problems of basic writers, these scholars have argued (of-
ten in response to studies drawing on theories of cognitive develop-
ment), are signs not of cognitive immaturity; rather, they signal a differ-
ence in "world view" (Bizzell, "What Happens"), "values" (Martinez
and Martinez, "Who Is Alien") or a lack of familiarity with certain dis-
course conventions. As Bartholomae has put it,

Basic writers are beginning writers, to be sure, but they are not writ-
ers who need to learn to use language. They are writers who need
to learn to command a particular variety of languagethe language
of a written, academic discourseand a particular variety of lan-
guage usewriting itself. . . . [Basic writing] is not evidence of ar-
rested cognitive development. ("Study of Error" 254)

Joseph Harris has observed that in keeping with these two ways of view-
ing basic writers there have developed two different sets of metaphors
for thinking about changes in the students' writing and the role of basic
writing teachers: metaphors of "growth" and of "initiation." If we think
of BW students as cognitively immature beginners, then "improvements"
in their writing are signs of cognitive growth, with BW teachers fostering
such growth. If we think of BW students as foreigners, then changes in
their writing represent changes in their social or cultural identities initi-
ated at least in part by writing courses ("Three Metaphors").

But both of these metaphors have been found to be problematic. Imag-
ining students as cognitively immature denies the obvious facts of their
status as adults (cf. Shaughnessy, Errors). Further, as Mike Rose has ar-
gued, identifying BW students in this way has functioned largely to ex-
clude them and BW programs from the university ("Language"). Fos-
tering cognitive maturity sounds like an unimpeachable, even commend-
able vocation, but not one appropriate for college. Finally, such a view,
as Rose and others have argued, ignores the rich complexity and par-
ticularity of both cognition and writing (Rose, "Narrowing"; Berthoff;
Bizzell, "Cognition," "William Perry"; Haswell; Kogen; Martinez and
Martinez, "Reconsidering").
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On the other hand, if learning to write is not a matter of becoming
cognitively mature but of changing one's social and cultural identity,
initiating such change seems liable to charges of cultural imperialism,
converting the "natives" to our native ways by teaching them the rituals
and gestures of academic discourse. Such conversions are difficult to
justify ethically. Justifications that have been offered, such as Thomas
Farrell's argument that "literacy," including the acquisition of the forms
of Standard English, enables critical consciousness or a mode of thought
necessary to Western culture, tend to fall back on "foundationalist" con-
ceptions of literacy which the "social" view rejects (Bizzell,
"Foundationalism"). In such foundationalist conceptions, literacy either
as a medium or a practice is reified and idealized into the equivalent of
what, in the nineteenth century, the West came to know as "art." Cul-
tural critic Raymond Williams has described this nineteenth-century
development as one in which "two processesthe idealization of art
and the reification of the mediumwere connected. . . . Art was ideal-
ized to distinguish it from 'mechanical' work" (Marxism 160). In this
process, Williams explains,

The properties of 'the medium' were abstracted as if they defined
the practice, rather than being its means. This interpretation then
suppressed the full sense of practice, which has always to be de-
fined as work on a material for a specific purpose within certain
necessary social conditions. (Marxism 159-60)

Claims that literacy yields significant cognitive rewards apply to "lit-
eracy" a similar abstraction of the written medium and thus suppress
the full sense of literacy as a practice.

But those rejecting justifications based on such reifications of writing
still face an ethical dilemma. Bizzell, perhaps foremost among
compositionists confronting this dilemma, explains,

an anti-foundationalist understanding of discourse would see the
student's way of thinking and interacting with the world, the
student's very self, as fundamentally altered by participation in any
new discourse. These will not be changes the student can erase at
will. Also, the ability to participate in a new discourse will change
the student's relationship with other discoursesparticularly in the
case of academic discourse. Because academic discourse is identi-
fied with social power, to show familiarity with it can mean being
completely alienated from some other, socially disenfranchised dis-
courses. Thus the student's new ability to participate in academic
discourse will condition his or her opportunities to participate in
other discourses, and make some life paths more attractive than oth-
ers. ("Foundationalism" 43 14)

However, teachers rejecting a reified, "foundationalist" view of literacy
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simultaneously deny themselves any foundation, or authority, for ad-
vocating or initiating such changes. As Bizzell puts it in a later essay,
"We [teachers] exercise authority over [students] in asking them to give
up their foundational beliefs, but we give them nothing to put in the
place of these foundational beliefs because we deny the validity of all
authority, including, presumably, our own" ("Beyond" 670).

As noted above, there are serious problems associated with viewing
basic writers as "beginners"; such a view belies the evident maturity of
BW students and the very complexity of their writing. But if it doesn't
make sense to think of these students as beginners, it is becoming in-
creasingly clear that it makes equally little sense to think of many of
them as "foreign." And just as "cognitivist" approaches to understand-
ing basic writing risk being exclusionary, so there are exclusionary im-
plications in identifying native basic writers as "foreign." Writers adopt-
ing such identifications have sidestepped those implications by treating
the contradiction of describing native students as "foreign" not as
oxymoronic (i.e., "pointedly foolish" [OED]), but as a paradox ("a state-
ment or tenet contrary to received opinion or belief, often with the im-
plication that it is marvelous or incredible" [OEM a marvel to be won-
dered at but not challenged or questioned. We can see this treatment
obtaining when Shaughnessy states that basic writers seem to have "come
from a different country" or states of them, "Natives, for the most part,
of New York, graduates of the same public school system as the other
students, they were nonetheless strangers in academia" (Errors 2-3).

Such a treatment of the situation of basic writers as paradoxical recurs
in the more general debate on America's "literacy crisis"at least, para-
doxically, in the language of conservatives. Former Secretary of Educa-
tion William Bennett warns that if students are not given access to the
Western high cultural tradition, "they will become aliens in their own
culture, strangers in their own land" (29-30). E. D. Hirsch Jr. laments
that currently, though

[young people] share a tremendous amount of knowledge among
themselves, much of it learned in school, ... from the standpoint of
their literacy and their ability to communicate with others in our
culture, what they know is ephemeral and narrowly confined to
their own generation. Many young people strikingly lack the infor-
mation that writers of American books and newspapers have tradi-
tionally taken for granted among their readers from all generations.
(Cultural Literacy 7)

These authors, in eerie echoes of Shaughnessy and Bizzell, thus warn
of the prospect of a curious phenomenon: natives who nonetheless be-
long to another country, members of a culture and a community who
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are yet nonmembers, knowledgeable youth incapable of communica-
tion, "aliens in their own culture, strangers in their own land." Such
descriptions give a peculiar cast to Shaughnessy's likening of the "terri-
tory of basic writing" to a "frontier." Robert Lyons argues that
Shaughnessy "uses this image . . . with great precision," explaining:

The frontier is the place where everyone is a stranger, and where
nobody is fully at home or settled in. In this new territory, everyone
has to get his bearings, students and teachers alike, and everyone
has to make adjustments in his habitual modes of thinking and act-
ing. The frontier calls on everybody's resourcefulness and ingenu-
ity in adapting his particular kind of knowledge to new situations.
It also calls for a special openness and trustin a difficult and
sparsely populated land, people must cooperate for survival. And
the frontier is finally a place where the future is necessarily more
important than the past. ("Mina Shaughnessy and the Teaching of
Writing" 11)

But this vision of basic writing as frontier ignores the prior, ongoing
inhabitance of the "frontier" territory by a variety of "others," inhabit-
ants from whose perspective the territory is not "frontier" but "home."
Of course, the descriptions of basic writers cited above positing clear
distinctions between those who belong and those who don't, the skilled
and the unskilled, do recognize the presence of "others." Both visions,
however, displace those "others" in a rehearsal of the American "fron-
tier" experience and common representations of that experience. As
Pierre Bourdieu observes of frontiers generally, "The frontier . . . pro-
duces cultural difference as much as it is produced by it" (Language 222).
In the history of the American "frontier," not everyone was a stranger,
but the strangers, with considerable firepower, on encountering native
inhabitants of the territory, decided the natives were the strangers, "true
outsiders," "outlandish," or "foreign." These they tried to convert when
they weren't trying to eliminate them from the territory altogether. Sub-
sequent mapping of the territory involved not only the delineation of
rivers and paths but also the identification of what territory belonged to
whom, with only tiny pockets of land allotted or "reserved for" the origi-
nal inhabitants, if indeed their presence and need for any territory was
acknowledged at all.

I recall the American frontier experience not in order to equate the
teaching of basic writing with cultural genocide but to demonstrate that
viewing students as "foreign" has led us to think about teaching in terms
of conversion or deracination. The dilemma is both ethical and concep-
tual, arising from problematic identifications of both students and teach-
ers which must be abandoned if the dilemma is to be resolved. It is fool-
ish, finally, to identify native students as strangers and for those of us
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teaching basic writing to identify ourselves as "natives"whether of
the academic discourse community, the land of Standard English, or even
the Land of Literacy, and it is dangerous to deny the operation of power
(while enacting it) through denying the specificities of history and cir-
cumstance. As descriptors of language practice, such identifications are
counterproductive, for they encourage a reified sense of students and
teachers and their languages and "discourse communities" while mask-
ing power relations among those groups (Harris, "The Idea"; Homer,
"Rethinking" 185-88; Pratt, "Linguistic"). Just as conservatives like
Bennett and Hirsch can be attacked for positing and attempting to im-
pose a particular, narrow, reified view of American culture as represen-
tative of all American culture, so theoretical discussions sometimes
present particularized, narrow, but most important, reified views of the
discourse of academic writing as representative of the literacy to be given
to students viewed as "other" by teachers imagined as "having" "lit-
eracy." The actual frontier of basic writing, and in particular the actual
writing of BW students, calls this view into question. As Bartholomae
has more recently observed,

[Basic writers] are not the only ones who make mistakes and who
present their work in ways that are inappropriate for a university.
Mainstream freshmen, senior English majors, graduate students, our
colleagues may all produce work that is naive, wrong, or off the
track. The issue, then, is not who misses the mark but whose misses
matter and why. To say this is to return attention to institutional
processes of selection and exclusion. . . . The work of basic writers
calls into question our assumptions about orderly presentation, stan-
dards of copy editing, and the stability of conventional habits of
thinking. This is not to say that order, correctness, and convention
should not be goals of a literate education. It is to say, however, that
the borderlines between our work and theirs are not as clear as we
like to assume. ("Writing" 68-69)

Basic writing threatens our sense of our identity (as represented in our
written work), our possession of particular linguistic territory (and I am
uncomfortable invoking the first person plural here). This sense of threat
is all too similar to that sense of threat implicit in conservative appeals
to preserve a reified cultural legacy posited as the American culture, the
tradition. Conservative rhetoric implicitly responds to the threatening
sense that the culture they have posited is a pure construct in conflict
with other possible constructions of that culture. The pronouns, as usual,
are telling. For example, Hirsch argues that it is only through "shared
information" that "we learn to communicate effectively with one another
in our national community" (Cultural Literacy xvii; my emphases). But
he complains early in his book that he can no longer communicate via
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allusions to Shakespeare, as his father once did, because he can no longer
assume that others would recognize or understand such allusions (9-
10). He admits that youth share other knowledge among themselves
which he, evidently, does not know but presumably could learn. The
problem for Hirsch, it seems, is thus not simply that he cannot commu-
nicate with them, but that their knowledge threatens to displace the le-
gitimacy, even the communicative power, of his own. "They" have a
shared community, and it is not "ours."

Correspondingly, the written language of basic writers threatens, or
seems to threaten, to displace the language that teachers would have
them use. "Their" conventions for writing are not "ours." Thus those of
us teaching basic writing are caught between the horns of an ethical
dilemma: if we "convert" students to "our" conventions, we are liable
to charges of cultural genocide; on the other hand, ignoring differences
between their conventions and those of Edited American English
amounts to abandonment (cf. Philip 18-19; Delpit 291-97).

One resolution to this dilemma is represented in recent revaluations
of "borderlands," "margins," and "negotiation" as terms to describe the
writing, and responding to the writing, of young children (Harste et al.
27-79), high school students (Robinson and Stock), the full range of K-
12 students (Boomer et al., Delpit), and professional writers (Hicks; hooks,
"marginality"), as well as beginning college students (Bartholomae,
"Writing," "The Tidy House"; Harris, "The Idea," "Three Metaphors";
Hill; Homer, "Rethinking"; McQuade; Rose, Lives; Sommers; cf. Giroux,
Border Crossings 28-36). This resolution might be thought of as recuper-
ating Lyons's utopian account of the "frontier" of basic writing cited
above. What renders the "frontier" image utopian is the absence of any
sense of power relations among the participants, the absence of any sense
of their individual or collective histories, and its assumption of shared
ideals for the future. All are equal and equally strangers (the territory
belongs to no one as of yet), all must make adjustments, everyone must
contribute, trust is essential, everyone looks to the future rather than
brooding on the past. These render the account vulnerable to ridicule,
whether as a representation of basic writing or indeed the teaching of
any writing at any level, or as an account of the American frontier expe-
rience. Redefining that "frontier" as "borderland" and the cooperative
efforts of "frontier settlers" as negotiations between border residents
injects a healthy sense of power relations into the picture and refutes
both the idea of the writer as autonomous individual and the notion of
writers operating from a location indisputably at the center of organi-
cally unified discursive communities with shared goals, suggesting in-
stead a conception of writing as the ongoing re-negotiation of positions
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in response to inevitable histories of conflict and contradiction, and a
conception of the field of teaching writing as essentially a site of contes-
tation.

Injecting such a sense of power relations into Lyons's depiction and
questioning the particular future to be worked toward need not entirely
eliminate it as an ideal. What is attractive in Lyons's depiction is its sense
of give-and-take and of unpredictable change"everyone has to get his
bearings, students and teachers alike, and everyone has to make adjust-
ments." In this phrase Lyons imagines a process of negotiation among
the parties as to what will be offered and what will be accepted, the
changes that each is willing to make and those which are rejected, a
welcome lack of determination about the direction to which those
changes will lead, and a sense that no oneneither students nor teach-
ersis comfortably "at home" or "native." By imagining the process in
terms akin to negotiation, Lyons comes close to resolving the dilemma
of requiring conversion or abandonment. For negotiation acknowledges
conflict and power as integral components of the dynamics of change
while positioning all parties as agentsallowing in education for what
Boomer et al, describe as "ownership" of learning (15-16). In negotia-
tion, the parties involved are interdependent on one another and on the
outcome of the negotiation. In negotiating, both parties engage in a dy-
namic exchange of power in which both are changed in ways neither
can predict beforehand (Gulliver xvii, 81). Through a process of explo-
ration, revision, and learning, both parties reposition themselves in re-
lation to each other and to their prior understandings of themselves and
the issues negotiated (cf. Boomer 8).

Nor need the operation of power among parties of unequal status
somehow falsify negotiations or predetermine their outcomes, as is some-
times imagined. As social theorist Anthony Giddens reminds us, "Power
relations . . . are always two-way, even if the power of one actor or party
in a social relation is minimal compared to another. Power relations are
relations of autonomy and dependence, but even the most autonomous
agent is in some degree dependent, and the most dependent actor or
party in a relationship retains some autonomy" (93). That teachers in
some ways wield more power than students thus does not mean that
students lack power or autonomy (rendering them automatons). As the
inability of teachers to predict the outcomes of their encounters with
students illustrates, those encounters are engagements in negotiation,
negotiations in which power operates in both directions in ways that
can change both students and teachers.

Viewing basic writing as border country and the teaching of basic
writing as negotiation is thus attractive for several reasons. First, unlike
the cognitivist view, it acknowledges the position of students as agents
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in relations of power. Rather than being seen as so many hungry, natu-
rally deplorable vacuumsbeginners bringing with them little but the
potential to learnstudents are recognized as capable of and interested
in exploring options and exercising choices in their work and requiring
respect for their maturity and responsibility as adults. Second, this view
makes explicit the historically and politically marginal, "border" status
of basic writing courses, students, and teachers in relation to activities
deemed more "central" while adopting a perspective that inverts that
status, in effect redefining "border" as "leading edge." By adopting such
a perspective on "marginality," as Jay Robinson and Patricia Stock ex-
plain, "the spatial location margin may be recognized for what it isa
generative site for making meaning, a generative site for building knowl-
edge with the potential to benefit all of us wherever we reside" (273).
Third, establishing the territory of basic writing as border country ac-
knowledges more fully the fluidity of identities which basic writing stu-
dents, teachers, and courses may occupy at any given moment. Henry
Giroux describes "border pedagogy" as enabling students "to rewrite
their own histories, identities, and learning possibilities" and as posi-
tioning teachers "as intellectuals whose own narratives must be situ-
ated and examined as discourses that are open, partial and subject to
ongoing debate and revision" (Border Crossings 30, 35). Redefining basic
writing as border country establishes both teachers and students as
strangers to one another who nonetheless agree to meet to engage in
what Ira Shor has described as "mutual re-creations" (Critical Teaching
xxvii) in which students and teachers continually contest one another 's
positions and authority in ever-shifting relations of power. This view
thus eliminates the ethical dilemma teachers have posed for themselves
of whether or not to "convert" students by acknowledging students'
own responsibility and choice in seeking change and the indeterminate
nature of the changes to which any basic writing course might lead ei-
ther students or teachers.

Finally, such a conception of basic writing corresponds closely to re-
cent accounts of writing which stress the operation of conflict and power
in the production of writing. Indeed, some writers have attested that it
is only under such "border" conditions, fraught with conflict, that writ-
ing is possible. Gloria Anzaldiia, writing of both geopolitical and psy-
chic borders, describes borders as

set up to define the places that are safe and unsafe, to distinguish us
from them. A border is a dividing line, a narrow strip along a steep
edge. A borderland is a vague and undetermined place created by
the emotional residue of an unnatural boundary. It is in a constant
state of transition. The prohibited and forbidden are its inhabitants.
(3)
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Yet she argues that it is these very conditions that make her writing pos-
sible. As she explains,

Writing produces anxiety. Looking inside myself and my experi-
ence, looking at my conflicts, engenders anxiety in me. Being a writer
feels very much like being a Chicana, or being queer. . . .

Living in a state of psychic unrest, in a Borderland, is what makes
poets write and artists create. (72, 73)

bell hooks, acknowledging that marginality is commonly identified as a
"site of deprivation," argues from her own experience as a writer that it
also be recognized as a "site one stays in, clings to even, because it nour-
ishes one's capacity to resist. It offers the possibility of radical perspec-
tives from which to see and create, to imagine alternatives, new worlds"
("marginality" 342,341). Min-Zhan Lu, drawing on her own experience
of conflict between the discourses of Mao Tse-tung's Marxism and West-
ern humanism in her education in the People's Republic of China, rec-
ommends treating the writing classroom as a borderland in which stu-
dents learn to negotiate and draw on such conflicts in their writing.
Neither her parents nor her school teachers recognized the value of such
experiences of conflict. Instead, home and school each insisted on main-
taining its borders: "each contrived a purified space where only one dis-
course was spoken and heard.... [and] jealously silenced any voice that
threatened to break the unison of the scene" ("From Silence" 445). As a
result, she explains, "I was unable to acknowledge, grasp, or grapple
with what I was experiencing, for both my parents and my teachers had
suggested that, if I were a good student, such interference [between dis-
courses] would and should not take place" (443). Nonetheless, she claims
that "in spite of the frustration and confusion I experienced growing up
caught between two conflicting worlds, the conflict ultimately helped
me to grow as a reader and writer. Constantly having to switch back
and forth between the discourse of home and that of school made me
sensitive and self-conscious about the struggle I experienced every time
I tried to read, write, or think in either discourse" (437-38). Consequently,
Lu argues that rather than maintaining borders between discourses, we
need to encourage students to explore ways of negotiating the conflict-
ing discourses of home and school in their writing (447). Marlene
Nourbese Philip similarly argues for Caribbean writers that they write
in the contested space between the language varieties of demotic and
Standard English. For Philip, "The excitement . . . as a writer comes in
the confrontation between the formal and the demotic within the text
itself" (18). "To say that the experience [of the Caribbean] can only be
expressed in standard English (if there is any such thing) or only in the
Caribbean demotic . . . is, in fact, to limit the experience. . . . It is in the
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continuum of expression from standard to Caribbean English that the
veracity of the experience lies" (18). "It is not sufficient," she argues, "to
write only in dialect, for too often that remains a parallel and closed
experience, although a part of the same language. Neither is it sufficient
to write only in what we have come to call standard English. The lan-
guage as we know it has to be dislocated and acted uponeven de-
stroyedso that it begins to serve our purposes" (18-19).

The images these writers present of the scene and dynamics of writ-
ing correspond closely to the actual situation and experience of class
meetings for basic writing courses, meetings in which strangersboth
teachers and studentshowever warily, approach one another, learn and
change from their encounters with one another, and learn and change
the language in working with it. To demonstrate both the value of such
images for teachers of basic writing and some of the problems which
they present, I want to look at the implications which viewing the "ter-
ritory" of basic writing as a borderland and the teaching of writing as
negotiation has for the most high-profile issue in the teaching of basic
writing, error (cf. Homer, "Rethinking"; Hull, "Research"). Those writ-
ing on error have taken approaches aligned with the different views of
basic writers described above. Those influenced by theories of cognitive
development have used basic writers' apparent inability to "see" their
errors or correct them as further evidence of students' cognitive imma-
turity. In response, such teachers have devised exercises to develop cog-
nitive and perceptual skills in students (Goldberg, Gorrell). Patricia
Laurence, arguing from Piaget that "perception interferes with cogni-
tion and cognition interferes in perception," has argued that BW stu-
dents' inability to recognize and correct their errors indicates that their
"perception remains in the preliminary centered stage" ("Error's" 30, 32).
In this stage, "A student sees a word or object in one way, his way, and
visual and cognitive exploration is unfocused and unsystematic. This
student may perceive letters and parts of words, but recognition will
not itself result in meaningful interpretation. . . . perceptions are not
analytic" (31). To encourage "de-centration, the ability to see words in
new ways," she has recommended exercises in which students circle
different examples of different grammatical constructions (35-37).

Other researchers, rejecting the notion that students suffer from cog-
nitive immaturity, argue instead that basic writers' errors are compa-
rable to the errors of anyone learning a second language. Researchers
have used the technique of error analysis, borrowed from the field of
second-language acquisition, to argue that BW students' errors are indi-
cations of their attempt to approximate written discourse (Bartholomae,
"Study"; Kroll and Schafer; Schwalm; Shaughnessy, Errors; Tricomi). The
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advantage of this approach, Barry Kroll and John Schafer explain, is that
"instead of viewing errors as pathologies to be eradicated or diseases to
be healed, the error-analyst views errors as necessary stages in all lan-
guage-learning, as the product of intelligent cognitive strategies and
therefore as potentially useful indicators of what processes the student
is using" (209). And other scholars have convincingly argued that we
see the problems of basic writers in terms of different interpretive com-
munities. Elaine Lees, for example, has argued that "errors" are socially
constructed by the interpretive community of proofreaders ("Proofread-
ing"). In this view, the problem for BW students is one of not yet belong-
ing to that interpretive community, with its ways of seeing which allow
members to construct and eliminate errors. In both these views, basic
writers are granted a degree of respect as cognitively mature adults.
Their problems are re-imagined as comparable to the problems of social
outsidersforeigners learning a new language, or pledges seeking ini-
tiation into a different interpretive community.

These latter views, however, confront the ethical dilemma of requir-
ing native speakers of English to use the conventions of Edited Ameri-
can English to represent their own language. Lees has observed that one
of the reasons basic writers have so much trouble with error is that "Nil
learning to identify a familiar form as an error . . . a learner not only
moves into an interpretive community but moves out of one as well. . . .

To make such a move at all, it appears the learner must give up a sys-
tem, a set of assumptions, a way of proceeding: one that already works,
or seems to" ("Proofreading" 226-27). Persuading such writers to make
such sacrifices is hard work. Those attempting to justify the teaching of
EAE to such students have alternatively argued the status of EAE as a
separate, politically neutral languagethe English "grapholect"or
argued for the acceptance of the dominance of EAE as an historical fait
accompli (Epes, Eskey). Shaughnessy, for example, argues that "mas-
tery of formal written English [is] the language of public transactions
educational, civic, and professional," "a claim upon a wider culture"
(Errors 125, 126). But like those who reify the medium of "literacy," or
American culture, this reifies the "language of public transaction" as a
static entity to which students must needs submit: "the language of pub-
lic transactions" (Lu, "Redefining").

Sarah D'Eloia, alternatively, defends teaching EAE not in terms of
maintaining the status quo but in terms of the lives of individual stu-
dents within it:

If one is persuaded that the business of the English teacher is more
properly teaching a radical critique of our present social order rather
than equipping students with the language skills necessary to cope
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successfully in it, there is, indeed, little point to teaching standard
English. However, to pursue the former course of action as the more
moral, one must assume that our social order is changing so rapidly
that our students can safely ignore social dialect and class as well as
racial discrimination and, more importantly, that they can safely
ignore the demand for skills of a technological society. We do not
believe either can safely be ignored. In the absence of this safety,
two facts remain: It will be important that middle class Americans
learn to tolerate a broader spectrum of linguistic diversity, at the
same time that upwardly aspiring minorities make linguistic
accomodations [sic] toward the standard, especially in writing. While
it is true that broad scale linguistic change is the product of social
change, it is equally true that linguistic change toward control of
the standard facilitates social mobility and social change for indi-
viduals. ("Teaching" 9)

D'Eloia might well be accused of sidestepping the political controversy
associated with issues of teaching EAE here, but such sidestepping is
understandable given the kinds of choices that seem to be available. Ei-
ther we abandon BW students to "their own" language conventions and
the consequences which currently follow upon use of those conventions,
or we accept the unjust dominance of EAE in order to enable "social
mobility and social change for individuals."

But again, this dilemma results from a series of reifications: the stu-
dent is imagined as belonging entirely to a particular language commu-
nity itself imagined as completely separate from the language commu-
nity and practices of academics or "literates," a community whose own
ways are imagined as fixed and with members assumed to be in uncon-
ditional possession of those ways. But if, as Bartholomae claims, "the
borderlines between our work and [the work of basic writers] are not as
clear as we like to assume," then the problem of basic writing becomes
not one of who belongs where, and the terms for granting possession of
a fixed territory or membership in a given community, but rather how
we and our students can negotiate in the border country to produce
different sorts of work at different times and thus, construct different
sorts of communities: what conventions or practices might be accepted,
by whom, and under what conditions, for a given writing. One BW stu-
dent, writing about the situation of a writer like himself, describes the
problem thus: "He tries different methods to find out which makes soci-
ety understand his work. He tries to reach this goal, so he can be on the
border line of what society wants and what he wants" (quoted in Lees,
"The Exceptable Way" 144). In response to such students, I don't think
we should attempt to identify "what society wants," handing him a map
of what we think goes where. Nor would I recommend offering such
students maps of multiple sets of fixed conventions, each with its ap-
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propriate place, as is sometimes suggested (Shaughnessy, Errors 121;
D'Eloia, "Teaching"; cf. Lu, "Redefining"; Pratt, "Linguistic"; Lees, "The
Exceptable Way"). As Lees has recently argued, both such responses re-
quire that we pretend to a certainty about conventions that the history
of writing and the research on reader responses to writing deny, and
both thus treat the writer as powerless in the face of such conventions
("The Exceptable Way" 151-52). Testimony to the effect of such treat-
ment is offered by the BW student quoted above, who, having outlined
a "trial and error" method for a writer to use to survive on the "border
lines," warns,

but if the trial and error does not work, and [the student] is in my
position of not knowing how to express himself my [sic] using the
exceptive method of the society, he would have pity for himself, he
would be up late at nights asking God for his help.... it would hurt
him so bad that he would just don't know what to do. While the
writer that is not stuck would have some freedom in the way he
wrote his works. (quoted in Lees, "The Exceptable Way" 144)

Though such testimony could be used to support pedagogies aiming
simply to teach "the exceptive method of the society," I would argue
that the real problem for this student is that he imagines that such a
method exists and that to progress on the road to writing freedom, he
must somehow acquire it. Lacking that method, he imagines himself as
powerless, pitiable, reduced to praying as a last resort. On the other
hand, note that he characterizes the "writer that is not stuck"the sort
of writer he would presumably want to becomenot as one in posses-
sion of such a method but as one with "some freedom in the way he
wrote his works." To convince this writer that he is not powerless, we
will have to also grant that he too has "some freedom" and respond to
his writing accordingly. Giddens warns that "Nil agent who does not
participate in the dialectic of control, in a minimal fashion, ceases to be
an agent" (149). As I have argued elsewhere, to prevent such an eventu-
ality in students requires that we encourage their participation in such a
dialectic, recognizing and getting them to recognize their potential as
agents in their writing ("Rethinking"). This does not mean we ignore
points of difference, problems we or other readers have with their writ-
ing. It means rather that both teachers and students need to focus on
such points of contact, the borders where different and shifting sets of
conventions conflict, and to practice negotiating those differences. This
means drawing attention, in class, to conflicting ways particular read-
ers have of responding to particular textual conventions, asking not just
what difference a particular writing practicesay, fragmented free modi-
fiers, or ways of citing another textcan make, but to whom, and when,
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and why it might make such differences (cf. Yelin; Harste et al. 27-29,

202-3; Delpit 293-96). We can make explicit the perspective we adopt in
"proofreading" papers and ask students to compare that perspective
with those which make less likely the "discovery" of errors. Rather than
responding to their texts in isolation, we can interview students about
why they have followed the particular notational practices they have,
and we can explain what of those practices bothers us and which de-
light us and the reasons for those responses.

Let me illustrate with an excerpt from a student's paper. In response
to an assignment, given about midterm, which asked students to dis-
cuss what Richard Rodriguez's Hunger of Memory suggested about edu-
cation, one student in an "intensive writing" class for begirming college
students wrote:

In "Complexion" Rodriguez writes, "I consider the great victoms of
racism to be those who are poor and forced to do menial labor"
(117). Through his life, Rodriguez comes to view those minorities
who are less fortunate as vicitms of racism. He goes on to say "He
was surprised to meet manual laborers with college diplomas" (133).
Rodriguez views education as a means of avoiding this labor asso-
ciated with racism. When I worked in construction this summer I
was also surprised to work with a laborer that had a college degree
from the University of Texas. He said that office jobs weren't what
he wanted to do, so he was a laborer. I didn't consider him poor or
underpriveleged, because he had made the choice to stay in a pro-
fession that he enjoyed instead of using his education to pursue a
job in which he could make more money. On the other hand, I also
worked with several guys that were high school dropouts that I
would consider poor, because they were working as laboroers not
by choice, but because their lack of education had limited their ca-
reer options.

The misspellings, awkward syntax, and unconventional use of quota-
tion marks might well lead us to view this writer as suffering from faulty
perception and cognition, or as an alien to the discourse of the academy.
His three spellings "victoms," "vicitms," and "laboroers" might persuade
us that he is unable to "de-center" his perception of his writing enough
to see the letters he has written (as might his silent alterations of
Rodriguez's original text in his first quotation). And so we might assign
him exercises to improve his skill at perceiving words and letters. His
confusion of direct and indirect quotations might persuade us that he is
a writer to whom, ironically, the conventions of writing are "foreign"
and to whom they must be taught. Or, to lump together these two per-
spectives, we might label the writer an outsider to the "interpretive com-
munity of proofreaders," to whose assumptions, values, goals and pro-
cedures he must be converted.
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I would deny neither that the writer in some ways faces just these
difficulties nor that the pedagogies suggested as remedies possess a cer-
tain utility for students facing such difficulties. However, I would object
to the way in which both approaches position teachers as powerless con-
duits of hegemony and the student as an essentially powerless object on
which that hegemony operates, a potential consumer of the products of
the culture of high literacy but, like an impoverished nation, with little
to contribute in return. We might better respond to this writer by ac-
knowledging to him at the outset the reading of the relationship be-
tween the concepts of labor, poverty, and education he has produced
and wants to offer. As Lees has recently argued, "The intriguing pros-
pect for a developing writer may be, in the end, the possibility that some-
one will listen, that someone will hear what he or she has to say. . . . to
seem someone worth listening to" ("The Exceptable Way" 161). And as
Robinson and Stock have argued concerning marginalized high school
students, "If we would be literate, and help others to become so, it is a
time for thoughtful listening to those voices that come from the mar-
gins; it is time for reflective reading of texts that inscribe those voices as
centrally human ones" (313, my emphasis). Such "thoughtful listening"
requires that we position this student as a writer engaged in an attempt
to make meaning. To do this would mean that we still attend to "errors"
but in terms not of "de-centration" or "conversion" but of the specific
forms of reading by particular readers. "Reflective reading" of his text
would have to include explaining what might confuse or bother par-
ticular readersmost clearly for me in this case, the use of quotation
marks to mark the citation to Rodriguez's statement about manual la-
borers with college educations. Without identifying his use of quotation
marks as violations of some absolute law, I could explain what those
marks signal to me and other readers like me and the confusion that
results for readers to whom such marks signal such meanings: who, af-
ter all, was surprised? Who is Rodriguez talking about if not himself?
Of course, in this instance, given the social and institutional status of
"my" reading, and given the student's desire to persuade readers like
me to appreciate his response to Rodriguez, he is likely to want to change
to "my" ways of notation and spelling in spite of the fact that his own
spellings and his marking of the second quotation clearly did not bother
or confuse him. What we should be wary of unwittingly encouraging
him to do, however, is to alter the reading he offers in obliging such
"academic" readers. More than once in asking individual students about
error-ridden passages, I have discovered how completely I have misin-
terpreted the student's meaning, and how my unconscious assumption
of the correctness of my own interpretation has stalled the interview.
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I have found it better, though less immediately efficient, to question the
student as to why he or she uses a particular notation or syntax and the
meaning he or she perceives from such notations and syntax (cf. Tricomi
64). This can often lead to explicit negotiations comparable to those be-
tween writers and editors: "Can I get you to see X if I do A or B?" And it
can lead to disagreements. My suggestions, however clever and well-
intentioned I believe them to be, are not always taken. Instead, they serve
as points of departure for exploring options and making decisions. In
any case, however, the student remains positioned as having some say
and some role to play other than that of apprentice or mimicsome
freedom. That this freedom is not absolute, is conditioned in part by the
shifting and powerful demands of others, does not render it empty but
dynamic. In reinforcing the students' sense of being in a position to ne-
gotiate, we enable them to see writing as a negotiating process of bar-
gaining as to what might count as what, to whom, for what purposes,
under what circumstances.

There are numerous difficulties in attempting thus to position stu-
dents and teachers. Perhaps most obviously, it directly contradicts com-
mon teacher-student relations in which teachers are granted, and are
expected to operate from, a position of absolute authority on their sub-
ject. As a consequence, students might well be tempted to dismiss such
non-absolute "positioning" as mere posturing (Boomer 7-10; cf. Delpit
286-91). Maintaining the distinction is both vital and an ongoing task.
Second, such positioning assumes the shifting identity of both teachers
and students, an assumption with which few teachers or students are
comfortable. Harris has remarked on the extraordinary persuasiveness
of appeals to membership in a particular community ("The Idea").
Pedagogies denying the validity of such appeals must compete with
pedagogies which make them; further, they must posit in place of such
appeals a fluid, shifting sense of identity which flies in the face of what
Harris calls the "myth of the autonomous essential self" (20). Though
Harris claims social theories of reading and writing have helped
deconstruct this myth for composition teachers, it remains dominant in
much of American culture. Finally, acknowledging to students the inde-
terminacy of the outcomes of negotiations between readers and writers
is to deny what many students presumably wantindeed, what any
writer dreams of at least some of the time as an ideal: a sure thing, a
proven method, the absence of conflict, contradiction, and tension, the
achievement of perfect communication (cf. Lu, "Conflict"). Indetermi-
nacy doesn't sell, a significant liability in a consumerist society.

In spite of these limitations, models of writing as negotiation and basic
writing as a borderland offer significant advantages over previous con-
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ceptions of basic writers, basic writing, and the writing classroom. They
acknowledge the play of power in language, the shifting nature of lan-
guage practices, and the agency of both teachers and students. And more
importantly, they position every student writer as a writer with "some
freedom," akin to rather than different from other writers in residing
"on the border line of what society wants and what he wants." I have
been arguing that basic writers, like all writers, have "some freedom,"
and that to act on that freedom is not a matter of sloughing off immatu-
rity; nor does it require students to sell their souls. Students, like all
writers, can negotiate as writers for particular positions for particular
occasions, vis-à-vis particular readers, if only we can persuade them,
and ourselves, that they can.
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6 Re-thinking the "Sociality" of
Error: Teaching Editing as
Negotiation

Bruce Horner

That errors in writing are somehow "social" is no news to the field of
composition. Yet there is a recurring discrepancy in the approach
compositionists take toward this dimension of written error. On the one
hand, what counts as an "error" (or as "correct") in writing is generally
recognized as "social": most compositionists freely acknowledge the
history of the controversial imposition of standards of "correct" nota-
tion as a set of arbitrary conventions. On the other hand, the production
of particular errors is regularly identified and treated not as social but
as individual, evidence of an individual writer's cognitive or percep-
tual difficulties, trouble knowing and/or seeing error. We might account
cynically for the discrepancy between recognition of what might be called
the "sociality" of errors and the focus of research and teaching on error
as a sign of ethical irresponsibility. I would argue, however, that this
discrepancy results from an impasse in how the "sociality" of error has
been theorized. To acknowledge that errors are "social" seems to mean
primarily that one acknowledges the history of the regularization of
conventions for writing English, a regularization which, not coinciden-
tally, has favored the syntactic forms of dialects spoken by more power-
ful social groups. But all this seems to be viewed as a fait accompli, "his-
tory" in the sense of something in the past about which there is little
now to be done, a digression that takes attention away from the imme-
diate problems of our students and their writing. The proper focus of
attention for researchers and teachers of writing, it seems largely to be
assumed, is on matters of student cognition and perception.

In her 1985 review of "Research on Error and Correction" Glynda
Hull testifies to this state of affairs. Hull acknowledges that "[m]ost of
the controversy surrounding correctness in writing has finally to do with
power, status, and class," but observes that much recent research on
error "can be viewed as walking a middle ground in the controversy,
neither despairing that students must learn a privileged language nor
grieving overlong that there is a cost" (165, 166). This research takes as
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its purpose "not a delineation of the social and political implications c
error and correctness but an investigation of those mental processes in
volved in making errors and correcting them" (167).1 Note that research
ers pursuing such matters do not deny the social controversy "surround
ing" errors. But they assume that those matters surround without, as i
were, infiltrating or impinging upon error, that the controversy exist
outside the perimeter of the site where error is produced and corrected
And if the "mental processes" responsible for producing and correctinl
error are indeed distinct from the social and political "implications" c
what is produced, then one may justifiably dismiss questions about th
social constitution of error as immaterial to research on error, question
belonging to the province of sociolinguists and social activists but no
writing teachers.

In what follows, I want to call that distinction into question. My in
tent is not to call composition researchers and teachers to ethical ac
count, nor to deny the necessity of teaching conventions of writinl
(though I have some recommendations for how we might better teacl
them). Rather, I argue that the distinction between "error" and its socia
implications is false, and that, consequently, to the extent that any re
search and teaching is based on that distinction, it is flawed. The "soci
ality" of error has much to do with both its production and correction
and if we are properly to understand and respond to written error, w,
need to attend to that sociality in our research and teaching. Such atten
tion need not and should not override our attention to matters of cogni
tion and perception but inform it. In short, the split between social ap
proaches and cognitive approaches to error, like the sociocognitive di
vide compositionists generally have recently been attempting to cross
is a problematic split which hampers our research and teaching.'I begii
by considering in some detail how errors might be viewed as social ii
their production and correction, rather than only in their implications.
then examine two ways in which this is elided in some of the literatup
on error, and the problematic results of such elisions. Finally, I examin
how a more fully "social" view of error might inform our teaching o
editing.

I: Errors as Social "Achievements"

In a critique of literacy studies, Sylvia Scribner notes that although lit
eracy is most often defined as "an attribute of individuals," "the singt
most compelling fact about literacy is that it is a social achievement'
(emphasis in original). For, as she explains,

15C



Re-thinking the "Sociality" of Error 141

Individuals in societies without writing systems do not become lit-
erate. . .. the individual child or adult does not extract the meaning
of written symbols through personal interaction with the physical
objects that embody them. Literacy abilities are acquired by indi-
viduals only in the course of participation in socially organized ac-
tivities with written language.. .. It follows that individual literacy
is relative to social literacy. . . .

The enterprise of defining literacy, therefore, becomes one of as-
sessing what counts as literacy. ... in some given social context. (72)

But if, as Scribner urges us to do, we acknowledge literacy to be a social
rather than an individual achievement and thus an achievement that
varies from time to time and place to place, we must simultaneously
also acknowledge "errors" in writing as social achievements, though of
a peculiar kind. For if definitions of literacy must involve "what counts
as literacy. . . . in some given social context," then definitions of error in
writing must similarly involve what counts as an "error" in some given
social context.3

We can get a sense of how errors might represent social "achieve-
ments" by recalling the social interaction in and by which they are pro-
duced, recognized, and corrected. Errors in writing are usually described
as the failure of writing to conform to conventions in language or nota-
tion. But a convention, as Raymond Williams reminds us, carries from
its roots the sense of meetinglike an annual "convention"and, by
derivation, agreement. In writing, Williams observes, a convention func-
tions as "an established relationship, or ground of a relationship, through
which a specific shared practicethe making of actual workscan be
realized" (Marxism 173). Through specific notations, Williams observes,
such relationships are "expressed, offered, tested, and amended in a
whole social process, in which device, expression, and the substance of
expression are in the end inseparable" (Marxism 171-72). Any failure in
conventions thus represents a failure of the parties involved to reach
agreement, the rejection by one party of the relationship expressed and/
or offered by the other.

We can thus understand errors as representing flawed social transac-
tions, instances of a failure on the part of both the writer and reader to
negotiate an agreement (the process of offering, testing, and amending)
as to the kind of relationship that should exist between them and as to
the kind of significance to be attributed to the written notations offered,
a failure which makes impossible the realization of a certain kind of
"work." This view of error helps to explain the difficulty of determin-
ing whether a given notatione.g., the "fragmented" free modifier
represents an error or, say, an effective stylistic device. The status of the
form as an error depends largely on the relationship between a particu-
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lar writer and a particular reader at a particular timethe status and
authority which, in a particular time, the writer claims and which the
reader agrees to accord the writer. It is a matter re-negotiated at each
writing and at each reading. Quarrels between publishing writers and
their editors or critics concerning the acceptability and significance of
particular usages attest to the negotiated status of given notations as
errors.

If we can distinguish basic writers from others on the basis of their
errors, we may say that what distinguishes them is not so much that
they make more errors than do other writers or that their errors are more
severe but that (1) on their own, basic writers don't recognize the same
particular notations their intended readers do for what those readers
recognize them as (errors) and (2) they are not aware of, or do not know
how to reach an agreement with these readers through the process of
offering, testing, and amending notations. We may say that, in Scribner's
sense, many of their errors remain at least partially unachieved, for if
errors are social achievements, then they can't fully exist until both reader
and writer agree on their existence. Whereas the more successful stu-
dent writers will frequently recognize and agree with their readers that
particular notations are "errors," basic writers, though they may believe
in the sincerity of teachers who mark their papers as full of errors, are
seldom in agreement with them. When I first ask students in my basic
writing classes to correct errors in their writing, individually or in groups,
their "corrections" often leave untouched the errors I have in mind and
alter what I fail to see as originally in error. Paradoxically, at least one of
my goals may well be to help them to producei.e., achieve or recog-
nizemore of the kind of errors I recognize in their writing.

But such an achievement can be reached only through a process of
negotiation. And in negotiation, the parties operate in a relation of power
that inevitably changes both. As P. H. Gulliver observes, negotiation is
"a dynamic process of exploration in which change is intrinsic: changes
in each party's assessment of his requirements, in his expectations of
what is possible, preferable, and acceptable, and changes in his under-
standing of the opponent's assessments and expectations" (Disputes and
Negotiations xvii). It is a process of "learning and adjustment by the par-
ties" (Gulliver 81). If the negotiation results in agreement, "the position
of each [party] has been subtly changed not only by the terms offered,
but by its experience of the other and exposure to the other's persua-
sion" (Vickers 151; qtd. in Gulliver 81). Negotiation is not a matter of
one party persuading a second to adopt the position of the first, nor a
process of exchange (barter) between two parties, but a process of joint
change and learning in which power operates dialectically.
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To teach students to "achieve" errors through negotiation, it thus will
not do simply for me to bully students into confessing the status of cer-
tain notations as errors. For the errors to be "achieved" as errors, the
achievement must represent an agreement reached between the writer
and reader to attribute a certain kind of significance to specific nota-
tions, and that agreement must be the result of a relationship in which
both writer and reader hold a degree of power and authority. But what
especially marks much present-day basic writing as suchas a type of
writing and as an institutionis a very different social relationship in-
herent in the activity of the writing and its teaching, a relationship in
which authority is imagined to reside with the teacher/reader alone,
but in which no one, including the teacher, has power. Rather, the teacher
becomes the instrument of a power operating through her upon the stu-
dent. The writer assumes no authority for the specific notations offered,
and the teacher/reader refuses to ascribe any power or authority to the
writer. When confronted with certain usages in the writing of basic writ-
ers, teachers are either not willing or unprepared to participate in the
kinds of relationships with the writer and the text which do ascribe power
and authority to the writers and their writing. In Elaine Lees's example,
readers laugh at the student sentence "People nowadays are using sex
to sell things all the time (such as in movies, TV, and pubic advertising)"
because of the kind of writer they imagine the student to be, one with-
out any authority as a writer ("Proofreading as Reading" 225). Given
different assumptions about the writer, the word "pubic" might well be
read as fully appropriate, not an "error" at all. Joseph Williams similarly
points to the role which readers' sense of writers plays in producing
error when he wryly observes that "if we [teachers] could read those
[error-ridden] student essays unreflexively, if we could make the ordi-
nary kind of contract with those texts that we make with other kinds of
texts, then we could find many fewer errors" (159; quoted in Lees, "Proof-
reading" 217; my emphasis).

That teachers seldom make such contracts with students results from
treating the asymmetry of power relations between teachers and stu-
dents as necessarily denying students any agency or power. Because stu-
dents have less power, they are imagined to have none. But as social
theorist Anthony Giddens observes, "Power relations . . . are always
two-way, even if the power of one actor or party in a social relation is
minimal compared to another. Power relations are relations of autonomy
and dependence, but even the most autonomous agent is in some de-
gree dependent, and the most dependent actor or party in a relationship
retains some autonomy" (93; see also Isaac 79-95). Power itself is best
conceived not so much as a resource but as a capability (Giddens 68, 91).
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Students who fail to exercise power or authority do not deny the possi-
bility of their own agency but simply reject it. As Giddens observes, "An
agent who does not participate in the dialectic of control, in a minimal fashion,

ceases to be an agent [sic]" (149). Similarly, teachers who fail to acknowl-
edge the power of their students likewise reject the opportunity of ne-
gotiating with them, and so, however indirectly, reject their own power

and agency as well.
But if we accept the view that errors are the product of social relation-

ships, and that editing is a matter of negotiating those relationships,
then our teaching of error and editing will have to engage issues of power,
authority, and conflict. What counts as an error will have to be taught as
negotiable and thus variable, dependent on the specific historical and
social context in which a notation occurs, its status as an error varying
from reader to reader, even from reading toreading, as agreements as to
relationships of power and authority are renegotiated. In the last de-
cade of error research, however, it is just these issues that have been
dismissed from consideration.

II: Errors as Linguistic Confusion

Hull's observation that researchers have chosen to walk a "middle
ground in the controversy [over error], neither despairing that students
must learn a privileged language nor grieving overlong that there is a
cost" ("Research" 166) hints at why compositionists have tended to dis-
miss issues of conflicts in power and authority from consideration. The
issues, however real, are assumed to be long-settled, "dead," the con-
troversy something about which one can do little but despair and grieve.
There are two interdependent assumptions governing this view: (1) that

the conventions constituting standard written English are largely fixed
and (2) that the social order which has determined the appropriateness
or nonappropriateness of certain conventions is largely fixed. The lan-
guage of privilege is settled, and students must, if they are to have ac-
cess to privilege, learn it. The strategies for responding to students' er-
rors adopted by those accepting the validity of these assumptions are
thus necessarily strategies of accommodation. Those adopting such strat-

egies make two additional assumptions: (3) that it is counterproductive
to remind students of what cannot be changed (a "dead" issue, after all)
and (4) that students are at a significant remove from the conventions of
standard Edited American English. Evidence of these assumptions ap-
pears in the models and metaphors governing descriptions of basic writ-
ers and their difficulties. The changes in student writing hoped for are
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described using metaphors of travel from one fixed location to another,
whether from one fixed linguistic territory to another, one cognitive stage
or state to another, one discourse community to another, or from an out-
side to an inside. In some of these, the problems of basic writers are
reconceptualized as being not primarily social but cognitive and /or lin-
guistic. Improvement in writing is identified with models adapted from
theories of cognitive development or second-language acquisition. In
the process, what might otherwise be termed conflicts of power or agree-
ment get redefined as linguistic or cognitive problems, and pedagogical
implications are drawn that ignore the social dimension of the prob-
lems.

We can see this process operating in Mina Shaughnessy's character-
ization of the difficulties of basic writers in her highly influential Errors
and Expectations:

Confusion, rather than conflict, seems to paralyze the writer at this
level. Language learners at any level appear to seek out, either con-
sciously or unconsciously, the underlying patterns that govern the
language they are learning. They are pressed by their language-learn-
ing faculties to increase the degree of predictability and efficiency in
their use of language. This is less a choice they make than an urge they
have to move across the territory of language as if they had a map
and not as if they were being forced to make their way across a
mine field. What has been so damaging about the experience of BW
students with written English is that it has been so confusing, and
worse, that they have become resigned to this confusion, to not
knowing, to the substitution of protective tactics or private systems
or makeshift strategies for genuine mastery of written English in any
form. (10, my emphases)

In this passage, Shaughnessy establishes a "middle ground" by describ-
ing the problems of basic writers as those of anyone learning a new lan-
guage. Using the evidence of what error analysts would call an "inter-
mediate language" in students' writing, she argues that basic writers'
problems are best understood in terms of inevitable cognitive growth
a matter of "confusion," not "conflict," evidence of their "level" of "lan-
guage learning," the pursuit of an "urge they have," not a "choice they
make." Learning to write conventionally correct prose is equated with
learning a new language, and learning a new language is presented as
involving purely cognitive demands. For the terms of "conflict," "choice,"
and negotiation inherent in that practice of learning and using the con-
ventions of Standard EAE Shaughnessy substitutes a restricted set of
terms drawn from models of second-language acquisition.'

That Shaughnessy should choose to make such a substitution seems
to result from her sense that attention to the sociality of errors consti-
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tutes a damaging evasion of error rather than a focus on one of its intrin-
sic elements. In a passage following the one quoted above, she argues,
"To try to persuade a student who makes these errors that the problems
with his writing are all on the outside, or that he has no problems, may
well be to perpetuate his confusion and deny him the ultimate freedom
of deciding how and when and where he will use which language" (11).
Shaughnessy likens the transactions of writers and readers to bargain-
ing, but a bargaining in which errors represent so much static interfer-
ence, not disagreements:

[Errors] demand energy [from the reader] without giving any re-
turn in meaning; they shift the reader's attention from where he is
going (meaning) to how he is getting there (code). In a better world,
it is true, readers might be more generous with their energies, . . .

but it would be foolhardy to bank on that kind of persistence except
perhaps in English teachers or good friends. (12)

Shaughnessy acknowledges that what counts as an error continues to
vary and that this is socially determined. "This is not to say," she re-
minds us, "that the boundaries of error do not shift nor to suggest that
certain battles along those borderlines are not worth waging" (13). But
such battles are "battles," not negotiations.' As such, they have no place
in the immediate work of the basic writing classroom:

[W]hen we move out of the centuries and into Monday morning,
into the life of the young man or woman sitting in a BW class, our
linguistic contemplations are likely to hover over a more immedi-
ate realitynamely, the fact that a person who does not control the
dominant code of literacy in a society that generates more writing
than any society in history is likely to be pitched against more ob-
stacles than are apparent to those who have already mastered that
code. (13)

In a critique of Shaughnessy, Min-Zhan Lu, adopting a perspective
afforded by Marxist and poststructuralist theories of language, has iden-
tified in Shaughnessy's work a "politics of 'linguistic' innocence," a poli-
tics constituting a part of Shaughnessy's "legacy" to later researchers on
error which Lu would have us resist. Lu argues that we cannot view
writers in any writing as operating within any single linguistic sphere
either controlling or not controlling the "dominant code of literacy," for
examplenor as ever being politically innocent. Rather, as these theo-
ries suggest,

language is best understood not as a neutral vehicle of communica-
tion but as a site of struggle among competing discourses. Each dis-
course puts specific constraints on the construction of one's stance
how one makes sense of oneself and gives meaning to the world. . . .
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Each time one writes, even and especially when one is attempting
to use one of these discourses, one experiences the need to respond
to the dissonance among the various discourses of one's daily life.
Because different discourses do not enjoy equal political power in
current-day America, decisions on how to respond to such disso-
nance are never politically innocent. ("Redefining" 27)

Lu argues that students' attention needs to be drawn to the politics of
those decisions, not to decry their implication in politics, but so that
students may make those decisions from a position of being more fully
informed. To overlook those implications is to oversimplify, and thus to
confuse, the task that our students, like all writers, face when writing.
The task is not one of moving from one fixed sphere or stage or commu-
nity of language use to another, or of choosing one over another, but of
responding to the dissonance among these for particular, often conflict-
ing purposes to which one would like to align oneself at a particular
time in a particular writing (Lu, "Redefining" 35).

To illustrate the sort of confusion to which silencing such dissonance
can lead both students and researchers, I want to discuss Mary Epes's
1985 study of the socially charged issue of the influence of spoken dia-
lect on basic writers' errors. Epes's study is worth considering in detail
because the care with which Epes builds her case and the pedagogical
implications she draws show how easily issues of power, status, and
class associated with learning writing conventions can be sidestepped
by even the best work of researchers and also, and more important, the
highly problematic "middle ground" to which such sidesteps lead them.

In her study, Epes provides an elaborate comparison between the
number and types of errors produced by two groups of adult basic writ-
ers, one composed of thirteen speakers of standard dialect, whom she
parenthetically ,describes as "all native speakers [of English], mostly
middle class, and mostly white," the other composed of thirteen speak-
ers of nonstandard dialect, whom she parenthetically describes as "all
native speakers [of English] and all black except one" ("Tracing" 8). She
reports that "differences in cognitive, composing, and reading skills do
not seem to account for the differences in the error rates of the two
groups" (the second group makes many more errors, and more errors of
certain types, than the first) and so concludes that dialect differences are
to blame (15). In reporting her conclusions, she explicitly dismisses the
influence of nonlinguistic factors on students' performance: "[T]here are
peculiarly linguistic (as distinct from sociological and psychological)
reasons for the severe problems with the written language almost uni-
versally experienced by nonstandard dialect speakers" (29). The terms
of her explanation would seem to suggest otherwise:
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Because NSD speakers must write a language which is in certain
ways in conflict with the language they speak, they are more subject
than SD speakers to an insecurity which can have a highly adverse
effect on their development as learners and writers.... For a variety
of reasons traceable to nonstandard speech patterns, NSD speakers
do not develop the perceptual skills necessary to control some as-
pects of the written code at the same pace that SD speakers gener-
ally do. (29-30; my emphases)

But though to readers unfamiliar with Epes's article, "conflict" and "in-
security" might suggest social, political, and affective psychological fac-
tors for students' difficulties with writing, Epes has already earlier rede-
fined such terms as bearing purely linguistic significance, the conflici
and insecurity which, say, a native speaker of French might encountei
in attempting to speak English purely for purposes of recreation (if one
can imagine such an attempt). We can see this redefining of "linguistic'
as a category encompassing all sorts of difficulties in Epes's earlier com-
mentary on the multiple hypercorrect forms which the speakers of NSE
produce in their writing. Epes describes such forms as signs

both of [NSD speakers] struggle to resolve the conflict between their
spoken language and the one they're trying to write, as well as of
the linguistic insecurity which grips them as soon as they pick up a
pen. Over the years when they should and could be growing in lit-
eracy skills, this insecurity apparently becomes for many a general-
ized malaise which affects every aspect of their experience as writers,
and, unfortunately, their overall self-image as learners. (22, my em-
phases)

An initial "insecurity" and "conflict" described as purely "linguistic'
are identified as the source of students' later experience of "general
malaise" and lousy "overall self-image."

Epes transforms the problem of NSD speakers' written errors into a
linguistic and perceptual problem by maintaining a distinction between
composing and encoding, between norms that are optional and those
that are givens (by whom to whom? we might ask), a distinction that iE
basic to the design and method of analysis of her studyindeed, a dis-
tinction she makes early on in order to "head off confusion about the
goals and design" of her study. She explains:

As a skill, encoding includes control over all the norms of the writ-
ten languagethe norms relating both to its visual forms (spelling,
punctuation, capitalization, indentation, etc.) and to its linguistic
forms (denoting tense, number, case, word-class, etc.). Encoding is
distinct from composing inasmuch as it is concerned with the giv-
ens of the written code, whereas composing is concerned with the
options of the written language which that code represents. . . .

1 6 7
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For the purposes of this investigation, I define error narrowly as
any clear deviation from the norms of standard written English. This
definition places error in the domain of right/wrong, not of better/
worse. So defined, errors manifest weaknesses in encoding skills,
not in composing skills. (6, emphases in original)

Epes finds "[difficulties in objectifying the code] to be particularly se-
vere among the NSD speakers" (27), difficulties which Epes links to dif-
ferences between NSD and the "norms" of the written code. The fact
that "their natural language forms happen to be unacceptable in writ-
ing does not make it any easier for NSD speakers to see, much less to
avoid them [i.e., NSD forms in writing]" when looking for errors (21).
When asked to "detect" errors when reading a passage "encoded" with
NSD forms, they have trouble "seeing" the NSD forms as errors (21).
What Epes sees as a clear matter of right and wrong, they can't see. And
finding themselves unable to "objectify" the code, they experience "con-
flict," "general malaise," and end up with poor "overall self-image as
learners." In Epes's argument, the conventions of writingmatters of
agreement as to what is and isn't acceptable or optionalare treated as
matters of physical, visual facts, "facts" which NSD speakers can't see.
The students' experience of conflict concerning the "factuality" of these
conventions and their difficulty seeing their own forms as errors thus
appear to indicate their lack of perceptual skills. Whereas Shaughnessy
rejects the possibility that basic writers experience "conflict" by re-nam-
ing it the experience of "confusion," Epes redefines conflict as confu-
sion, a confusion explained as resulting from a lack of ability to see what,
or in the ways that, some others see.

I don't mean to deny the cognitive or linguistic dimensions to learn-
ing writing or, for that matter, other dimensions, such as the physical
demands of typing or handwriting, to which Epes, Shaughnessy, and
other writers attend in their studies of error. But I do deny the distinc-
tion Shaughnessy and Epes make between confusion and conflict, and
between the cognitive or linguistic, on the one hand, and the social. By
adopting a desocialized, depoliticized model for their understanding of
writing problems, presenting the learning of writing as an individual's
journey across the "territory of language" to "genuine mastery of writ-
ten English," these writers misrepresent the conventions of writing as
"givens" and the academic success of some with those conventions as
natural, the possession of "genuine" mastery. Effective editing, or the
production of conventionally "correct" writing, comes to be seen as or-
dinarily an inevitable part of an individual's cognitive or linguistic de-
velopment, something which one's "language-learning faculties" press
one to learn, an ability which every college student ought to have al-
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ready acquired but which basic writers haven't. And for those accepting
these views, basic writers come to be labeled unnatural, stuck in an ear-
lier stage of cognitive development (Lunsford, "Cognitive Develop-
ment"), unable to see words "as they are" (Laurence, "Errors' Endless
Train" 30), trapped by cognitive barriers which prevent them from real
learning in which they can see "the reality behind the symbol" (Goldberg
40).9

In short, such studies misrepresent the conventions of writing as fixed
rather than inevitably shifting, renegotiated throughout history and in
each act of writing; in so doing, they misrepresent the inevitable and
recurring confrontation with conflict which any "mastery" of written
English in fact entails and the difficulties which basic writers face in
attempting to achieve such "mastery." Finally and perhaps most impor-
tant, in sidestepping the conflict inherent in academic (and any other
type of) writing, such studies result in pedagogies which can contribute
to the very confusion and malaise from which students suffer. For they
reinforce basic writers' sense that their position as writers is one of pow-
erlessness. The teacher /reader remains in control of, and the authority
on, what counts as mature writing, the target language, what is "right,"
even "reality." In a sense Epes likely is accurate in identifying her stu-
dents' feelings as ones of "generalized malaise," "insecurity," or poor
"overall self-image." She reports that the students she interviewed com-
plained themselves that "when they were involved in composing, they
tended uncontrollably to 'slip back' and use 'bad English' in their writ-
ing." One, Epes reports, chastizes herself, "There I go again. I don't say
that r there was several patients1 no more. It's out of my past" (28).
Students who are repeatedly told they are not seeing what's there, get-
ting it wrong instead of right, not being "objective," may well believe
such usages to be "slips," "bad English," instances of once again not
using the "right word." By locating written error in the "domain of right/
wrong," we encourage student writers to position themselves as having
no control over or authority on their writing, a position, by the way,
which students may find all too tempting, since in denying them power,
it also relieves them of responsibility.

This is not to say that those studies sidestepping social dimensions to
writing have yielded no insights. The claims of those who see basic writ-
ers' problems as showing cognitive or perceptual inabilities or those who
see such problems as evidence of stages akin to those in second-lan-
guage acquisition are based on studies conducted too carefully to be
simply false. Epes, for example, demonstrates convincingly a correla-
tion between the primary spoken dialect of the students in her study
and specific types of errors in their writing, a correlation much debated
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in prior studies. I am arguing, however, that the cognitive and percep-
tual demands of writing that researchers like Epes have described are
intrinsically social in ways the writers fail to acknowledge or confront,
ways which radically qualify both the significance of their claims and
the kinds of utility their pedagogies possess. The "cognitive" and "lin-
guistic" intersect with the "political" and the "social." Epes's argument,
for example, needs significant qualification: Though she does demon-
strate a correlation between her students' spoken dialect and specific
errors in their writing, it is not at all clear that the differences between
the spoken dialect and the written "code" alone as purely linguistic phe-
nomena account for NSD speakers' difficulties. Rather, as I have shown
her own language suggesting, the attributes of class, power, and iden-
tity associated historically with that dialect and that code in the United
States seem to have much to do with their difficulties.1° In understand-
ing basic writers' problems with error and especially in devising
pedagogies to address those problems, we need to take the intersections
of their political, social, linguistic, and cognitive dimensions into account.
For example, though NSD speakers' difficulties in producing or identi-
fying specific forms may make it seem necessary and useful to assign
them some kind of grammar lessons on those forms and exercises in
improving "perception skills," as Epes recommends (30-31), we need to
consider how such teaching practices risk reinforcing the distress which
such students experience insofar as they present as inarguable "givens"
what students have neither received nor decided fully to accept.

III: Errors as Cultural Difference

In "Proofreading as Reading, Errors as Embarrassments," Elaine Lees
suggests one model for understanding errors which begins to take into
account how the production of errors might itself have social and politi-
cal dimensions. Drawing from Joseph Williams, the work of Stanley Fish,
and her own research on writing and reading behavior, Lees argues,

Students who proofread their own work unsuccessfully may be
viewed not so much as "missing what's there" on the surface of
their texts as constructing . . . those texts differently from the way
other, powerful readers do. Though a student may compose a text
in which a teacher finds errors, we cannot assume that the student
constructs, or can construct, a text that reveals those errors as he or
she reads. (220)

For Lees, this is not, it bears emphasizing, a "perceptual" problem, at
least not in the sense of physical visual impairment, something to be
fixed by eye exercises. Rather, for Lees, the problem basic writers have
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with error is one of not yet belonging to the interpretive community of
proofreaders, with its shared goals, procedures, assumptions, and val-
ues. It is a problem of social identity, a lack not simply of skill or knowl-
edge but of agreement. Lees suggests that this may account for why
some basic writers have so much difficulty learning to see their errors,
for to do so may require that they not only move into a new "interpre-
tive community" but move out of another ("Proofreading" 226-27).

The model Lees offers, by redefining perception in social terms, elimi-
nates some of the reductiveness of responding to students' difficulties
with proofreading as purely cognitive or perceptual by reconceiving
perception and cognition themselves as social. However, in place of the
distinction between seeing what's on the page and what isn't, this model
substitutes a distinction between cultural communities presented as
largely fixedthe community of proofreaders versus the others. This
fixing of communities thus risks reinscribing the task of basic writers as
moving from one community to another, but now with all the attendant
ethical questions to which such moves, described in such terms, give
rise. If proofreading is not a matter of improved perception or advanced
cognition, what justification can we offer for teaching it? Why should
students exchange their goals, procedures, assumptions, and values for
those of their teachers? And why should teachers themselves encourage
such an exchange?

In short, in place of viewing students as moving up the stages of lin-
guistic maturity, in this model basic writers' difficulties are seen as those
of acculturation. And in line with this second view, teaching writing can
come to be seen as a matter of cultural imperialism, of asking students
to move from an "oral" to a "literate" culture, to exchange the language
of home and family (with its attendant goals, procedures, assumptions,
and values) for the language of the academy (with all its cultural bag-
gage). And what might otherwise be thought of as a continuum, or at
least a cacophony, of goals, procedures, assumptions, and values is imag-
ined as a choice between two distinct alternatives.

We can see this way of distinguishing basic writers operating in de-
scriptions of them as members of an "oral" rather than a "literate" cul-
ture (Farrell, "Literacy, the Basics"; Ong 51; Sloan) or as lacking a "tex-
tual" orientation, reading only for "gist" or "meaning" but not for "code"
(Lees, "Proofreading" 227; Epes 26), as evidenced by their failure to at-
tend to or see the need for citing passages from a texttheir own or
another 'swhen discussing its meaning; by the physical distance stu-
dents often maintain between themselves and (written) texts; and by
their apparent failure, when reading aloud from their own texts, to see
any difference between the words they speak and the marks on the page.11
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A number of pedagogies based on this distinction have been devel-
oped to produce a "textual" orientation in students. Donna Correll, for
example, recommends having students engage in "controlled" compo-
sitionthat is, exact copying of passages or copying them and then al-
tering specified lexical or syntactic formsto combat what she describes
as students' "lack of attention to written forms." Such practices require
what she describes as "accuracy in both transcription and manipula-
tion," thereby focusing "student attention on lexical and syntactic forms
in the written language" (308). Exercises which have students infer un-
derstandings of syntactic forms and rules of punctuation from examples
similarly give students practice in attending to particular syntactic forms
and marks of punctuation. (For examples, see D'Eloia, "Uses"; Lunsford,
"Cognitive Development"; The Comp-Lab Exercises; Connections.) In so
doing, students are to develop a "textual" orientationa tendency to
pay attention to the "codes" of writing.

Aside from the ethical dilemmas it raises, there are at least three prob-
lems with viewing errors as signs of cultural difference. First, those
making a distinction between a textual versus an oral orientation, or
between "code" and meaning (like Epes's distinction between "encod-
ing" and "composing"), often fail to take into account the socially pro-
duced sense of what "reading for code" involves, and so fail to honor
the "textual" orientations students do bring to their reading. The dis-
tinction between a "textual" (or "literate") and an "oral" orientation can
thus easily slide back into the distinction between accurate versus faulty
perception which Lees is at pains to dismantle (see quotations from
Gorrell, above). The distinction can in fact better be described as a dif-
ference in the practice of constructing, or composing, meaning out of
"code." If I "depart from my text" in delivering a speech, this is not a
sign of my illiteracy or lack of textual orientation but a sign of a different
orientation to my text, a different use I am making of it no less sophisti-
cated, perhaps more, than that of a speaker reading verbatim. The prob-
lem many basic writers may have is not that they lack textual orienta-
tion but that they frequently adopt kinds of textual orientation unaligned
to the kinds of orientations their teachers sometimes want them to take.

This points to the second problem with viewing basic writers and
their teachers as belonging to separate interpretive communities: it ig-
nores the degree to which neither basic writers nor their teachers are so
simply identified or distinguished from one another.12 Basic writers are
not strangers to the land of proofreading (they have, after all, heard of
and pay attention to the sentence, commas, grammar, etc.), any more
than English teachers lack approaches to writing and reading that basic
writers regularly adopt. Basic writers regularly employ most of the marks
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of punctuation common in English writing, try to follow regularized
spelling, and so on. English teachers often ignore nonstandard punctua-
tion and syntactic patterns. We can get a sense both of the differences
that exist between the kinds of textual orientations teachers and stu-
dents take toward texts and of the overlap between those orientations in
some of the literature describing the editing processes of basic writers.
Hull, analyzing a protocol of an editing session between a tutor and a
student, has remarked

how unswervingly the student and tutor talk past one another. . . .

The tutor brings to her reading a particular kind of understanding
of texts, where it makes sense to pay attention to the structural logic
of sentences, and she tries to explain the errors in terms of that un-
derstanding. And in so doing, she loses the student, who just isn't
able to participate in her discussion, not yet being a party to her
notions of error and editing. He, on the other hand, seems to have
his own agenda for improving his text, an agenda which turns upon
a concern, not so much for how individual sentences are put to-
gether, but for what is appropriate semantically and stylistically.
("Acts of Wonderment" 216)

The student described clearly has a particular orientation to his text. In
the editing session Hull describes, the student makes a number of
changes in his text in order to clarify his meaning and improve his style.
However, his kind of orientation to his text doesn't allow him to see the
problems the tutor sees, problems of blurred syntax and punctuation.
As Hull puts it, he is "not yet . . a party to her notions of error and
editing." Hull describes a successful editing tutorial as one in which
"[the student] finally sees enough instances of the error and gets suffi-
cient feedback on his attempts to correct it that he is able to think about
punctuating sentences in his tutor's terms rather than his own" ("Acts
of Wonderment" 219). This shift in perspectives, Hull notes at the begin-
ning of her essay, like the shift in perspective that enables a teacher to
understand the logic of a student's errors, can lead to a sense of "won-
derment," which she describe's as "the apprehension and appreciation
of another 's way of thinking; a kind of insight, often sudden, at times
marvelous, that allows one to see from another's vantage; an epiphany,
if you will" (199). We should not dismiss either the real pleasures of
such shifts in perspective or their substantial value for both teachers
and students. At the same time, however, we need to acknowledge two
qualifications to what such shifts represent. First, we need to recall that
such shifts are not purely cognitive or perceptual ones, as the visual
metaphor of "perspective" might suggest. As Patricia Bizzell explains,

[S]tudents who struggle to write Standard English need knowledge
beyond the rules of grammar, spelling, and so on. They need to know:
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the habitual attitudes of Standard English users toward this pre-
ferred form; the linguistic features that most strongly mark group
identity; the conventions that can sometimes be ignored; and so on.
Students who do know the rules of Standard English may still seem
to academics to be writing "incorrectly" if the students are insensi-
tive to all these other features of language use in the community
then the students are using academic language in unacademic ways.
("Cognition" 224)

Second, however, we also need to acknowledge that such shifts are not
so simple, so binary, as the metaphor of perspective shifting would sug-
gest. For however full of wonderment, such shifts are not instances of
students encountering the previously unimaginable. In the editing pro-
tocol Hull analyzes, though the student is not initially party to the per-
spective of his tutor, neither is he wholly a stranger to it. When the tutor
mentions terms like sentence, comma, and period, the student doesn't ask
for definitions, as he might if he were a foreigner (see "Acts of Wonder-
ment" 216-18). Rather, he learns, or seems to learn, a new concept for
how sentences and periods and commas, about all of which he has some
previous knowledge, might relate to one another. And the tutor, though
frustrated initially by the failure of the student's focus to correspond to
her own, can understand, recognize, and respond meaningfully to his
earlier focus on matters of style, rhetorical strategy, semantics: whether
or not, for example, the student ought to admit in his paper that he
doesn't like a story his teacher has assigned (215).

Viewing errors as signs of cultural difference, then, can perpetuate
the false sense of each cultural orientation as unified and distinct from
the other. A final problem with this view is related to this last. Not only
is there overlap between the perspectives of basic writers and their teach-
ers. Each of those perspectives is itself constantly shifting. The ground
of the "new" territory to which teachers might see themselves as at-
tempting to lead students is not only not entirely new to students, it is
not firm; the perspective which we would presumably have them adopt
itself shifts. Though the metaphor of "perspective shifting" would sug-
gest that teaching students to edit represents a kind of "conversion" pro-
cess whereby students come to abandon what is imagined to be "their"
ways of seeing texts and adopt "ours," and though the metaphor of "ter;
ritories" of language would suggest teaching editing as involving a kind
of growth, or "expansion" of, by addition to, the repertoire of perspec-
tives students can adopt towards texts, the fact is that neither "our" per-
spectivethe attitudes, goals, assumptions and practices of the "aca-
demic discourse cornmunity"nor "theirs" is itself (and I am question-
ing the identification of it as singular) fixed but is constantly shifting,
renegotiated in every instance of language use.13 There is no utopian
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promised land either to which or from which we might lead students.
The lack of agreement among teachers as to labels for errors, what does
and doesn't count as an error, and the relative importance of particular
kinds of errors illustrates the shifting perspectives of the "academic dis-
course community" (see Connors and Lunsford, Greenbaum and Tay-
lor, Wall and Hull). We might, as Sidney Greenbaum and John Taylor
do, attempt to enforce agreement as to what does and doesn't count as
an error, joining their call for increased training so that teachers will "be
capable of identifying and correctly labeling errors for themselves" (174),
assuming, as they do, that "[iJt is reasonable to expect that teachers should
be able to identify and correct errors that are relevant to their discipline"
(169). But this assumption, with all due respect for the English profes-
sion, is not reasonable but rather a plea for a utopian condition. Susan
Wall and Glynda Hull, though they too call for the development of what
sounds like a kind of utopian "common language" for teachers and stu-
dents to use to talk about error, also admit that, in the long meanwhile,

Students must ... understand that for particular teachers errors may
have several different and interchangeable names; that different
teachers may name the same kinds of errors differently; that certain
jargon terms like "usage" have different meanings depending upon
the teacher; that what teachers consider an error in writing may vary
considerably; that a teacher's labels may be imprecise or even miss-
ing, so that they must be attentive to other cues such as boundary
markings or questions to infer the kind of error the teacher perceives;
that suggested revisions or comments like "wrong word" imply a
version of the text that the teacher is constructing, not exactly the
one they wrote or intended; and that even if all errors are identified
with labels, some require consulting a rule or convention to be cor-
rected while others involve revisions that are more negotiable. (286
87)

This is a tall order for students but, unlike the call for universal agree-
ment on error, not, I would argue, an unreasonable one, provided teach-
ers, particularly English teachers, participate in helping students achieve
such an understanding.

IV: Teaching Editing as Negotiation

I have argued above that the most serious risk of any pedagogy designed
to teach editing is that it may reinforce students' sense of themselves as
powerless in their writing, for the powerless cannot negotiate. Precisely
for this reason, I am not advocating that teachers simply offer students a
new "presentation" of errors as "social," lecturing them on the historic-
ity of specific notions of "correctness" in writing and mocking inconsis-
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tencies in style handbooks, especially if the effect of this would be to
persuade students to dismiss the real significance of error, however con-
strued, for writers and readers. To do so would simply reinforce stu-
dents' sense of their position as powerless receivers of the wisdom of
others, adding to their bewilderment and confusion in the face of differ-
ent notions of error while failing to honor that confusion as an appropri-
ate response to the confusing situation Wall and Hull describe. Rather
than attempting to sell students a new theory of error, we need to find
ways to engage them in negotiations with readers about error in their
writing and in theorizing about error. Teaching the history of the nego-
tiation of particular conventions as "correct" can have value only to the
extent that it encourages students to take active roles in continuing such
negotiations in their own writing. For it is only by doing so that their
notational practice as writers will represent a "choice they make."

Such choices will not, of course, be made "freely," if by "freely" we
mean divorced from issues of power and authority. Teachers, the acad-
emy, larger social institutions wield far more power than do individual
students. It would be misleading to pretend to ourselves or to our stu-
dents that this is not the case. I have been arguing, however, that it is
equally misleading and damaging to pretend to ourselves or to our stu-
dents that they lack any power. Indeed, the changes students make to
their texts to correct errors can represent what Giddens terms the
"instantiation" of students' power in action (91), in the context of nego-
tiations with particular readers concerning meaning. For a basic writer
to change an idiosyncratic spelling of a word to a socially sanctioned
spelling or to "unblur" the syntax of her sentence at the request of a
reader should not be seen as an instance of the power of the institution
operating on the powerless but as the student's exercise of her power as
a student and writer (see Isaac 81). Students do have the power to refuse
to make such changes, to insist on idiosyncratic spellings and nonstand-
ard syntactic patterns. That they seldom choose to do so signals not their
lack of power but their use of it in a negotiating strategy by which they
attempt as writers to communicate particular meanings to particular
readers. Just as basic writing students choose enrollment (see
Shauglmessy, Errors 3; D'Eloia, "Teaching Standard" 9), so, not very sur-
prisingly, those students frequently choose to attempt to employ stan-
dard spellings, uses of punctuation, and syntactic patterns. As Giddens
observes, "Every instance of the use of language is a potential modifica-
tion of that language at the same time as it acts to reproduce it" (220). To
deny students any attributes of agency in making such choices is to deny
them any right or responsibility for such choices, and so to discourage
their investment in their writing. We can acknowledge the play of hege-
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monic forces in constructing possible choices for students without de-
nying the operation of agency in students' alignment with one or the
other of those choices in their negotiations.14

How might we teach editing as such a process of negotiation? My
suggestions fall into two categories: practices in conferences or small
groups with individual students, and more general practices in writing
assignments and class discussions. Hull advocates ideally using indi-
vidual tutorials to teach editing because such tutorials enable teachers
to tailor instruction to the specific problems an individual student has
with error and editing and, unlike workbooks, to keep attention focused
on the student's own writing ("Acts of Wonderment" 219-22). Class in-
struction, she argues, is most useful for addressing "those things that
the majority of students don't do in their writing [but need to learn how
tol," like using quotation marks, and for teaching general strategies for
the detection and correction of mistakes, but not for calling attention to
the particular mistakes which individual students make (222).

Yet class discussions can also be used to provide an important social
context for the work conducted in individualized editing tutorials, so
that such work would be perceived as individual negotiations between
different ways to "read" the student's texts rather than as the elimina-
tion of "individual" problems, occasions for dealing with the individual
student's failure to "get it right," "right" being what the teacher or group
or peers or a particular handbook, as authority, says goes. In class dis-
cussions, we might pose some questions to students about the varying
notions of "error" they have already learned. We can present students
with the conflicting evidence on "correctness" provided by examples of
printing from earlier and later times or by different style handbooks or
by different genres, and ask them, in class discussions and perhaps in
writing assignments, what they make of such conflicts and how they
resolve them in their own practice as writers. Or we might ask them to
consider how they would classify kinds of errors: what do they make,
for example, of such annoyances as smeared ink, illegible handwriting,
or putting the wrong date down? If these are "errors," how would they
describe the relationship of these sorts of "errors" to things like mis-
spellings, or missing or repeated words, or homonym confusion, or
blurred sentence structure? Or missing deadlines? Or use of the first-
person pronoun? In what sense would they say any of these constitute
"errors"? How would they rank (and define) the seriousnessor signifi-
cance of such different types of errors as misspellings, blurred syntax,
comma splices, omitted words? To whom? Under what conditions? (in
notes to oneself? in a "speech text"? a letter home?) By what criteria?
Such questions would present the issue of error as something about
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which they as writers must theorize and make choices, not something
they need simply learn about and acquiesce to, though in their theoriz-
ing and in their writing they must also confront the theories, rankings,
definitions of other readers (including teachers) as well. For such ques-
tions would put students in the position to negotiate and renegotiate
the concept of "correctness," including, importantly, the concept of its
negotiability. In a particular semester, teachers and students might well
negotiate, as a class, the relative acceptability of particular types of er-
rors for particular writings produced for that course, thus bringing out
the degree to which errors are contextualand ways to respond to them,
e.g., agree that the teacher would circle all misspellings, or write in the
correct spellings, or ignore misspellings completely, or adopt different
markings at different stages of the course. (Rankings would of course
vary not only in ordering but in the categories devisedfor example,
writing "hte" might be considered a far more serious error by a given
class than writing "then" for "than" or writing "definately," and a fail-
ure to proofread at all could be considered more serious than either.)
And such negotiations need not be exercises in humiliation for students
confronting the greater power and authority of the teacher, either. Teach-
ers can serve as mediators, offering informed guidance to what might
well be acceptable outside the course, in different writings or in various
contexts. And students invested in college are unlikely to desire, let alone
attempt to bargain for, the ignoring of all errors. Making marking prac-
tices negotiable would have the added bonus of demystifying those prac-
tices, making their meanings explicit through the process of negotia-
tion, and thus offering another example of how conventions of notation
come to be conventions (in the sense of "agreements"). And it will ren-
der the meaning of those practices something which teachers and stu-
dents alike must learn anew through the process of negotiation under-
gone in a particular course.

Individual conferences could provide the occasion for negotiations
between the writer and the teacher /reader about specific writings. But
if editing is to be taught as a matter of negotiation, of agreeing on spe-
cific meanings for given notations rather than being a matter of elimi-
nating static from the transmission of meaning, then these conferences
would have to involve questions of meaning, purpose, and relationship
as much as they involve "code." Especially when students' writing seems
to show clear problems of "form," as in garbled syntax, teachers will
have to resist the temptation to define the problem as merely "formal,"
for in doing so, they risk changing the meaning the student intended.
As Elizabeth Tricomi observes, simply asking writers of garbled sen-
tences what they mean by them frequently elicits from the students an
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ungarbled version which clarifies the meaning (64). But, she warns,
"Often I have thought I understood a garbled sentence, only to discover
through conversation with its student-writer that I did not at all. If I had
merely inserted my revised version, I would not have helped since my
grammatically correct sentence would not have expressed the student's
intended meaning" (64). Rather than teaching editing as a matter of dress-
ing meaning up or eliminating static, conversations like the one Tricomi
describes can teach editing as a process of negotiation between reader
and writer, negotiation as to competing ways of making meaning of the
same text. Here Hull's advice to teach editing using the student's own
text has particular force, since it allows for the push and tug of negotia-
tion between a writer and a reader about what to make of a given text,
not unlike the negotiation that occurs between professional writers and
editors about texts. Often enough, to be sure, that editing will result in
"conformity" to certain conventions, to the reproduction of established
relationships between reader and writer, because of the acknowledged
currency of those conventions and the choice of the writer to align her-
self with the power of that currency. But sometimes, too, editing can
involve resisting or at least contesting those conventions, manipulating
conventions for what, for the moment, can be unconventional effects, as
interviews with students about their breaks with convention will some-
times reveal. With each act of writing, students, like all writers, have the
choice of reproducing or working to alter or oppose hegemonic writing
practices (Raymond Williams, Marxism 112-13). A teacher (or a student
reader) can offer his reading of a particular notation and argue for the
currency of that reading (that a lack of notation leads to ambiguity or
suggests a meaning that surprises or confuses him), but the writer can
argue as well for her reading of that notation. The conversation Tricomi
describes would ideally to my mind continue with the student and
teacher analyzing the differences between the "garbled" and several
possible "ungarbled" versions, noting the differences in meaning that
result, attempting to account for the production of the different versions,
and working out how to choose from among them.

How we structure those conferences will help to determine whether
they become sites of negotiation or of domination and accommodation.
Tricomi recommends that we ask students about the ambiguity which
sentences create for us or ask simply what the student means by a par-
ticular sentence or passage, explaining what troubles us, or that we read
aloud to the student those sentences that make us stumble (63-64). The
value of such practices, it seems to me, lies in the relationship they es-
tablish between the student, the teacher, and the text. Students maintain
authority over and responsibility for their notations; teachers adopt the
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roles of readers who want to understand but may read those notations
differently. In my own experience, I have found it useful to foreground
the difference between my reading of a student's text and her own by
providing each of us a photocopy of the text. I read my copy aloud to
the student as she reads silently, illustrating to the student my reading
of her text and the difficulties which that reading leads me to have with
it without denying her own reading. This practice also provides imme-
diate and appropriate occasions for me to ask the sorts of questions
Tricomi recommends. In conferences, I have asked students to type their
papers into the computer from their handwritten copies as I look on. As
they type, they frequently ask questions themselves about how they origi-
nally notated their papers, change their notation as they go, and dis-
cover ambiguities in the meaning of particular sentences or passages
(frequently ones which gave me no trouble) and attempt to explain them
to themselves and me simultaneously, trying revisions out on me with
"Would it make better sense to say . . . ?" or "What do you think that
means?" Putting them to work on their own texts by putting them in
control of the computer keyboard positions them materially as in con-
trol of and responsible for deciding what will be entered and how. My
role, as the questions quoted above suggest, then becomes that of either
the curious draft reader or mediator between their handwritten version
and the version they are entering, raising questions that occur to me
about differences I perceive between the two but without authority to
alter the writing.

A similar sort of structuring might be adopted using peer groups com-
prised of one student whose writing was under consideration, with the
other group members responding as readers to that writing, each pro-
vided with his or her own copy of the original. The argument against
peer editing groups has been that basic writers are not competent edi-
tors and so cannot provide appropriate advice to their peers. But this
argument holds only if we see the purpose of such groups to be the
production of a set of error-free papers. On the other hand, if teachers
take as their aim teaching the dynamics of negotiation inherent in any
editing, then peer groups can provide a valuable site for practice in such
dynamics." The point of such group meetings would be not to arrive at
a consensus, with teacher as final arbiter.16 Instead, disagreements among
group members as to the "correctness" or appropriateness of particular
forms, common enough in my experience, would provide occasions to
investigate the negotiable and clearly variable acceptability of such forms.
That a teacher 's response to some of those forms might vary signifi-
cantly from a group of student readers' responses could be used to high-
light further how questions of different sorts of power and authority
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enter into the making of conventions. This does not, or should not, mean
that a student writer would learn to deny the particular authority of
student readers by submitting instead to the teacher's authority (or vice
versa). But students can attend to how contexts and readers need to be
taken into account, if not always submitted to, in choosing one form
over another. A student's confrontation with differences between those
forms which one or more of his peers will accept and /or a particular
teacher finds acceptable, or between what different student readers take
a particular form to mean, will prepare him for confronting and under-
standing differences between the responses of different teachers and
other readers to his writing as one of the normal conditions of writing
and reading, rather than as yet another proof that English is an alien,
confusing world.

But structuring conferences and small group work in such ways,
through such practices, must be part of a larger structuring of course
design if these are to be sites for negotiation rather than a coy type of
domination. It is sometimes recommended that editing be taught as a
separate, final stage in the writing process, so that students may focus
their attention primarily on the production of meaning, not blocked by
concerns about conventions. But a pedagogy which views errors as them-
selves bearing meaning rather than interfering with its transmission can-
not distinguish editing from composing. Though such a pedagogy might
still ask students to defer attention to editing, it cannot distinguish be-
tween composing and encoding. All parts of the "composing process,"
including editing, must be taught as involving negotiation about mean-
ing. Class discussions and writing assignments must reinforce students'
sense of their position as negotiators of meaning construction in their
writing at every stage.

Elaine Lees, calling the ability of literate readers to produce more than
one reading of a text "heterotextuality," suggests that we may need to
artificially reduce such heterotextuality for basic writers so that when
editing, they can concentrate on constructing meanings appropriate for
proofreading ("Proofreading" 227, 228). But I have been arguing that it
is not such students' heterotextuality but their false sense that such
heterotextuality is wrong that confuses them. Therefore, I would en-
courage class discussions and writing assignments which have students
develop and reflect upon multiple ways of constructing meaning out of
texts, including "academic" ways of reading in which those issues raised
by what is called "proofreading" matter.

For example, we can give our students writing assignments in which
distinctions between, say, direct or indirect quotations, or the notation
of exact wording or restrictive versus nonrestrictive modifiers, can mat-
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ter in the way they often do for academics, assignments which in all
likelihood will encourage them to respond in "academic" ways to texts
they have read, to attempt to establish "academic" relationships in their
writing to the texts on which they comment and to their imagined audi-
ence and to reflect on such relationships.17 Requiring students to respond
in their own writings to other texts, ideally writing responses to the same
text, allows class (or small group) discussion of their writing to focus on
and attempt to account for the kinds of value of "academic" and other
"textual orientations" resulting in the different responses of different
students, or in succeeding responses of the same student given several
assignments on the same text.18 In such discussions, we can point to the
negotiation of meaning and relationship in students' own notational
practices, through analysis of the texts they produce and the relation-
ship of those texts to the texts they have read. Such discussions can in-
volve students in the practice of the kind of myopici.e., "close"read-
ing in which academics sometimes engage in order to show them the
valuable kinds of meanings that such reading yields and the kinds of
relationships between readers, writers, and texts which it establishes.
And those meanings and relationships associated with "close" readings
can and should be compared with the kinds of meanings and relation-
ships associated with other kinds of reading which often compete for
readers' attentionreadings which, for example, take a writer 's politi-
cal identity as a crucial determinant of the significance of his writing
("John Berger is a Marxist, and so his arguments should be dismissed"),
or which rely on the authority of a specific reader or a majority of read-
ers to determine meaning ("As the review said, this book is about. . . .";
"As everyone has said, the writer means. . . ."), or which take a reading
as a kind of springboard for the student to offer up commonplaces on a
general topic ("This story shows that you shouldn't judge a book by its
cover.") Though such readings may seem outrageous, they are entirely
appropriate for certain purposes under certain conditions, just not (or
not always) for purposes honored in classrooms. To engage students
more directly with questions of "error," we can ask them to explore the
relationships in meaning and authority between texts (ideally their own)
which might be described as transcribing, summarizing, or interpreting
a second text and how those differences play out in their own writing
practice, so that while they are learning "controlled composition" they
are also considering who and what is being controlled in such a prac-
tice, and to what purpose.

I'll use an assignment from David Bartholomae and Anthony
Petrosky's anthology Ways of Reading to illustrate how teachers can po-
sition their students as writers negotiating different ways of reading a
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.text. The assignment, which follows a reprint of Chapter Two of Richard
Rodriguez's Hunger of Memory, "The Achievement of Desire," asks stu-
dents to consider the relationship between Richard Rodriguez and Ri-
chard Hoggart (from whose book The Uses of Literacy Rodriguez draws
the concept of the "scholarship boy" to make sense of his own experi-
ence) as it is suggested by Rodriguez's references to Hoggart's text (Ways
of Reading 520-21). The question for students is in what ways Rodriguez's
use of Hoggart in the writing of his essay resembles the use a "scholar-
ship boy" might make of the sayings of his teacher. Is Rodriguez being
"an imitative and unoriginal pupil" in relying as he does on Hoggart?

I like the way this assignment first of all engages students in explor-
ing how writers can establish relationships differing in authority by how
they incorporate the texts of others into their own. The appropriateness
of direct quotations, indirect quotations, and terms is explored not in
terms of "right/wrong" but in terms of kinds of textual authority. In
analyzing Rodriguez's use of Hoggart, students discover how a writer
negotiatesin the sense of both navigating and bargainingthe author-
ity he grants to another and that which he transfers to or assumes him-
self. That analysis itself involves students in the kind of "close" reading
of texts which I encourage for the kind of authority it allows them to
establish for themselves as writers. Discussion of students' written re-
sponses can focus on the students' own negotiation of such authority:
using the term and concept of the "scholarship boy" which they have
taken second-hand from Rodriguez, how do they establish their own
authority on the relationship between Rodriguez and Hoggart? The chal-
lenge of the assignment for students lies precisely in how they can posi-
tion themselves as authorities in relationship to not one but two prior
texts. It is that challenge which makes questions about the appropriate-
ness of such "mechanics" as quotation marks, quotations of quotations,
even the "exactness" of transcriptions, seem anything but mechanical.
Indeed, such questions address issues subtler than, but also co-exten-
sive with, such "larger" rhetorical concerns as the construction and in-
terplay of voice, audience, and representation of subject matter which
students presumably also have been addressing in their writing prac-
tice.

And negotiating. When I asked students in a basic writing class who
had just read Rodriguez's Hunger of Memory to write an essay in which
they tried to make sense of Rodriguez's statement that "education is a
long, unglamorous, even demeaning processa nurturing never natu-
ral to the person one was before one entered a classroom" (Hunger of
Memory 68), and reminded them to "use references to specific incidents
and statements Rodriguez makes throughout his book to help us under-
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stand what leads you to interpret his book and the quoted passage as
you do," a student wrote as part of his response:

After reading Rodriguez's autobiography, I too get the feeling of
disappointment, a feeling of disrespect towards his education and
what it has done to him. I think that his education has separated
him from his past. When he first started school, he would shy away
from learning experiences and interacting with other kids. His bond
with his mother and father was extremely close (Aria). His Hispanic
culture was all that he knew and what he really loved. The outside
world, that of the gringos, was far away, distant and unfriendly. I
have nothing to back up my thoughts of it being unfriendly; it is just the
feeling I got when I read the book [my emphasis]. His Spanish made
him feel at home, comfortable, and most of all intimate with his
family. On page 18, he says, "Family language: my family's sounds.
The voices insisting: You belong here, we are family members. Re-
lated. Special to one another. Listen!"

What strikes me about this passage is that the student demonstrates not
only his awareness that some readers would demand something to "back
up" the feeling he has (and his ability to offer kinds of "back up") but
also his own unwillingness to deny responses not "authorized" by such
practices. In stating that he has no "back up" but still feels the way he
does, he is in effect negotiating with readers, explaining the conditions
under which he's arrived at his response and under which they will
have to consider its validity. He has moved from perceiving his role as a
writer being a person trapped in a set of arbitrary but unquestionable
rules to that of someone making deals, negotiating with readers about
what he thinks they might want, what he's willing to give, and what
he's looking for in return.

For students to imagine the kind of relationship between reader and
writer in which such "mechanical" notational practices as quotations
matter in more than "pedantic" ways is of course difficult. For them to
imagine that they can participate in such a relationship is daring. For
them to attempt to establish and alter such relationships through their
writing is both. But we can encourage our students to make such at-
tempts by teaching all aspects of writing, including editing, as negotia-
tions in which they can play a role and in which they have a stake.
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7 Professing Multiculturalism:
The Politics of Style in the
Contact Zone

Min-Zhan Lu

In her 1991 essay "Arts of the Contact Zone," Mary Louise Pratt points
out that while colleges and universities have increasingly deployed a
rhetoric of diversity in response to the insistence of nonmainstream
groups for fuller participation, the "import" of "multiculturalism" re-
mains "up for grabs across the ideological spectrum" (39). I begin with
Pratt's reminder because I want to call attention to the images of "grab-
bing" and "import." These depict "multiculturalism" as a construct
whose "import"meanings, implications, and consequencesis avail-
able only to those willing to expend the energy to "grab" it: to search,
envision, grasp, articulate, and enact it. And these images conjure up
the act of importingof bringing inperspectives and methods for-
merly excluded by dominant institutions. I want to articulate one "im-
port" of multiculturalism here by exploring the question of how to con-
ceive and practice teaching methods which invite a multicultural ap-
proach to style, particularly those styles of student writing which ap-
pear to be ridden with "errors." And I situate this question in the con-
text of English Studies, a discipline which, on the one hand, has often
proclaimed its concern to profess multiculturalism but, on the other hand,
has done little to combat the ghettoization of two of its own cultures,
namely composition teaching and student writing.

My inquiry is motivated by two concerns which I believe I share with
a significant number of composition teachers. The first results from a
sense of division between the ways in which many of us approach style
in theory and in our teaching practice. I have in mind teachers who are
aligned in theory with a view of composition which contests the separa-
tion of form and meaning and which also argues against a conception of
"academic discourse" as discrete, fixed, and unified. This alignment,
while generating a critical perspective toward traditional methods of
teaching style through drills in "correct usage," does not always result
in any immediate revision of such methods in classroom practice. Some
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of us tend to resolve this gap between theory and practice in one of two
ways: (1) we set aside a few weeks to teach "usage" or "copyediting" in
the traditional way while spending the rest of the term helping students
to revise their work on a more conceptual level; or, (2) we send students
who have "problems" with "usage" to the writing workshop. Such "reso-
lutions" often leave the teacher frustrated. Because she recognizes the
burden on those at the fringe of having to "prove" themselves to those
at the center by meeting the standards set by the latter, she cannot but
take seriously students' anxiety to master "correct" usage. Neverthe-
less, she is aware that instead of helping them to overcome such an anxi-
ety, her teaching strategies risk increasing it, as they may reinforce stu-
dents' sense of the discrepancy between their inability to produce "er-
ror-free" prose and their ability to come up with "good ideas," and they
may confirm these students' impression that only those who make "er-
rors" need to worry about issues of "usage" and "editing." My second
concern has to do with a division many of us feel between our role as
composition teachers and the role we play as students, teachers, or schol-
ars in other, supposedly more central areas of English Studies. As our
interest in composition teaching, theory, and research evolves, we are
increasingly interested in contesting the second-class status of work in
composition. At the same time, we are often all too aware that we our-
selves are guilty of perpetuating the divisions between composition and
other areas of English Studies by approaching the writings of "begin-
ners" or "outsiders" in a manner different from the approach we take to
the writings of "experts."

Two stories, both of which took place around the turn of this century,
illustrate part of the historical power of that kind of division. The first
story comes from Gertrude Stein's The Autobiography of Alice B. Toklas.
According to Stein, right after she had made arrangements to have her
book Three Lives printed by Grafton Press of New York, "a very nice
American young man" was sent by the press to Paris to check on her:

You see, [the young man] said slightly hesitant, the director of the
Grafton Press is under the impression that perhaps your knowledge
of english. But I am an american, said Gertrude Stein indignantly.
Yes yes I understand that perfectly now, he said, but perhaps you
have not had much experience in writing. I suppose, said [Stein]
laughing, you were under the impression that I was imperfectly
educated. He blushed, why no, he said, but you might not have had
much experience in writing. Oh yes, she said, oh yes. . . . and you
might as well tell [the director] ... that everything that is written in
the manuscript is written with the intention of its being so written
and all he has to do is to print it and I will take the responsibility.
The young man bowed himself out. (68)
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This exchange between an indignant Stein and an embarrassed "young
man" reveals some of the criteria used by "educated America" when
dealing with an idiosyncratic style. These criteria are: (a) the writer 's
"knowledge of English," which is seen as somehow dependent on
whether she is a native speaker, and (b) the writer 's "experience in writ-
ing," which is seen as related to whether she has been lim]perfectly
educated." Stein, an "American" bearing certification of a "perfect" edu-
cation from Radcliffe and Johns Hopkins Medical School, knew she had
the authority to maintain that everything in her manuscript was "writ-
ten with the intention of its being so written." Stein's indignation and
the embarrassment she elicited from the "young man" suggest that in
the early 1900s, ethnic and educational backgrounds were two common
denominators for determining whether style represented self-conscious
and innovative experimentation or blundering "errors."

The second story took place a few years prior to the Stein event, when
the style of another writer, Theodore Dreiser, was also questioned by a
publisher to whom he had submitted his first novel, Sister Carrie. The
rejection letter from Harper faults Dreiser for his "uneven" style which,
according to the editors, was "disfigured by colloquialisms" (Sister Car-
rie 519). Existing manuscripts of the book's revision indicate that Dreiser
did not defend his style with the kind of authority Stein exhibited. In-
stead he sought editorial help from his wife Jug and friend Henry be-
cause he deemed both to have been better educated than himself. There
is evidence in the revised manuscript that Dreiser adopted nearly all of
Jug's corrections of grammar and Henry's rewording of his Germanic
rhythms and cumulative sentence structures (Sister Carrie 580-81). Read
in the context of Stein's story, Dreiser 's willingness to have all aspects of
his style "corrected" might be attributed to his acute awareness of the
criteria used by "educated America" when dealing with the writing of
the son of an impoverished German immigrant with extremely sporadic
formal education. The early reception of Sister Carrie proves the validity
of Dreiser's concern, as even its defenders attributed its "crude" style to
his ethnic background and lack of formal education.'

Almost a century after these events, more and more English courses
are now informed by a view of language as a site of struggle among
conflicting discourses with unequal sociopolitical power. Students in
these courses are beginning to approach the style of what they call "real"
writers like Stein and Dreiser very differently. Interest in multiculturalism
has also shifted the attention of some teachers to writers' success at what
Bakhtin calls "dialogically coordinating" a varied and profound
"heteroglossia" (295-96). Analysis of style in these classrooms often cen-
ters on the politics of the writer 's stylistic decisions: (a) mapping the
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"heteroglossia" on the internal and external scenes of writing, (b) at-
tending to the writer's effort to look at one discourse through the eyes
of another, and (c) considering the writer 's willingness to resist the cen-
tripetal forces of "official" discourses. Viewed from this multicultural
perspective on style, the writings of both Dreiser and Stein could be
considered in terms of the efforts of each to dialogically coordinate the
profound heteroglossia within and outside official "educated" dis-
courses. For readers adopting this perspective, neither Dreiser's ethnic
background nor his "imperfect" educational background would be used
to dismiss his "uneven" style solely as evidence of "error"that is, to
conclude that his style merely reflects his lack of knowledge or experi-
ence in writing. In fact, given the frequency with which writings from
what Gloria Anzalchia has called the "borderlands" are being currently
assigned in some English courses and the praise this type of writing
receives for its hybridization of "official" discourses, Dreiser 's readi-
ness to yield to the authority of the "better educated" now appears "con-
servative"indicating a passive stance toward the hegemony of ethno-
centrism and linguistic imperialism. In fact, the publication of the Penn-
sylvania edition of Sister Carrie in 1987 indicates that such a critical view
privileging resistance was in operation when the editors decided to de-
lete many of the changes made by the "better educated" Jug and Henry
in the hope of preserving the "power and forcefulness" of Dreiser 's origi-
nal prose (Sister Carrie 581).

However, Dreiser 's reaction still haunts me, especially when I move
from teaching students to analyze the idiosyncratic style of "real" writ-
ers to helping them to work on their own styles. In my "literature" courses
for junior- or senior-level college students or "writing" courses for first-
year students, students learn to talk with considerable eloquence about
the politics of stylistic decisions made by "real" writers, especially those
writing from the borderlands by choice and/or necessity. Most of the
readings I assign for these classes call attention to writers' need and
right to contest the unifying force of hegemonic discourses, and thus
make Dreiser 's submission to the authority of the "better" educated
appear dated and passive. Yet the meaning of Dreiser's submissiveness
changes for me and most of my students as soon as we move to work on
the style of a student writer, especially when we tinker with what we
call the writer 's "discursive voice": that is, when dealing with devia-
tions in diction, tone, voice, structure and so on (which we loosely call
the "rhetorical register" of the writer's voice), or with punctuation, syn-
tax, sentence structure and so on (which we refer to as the "grammatical
register" of the writer 's voice). On those occasions, how to sound "right"
suddenly becomes a "real" concern for my students: pervasive, imme-
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diate, and difficult for me to dismiss. My students' apparent anxiety to
reproduce the conventions of "educated" English poses a challenge for
my teaching and research. Why is it that in spite of our developing abil-
ity to acknowledge the political need and right of "real" writers to ex-
periment with "style," we continue to cling to the belief that such a need
and right does not belong to "student writers"? Another way of putting
the question would be, why do we assumeas Dreiser didthat until
one can prove one's ability to produce "error-free" prose, one has not
earned the right to innovative "style"?

Again, I believe Dreiser's account of his own educational experience
might shed some light on the question. In Dawn, Dreiser writes about
his opportunity to attend the University of Indiana, Bloomington, for
two short terms. A former teacher made arrangements to exempt Dreiser
from the preliminary examinations because, Dreiser points out, these
exams would have quickly "debarred" him (342). Life as what we might
today call an open admissions student at Indiana made Dreiser feel "re-
duced." He "grieved" at his "inability to grasp . . . such a commonplace
as grammar" (378). Even though he knew he was able to apprehend
many things and to demonstrate his apprehensions "quite satisfacto-
rily" to himself, he found the curriculum "oppressive," leaving him
"mute" with "a feeling of inadequacy" (425). The events surrounding
the efforts of Dreiser and Stein to publish their first books indicate that
the common approach of the editors, publishers, and critics to their id-
iosyncratic styles was not coincidental. Dreiser 's experience at Indiana,
his willingness to have his "uneven" style "corrected," and Stein's quick
rebuttal to the "young man" all point to the institutional source of this
approach. A common view of "style" as belonging only to those who
are beyond "error," and a certain type of college curriculum treating
matters of grammar or usage as the prerequisites to higher education,
seem mutually reinforcing. It is this belief that pushes students identi-
fied as having "problems" to meet such "prerequisites" and assigns teach-
ers trained to deal with such "problems" to the periphery or border-
lands of higher education.

Dreiser 's memories of Indiana seem symptomatic of the feelings of a
significant number of college students I encounter. I have in mind par-
ticularly students who seem quick to admit that they are "not good" at
writing because they have been identified at some point in their educa-
tion as needing specialremedial, laboratory, or intensiveinstruction
in the "basics." Like Dreiser, they are frustrated at their inability to grasp
"grammar" because they have been encouraged to view it as "such a
commonplace"something everyone who aspires to become anyone
ought to be able to master. And they feel muted and reduced by the

it 8



Professing Multiculturalism: The Politics of Style in the Contact Zone 171

curriculum because it does not seem to recognize that they are quite
able to grasp subjects other than "grammar" and demonstrate their un-
derstanding of such subjects satisfactorily to themselves, if perhaps not
in writing to others. It seems to me that one way of helping students to
deal with this frustration would be to connect their "difficulties" with
the refusal of "real" writers to reproduce the hegemonic conventions of
written English. And it seems to me that this will not take place until
teachers like myself contest the distinction between "real" and "student"
writers and stop treating the idiosyncratic style of the not-yet "perfectly
educated" solely in terms of "error." One form of contestation could be
to apply to student writing the same multicultural approach we have
been promoting when analyzing the work of "real" writers. Susan Miller
has argued in Textual Carnivals that the tendency to treat student writers
as "emerging, or as failed, but never as actually responsible 'authors"
has served to maintain the low status of composition studies in its rela-
tions to those "outside it, and its self-images and ways of working out
its new professionalization" (196, 195). An approach to student writing
that treats students as real writers would undo such binaries and thus
assert the right and ability of writing teachers and students to fully par-
ticipate in a truly "multi-cultural" curriculum.

My aim here is to discuss a teaching method formulated out of my
attempt to apply a multicultural approach to student writing. The class-
room I envision intersects with various models of teaching writing as
"repositioning" or models that treat the writing classroom as a "border-
land."' One central aspect of this type of "border pedagogy" is its con-
cern to treat meaning as resulting from the writer 's effort to negotiate a
position in response to multiple and often conflicting forces, discursive
as well as social and historical. Border pedagogy contests a before/after
frame of mind, the belief that until a writer has proven her competency
in Englishi.e., learned to produce "error-free" proseshe has not
earned the right to experiment with critical thinking or innovative style.
It critiques the ethnocentric cast to such a belief, viewing it as speaking
more to the anxiety of those in power to control who has the right to
tamper with something called "our" culture than to some kind of "es-
sence" in student writing.' To various degrees, border pedagogies present
the classroom as a potential "contact zone." Border pedagogies contest
an either/or approach to the individual's relationship with conflicting
cultures. Instead, they foreground students' needs, rights, and abilities
to approximate, negotiate, and revise "official" cultural rules.

In arguing for a multicultural approach to styles traditionally dis-
placed to the realm of "error," I align my teaching with a tradition in
"error" analysis which views even "error-ridden" student writings as
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texts relevant to critical approaches available to English Studies. I have
in mind here research using theories of the production of meaning to
conceptualize the action of a student/writer in the process of compos-
ing an idiosyncratic style and reception theories to map the action of a
teacher or student reader in the process of speculating on the causes and
revisions of nonconventional style(s).4 I am particularly interested in
explicitly foregrounding the category of "resistance" and "change" when
helping students to conceptualize the processes of producing and inter-
preting an idiosyncratic style in students' own writings. In the class-
room I envision, the notion of "intention" is presented as the decision of
a writer who understands not only the "central role of human agency"
but also that such agency is often "enacted under circumstances not of
one's choosing" (West 31). I define the writer's attempt to "reproduce"
the norms of academic discourses as necessarily involving the re-pro-
ductionapproximating, negotiating, and revisingof these norms.
And I do so by asking students to explore the full range of choices and
options, including those excluded by the conventions of academic dis-
courses.

These aspects in the classroom I envision inevitably distance it from
classrooms influenced by one belief prevalent in ESL courses or courses
in "Basic Writing": namely, that a monolingual environment is the most
conducive to the learning of "beginners" or "outsiders." This belief over-
looks the dialogical nature of students' "inner voices" as well as the
multicultural context of students' lives. The classroom I envision also
differs from approaches to students' ambivalence toward the effects of
education exemplified by Mina Shaughnessy's Errors and Expectations.
Shaughnessy convincingly shows the relevance to error analysis of a
range of feelings common to students likely to be identified as basic
writers: their anxiety to "sound academic" and to self-consciously emu-
late the formal style (194), their low self-esteem as learners and writers,
and their sense of ambivalence toward academic discourse. But as I have
argued in "Conflict and Struggle," Shaughnessy's goal in acknowledg-
ing students' ambivalence is only to help them dissolve it (904-6). Be-
cause this ambivalence arises from sources well beyond the classroom
coming from the unequal power relationships pervading the history,
culture, and society my students live innot all students can or even
want to get rid of all types of ambivalence. On the contrary, the experi-
ences of writers like Gloria Anzaldda, bell hooks, and Mike Rose sug-
gest that, appropriately mobilized, a sense of ambivalence might be put
to constructive uses in writing.

At the same time, the sort of resistance I want to promote differs from
the kind underlying romantic celebrations of students' "right to their



Professing Multiculturalism: The Politics of Style in the Contact Zone 173

own language," celebrations that operate on a view of students as "free
agents." Unlike such celebrations, resistance in border pedagogy rejects
both the notion of social and historical determinism that would enforce
a particular style as the inevitable, only possible style for students to
pursue, on the one hand, and, on the other, the notion of the free will of
a freely choosing subject. It instead encourages student writers to chal-
lenge the either/or positions to conflicting cultures promoted by the
hegemonic in the current-day United States and it insists, in the words
of Cornel West, that "openness to othersincluding the mainstream
does not entail wholesale co-optation, and group autonomy is not group
insularity" (33).

To foreground the concepts of "resistance" and "change" when ana-
lyzing the styles of a student or "real" writer, I ask students to read de-
viations from the official codes of academic discourses not only in rela-
tion to the writer's knowledge of these codes but also in terms of her
efforts to negotiate and modify them. Aside from increasing the student's
knowledge of and experience in reproducing these official forms, I am
most interested in doing three things: (1) enabling students to hear dis-
cursive voices which conflict with and struggle against the voices of
academic authority; (2) urging them to negotiate a position in response
to these colliding voices; and (3) asking them to consider their choice of
position in the context of the sociopolitical power relationships within
and among diverse discourses and in the context of their personal life,
history, culture, and society.

Because of the tendency in English Studies to ghettoize the culture of
composition, I will use some student writing produced in writing courses
for first-year students to illustrate how I would actually go about teach-
ing a multicultural approach to style. And I am going to focus on fea-
tures .of writing styles which are commonly displaced to the realm of
"error" and thus viewed as peripheral to college English teaching. In
using these rather than other types of examples, I hope to illustrate as
well the need to view composition as a site which might inform as well
as be informed by our effort to profess multiculturalism in other, sup-
posedly more "advanced" and "central" areas of English Studies.
Bartholomae has recently reminded us that there is no need "to import
'multiple cultures' [into the classroom, via anthologies]. They are there,
in the classroom, once the institution becomes willing to pay that kind
of attention to student writing" ("Tidy House" 14-15). Such attention,
he explains, could produce composition courses in multiculturalism "that
worked with the various cultures represented in the practice of its stu-
dents" ("Tidy House" 14). My second reason for using these examples is
related to the ways in which conflict and struggleimportant aspects
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of life in the contact zonehave been perceived by teachers specializ-
ing in error analysis. These teachers tend to hear arguments
foregrounding conflict and struggle in the classroom as sloganeering
"students' right to their own language" in order to eliminate attention
to error, or as evidence of a "PC" attack on the "back to basics" move-
ment (see, for example, Traub). The examples I use here, I hope, will
demonstrate a way of teaching which neither overlooks the students'
potential lack of knowledge and experience in reproducing the domi-
nant codes of academic discourses nor dismisses the writer's potential
social, political, and linguistic interest in modifying these codes, with
emphasis on the word "potential."

When teaching first-year writing classes, I usually introduce the
multicultural approach to student writing style around the mid-point of
the term, when I feel that students are beginning to apply to their actual
practices a view of writing as a process of re-seeing. To present the
writer's experimentation with style (including what is generally called
"copyediting" or the "correction of error") as an integral part of the re-
vision process, I look for sample student writings with two characteris-
tics. First, I am interested in writings with the kinds of "error" a major-
ity of the class would feel they can easily "spot" and "fix." This type of
writing allows me to acknowledge some potential causes of
nonconventional styles and effective methods of revising them which
are more widely disseminated in traditional writing classrooms and
workshops and more familiar to most students. Second, I look for styles
which are also more conducive to my attempt to help the writer to nego-
tiate a new position in relation to the colliding voices active in the scenes
of writing.'

Following is a handout I have used when teaching first-year compo-
sition classes. The two segments on the handout are from the papers
one student wrote in response to two assignments, one asking her to
discuss an essay, "From a Native Daughter," by Haunani-Kay Trask,
and another asking her to comment on the kind of "critical thinking"
defined in the "Introduction" to an anthology called Rereading America.
For the convenience of discussion in this essay, I have added emphasis
to the handout:

Segment One:
As a Hawaiian native historian, Trask can able to argue for her people.
As a Hawaiian native, she was exposed to two totally different view-
points about her people. She was brought up in Hawaii. During
this time, she heard the stories about her people from her parents.
Later on she was send to America mainland to pursue higher edu-
cation, in which she learnt a different stories about her people. There-
fore, she understood that the interpretation of land was different
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between the "haole" and the native. To prove that the "haole" were
wrong, she went back to Hawaii and work on the land with other
native, so she can feel the strong bond with land her people have
which the "haole" could not feel. The "haole" historians never bother
to do so as they were more interested in looking for written evi-
dence. That was why Trask, as a native Hawaiian historian, argued
that these "haole" historians were being ignorant and ethnocentric.
That is also why Trask suggested the "haole" historians learn the
native tongue.

***

Segment Two:
Elements like perceiving things from different perspective, finding
and validating each alternative solutions, questioning the unknown
and breaking the nutshell of cultural norms are important for de-
veloping the ability of "critical thinking." . . .

Most of the new universities' students are facing new challenges
like staying away from family, peer pressure, culture shock, heavy
college work etc. I can say that these are the "obstacles" to success.
If a student can able to approach each situation with different per-
spectives than the one he brought from high school, I may conclude
that this particular student has climbed his first step to become a
"critical thinker." . . .

However, there is one particular obstacle that is really difficult for
almost everyone to overcome, that is the cultural rules. From the
textbook, I found that cultural rules are deep rooted in our mind
and cause us to view things from our respective cultural viewpoint.
Even though cultural values lead the way of life of a particular group
of people, they blind us as well. I relate to this because I truly be-
lieve that the cultural rules of my country, Malaysia, make my life
here difficult. In order to achieve a "critical mind," one should try
to break from his own cultural rules.

***

"can," verb:
1. to be able to; have the ability, power, or skill to. 2. to know how to.
3. to have the power or means to. 4. to have the right or qualifica-
tions to. 5. may; have permission to. (The Random House Dictionary)

" able," adjective:
1. having necessary power, skill, resources, or qualifications; quali-
fied: able to lift a trunk; . . . able to vote. (The Random House Dictio-
nary)

When using this handout to initiate a multicultural reading/writing, I
am most concerned to give students a sense of how to go about map-
ping a contact zoneusing a piece of writing to generate diverse inter-
pretations, each viewed as a socially constructed form of reading enact-
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ing discursive stances or voices endorsed by particular cultural sites,
and revising that text in the context of that contact zoneenacting a
process of re-writing in which each student negotiates with the diverse
stances or voices the class has constructed during the discussion.

I usually begin by asking students what particularly about the two
segments might be said to make the voice of the writer idiosyncratic.
My students in both writing and literature classes have been fairly quick
in tracing it to the "can able to" structure in the two segments. Then I
ask the class to speculate on potential causes of that idiosyncrasy. Stu-
dents' responses to this question usually go something like this: here is
a "foreign" speaker, a student from Malaysia, trying to use the English
idiom "to be able to" and ending up with an "error." So we usually talk
a little bit about the difference in grammatical function between the verb
"can" and the verb "to be" in relation to the adjective "able." And I de-
scribe the writer's own initial interpretation of the cause of this "error":
her native language is Chinese. With the help of a workshop tutor, she
had realized that the Chinese translation for both "can" and "be able to"
is the same. When using the expression "be able to," she would be think-
ing in Chinese. As a result, she often ended up writing "can able to." I
would refer to her own initial reading because I am interested in com-
plicating but not denying the relationship between style and the writer's
knowledge of and experience with the conventions of written English.
So I try to acknowledge first that exposure to and practice in reproduc-
ing the "be able to" structure could be one of the ways to revise these
segments.

I then go on to complicate this approach by also calling attention to
the relationship between form and meaning. What might be the differ-
ence in meaning between "can," "be able to," and "can able to"? Most of
the students I have encountered tend to see "can" as interchangeable
with "be able to." To them, "can able to" appears redundant, like a double
negative. To problematize this reading, I usually call attention to the
two dictionary entries included in the handout, especially to definition
5 under "can." Definition 5 opens up a new reading by presenting the
word "can" as having one more meaning than "to be able to." Rather
than approaching the issue of ability from the perspective of what an
individual possesses, definition 5 approaches it from the perspective of
the external forces permitting something, as in the verb "may."

Most native English speakers among my students tend to argue that
in actual usage, only grandmas and schoolteachers make the distinction
between "can" and "may." Everyone uses "can" and "be able to" inter-
changeably nowadays. In response, I tell them the writer's position on
the issue. She was aware of the distinctionshe was the one who first
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called my attention to definition 5. At this point, a "contact zone" would
begin to take shape with three conflicting positions on the meanings of
"can" and "able to": the position of a speaker of idiomatic English, the
position of the dictionary, and the position of a "foreign" student writer.
Since the "foreign" student writer is here being cast as that of someone
lacking knowledge and expertise in formal and idiomatic English and
thus the least powerful of the three, I am most interested in furthering
the students' existing construction of that position so it is not so easily
silenced.

To that end, I pose the question of whether, read in the context of the
two segments in the handout, one might argue that the "can" in the two
"can able to" structures does not take on the same meaning as the other
uses of "can" in the rest of the segments. This line of inquiry usually
leads us to compare the meaning of the "can" in the first sentence in
Segment One to the two "can's" in the seventh sentence and to the mean-
ing of the "can" in the "can able to" in Segment Two as well as the "can"
in the previous sentence or the "may" in the second half of the same
sentence. My aim here is to get students to re-construct the voice of the
writer by focusing on the various uses of the word "can" in the two
segments. When exploring the question, I also try to direct attention to
the passive voice (Trask was "brought up in Hawaii" and "send to
America mainland to pursue higher education") in the sentences fol-
lowing the statement "Trask can able to argue for her people." I explore
with the class how and why this passive voice might be read as indicat-
ing that the student writer is approaching Trask's ability from the per-
spective of the external circumstances of Trask's lifeusing "can" in the
sense of her having the "permission to" become a native Hawaiian his-
torianas well as from the perspective of her having the qualifications
to argue as an historian. The two uses of "can" in sentence seven, how-
ever, present Trask's and the "haole" historians' (in)ability to "feel" the
Hawaiian's bond with the land as more related to a person's will and
attitude rather than to whether each "may"has the permission to
learn the Hawaiian language or work with the people. ("The 'haole' his-
torians never bother to do so.") Similarly, in the second segment, the
"can" in "a student can able to adopt different perspectives," when read
in the context of the writer's discussion of the difficulties for "everyone
to overcome" the "obstacle" of cultural rules and of her own experience
of that difficulty, again foregrounds the role of external conditions and
their effect on one's ability to do something. In that sense, this "can" is
closer in meaning to the "may" in "I may conclude," a conclusion pre-
sented as depending more on the action of someone else than on the
ability of the "I" drawing the conclusion. At the same time, this "can" is
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different from the "can" in the "I can say . . ." since the latter seems to
depend on the ability of the speaker to name the situations as "obstacles"
rather than on whether or not the speaker has permission to so name
them.

In getting the class to enact a "close reading" of the two segments, I
aim to shift attention to the relationship between a discursive form, "can
able to," and the particular meanings it might be said to create in par-
ticular contexts. As a result, a new question often surfaces: What kind of
approach to "ability" is enacted by a speaker of idiomatic English who
sees "can" and "be able to" as completely interchangeable in meaning?
In exploring this question, students have mentioned popular sayings
such as "if there is a will, there is a way"; TV shows such as Mr. Rogers'
Neighborhood which teach viewers to believe "everyone is special," pos-
sessing unique qualities; and various discourses promoting the power
of positive thinking. Students begin to perceive the way in which a com-
mon treatment of "can" and "to be able to" as interchangeable in mean-
ing might be seen as contributing to a popular American attitude to-
ward the transcendental power of the individual. Once we locate these
conflicting approaches to the notion of ability, it becomes clear that the
revision or "correction" of the "can able to" in these two segments can
no longer take place simply at the level of linguistic form. It must also
involve a writer 's negotiating a position in relation to value systems
with unequal social power in the United States: one "popular" and the
others "alien," "dated," or "formal" but critical. Once this structural
"error" is contextualized in conflicting attitudes toward a belief in the
transcendental power of the individual, the issue can no longer be merely
one's knowledge of or respect for the authorities of a dictionary English
versus colloquial English, or one's competency in a particular language,
but also one's alignment with competing discursive positions.

At this point, we will have mapped a contact zone with a range of
choices and options both among linguistic forms and discursive align-
ments. As we move on to the question of how each of us might revise
these two segments, I would make sure that each student further en-
larges this contact zone by taking into consideration the specific condi-
tions of her or his life. I would have already introduced my definition of
the "conditions of life" in previous assignments and class discussions, a
definition that includes a whole range of discursive sites, including that
of race, ethnicity, gender, sex, economic class, education, religion, re-
gion, recreation, and work. I also encourage each student to think about
"life" in terms of the life she has lived in the past, is living in the present,
and envisions for the future. Furthermore, I stress that decisions on how
to revise should also be related to each student's interpretation(s) of the
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two texts discussed in the segments. To summarize, the contact zone in
which the revision takes place would encompass the collision of at least
the following voices: the voice of a "foreign" student writer (as con-
structed by the class at the beginning of the discussion), the voice(s) of
the writer of the two segments (as constructed by the class discussion
resulting from a "close reading" of the various uses of "can"), the voice
of a dictionary, of a speaker of idiomatic English, the voices important
to the specific conditions of each student's life, the voice of a teacher,
and the voice emerging from each student's interpretation of the two
texts discussed in the two segments.

Since decisions on how to revise the "can able to" structure depend
on who is present, the particular ways in which the discussion unfolds,
and who is doing the revision, such decisions vary from class to class
ahd student to student. To illustrate the unpredictability of the outcome,
let me use two decisions made in two different courses, one by the origi-
nal writer of the two segments and one by another student whose na-
tive language is also Chinese. Like all other students in my class, during
the process of a "close reading" of the uses of "can" in these two seg-
ments, the original writer encountered a construction of her "voices"
which she may not have fully considered before the discussion. There-
fore, when revising the two segments, she too had to negotiate with
these forms of reading and constructions of voices. Upon reflecting on
the conditions of her life, she reviewed the attitude toward "ability"
promoted in the particular neighborhood in Malaysia where she grew
up. In view of that as well as of her own experience as a "daughter"
(especially her difficulties persuading her parents to let her rather than
only the "sons" go abroad for college), her current "difficulty" in adjust-
ing to the kind of "critical thinking" promoted in my classroom (which
she felt was the direct opposite of what she was told to do in her school-
ing back home), and her admiration of Trask's courage to "argue for her
people," the writer decided to foreground the relationship between in-
dividual ability and the conditions in which that ability "may" be real-
ized. With the help of her classmates, she came up with several options.
One was to add an "if" clause to a sentence using "be able to." Another
was to change "can able to" to "may be able to." One student suggested
that she use "can able to" and then tag a sentence to explain her reason-
ingher view of "ability." Among the suggestions, the writer picked
"may be able to" because, as she put it, it was clearly "grammatically
correct" and "says what I want to say." As the term progressed, one of
the students in the class used "can able to" playfully in a class discus-
sion, and others caught on. It became a newly coined phrase we shared
throughout the term.
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However, a Vietnamese American student whose home language is
also Chinese took a very different stance toward the hegemonic attitude
toward "ability" and for a quite different reason from what led some of
my American-born students to identify with the voice of an idiomatic
speaker. Using examples from his immigrant community, he argued for
the importance of believing in the capacity of the individual. He pointed
out that the emphasis on external conditions had made some people in
his community fatalistic and afraid to take up the responsibility to make
changes. According to him, there is a saying in classic Chinese similar to
"if there is a will, there is a way." His parents used it repeatedly when
lecturing him. So he was all for using "can" and "be able to" interchange-
ably to foreground the power of the individual. He hoped more people
in his community would adopt this outlook. Accordingly, his revision
changed "can able to" to "be able to." At the same time, he also changed
the passive voice in the sentences referring to Trask's childhood and
education in the first segment to the active voice, arguing that there is
enough basis in the essays to sustain that reading.

Given the frequency with which students opt for the voices of aca-
demic authority, I used to wonder if this kind of teaching is driven more
by my view of language as a site of struggle than by the needs of stu-
dents eager to internalize and reproduce the conventions of academic
discourse. My conclusion is: No, this process of negotiation is particu-
larly meaningful for students anxious to master the codes of academic
discourse, especially because their discursive practices are most likely
to have to take place in the kind of postmodern capitalist world critics
such as Fredric Jameson have characterized. Although the product, their
decision to reproduce the code, might remain the same whether it is
made with or without a process of negotiation, the activities leading to
that decision, and thus its significance, are completely different. With-
out the negotiation, their choice would be resulting from an attempt to
passively absorb and automatically reproduce a predetermined form.
In such cases, the student would perceive different discourses, to bor-
row from Bakhtin, as belonging to different, fixed, and indisputable
"chambers" in her consciousness and in society. And she would evalu-
ate her progress by the automatism with which she was able to move in
and out of these "chambers." If and when this student experienced some
difficulty mastering a particular code, she would view it as a sign of her
failure as a learner and writer.

On the other hand, if the student's decision to reproduce a code re-
sults from a process of negotiation, then she would have examined the
conflict between the codes of Standard English and other discourses.
And she would have deliberated not only on the social power of these
colliding discourses but also on who she was, is, and aspires to be when
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making this decision. If the occasion arises in the future when she expe-
riences difficulty in reproducing a particular code, as it very likely will,
her reaction would be much more positive and constructive. Aside from
tracing it to her knowledge and experience, she would also contextualize
her difficulty in the power struggle within and among cultures impor-
tant to her life. To borrow from my Malaysian student, she would be
thinking in terms of not only whether she is able to but also whether she
"can able to" reproduce it. Furthermore, having participated in processes
of negotiation in class, she would have some idea of how to go about
coping with her difficulty.

Learning to work on style in the contact zone is also useful for those
students interested in exploring ways of resisting the unifying force of
"official" discourse. First, it can help students hear a range of choices
and options beyond the confines of their immediate life. Second, negoti-
ating as a group gives them the distance they need but might not have
when dealing with their own writing in isolation. Therefore, devoting a
few class periods to familiarizing students with this approach to style
can be fruitful, especially if students are asked to theorize their action
afterward by reflecting on its strengths and limitations. Once I feel that
the students have a sense of how to go about enacting such a process, I
encourage them to practice the method on their own, and I use
conferencing and workshops to help individual students further that
line of exploration.

Obviously, one of the challenges for such a teaching method is that
one can only project but not predict a class discussion on the basis of the
chosen sample. In fact, life in the contact zone is by definition dynamic,
heterogeneous, and volatile. Bewilderment and suffering as well as rev-
elation and exhilaration are experienced by everyone, teacher and stu-
dents, at different moments. No one is excluded, no one is safe (Pratt,
"Arts" 39). Therefore, learning to become comfortable in making blun-
ders is central to this type of teaching. In fact, there is no better way to
teach students the importance of negotiation than by allowing them the
opportunity to watch a teacher work her way through a chancy and
volatile dialogue. Seemingly simple markers such as skin color, native
tongue, ethnic heritage or nationality can neither prescribe nor pre-script
the range of voices likely to surface. How to voice and talk to rather
than speaking for or about the voices of the "other" within and among
cultures is thus not a question which can be resolved prior to or outside
of the process of negotiation. Rather, it must remain a concern guiding
our action as we take part in it.

At the same time, the teacher's willingness to enter a process of dy-
namic negotiation does not mean she cannot explore ahead of time the
kind of voices she might want to introduce into the dialogue or the type
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of discursive sites in which she might want the student to situate the act
of re-vision. Neither does it mean that she would not have to take it
upon herself to urge and guide the student writer to engage in dialogue
with the voices emerging from that site or to take a socially responsible
position in relation to these conflicting voices. I'll use two more examples
to illustrate how I would plan a tutorial with a student. The following
are segments from a student's folder:

Segment One
Rodriguez father was a working man. From the passage it seems like
his father had a very good paying job, else how could they afford to
live in the neighborhood the did. Rodriguez also attended a catho-
lic school. Since this a private school it takes a little bit of money to
attend these types schools. So I feel his family was financially stable.

Segment Two
Education played a large part in Rodriguez life. Rodriguez couldn't
get enough education. . . .

Rodriguez urge to learn so despertly he became a scholarship boy. Al-
ways looking for new things to read. He practically shut his parents
off. . . . He would come home after school and just read all day.

Rodriguez wanted to be so much like his teachers. He thought if he
read and took notes, memorized the books major themes, he would
becme as smart as his teachers.

When reviewing this student's writing, I noticed the recurrence of sev-
eral patterns, such as his way of indicating the possessive case and a
tendency to drop the copulae, as illustrated by the parts I have high-
lighted in the two segments above. I would enter these segments (with-
out the emphasis) on the computer screen to focus the tutorial with this
student. Using these segments, I would plan to help him see copyediting
as an integral part of the revision process and to revise these in a contact
zone which I would help him construct by asking him to recall and then
re-view what he is trying to say in the original. Because there are enough
references in one of his papers to suggest that this writer is an African
American who grew up speaking a version of English very different
from the kind of written English he encountered at school, I would be
concerned to familiarize this writer with the conventions of academic
English. To that end, I would spend a part of the tutorial finding out his
knowledge of the difference between the conventions of his home dia-
lect and written English and the levels of identification he habitually
enacts with these discourses when speaking and when writing both in-
side and outside college classrooms. In the process, I would hope to
help him map out a contact zone that would include the voices of a

201



Professing Multiculturalism: The Politics of Style in the Contact Zone 183

dialect speaker as he constructs it when examining the discourse of home,
the voices of a speaker of Standard English as I project it and as he de-
picts it, the voices of a writer of Standard English (as envisioned by him
and by me), and the voices of the "I" of these two segments (as we con-
struct it through re-reading the segments).

More specifically, as Bartholomae recommends, I would help him cre-
ate an "oral reconstruction of the written text" by asking him to read the
segments aloud ("Study" 266). I would call attention to the potential
difference between the voice "reading for meaning," from "top down"
("Study" 263) and the voice of a reader/writer of Standard English, as
enacted by me when reading the segments. If doing so suggests that his
ways of handling the possessive case and the copulae might be related
to "dialect interference," then we would spend some time talking about
the difference in the use of copulae and structure of the possessive cases
in the spoken languages he uses and in the written English I practice.
And we would spend some time experimenting with ways of revising
Segment One by negotiating with the forms we have located in these
discourses.

But to complicate this reading of his style, I'd then turn his attention
to the sentence in Segment Two: "Rodriguez urge to learn so despertly he
became a scholarship boy." Mary Epes has suggested that students need
to treat the process of "encoding" as completely different from the pro-
cess of "composing" (31). However, I would choose to focus on this sen-
tence precisely because revision of its "form," its "encoding," cannot be
separated from its "content." I would first ask the writer to recall what
he was trying to say when writing the sentence. I would type into the
computer what he says so we might later come back to it. Then I would
provide him with two sentences I came up with when trying to "trans-
late" his sentence into the kind of English I use when writing:

(1) Rodriguez's urge to learn was so desperate that he became a
scholarship boy.

(2) Rodriguez was urged to learn so desperately that he became a
scholarship boy.

And I would ask him which of my interpretations of what he might be
trying to say seemed more acceptable to him at this point, if either. Given
what he wrote in his paper, which he pretty much summarized with the
sentences I have included here, I suspect he would choose the first one.
If so, we would use it to construct the voice of a writing teacher and
explore how its structure and meaning were different from and/or in-
tersected with the other voices we had mapped out so far. These would
include the voice of the writer he has constructed when recalling his
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"intention" and the voices I would also have him construct with the
question of how he might put it if he were saying or writing about the
same thing to a family member, a peer in his neighborhood, or a fellow
student close to him. And I'd urge him to experiment with different ways
of revising the original text by taking different positions in relation to
these voices.

Finally, I would also explain to him my reasons for coming up with
the second sentence. One of the benefits of doing so is to familiarize him
with the ways in which a reader like myself goes about "seeing" a sen-
tence: the attention I give to the adverb form of the word "desperately,"
which led me to speculate that he may be using the word "urge" as a
verb. This approach brings up the question of whether Rodriguez is the
subject or the object of the "urge." This question, I would add, leads me
to think that although in the context of his paper, neither possibility makes
sense, in the context of Rodriguez's book, at least as I read it, the passive
voice might actually make sense. So our discussion might turn to cer-
tain aspects of the book and his interpretations of these aspects, which
he might not have considered so far in his writings. The purpose here
would be to help him see experimentation with style as a way of gener-
ating meaning in a process of rereading and rewriting. Throughout the
tutorial, I would also be focusing my energy on urging him to contest
the boundaries set by the sentences I offered and by the versions he has
come up with while also making sure that he does not lose sight of the
politics of his decision in the context of the conditions of his life.

Here is another sentence I have selected from the writing of a student
who has a tendency to use a "there are could be" structure:

There are could be many students who could claim that they re-
member how education had changed their family life.

When working on this feature in his style, I'd begin by asking the stu-
dent to read the sentence aloud. If he stumbles over the "are could be"
or edits out the "could be" in orally reconstructing the sentence, I would
ask him to talk about why he decided to do so, both in terms of meaning
and form. Then I would ask him to consider the extent to which his
"reading" speaks for or deviates from what he had in mind in writing in
order to acknowledge, as Tricomi has argued, that reading aloud is one
method for revision (264). But unlike Tricomi, who is mainly concerned
that the revision "conforms" to the student's "intended meaning," I
would also be interested in using the voice established in the first revi-
sion as a point of departure to initiate a process of negotiation. That is,
I'd then proceed to introduce new voices by asking the student to ex-
periment with new ways of revising the sentence. For example, I could
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ask him to consider the possibility of deleting the word "are" instead of
the phrase "could be." We would then discuss the change in form by
comparing the third version with the first and second, and we'd move
on to consider the change in meaning between the second and third. To
help him imagine more voices, I might suggest we try ways of retaining
both "are" and "could be" in the sentence, leading him to come up with
sentences such as "There are (could be?) many students who would. . . ."
or "There could be/have been many students who would. . . ." And I
would discuss with him the potential change in form and meaning in
each case. Having located a range of voices, I would encourage the stu-
dent to take a position among these diverse possibilities, taking into
consideration the arguments he has made in the rest of the paper, his
reading of Rodriguez's book, and especially the complex contexts of the
student's personal and social life. For example, I might ask him to con-
sider the following questions: how might his being a male, white, over
thirty, a full-time employee in "business," the first one in his family to
attend college, and a father of two children constrain his choice among
this range of voices? Why and how might he want to contest such con-
straints? (For instance, would his choice change if he were to look at the
issue from the point of view of his children rather than that of himself
and his parents? Would the gender of his children make any difference
to his choice?) In choosing a particular form of identification, which as-
pect of his life might be most affected? In what way?

On the other hand, I would be aware when planning for this tutorial
that it is also possible that when asked to read the sentence aloud, the
student would skip the "could be" (or "are") without showing any evi-
dence of being aware that he had done so (see Bartholomae, "Study"
261-63). Then the tutorial would take quite a different turn than the
scenario I have just projected. I could show him the sentence I'd jotted
down from the sentence he read and ask him to compare it with his
original sentence. Or I might ask him to listen to me read his original
sentence while silently comparing what I say with the sentence I'd jot-
ted down from his reading. One way or another, I'd be getting him to
locate the difference between his reading and mine so we could then
discuss why he skipped the phrase "could be" (or "are") but put it down
when writing. And we'd explore the potential change in form and mean-
ing resulting from each reading. To avoid overpowering his reading with
mine, I might also point to other sentences with "there are" or "could"
constructions in his papers and ask him to talk about why he did not
put down both in those cases. And I might ask him to experiment with
ways of cueing readers how they are supposed to consider only one of
the forms on the page when reading, even though both are on the page,
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such as coming up with a sentence like "There are (could be?). . . ." In
short, I would keep in mind that the actual negotiation would depend
on the particular responses this student writer put forward as well as by
my concerns as a teacher.

Needless to say, this type of teaching would work better when stu-
dents are also asked to try the same method when analyzing the style of
"real" writers so they understand that the "problems" they have with
style are shared by all writers. For example, when students in a first-
year writing course were reading Trask's essay "From a Native Daugh-
ter," I asked them to discuss or write about aspects of her style which
seemed to deviate from the style of other historians they had encoun-
tered. Several students observed that the paragraphs in Trask's essay
are shorter, including a series of one-sentence paragraphs with parallel
structures of "And when they wrote . . . , they meant . . ." (123-24).
Others were struck by the opening of Trask's essay, where she addresses
her audience directly and asks that they "greet each other in friendship
and love." She tells many more personal stories and uses fewer refer-
ences for support, and she uses the imagery of a lover to depict the role
of language. I urged them to examine these stylistic features in relation
to the particular stance Trask seems to have taken toward the conflict
between "haole" (white) culture and the native Hawaiian culture. Hav-
ing approached the writing of a "real" writer from the perspective of the
relationship between meaning, form, and social identifications, students
are likely to be more motivated in applying this perspective to their own
style and its revision.

At the same time, using a student paper to enact a negotiation in the
contact zone can create a sense of immediacy and a new level of mean-
ingfulness about abstract concepts discussed or enacted in the assigned
readings for students in "literature" and "critical theory" classes. For
example, the handout with the "can able to" construction can be used in
senior-level critical theory courses when discussing Bakhtin's notion of
"internal dialogism," Raymond Williams's concept of "structures of feel-
ing," Cornel West's "prophetic critics and artists of color," and "dense"
critiques of colonial discourse by such writers as Edward Said or Homi
K. Bhabha. In the process of re-vising the "can able to" structure in the
handout, in actively negotiating conflict in a contact zone, students in
literature and cultural critical theory courses can gain a concrete oppor-
tunity to test the theories of various critics against their own efforts to
practice them. This type of activity reduces the "alienation" undergradu-
ate students often experience when asked to "do" theory. Testing theo-
ries against their own writing practices can also enable students to be-
come more aware of the specific challenges such theories pose as well as
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the possibilities they open up for the individual writers committed to
practicing these viewpoints. This method can also be used in upper-
level literature courses when teaching such "borderland" literature as
Sandra Cisneros's short story "Little Miracles, Kept Promises" or Break-
ing Bread by Cornel West and bell hooks. Reading and revising a student
text, students can become more sensitive to the ways in which a "real"
writer negotiates her way through contending discourses. At the same
time, such reading and revision of their own writing allows students to
enter into dialogue with "real" writers as "fellow travellers," active learn-
ers eager to compare and contrast one another 's trials and triumphs.

One of the reactions to teaching style on the contact zone is fear that it
will keep students from wanting to learn the conventions of academic
discourse. My experience so far suggests that the unequal sociopolitical
power of diverse discourses exerts real pressures on students' stylistic
choices. After all, students choose to come to college, the choice of which
speaks volumes on that power. The need to write for professors who
grade with red pens circling all "errors" is also real for a majority of our
students in most classrooms outside English departments. Therefore,
although the process of negotiation encourages students to struggle with
such unifying forces, it does not and cannot lead them to ignore and
forget them. It acknowledges the writer 's right and ability to experi-
ment with innovative ways of deploying the codes taught in the class-
room. It broadens students' sense of the range of options and choices
facing a writer. But it does not choose for the students. Rather, it leaves
them to choose in the context of the history, culture, and society in which
they live.

Another reservation toward this type of teaching is that students who
cannot write a "coherent" sentence are not ready psychologically and
intellectually to participate in the kind of intricate reading/ writing re-
quired by such a pedagogy. When addressing this concern, I believe we
ought to focus our attention more on the teacher 's potential hesitance to
meet the challenge of living in the borderlands than on whether it truth-
fully reflects the ability of students to live there. Bartholomae has re-
cently made the grim observation that "Basic writers may be ready for a
different curriculum, for the contact zone and the writing it will pro-
duce, but the institution is not. . . . because of those of us who work in
basic writing, who preserve rather than question the existing order of
things" ("Tidy House" 15). Homer, discussing "border" approaches to
teaching Basic Writing, warns that the approach I am advocating "as-
sumes the shifting identity of both teachers and students, an assump-
tion with which few teachers or students are comfortable" ("Mapping"
47). But one might argue that life in the contact zone puts the teacher
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more than the students at a disadvantage, for it has always been the
privilege of the more powerful but never the right of those with "lower,"
"foreign," and/or "beginning" status to avoid the need to negotiate con-
flicts in their day-to-day existence. It seems to me that the feasibility of a
multicultural approach to style rests on the willingness of "us" to yield
the protection of "our" power provided by the code of the "objective,"
"civilized," "rational," "sophisticated" tone of voice.

At the same time, I am not suggesting that moments of consensus, or
time spent sharing our knowledge and experience in employing a par-
ticular voice, have no place in the sort of classroom I am promoting. As
Pratt cautions, to foreground the fact that no one is safe in the contact
zone does not necessarily mean we displace the use of "safe houses,"
social spaces where groups can constitute themselves as communities
with high degrees of trust and understanding ("Arts" 40). My main ar-
gument with teachers who claim that life in the contact zone is too con-
fusing and traumatic for our students is that classrooms which avoid
any sign of conflict and struggle turn themselves into nothing but "safe
houses" where "comfort" belies the complexity, instability, and volatil-
ity of life within and outside the classroom.

The question of how to articulate a multicultural approach to style
when analyzing the writings of student writers is particularly urgent
for those of us committed to professing a multicultural English Studies.
English Studies as a discipline has continually been energized by the
intrusion of "aliens." To borrow a metaphor from Stuart Hall in his read-
ing of the heritage of cultural studies, the house of English has been
broken into by "thiefs" on many nights (282). "Thiefs" as diverse as Af-
rican Americanists, feminists, and post-colonialists have managed not
only to interrupt but significantly transform the lifeway of the residents
of English. On the other hand (and I find this very disturbing), in spite
of such self-renewing changes, English has largely remained a site where
only its peripheral membersgraduate students, adjuncts, part-timers,
and junior facultyare regularly assigned to deal with the idiosyncratic
style of student writers. For those of us committed to a multicultural
lifeway who stand on the periphery of our discipline by choice and ne-
cessity, it is especially important to break the divisions between "errors"
and "style" and between approaches to the writings of "real" and stu-
dent writers. In turning the teaching of style when dealing with student
writing into a site where the pedagogical arts of the contact zone can be
explored, practiced, and theorized, we might claim for students and
teachers of what are called "basic skills" the right to actively participate
in constructing a truly multicultural curriculum.
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However, to approach the struggle over the import of multiculturalism
solely in terms of a conflict among critical and pedagogical theories with-
out taking into consideration the actual working conditions surround-
ing the effort of teachers to produce and implement such theories would
be grossly reducing both the complexity and contentiousness of life in
the contact zone. One of the "common sense" notions among teachers
of writing, especially those assigned to deal with the "basics," is that
"reasonable loads" ensuring "adequate time to fulfill" the multiple re-
sponsibilities of a writing teacher are still far from being a given where
most of us work, in spite of repeated position statements on these issues
from professional organizations like the Conference on College Compo-
sition and Communication and the National Council of Teachers of En-
glish ("Guidelines," "Statement"). Furthermore, our interest in and com-
mitment to theories of language and teaching are heavily constrained
by our sense of what "works" in the classroom on Monday morning,
which is itself inevitably related to conditions such as teaching loads,
course assignments, class size, assessment procedures, and the institu-
tional status of individual teachers. I point to these specific constraints
to emphasize what narratives of pedagogical theory such as this one
both can and cannot do. The actual conditions in which most of us work,
if we take them as givens, make teaching style as a process of negotia-
tion appear highly "irrelevant." The sheer demands on time and energy
such a pedagogy makes and the kind of one-on-one contact with stu-
dents it requires suggest that for a lot of us, it is not a pedagogy which
would "work" if not accompanied by drastic changes in our working
conditions. At the same time, from the perspective of theory and re-
search, it could also appear highly "relevant" if we consider the ways in
which it implicitly points to the need for "adequate time" and "reason-
able loads"changes in our existing working conditions to meet pro-
fessional guidelines. That is, this pedagogy could function as a relevant
voice in our negotiation with colleagues and administrators over the
conditions of our work because of its potential ability to mobilize the
institutional authority of "theory." Our sense of what "works" is always
related to our view of what is "realistic." Unfortunately, as Raymond
Williams points out, being "realistic" "probably more often means 'let
us accept the limits of this situation' (limits meaning hard facts, often of
power or money in their existing and established forms) than 'let us
look at the whole truth of this situation' (which can allow that an exist-
ing reality is changeable or is changing)" (Keywords 218). I take Williams
to be saying here that our sense of reality often fails to attend to the
dialectical relationship between the conceptual and the actual or between
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theory and practice. Rather, we tend to adopt a before-after frame of
mind, driven by our sense of the "hard facts." The overwhelming per-
vasiveness of the "limits" confronting our work often leads us to as-
sume that such "hard facts" form a stable and seamless net, a "thing"
existing independently of our thoughts and actions rather than dialecti-
cally related to them. It is in the interests of hegemonic forces that we
accept these "limits" as the preconditions of how we think and act and
thus that we occlude our attention from the changeable and changing.
For the same reason, it can only be in the interests of teachers and stu-
dents labeled "basic" by such hegemonic forces to explore and formu-
late theories which demand changes in existing limits to our working
conditions as well as to our thinking and action. To do so might often
mean self-consciously looking for institutional cracks and gaps where
such exploration is possible. It is important to keep in mind that the
emergence of a critical discourse alone cannot bring about the change it
promotes. However, it is also imperative that we recognize it as one of
the potential forces for envisioning and constructing the changeable and
changing. The two are not mutually exclusive from the perspective of
dialectics. I offer my narrative of why and how to teach style as a pro-
cess of negotiation in the hope that it serves as a comment on the need
for change in not only existing approaches to the style of "real" and
"basic" writers but also existing working conditions which "limit" our
interest in and commitment to approaches which question all "hard
facts."



Some Afterwords: Intersections
and Divergences

Bruce Homer

In various ways, the writings collected in this volume pose the question
of how a cultural materialist approach would operate in current debates
in basic writing and college composition generally: the possibility of
eliminating basic writing through "mainstreaming" or other strategies;
the relevance of contact zone pedagogies and feminist and post-colonial
critiques of the politics of representation to basic writing; the relation
between basic writing and the "author-function"; challenging the con-
tinuing separation between matters of "style" and matters of "content";
and the perduring textual bias of research in composition.

Debate on basic writing in the mid-1990s sometimes echoes in trouble-
some ways the polarized debate during Basic Writing's "birth," seem-
ing to allow for only two positions, for or against. This "re-polarization"
of debate on basic writing results in part from recent New Right cut-
backs to funding public higher (and other) education and simultaneous
and consequent increasing reliance on part-timers and other non-ten-
ure-line faculty, heavier teaching loads (more courses with more stu-
dents per section), less student financial aid, less support staff and ma-
terials (paper, computers, workshop tutoring) for students and teach-
ers, and the decay of schools' physical plants: in other words, the con-
tinuation of or, in some cases, return to working conditions suffered as
"temporary" in the 1970s. In that context, any work, including the work
collected in this volume, that calls into question the politics of discur-
sive practices may well be slotted into the "against" position. Certainly
our insistence on the historicity of Basic Writing challenges the construc-
tion of "basic writing" into an objective, unified, and stable entity, rep-
resented as a "course," "student," or "writing." To teachers concerned
with their own and their students' immediate institutional survival,
however, any suggestion that "basic writing" is a construct may seem
an elitist gesture from those situated to afford engagement in fine theo-
retical distinctions, at best an irresponsible admission, but in any event
likely to provide additional fodder to those on the New Right attacking
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basic writing programs, teachers, and students. For if "basic writing"
does not signify a "real" phenomenon, a concrete body of students with
self-evident needs that must be met, then one may legitimately question
whether or not to preserve basic writing programs. Similarly, given ex-
isting power relations in the United States, any emphasis on the politi-
cal import of the teaching of basic writing may well seem to threaten to
encourage those in positions of dominance to exercise that dominance
more conclusively by putting an end to basic writing programs. Even
teachers who agree that representations of basic writing are constructs
that have functioned strategically but problematically may well argue
that such theoretical critiques are not worth the immediate, perhaps long-
term, and significant material losses that such critiques may cost. Re-
sponding to the keynote speech given by David Bartholomae at the 1992
Conference on Basic Writing in which Bartholomae questions the use-
fulness of "more talk of basic writing" ("The Tidy House"), Karen
Greenberg, for example, worries, "If reactionary political academics and
budget-minded administrators and legislators join forces with compo-
sition 'stars' like David Bartholomae to attack basic writing programs,
then these programs are doomed" ("Politics" 66).

On the other hand, attention to issues of difference and power in the
production and reception of all representations of students through
historicizing those representations can contribute practically in two ways.
First, it can equip those concerned with students' welfare to combat
powerful but damaging representations of students and teachers also
being offered as the "objective facts" about them. Locating current rep-
resentations of students in the ongoing history of conflicting represen-
tations of such students can enable us to benefit from that history. "Basic
writing" itself, we need always to remember, was invoked as a term to
combat dominant representations of students as "other": "illiterate,"
"boneheads," "barbarians," "not college material." While one may get
the sense that current debate over basic writing is entirely new, in fact
there has never been agreement about the definition of basic writing: it
has since its inception been a contested term, and was itself introduced
as part of a longer ongoing debate on how best to represent students.

The specific debate between Bartholomae and Greenberg alludes to
this history of competing representations. Bartholomae's critique of the
term "basic writing" notwithstanding, he does not call for ending basic
writing programs, for, as he explains, he fears "what would happen to
the students who are protected, served in its name," suspecting it would
allow "the return of a way of speaking that was made suspect by the
hard work and diligence of those associated with basic writing" ("Tidy
House" 20-21). His challenge for basic writing, instead, is to take basic
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writing as the name for "a contested area. . . , a contact zone, a place of
competing positions and interests" (21). And Greenberg, while worried
that "if enough people subscribe to David Bartholomae's views on basic
writing, there won't be any basic writing instruction in college much
longer," insists that basic writing programs based on deficit or remedial
models "deserve to be eliminated" (66, 67). Thus both Greenberg and
Bartholomae engage in the ongoing struggle over how best to represent
students and writing now commonly represented as "basic," calling at-
tention to the material consequences of such representations in specific
social historical locations.

Further, attention to issues of difference and power in the production
and reception of diverse stances on how best to represent students can
promote alternative representations by variously situated teachers, pro-
gram administrators, and students by locating any representations in
those situations. For example, Bartholomae's critique of basic writing
needs to be accompanied by consideration of the specific material con-
straints experienced by teachers, students, and institutions and the im-
plications of his critique for them. And the "success" that Greenberg
describes students achieving through certain programs needs to be un-
derstood and defined in terms of the social and historical location of
those students and programs. Further, both arguments need to be lo-
cated more specifically in the constraints shaping and allowing for those
arguments to be heard, so that we can be attuned as well to what is
silenced in those arguments, and what arguments are not heard at all.

It is encouraging to note attempts to locate programs for basic writ-
ing in terms of just such constraints, as occurs, for example, in Rhonda
Grego and Nancy Thompson's "Repositioning Remediation" and Mary
Soliday's "From the Margins to the Mainstream," both of which appear
in the February 1996 issue of College Composition and Communication along
with an accompanying Interchange on "Rethinking Basic Writing" in
responses from Akua Duku Anokye, Suellynn Duffey, and Judith Rodby:
"Housewives and Compositionists," "Mapping the Terrain of Tracks and
Streams," and "What's It Worth and What's It For? Revisions to Basic
Writing Revisited." As these titles suggest, all the writers challenge the
inevitability and naturalness of basic writing, instead, like Bartholomae,
seeing the term as strategic, preserving an institutional "slot," however
problematically, for certain students and teachers. But all of them also
imagine any strategy in the context of historical and social and material
pressures on those students and teachers: the historical "feminization"
of work in composition, especially basic writing; the absence of credit
granted for student's work and tuition paid for "remedial" courses; the
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pervasive "downsizing" of funding for education; the "remedial" func-
tion of composition historically. Moreover, by locating their own work
in the specifics of their own institutions, they reject the application of
their arguments universally to all institutions. Grego and Thompson
report on the strategy of a writing "studio" program they developed in
response to a state-mandated elimination of credit for basic writing, but
caution, "The Studio is not a destination which we urge others to pur-
sue simply as some latest trend" (82). Soliday, while describing what
appears to be an effective FIPSE-funded project at CUNY in which basic
writing students are placed in "mainstream" courses, warns that "insti-
tutional politics contextualize a mainstreamed course, and once the new
course is no longer protected by the prestige and funding of a special
grant, politics can redefine the course's original goals"; consequently,
"we have to be acutely aware of our role in a potential struggle over
redefining the considerable territory which constitutes remedial educa-
tion within an institution" ("From the Margins" 96). In particular, Soliday
notes the danger that administrators might well view mainstreaming
not "as a method of enhancing instruction for open admissions students,
[but] for cutting costs by eliminating remedial courses and the students
these courses traditionally have served" (97). Suellyn Duffey echoes such
cautions in her response, stating "neither [article] should convince us to
mainstream basic writing students at our own institutions" (104). Rather,
while she sees Grego and Thompson's article illustrating that
"mainstreaming can work, [it] should not be seen as evidence that
mainstreaming is a desirable alternative to tracking. Instead, it describes
several adaptations to enforced mainstreaming, but those adaptations
argue neither for nor against it" (105). And Judith Rodby ends her re-
sponse by calling for more talk and writing to each other "comparing
and developing a variety of political strategies, private and covert, de-
liberate and public, to preserve the integrity of our work with students
and their writing" (111, emphasis mine). Rodby's call is especially im-
portant in confirming both the value and the dynamics of such discourse:
while rejecting any reified notions of basic writing, she insists on the
sharing of strategies to address it precisely because it is problematic
variously constituted and re-constituted and inherently strategicrather
than a problem susceptible to merely technical solution, and she calls
for hearing a greater number of strategies, thus bringing out the differ-
ent constraints that tend to muffle some voices while amplifying others.

Such accounts demonstrate the cogency of understanding basic writ-
ing as indeed a "contact zone," Mary Louise Pratt's evocative image for
one of the "social spaces where cultures meet, clash, and grapple with
each other, often in contexts of highly asymmetrical relations of power"
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("Arts" 34). Many compositionists concerned to address issues of differ-
ences and power in the teaching of writing both institutionally and peda-
gogically have been attracted to Pratt's image, for it both foregrounds
the operation of power relations in constructing and erasing difference
and gives a positive valuation to the unleashing and play of difference.
Indeed, one could argue that even critiques of the problematics of the
"contact zone" in some ways offer additional support for the cogency of
understanding composition and basic writing as a site of such contact.
By foregrounding questions of power and difference, those problematics
offer useful directions for teaching and research countering hegemonic
discourse on basic and other writing. The question raised by the image
of the contact zone is how one responds, institutionally and pedagogi-
cally, to the dynamic heterogeneity to which the image points. Does one
respond, as Pratt describes is historically typical, by eliminating, ignor-
ing, or silencing evidence of such heterogeneity? Or, if one decides to
embrace and encourage it, how does one go about doing so, given exist-
ing power relations and the real dangers to which such clashing and
grappling may lead? Related to this question is the more general issue
of the role teacherly "authority" plays in a politicized understanding of
the teaching of writing. Given asymmetrical relations of power within
the classroom, how can a teacher enact his commitments to the ideals of
democracy and social justice toward which contact zone pedagogies are
intended to work without betraying them through the exercise of his
position of power? And how do asymmetrical relations of power within
institutions impinge on those teachers and their students, especially the
dominated and their need for "safe" space and communal support? Such
questions fall with particular force on teachers of basic writing as the
dominated of the dominant, perpetually negotiating both with and as
the dominant for themselves, their programs, and their students.

What is highlighted by these questions is the need to view the "arts
of the contact zone" as a historically specific strategic response, a repre-
sentation of education put forth in competition with dominant repre-
sentations of education as the site for (re)producing social homogeneity.
In decontextualized conceptualizations of "contact zones," not only in-
dividual students and cultures but power and the contact zone itself are
all essentialized, imagined as reified, uniform entities neither produced
by nor susceptible to change. Thus reappropriated, contact zone peda-
gogy can seem at best, as Joseph Harris has complained, "a kind of
multicultural bazaar, where [students] are not so much brought into
conflict with opposing views as placed in a kind of harmless connection
with a series of exotic others" ("Negotiating" 33). The "harmless con-
nection" or "contact" thus achieved is likely to be "superficial," for it
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assumes both the essential immutability of the individuals' cultural iden-
tities and cultural tourism as its sole motive. What is needed, Harris
goes on to say, is "how competing perspectives can be made to intersect
with and inform each other. . . . how (or why) individuals might decide
to change or revise their own positions (rather than simply to defend
them) when brought into contact with differing views" (33). Otherwise,
the contact zone as a strategy of articulating oppositionalor alternative
discourse in order to make resistance to hegemonic discourse possible
is contained, rendered into the liberal pluralist ideal of conversation:
once all voices have been heard, class can be dismissed.' "Contact" be-
comes itself reified as a process in and for itself rather than being under-
stood as a response to and with consequences in specific social and his-
torical conditions. Thus Harris argues that the contact zone be seen not
so much as a "social space" in which different groups are heard but a
"forum," "process" or "event" constituted by and making possible "a
local and shifting series of interactions," "negotiations, interventions,
and compromises" ("Negotiating" 37). Both contact zones themselves
and the taking of positions will have to be imagined in dynamic rather
than static terms, as strategies to address debate on social justice.

Given the asymmetrical relations of power among students and be-
tween students and teachers, many will understandably be suspicious
of the utopian overtones of such aims. From one position, such aims
will seem to be an abuse of teachers' authority, the politicization of what
should be an occasion for the neutral acquisition of writing skills. Oth-
ers might see a teacher 's use of her authority over students to pursue an
ideal of social justice as contradicting that ideal. Despite their differ-
ences, however, both such positions are linked by a reliance on a
decontextualization of teaching and a monolithic, essentialized concep-
tion of power and of individual students and teachers. Concerns about
the "politicization" of teaching falsely assume that courses exist outside
relations of power in society, forgetting the array of social historical pres-
sures leading to the very presence of teachers, courses, and students. In
fact, power operates in classrooms whether or not teachers or students
choose to acknowledge or intervene in its operation. As a corollary,
whatever authority teachers possess, power is not restricted to or con-
trolled by teachers. Those concerned that teachers may "impose" on stu-
dents falsely assume that teacher authority renders students powerless
to resist teachers' ideas and efforts, forgetting that teacher authority is
more appropriately seen as something negotiated rather than exercised
by fiat (see Bizzell, "Power" 54-58). Further, students and teachers rep-
resent a heterogeneous array of intersecting and divergent identifica-
tions, interests, pressures, and circumstances. Indeed, any individual
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student or teacher, rather than representing a single, monolithic set of
interests, beliefs, and affinities, exhibits traits of both instability and con-
tinuity in her interests, positions, identifications, and circumstances. The
question is then how to engage students in constructing bases for posi-
tions of alignment in the context of social and historical differences. Imag-
ined thus, the "contact zone" is less a space one "enters" than a type of
activity in which people explicitly negotiate such differences and align-
ments.

The heterogeneity of interests both within and among students and
teachers combats the likelihood of any course serving a single political
agenda. That likelihood is further thrown into question if we challenge
assumptions about power underlying concerns about such a course.
Patricia Bizzell notes that critical pedagogues' suspicions about any ex-
ercise of power result from "an insufficiently differentiated conception
of power. . . . as a unitary force with uniform effects" ("Power" 54-55).
Teachers sympathetic to critical pedagogy have attempted to engage in
persuasion because of the appeal of its egalitarianism: no party is imag-
ined as having the right to impose her views on others, not even a teacher;
all are equal in the "dialogue." In practice, however, teachers' attempts
to disengage from power, imagined as inherently coercive, have resulted
either in leaving the classroom open to the exercise of power by others
(say, particular groups of students already in positions of dominance
over other students), in suspicions that this disengagement is one way
or another a ruse or cheat, or, at best, to a general retreat by all from any
engagement of any kind with others. The problem with such disengage-
ment, Bizzell notes, results from a failure to recognize the context in
which teaching takes place: existing power relations in society are far
from the egalitarian ideal in which true "collaboration" and persuasion
might occur; positing such an ideal as already existing within the class-
room simply allows those relations to operate unchecked ("Power" 59).
Indeed, such disengagement among critical pedagogues represents what
Bizzell elsewhere identifies as a nostalgic dream of transcending ideol-
ogy: aware that ethical commitments are "just another ideological con-
struct" and that there is no escape from ideology into "reality," teachers
nonetheless desire to "transcend" ideology by disavowing their com-
mitments ("Marxist" 55). To this recognition of the inevitability of the
play of ideological commitments should be added a corollary: that teach-
ers are in some ways more powerful than students does not mean that
students have no power. Thus teachers, suspicious of coercive power,
who therefore refuse to exercise any power falsely assume that attempts
at coercion will meet with no resistance. While it is important to ac-
knowledge the hegemonic role schools play, it is crucial, as Raymond
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Williams warns, to resist seeing hegemony "as more uniform, more static,
and more abstract than in practice, . . . it can ever actually be." Instead
we need to recall that "a lived hegemony is always a process . . . . [that]
has continually to be renewed, recreated, defended, and modified . . . .

[and that] is also continually resisted, limited, altered, challenged by
pressures not at all its own" (Marxism 112).

If recognition of the heterogeneity of students' and teachers' posi-
tions and identifications may combat concerns about the dangers of
political coercion, the dynamics of the hegemonic process obviate them:
no position is free of power relations or political commitments: all teach-
ing participates either to reinforce, reproduce, or work against the hege-
monic, which itself inevitably meets with resistance. The question for
teachers then becomes whether or not to acknowledge the operation of
that process and actively intervene in it. This would involve ideological
critique of, rather than mere liberal tolerance for, diverse positions, in-
cluding critique of the ideology underlying one's own pedagogy. From
the perspective of an Althusserian understanding of ideology, such
demystification must be understood as both ongoing and multidirec-
tional. But such demystification must be accompanied by attention to
not only what is but what might be, what is emergent, potentially gen-
erated by the contradictions revealed through demystification (see
Bizzell, "Marxist Ideas," and Jameson, "Conclusion"). The kinds of ten-
sions resulting from investigating contradictions through a contact zone
pedagogy can have constructive as well as deconstructive effects (Bizzell,
"Marxist Ideas" 64-67). The kind of pedagogy we would argue for, in
other words, sees the pursuit of hope and of critique related dialecti-
cally rather than in simple opposition: conflict and struggle can be gen-
erative and productive in its aims and effects. It is thus that we might
achieve a contact zone pedagogy where differences are negotiated to
change existing relations of domination, rather than being invoked only
to produce either a pluralist "multicultural bazaar" or a battle between
enemies. The idea of the contact zone, like "multiculturalism," has arisen
as a strategy aimed at confronting existing injustice to achieve yet unre-
alized justice.2 In place of conservative appeals to find a "common
ground" positing an essentialized humanityappeals which historically
have silenced difference and pushed some to the periphery to affirm the
right of others to the centerthe idea of the contact zone rejects propri-
etary claims and fixed identities, asking instead how identities and so-
cial spaces are formed and reformed and the role of power relations in
such formations.

This emphasis on both the fluidity of teachers' and students' subject
positions and the role of power in forming those positions is aligned to
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the work of composition teachers and researchers interested in contest-
ing representations of students and teachers as inhabiting discrete cog-
nitive, social, and /or discursive locations (Rose, "Narrowing"; Hull,
Rose, Fraser, Castellano; Hull and Rose, "'This Wooden Shack Place"
and "Rethinking Remediation"). The challenges to dominant ways of
demarcating basic writers from other writers and from teachers that have
resulted from such work is necessary for a truly productive contact zone
pedagogy and also important in combating the reductive understand-
ings of cognition, social identity, experience, and discourse such repre-
sentations support. Most recently such work has challenged the distinc-
tion between basic writers and Authors, demonstrating the implication
of the "author function" in maintaining the hierarchical organization of
English studiesmost notably the position of literary study in relation
to compositionand the authority of teachers over students (Miller;
Crowley; Stygall; Grego and Thompson 68-70).3 Mainstreaming repre-
sents one response to increasing awareness of the role institutional pro-
cesses have played in marginalizing basic writers, eliminating those pro-
cesses by eliminating institutional mechanisms which maintain the dis-
tinction between "basic" and other writers.

The distinction between Authors and students represents part of a
chain of binaries distinguishing not only Authors from writers but art
from mechanics, (unalienated) work from labor, and the individual will
from social demands, binaries that serve to maintain the prestige of one
set of writers, and the study of that set, and the low status of other writ-
ers and those studying their writing. Because basic writing teachers oc-
cupy the most marginal, precarious place in college and university En-
glish departments, they have historically felt the pressures of these bi-
naries most keenly and have therefore responded to them most sharply.
Moreover, aside from the institutional interest basic writing has in con-
testing the denigration of its students, basic writing teachers' own expe-
rience with their students and the now increasing body of research on
the history of literacy and on canon formation support radical challenges
to those binaries. However, precisely because of the marginal position
of basic writing students, teachers, and programs both within English
studies and within educational institutions generally to which the au-
thor/student binary is based and which it maintains, teachers may well
be tempted to erase the distinction between Authors and basic writers
by positing basic writers as Authors. While erasures of the differences
between authors and student writers might in some instances represent
a radical overhauling of dominant approaches, in some versions it can
represent a reactionary return to the bourgeois individualism of
expressivism. In such versions the Author/student writer binary would
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remain intact: the "other" would simply be moved to the side of the
dominant, the legitimacy of the norms constructing Authors remaining
unchallenged.

But if we re-define "authors" as "writers" with a lowercase "w"
that is, as social historical agents working in relations of power with
others, such as readerswe and our students can then draw on the rich
example of the actual work that all practicing published and unpub-
lished writers and editors and critics engage in as they negotiate the
meaning and acceptability of specific writings (as Lu shows in "Profess-
ing Multiculturalism"). To do this requires that we accept a more dy-
namic conception of power relations; that we acknowledge the instabil-
ity of authors, texts, meanings, and canons; and that we contextualize
differences established among writers socially and historically rather
than essentializing them. Given the present implication of many En-
glish teachers in maintaining the stability of authors, texts, meanings,
and canons, this is a difficult requirement to meet. However, by
historicizing the establishment of the binary differentiation between
Authors and basic (and other) writers, we can transform our traditional
approaches to that differentiationcommonly a source of ambivalence
and embarrassment among teachers and studentsinto an occasion for
classroom inquiry. Most directly, the ongoing negotiation of such differ-
ences would be acknowledged as a substantive issue for the profession
as a profession and as a "basic" issue for teachers and students in indi-
vidual courses. In this way students' and teachers' "personal" experi-
ences with writing would be connected to the social and institutional
forces shaping that writing and to which that writing itself responds.
For example, efforts are being made to demystify for students the stan-
dards and institutional processes by which their placement and exit tests
are evaluated, presenting those as negotiated and negotiable historical
agreements rather than unalterable "givens," so that students might be
in a position to work both toward meeting those standards and toward
changing them through renegotiation. The issue for such courses is thus
not simply accommodating such standards but learning how to negoti-
ate the operation of such pressures which have already constructed stu-
dents as writers. This means recognizing the operation of the material,
social, and historical within the classroom and within the student.4

Historicizing the linguistic, institutional, and pedagogical mechanisms
maintaining the distinction between Authors and student writers in this
way would not so much erase the differences in discursive interests,
material circumstances, and performances as contextualize them. Do-
ing so would enable teachers both to address and contest what are often
seen as conflicting demands: what Grego and Thompson distinguish as
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the "material" vs. the "psychic" needs of students or, more broadly,
matters of "thought" vs. "feeling," "conceptualization" vs. "experience,"
style vs. matters of content, or error vs. ideas. For some, any attention to
the former can seem to be capitulation to unjust social pressures on ba-
sic writers, the ignoring of students' psychic needs as writers and their
ideas and experiences that would be highly inappropriate in a response
to the writings of established authors. Others argue in turn that refusing
to attend to such matters is to abandon basic writers to the force of those
pressures. Both positions, however, maintain the distinction between
the "social" and the "individual" in writing; what is needed instead is a
pursuit of what Williams calls for as the "reciprocal discovery of the
truly social in the individual, and the truly individual in the social"
(Marxism 197). Such discovery, a not unrealistic goal for teaching, in-
volves examining both the ways in which the materiality of writing is
malleable and the continuing process by which "the contents of [the
individual writer 's] consciousness are socially produced" (193). Thus
the interests of the "social" and of the "individual" writer, a writer's
"psychic" and "material" needs, rather than being in competition, are
instead investigated as irrevocably, radically intertwined.

To investigate the "social production" of individual consciousness is
not, of course, to belabor the presence and pressure of the dominant but
to bring into dynamic play potentially oppositional emergent and/or
residual pressures also operating on individual consciousness. Williams
notes that

no mode of production and therefore no dominant social order and
therefore no dominant culture ever in reality includes or exhausts
all human practice, human energy, and human intention [what
modes of domination] select from and consequently exclude . . .

may often be seen as the personal or the private, or as the natural or
even the metaphysical . . . since what the dominant has effectively
seized is indeed the ruling definition of the social. . . . there is al-
ways . . . practical consciousness . . . that is unquestionably social
and that a specifically dominant social order neglects, excludes, re-
presses, or simply fails to recognize. (Marxism 125)

Compositionists drawing on feminist and post-colonial theory have
worked to recuperate "personal experience" and other categories tradi-
tionally excluded from academic discourse to capture the heterogeneity
and instability of "individual" consciousness or subjectivity by situat-
ing the "individual" at the intersection of class, race, gender, and other
social categories as a site of power struggle among and within cultures
and discourses, in alignment with the attempts of contact zone peda-
gogy to make possible the articulation of oppositional discourse. In teach-
ing, this involves making productive use of what Williams identifies as
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the "tension between the received interpretation and practical experi-
ence." This tension arises precisely because "there are the experiences to
which the fixed forms do not speak at all, which indeed they do not
recognize" (Marxism 130).

However, recuperating the oppositional potential of such experiences
is complicated. One's "practical consciousness" of experience differs from
"official consciousness" by being "what is actually being lived, and not
only what it is thought is being lived. . . . a kind of feeling and thinking
which is indeed social and material, but each in an embryonic phase
before it can become fully articulate and defined exchange" (130-31).
Compositionists hoping to draw on students' practical consciousness to
elicit oppositional thoughts and feelings must thus confront the com-
plex mediation of those thoughts and feelings by official consciousness,
one's learned sense of "what it is thought is being lived." Further, they
must simultaneously resist the dominant's identification of such con-
sciousness as "personal," "private," "feelings" distinct from the social,
even as they attempt to invoke what has been relegated by the domi-
nant to such categories. As Williams warns, the relations of practical
consciousness "with the already articulate and defined are . . . excep-
tionally complex" (131).

Work that is successful in addressing that complexity must avoid two
seemingly opposed tendencies both of which, albeit in different ways,
essentialize personal experience. First, experience can be read as the
passive "carrier" of determinate social structuresnothing more than,
say, one's racial, ethnic, gender, or class identity. Alternatively, and some-
times in reaction to this tendency, there is the tendency to return to the
bourgeois individualism of old-style expressivist pedagogy, in which
students are encouraged to tell of their "true, personal experience" pu-
rified of "outside influence." Both tendencies, however, suppress what
Williams describes as the "living and reciprocal relationships of the in-
dividual and the social" (Marxism 194). As a result, as in weaker ver-
sions of contact zone pedagogy, what begins as an attempt to make pro-
ductive use of difference becomes a reification of difference, whether in
terms of social identity or in distinctions between the "personal" and
the "social." Those combatting such tendencies do so by both invoking
and problematizing the "personal" in its relations to the social. Mary
Soliday, for example, describes a basic writing course in which, as stu-
dents read and write autobiographical literacy narratives, they learn to
locate their own experiences with literacy and those described in oth-
ers' accounts of literacy learning as participating in the clash and trans-
formation of identities, cultures, and languages. In the process, they learn
that "their experience is, in fact, interpretable" ("Translating" 512) and
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therefore something in which they can intervene critically. Thus Alisha,
one of the students described, theorizes her own experience and others'
experience with differences of language, identity, and culture to develop
a "new sense of self" that can negotiate the various pressures these exert
on her (518-20). Her writing comes to evince a "skillful intermingling of
life writing and exposition of other texts" intertwining the "personal"
and the "social" (519). And in "Reading and Writing Differences," Min-
Zhan Lu has described her use of a sequence of reading and writing
assignments to enable students to use experience both "experientially"
and analytically through revising their responses to readings. Drawing
on feminist critics on the margin who have critiqued the erasure of dif-
ference resulting from unreflective uses of "personal" experience, Lu
argues for a pedagogy in which students analyze their experience "not
only for what it allows [them] to reach towards but also what it might
prevent [them] from reaching" in order to open a perspective in which
they "conceive of transforming [themselves] with the aid of others." Such
a pedagogy encourages students to examine the ways in which their
experiences with discrimination serve to enable them to make certain
gendered meanings out of elements of a story while blinding them to
issues of class, ethnicity, nationality, race, and sexual preference. They
thus come both to revise their readings of the story and their sense of
their own experience. In such courses, personal experience is taken not
as the discrete residence of the individual immune to the play of the
social nor as yet another passive register of the social but as a site of and
for contesting meanings, building on, responding to, and revising those
meanings. Newly emergent meanings of both the self and society arise
in and through that process of contestation.

The emphasis in such work on the operation of the material, social,
and historical in the teaching, learning, production and reception of
writing intersects with recent feminist and postcolonial critiques of work
in composition and literacy education which re-locate that work as
gendered, raced, and classed, challenging the universality and politics
of the "norms" in the styles of writing taught, who teaches whom how,
under what material and institutional conditions, and the interests served
by such practices.5 That work also intersects with ethnographic research
in composition taking as its aim the elucidation of how cultural conflict
gets inscribed in students' writing, classroom discourse, and composi-
tion research.6 Such intersections, however, are suggestive for revealing
points of divergence as well as of alignment. Two related points of di-
vergence seem particularly salient in helping to delineate significant gaps
in and thus future directions for the work represented by the writings
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collected in this volume: what may be termed its "macro-textual" bias
and a resulting absence in it of "thick" accounts. In a review essay on
"Composition in the 90s," Tom Fox notes,

though our theory is social, composition's focus on the classroom
pulls us the other way, towards idiosyncrasy, individual students
and their successes, "good" days in single classrooms.... No doubt
we experience our classrooms this way because of the fact that we
teach in these time periods and we grade individual students. But
the institutional shape of our experience and the political theories
that we admire thus may work against each otherthe former to-
wards atomistic and individualist views and the latter towards
multiple, social frameworks.

The conceptual and rhetorical challenge of writing about peda-
gogy in the age of politics is how to weave these two perspectives
together. (569)

In calling for such a weaving, Fox echoes Hull, Rose, Fraser, and
Castellano's conclusions from their analysis of classroom discourse. Hull
et al. observe that much research on reading and writing consists of "ei-
ther fine-grained analyses of texts or of the cognitive processes involved
in text comprehension and production or.. . . studies of wider focus on
the social and political contexts of reading, writing, and schooling" (321).
Citing critics from a variety of disciplines, they warn that what is needed,
in fact, is a constant

moving between micro-level, close examination of oral or written
discourse and macro-level investigations of society and culture
seeking connections between language, cognition, and context... .

Without the microperspective, one runs the risk of losing sight of
the particulars of behavior; without the macroperspective, one runs
the risk of missing the social and cultural logic of that behavior.
(321-22)

Hull et al. thus argue that we need the kind of "weaving" for which Fox
calls, and Fox offers an account of how institutional segmentation of
teachers' experience constrains their attempts to engage in the sort of
weaving movement Hull et al. deem necessary. In a corollary critique,
Judith Rodby has noted that "Research on texts rather than people, a
bias promoted by the literature departments of which we are a part,
deflects our attention from theoretical frameworks that could help us
see and then explain literacy development and interpersonal relation-
ships," and so she calls for more case study and participant-observer
research to produce "more thick description, more information about
how the physical and conceptual context and the purpose and the social
milieu influence student writing" (111). I take Rodby to be calling not
for a rejection of the textualization of experience brought on by structur-
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alist and poststructuralist theory but for an expansion of the "texts" stud-
ied. The "texts" on which our own research focuses, while in many ways
expansively defined, do not incorporate those typically addressed in
case study and participant-observer research, and thus our work offers
primarily "macro" perspectives on basic writing. Our analyses of spe-
cific writings by students and teachers and classroom discussions serve
primarily to illustrate what we see as the logic and implications of our
theoretical positions for understanding the production and reception of
"basic writing" as a type of student, text, program, and discourse. Our
hope is such "thin" analyses may contribute to the collaborative "thick-
ening" of the field's account of itself and to the problematizing as well
of experience in ethnographic research.' Similarly, while our analyses
intersect with feminist and post-colonial critiques of literacy education,
and while we hope that they may contribute to such critiques, they do
not take up the specific ways in which work in basic writing is inscribed
by class, race, gender, and other social categories, as do Stygall and
Brodkey, for example. We look to further pursuit of such specificities in
understanding practices in basic writing. Finally, we look as well to de-
lineations of the specific relations between basic writing and literacy
education both at more "advanced" and "lower" levels of schooling and
at non-institutional sites of literacy learning, in the United States and
elsewhere, at present and in the past, not to erase differences between
the various literacy practices but to bring such differences into contact,
further revealing the operation of the material, social, and historical in
the teaching, learning, production and reception of all writing.
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Notes

Introduction

1. We take Raymond Williams's term ".cultural materialism" to designate
the materiality of discursive practicesthat is, interpreting historical material-
ism as treating "superstructural" practices as constitutive of as well as consti-
tuted by the structures of the "material base."

2. These assumptions draw on Louis Althusser's notion of ideology, Anto-
nio Gramsci's notion of hegemony, Raymond Williams's notion of the material-
ity of culture, Jacques Derrida's critique of the metaphysics of presence, Fredric
Jameson's notion of the political unconscious, and Michel Foucault's theory of
discourse and power. For a more detailed account of the Foucauldian impress
on our work, see Lu's discussion in her response included in the December 1993
College English "Symposium on Basic Writing: Conflict and Struggle, and the
Legacy of Mina Shaughnessy," (55.8: 894-901). Jameson's concept of the politi-
cal unconscious informs Homer's reading of dominant discourse on Open Ad-
missions ("Birth" 15-23). Homer discusses Althusser's notion of ideology in
"Some Afterwords" and Williams's notion of the materiality of culture in "Some
Afterwords" and "Re-thinking the 'Sociality' of Error."

3. Compare, for example, Wagner, Heller, and Kriegel's Working Through,
Shaughnessy's Errors, and Ira Shor's Culture Wars.

4. See, for example, accounts by Patricia Bizzell and David Bartholomae of
their first experiences with basic writing programs, and Shaughnessy's obser-
vation near the end of Errors and Expectations that teachers are beginning to see
the difficulties of basic writers as those of every writer "writ large" (Bartholomae,
"The Tidy House"; Bizzell, Introduction; Shaughnessy, Errors 293).

Chapter 1

1. Basic Writing is used to name the canonized field as it exists and is institu-
tionally reinforced through various means; basic writing (not capitalized) indi-
cates a more open vision of the field as material practice and that which escapes
institutionalization, a more open field of possibilities.

2. For a sense of the precarious conditions for faculty at CUNY during its
mid-seventies retrenchment, see Kapsis and Murtha.
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Chapter 3

1. To acknowledge the exclusion involved in the institutionalization of a field
and discourse, I use the capitalized form, Basic Writing, to refer to the dominant
ways basic writing has been represented and to call attention to the fact that the
work actually performed by teachers and students placed in classrooms labeled
as basic, which I identify as "basic writing," is always much more heteroge-
neous and dynainic.

2. For a discussion of such differences, see Lyons (1985) 184-85.
3. See Lu, "Redefining" for an account of a similar move in Errors and Expec-

tations.
4. For analysis of Bernstein's "structuralism," see also R. Gibson's Structur-

alism and Education.

Chapter 4

1. My view of language has been informed by Louis Althusser's notion of
ideology, Antonio Gramsci's analysis of hegemony, Jacques Derrida's critique
of the metaphysics of presence, Michel Foucault's theory of discourse and power,
and the distinction Raymond Williams makes between practical and official con-
sciousness.

2. For discussion of Shaughnessy's pedagogy in relation to her democratic
aspirations, see Robert Lyons and rebuttals to John Rouse's "The Politics of
Shaughnessy" by Michael Allen, Gerald Graff, and William Lawlor.

3. In arguing for the need to show "interest in and respect for language vari-
ety," Shaughnessy cites William Labov's analysis of the inner logic, grammar,
and ritual forms in Black English Vernacular (Shaughnessy, Errors 17, 237, 304).
Shaughnessy also cites theories in contrastive analysis (156), first-language in-
terference (93), and transformation'al grammar (77-78) to support her specula-
tions on the logic of basic writers' errors.

4. For a critique of the way modern linguistics of language, code, and com-
petence (such as Labov's study of Black English Vernacular) tend to treat dis-
courses as discrete and autonomous entities, see Mary Louise Pratt 's "Linguis-
tic Utopias."

Chapter 6

1. Hull ends her review by calling for research attending to the larger social
setting of basic writing, research which "will pay respectful attention to a
student's position as an outsider" (183-84). In "Rethinking Remediation,"
she and Mike Rose report on a research project they are conducting which takes
as its focus the social setting of remedial writers, and in "This Wooden Shack
Place," she and Rose present an analysis of the social bases of the kinds of read-
ings basic writers and their teachers perform.
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2. On the distinction between social and cognitive approaches, see Bizzell,
"Cognition." For attempts to bridge these approaches, see Berkenkotter and
Flower.

3. Cf. Kenneth Bruffee's discussion of Richard Rorty's concept of "normal
discourse" ("Collaborative Learning and the 'Conversation of Mankind," 642
43).

4. Cf. Martin Nystrand's description of written errors as representing occa-
sions when readers and writers are "OUT OF TUNE WITH EACH OTHER [sic]"
(65-66).

5. This is not to suggest that second-language acquisition does not itself pos-
sess social dimensions of power, status, and class (witness Richard Rodriguez's
Hunger of Memory and recent debates between the Canadian provinces) or that
theorists of second-language acquisition attribute no importance to the social
dimensions of language learning (see, for example, Stephen Krashen's discus-
sions of the roles which the "affective filter" and "acculturation" play in second-
language acquisition, 30-32,45-50). Such dimensions, however, have often been
ignored by teachers adopting models of second-language acquisition to under-
stand written error.

6. See Anatol Rapaport's distinction between "fights," on the one hand, and
what he calls "games" and "debates" (1-12).

7. Epes explains that she selected members for each group from a pool of
speakers representing a "spectrum of spoken dialect," from either end of which
she chose members. She determined dialect primarily on the basis of grammati-
cal features (8, n. 8).

8. Barbara Mellix's essay "From Outside, In" provides an account of an NSD
speaker's experience learning to write "standard" English which illuminates
social and political dimensions of that experience not addressed by Epes, though
suggested by concerns expressed by the NSD speakers Epes studies about speak-
ing "right" and using "bad English" (Epes 28).

9. For a general critique of applications of theories of cognition to basic writ-
ers' problems, see Rose, "Narrowing the Mind and Page."

10. For an articulation of this argument, see Patterson 154-56.
11. By "text" I refer here to printed words, not the broader sense which this

term has come to signify in critical theory and cultural studies.
12. See Bartholomae, "Writing," for a different examination of the difficulty

of distinguishing between basic writers and teachers.
13. For a useful general critique of the utopian overtones invoked by the term

community in studies of writing, see Joseph Harris's "The Idea of Community in
the Study of Writing." Harris critiques the appropriateness of both "growth"
and "conversion" as metaphors for describing the changes the basic writers
undergo M "Three Metaphors."

14. See Giddens's critique of what he terms the "derogation of the lay actor"
implicit in theories which deny the validity of reasons members of a society give
for their actions (71-72).

15. For a similar argument regarding peer groups generally, see Bruffee, "Col-
laborative Learning and the 'Conversation of Mankind, 646-67.
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16. See Ede and Lunsford's cautions on collaborative writing pedagogies as
technologies of institutional power (112-16,120) and their discussion of hierar-
chical and dialogic modes of collaboration (133-35).

17. One of the problems with workbooks is that the context they establish as
workbooks is at odds with encouraging students to adopt "academic" attitudes
toward their contents.

18. Cf. Hull and Rose's discussion of the value of eliciting the "mismatch"
between remedial writers' ways of reading and those encouraged by their teach-
ers (""This Wooden Shack Place" 296-97).

Chapter 7

1. See, for example, Anderson, "An Apology for Style"; Kazin, On Native
Grounds; and Mencken, "The Dreiser Bugaboo."

2. See Lu, "Writing as Repositioning." For a discussion of "border" peda-
gogy in teaching Basic Writing, see Horner, "Mapping."

3. See, for example, Rose, "Language of Exclusion."
4. See, for example, Bartholomae, "The Study of Error"; Elaine Lees, "Proof-

reading as Reading," "The Exceptable Way"; Horner, "Rethinking."
5. For an extended discussion of teaching editing as negotiation that informs

my own, see Horner, "Rethinking," especially pages 188-96.

Some Afterwords

1. On the limitations of this sort of approach, see Frank Walters 828.
2. See, in this regard, Pratt, "Daring to Dream" 8-12, and Lu, "Representing

and Negotiating Differences in the Contact Zone."
3. I have more to say about the challenges to the distinction between stu-

dents and authors in composition pedagogy in "Students, Authorship, and the
Work of Composition."

4. For a similar argument from a somewhat different perspective, see Walters,
especially pages 825,827.

5. See, for example, Brody; Delpit; Fox, Social Uses; Gilyard; Jarratt; Miller;
Royster; Stuckey; Villanueva.

6. See, for example, such studies as Stygall; Hull and Rose, "This Wooden
Shack Place and "Rethinking Remediation"; Hull, Rose, Fraser, and Castellano;
Brodkey; and Ewald and Wallace.

7. We have subsequently pursued this line of inquiry in Lu and Horner, "The
Problematic of Experience: Redefining Critical Work in Ethnography and Peda-
gogy."
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