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Responding to Student Diversity:
A Community College Perspective

The rapid growth of community colleges during the '60s and '70s can be traced, in part,
to public policy decisions to limit the amount of diversity selective four-year institutions
were required to accommodate. Two-year colleges were created to serve as the major
access point for populations previously excluded or underserved. Four-rar colleges
were expected to focus on achievement as traditionally defined. This arrangement has
resulted in the concentration Of students of color in institlitions with the fewest resources
from which they are less likely to graduate or transfer than their Anglo counterparts.'

The current concern with underpreparation is in large measure a concerti about the
long-term effects of concentrating a potential underclass in institutions that on the
surface appear to be designed to support existing social and economic arrangemer ts.
Community colleges are not alone in this dilemma. Wildavsk? describes prograrr s
originating in the Great Society era generally as failures because they had as their
objective changing client behavior and as it turns out, "Human Beings Are Not Very
Easy to Change After All."' Confronted with clients who refused or were unable to
change to conform to Great Society expectations for upward mobility from first-time
exposure to higher ,.ducation, community colleges first sought programs that required no
change in clientele and, then, clientele who could be changed, or, better yet, needed no
changing.

In the Diverted Dream, Brint and Karabee argue an administrative conspiracy as the
explanation for the "vocationalization" of community colleges during the '70s and '80s.
Wildavsky's perspective offers a more straightforward explanation. By the early '70s it
was clear to many community college leaders that continuing concentration on the
transfer function with a clientele from which many of the higher-achieving and mo-e
academically oriented students had been "creamed" by four-year institutions could only
lead to falure rates in excess of those for which they had already been publicly
criticized. The development of career programs in which less well-prepared students
4:ould succeed was an attractive alternative. Later, as these programs led to increasingly
close relationships with business and industry, _:ommunity colleges had many
opportunities to attract already employed workers, a clientele that needed no changing
to benefit from the work-related programs their employers helped to establish.

During the '70s, the philosophy of "right to fair gave students with increasingly marginal
preparation the opportunity to attempt any academic course community colleges offered
without prerequisites.

The community college emphasis on career programs and a widely publicized surplus of
four-year graduates produced among transfer offerings by the late '70s, a "stultifying
sameness of a curriculum shrunken to introductory courses."' In the early '80s, a pair of
NM-funded studies at two separate universities reached essentially similar conclusions.
An institution established to "level up" disadvantaged segments of society had achieved
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much of its success through leveling down the critical literacy skills required for
successful completion of arts and science courses!' 7

The preparation of students attending community colleges generally improved in the
'70s,5 but the '80s have been a very different story. By the middle of the past decade,
concern about the level of basic competencies and the preparation of students for more
advanced work had moved from its ranking as fourth in 1979 to the top concern among
community college administrators.9

In the last part of the current decade, community colleges have been drawn, often
reluctantly, into the assessment movement. The results have confirmed that more than
half of entering community college students lack the basic skills required to do credible
academic work.' In urban institutions the numbers often range from three-fourths to
more than 95% of the student body. As assessment becomes increasingly widespread,
community college educators, like their K-12 colleagues, find that the idea of making
measurement public has outrun their ability to demonstrate student accomplishment.'
In lieu of approval for extending opportunities, community college leaders now often
find themselves responding to charges that the less well-prepared students they
increasingly serve are graduating or transferring at levels significantly below tnose
previously attained by a better prepared cohort.

The general issue of preAration cannot be separated from factors of race and ethnicity.
Blacks, Hispanics and American Indians disproportionately rely upon community
colleges as their point of initial access to higher education. California community
colleges enroll 40% of all high school graduates but 80% of all giaduates of color.°
Blacks and Latinos are less well represented among graduates and transfer cohorts than
among community college students. In Florida, where 60% of all baccalaureate
candidates are expected to begin in community c,,lleges, Blacks constituted 18.7% of the
15-24 year-old population, 17.5% of the high school graduates, 13% of the community
college enrollments, and 4.8% of the Associate in Arts degree graduates in 1988. In the
same year they represented 7% of the state university system freshmen and earned 4%
of the baccalaureate degrees.° From these data and studies of information provided by
the National Center for Educational statistics, it is clear that community colleges are a
part of the pipeline problem as well as a potential contributor to a solution.
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Defining Underpreparation

The way a problem is defined has much to do with shaping the efforts aimed at its
solution. Describing the way community colleges relate to their constituencies as
strategic marketing rather than offering products, distributing services efficiently or
selling existing programs and services, has brought about fundamental changes in the
ways leaders think about their responsibilities and in their ways of doing business.'

The preparation problem has generally been defined in terms of student deficiencies.
The deficiency approach has involved the use of standardized or faculty-developed
assessment instruments as the basis for placing students with those advised to enter
developmental courses defined as underprepared.

Under the deficiency approach, even the most highly selective institutions enroll students
who are underprepared. At UCLA, one of the most selective universities in the nation,
there is a large Academic Advancement Program that serves a predominantly minority
student population who enter under Student Affirmative Action (SAA) guidelines. The
mean high school grade-point average (GPA) for all UCLA entering freshmen in 1986
was 3.76. The mean high school GPA for SAA matriculants was 3.41. At UCLA,
students with GPAs that would earn them merit scholarships in many other institutions
are identified as underprepared.' The matter is further complicated by curricular
differences. In some institutions, students who start their mathematics sequence below
the level of calculus are considered underprepared.

Researchers at Arizona State interviewed 107 Black, Latino and American Indian
graduates from 10 predominantly Anglo, four-year colleges and universities to determine
whether a student's perspective on preparation might furnish an alternative to the
deficiency view of student preparation.' Many of these baccalaureate graduates had
previously attended a community college. The interviews documented in detail
incredible stories of motivation, persistence and sacrifice both from students and from
their families. More than half of these degree recipients had begun their college careers
carrying the 'abel of underprepared.

These student interviews suggested that preparation involves more than the high school
attended and the courses takea. Preparation includes developing accurate expectations
about college participation through experiences that approximate college-going.
Preparation has cognitive, physical, tev.poral and social dimensions. The need for
college students to develop accurate expectations about course content and academic
skills is well understood, but substantially less attention is given to the other three
aspects of preparation for college-going.

Preparation is directly related to family educational experience. Students with the most
detailed and aecurate expectations came from families with a tradition of college-going.
ereparation was also influenced by association with present and past college-goers in
school, in the community and in the workplace. Positive role models helped students
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prepare by providing indirect simulation of college-going through the sharing of college
experiences.

The beliefs students develop about valued adult roles aad the part played by education
in structuring access to those roles, a characteristic we labeled "opportunity orientation,"
represents a second major dimension of student diversity. The reason so many first-
generation college-goers attend as adults has to do with the norms for becoming "adult"
in the working-class and inner-city communities where they grow up, In many such
settings, becoming adult involves getting a job or joining the service, not attending an
institution of higher education. As young adults experience educated role models in the
military or on the job, they increasingly recognize their own talents and better
understand the opportunities afforded by a college degree.

A view of adult status that excludes higher education as an appropriate choice provides
an inadequate base for selecting high school courses and leads to indifferent
performance in the courses that are chosen. Students with this orientation are most
likely to attend college as adults, if at all, and bring with them the liabilities of their
previous educational experiences, as well as the challenges of balancing coursework with
the demands of a family and a job. The problematic characteristics of more diverse
learners are cumulative. Lack of exposure to educated families and rigorous schooling
causes preparation deficiencies. These are aggravated by cultural norms that define
going to school and attaining adult status as mutually exclusive. The problem wouid be
serious under any circumstances, but it is aggravated by the proportionately greater
numbers of Black, Latino and American Indian students who experience poor
preparation!'

The interviews identified four categories of student preparation. Group I included
graduates who came from educated families, attended suburban or high-performing
inner-city schools and always expected to go to college. This was the group who
succeeded at places like UCLA despite being stereotyped in some instances as
underprepared. Students from this group were very unlikely to attend community
colleges. A second large group involved first-generation college students who lacked the
detailed preparation of Group I, but who had grown up with strong parental
encouragement to build a rewarding life through attending college. Group II identified
Ivntoring, summer programs and such support activities as tutoring ano learning
lab_vatries as critical to their ability to persist. A significant proportion of this group
began their postsecondary careers in a community college.

A third, quite small group, grew up in families and communities where the people with
whom they associated had not been to college and where they were consistently advised'
that attending college would ni ke no difference in the opportunities they would
subsequently experience. Hampered by a lack of preparation and attitudes that defined
college attendance as an inappropriate activity for adults, Group III graduates overcame
incredible odds, including negative peer and family pressures. All graduates in this
group reported community college experience as part of their degree attainment
marathon. A high proportion were employed at the time of the interviews in jobs no
better (and in two instances worse) than the jobs they held before entering college,
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perhaps reflecting the self-fulfilling nature of the prophecy made by their friends and
families.

A fourth group, also small, had detailed preparation, but lacked the conviction that a
college education would make a significant difference in their lives. Group IV included
a number of American Indians who came from reservations where unemployment rates
were high and opportunities for professionally trained workers very limited. Several
students from this group had attended associate degree institutions.

The characteristics of these four groups illuminate the preparation issue as it is curre,itly
defmed for com-lunity colleges. Group I students are heavily recruited by selective
institutions because their admission poses no threat to the way these institutions are
currently doing business. Group II students are also heavily recruited, especially by
teaching-oriented comprehensive colleges and universities. Even though they require
special assistance in making the transition from high school and in coping with the
demands of college work, they attend in the traditional full-time mode and are highly
motivated. While institutions must make some adaptations to serve them effectively,
such changes can often be accomplished by specialized staff, leaving the academic core
of the institution free to continue traditional learning practices.

Group III is disproportionately Black and Latino and is concentrated in and arourd the
larger American cities. In a very real sense, no one is anxious to serve this group, if by
serving them is meant taking seriously the responsibility for helping them achieve success
across the entire range of academic majors. Inner-city community colleges are happy to
have them as clients as long as everyone understands that the outcomes for judging
institutional success should be social welfare-oriented or preparation for lower level
vocational careers. The problem of underpreparation for community colleges is most
critically the task of achieving traditional outcomes for students whose diversity in
preparation and opportunity orientation make them poor candidates for traditional
learning practices.

Group IV is to some extent created by the unique circumstances of life on an Indian
reservation. The phenomenon can also be observed among affluent and alienated
majority students who have not been persuaded that the quality of their lives depends to
any serious degree upon their own exertions.
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A Conceptual Framework for
Anal Pre ration Is....a.,...L.,_,Jes

Figure 1 represents a model of the process through which 10 institutions involved in a
national study of minority progess to the baccalaureate altered their organizational
cultures to respond to the pressures produced by a more diverse student body.' When
confronted with internal or external pressures to improve participation, institutions
reacted in Stage 1 by emphasizing recruitment, financial aid, waiver of admission
standards and providing more convenient class offerings. The more diverse students
admitted experienced difficulties in meeting academic expectations developed for
students with different precollege experiences.

To counter high attrition rates, institutions adopted systematic interventions in Stage 2 to
change students so they were better able to cope with institutional expectations. Some
of the more multicultural institutions in the study approached a third stage when they
adopted strategies to alter the learning environments they provided for more diversely
prepared students rather than expecting students to do all of the changing.

Within the model, organizational culture is defined as the assumptions and beliefs
shared by members.' Adaptation is defined as changes in an organization's behaviors,
values and beliefs to maintain or improve relationships with those who control
resources.' The learning environment consists of the interventions and strategies an
institution employs to help students achieve ou:comes. The iearning environment can be
thought of as the observable product of an institution's invisible culture. Administrators
and faculty leaders manage culture to ensure that institutions move through the three
stages rather tnan reducing standards, redefining outcomes or tolerating excessively high
attrition.

The model in Figure 1 contrasts open-access institutions and the achievement problems
they commonly experience with selective institutions which are much more likely to
experience participation problems. However, selective and opcn-access institutions can
experience both types of problems. A racial or ethnic group can be underrepresented in
the selective allied health programs of a community college. Conversely, a selective
university in an urban setting may have good participation rates accompanied by
disproportionately los., graduation rates for some groups.

Colleges work with three sets of variables in responding to preparation issues: student
characteristics, expected outcomes, and organizational culture. Institutions can limit
student diversity through screening out those who lack the skills necessary to achieve
specified outcomes within their existing learning environments. They can substitute new
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outcomes requiring less in the way of preparation or opportunity orientation; or
alternatively, the requirements for achieving existing outcomes can be reduced. Finally,
they can work to alter the organizational cultures that define the range of student
diversity their learnirg environments serve effectively. Altering organizational culture is
the most difficua and time-consuming of the three alternatives, but it is also the one
that offers the best hope for augmenting deficiency approaches with alternatives that
emphasize achievement.
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Institutional Stratecies for Responding
to Preparation kosues

Community colleges have had substantial success in removing the barriers to
participation by previously underrepresented groups. They have also had better success
in reducing race and ethnieity-related differen-sts in achievement than many of their
four-year counterparts. Important disparities remain, however, and are an important
factor underlying much of the current concein about community college outcomes.n

In 1986, Blacks were 88% as likely as Ang los to attend a two-year college in the 26
states where they represented more than 5% of the population. A Black attending a
two-year college was 85% as likely as an Anglo to graduate. Latinos in the 10 states
where they represented more than 5% of the population in 1986 were 68% as likely to
attend and 91% as likely to graduate as Anglos. With the exception of a 6% decline in
participation by Blacks, all rates remained essentially constant between 1980 and 1986.
By way of contrast, Blacks, Latinos and American Indians, as a group, were only 64% as
likely as Arglos to attend a four-year institution in 1986 and only 71% as likely to
graduate.n

The model in Figure 1 can he used as a tool to help institutions assess the effectiveness
of their strategies for responding to student diversity. The first step requires the
examination of outcomes over time to determine the relative importance of strategies
that focus on reducing barriers, changing students or changing the learning environment.
The outcomes that drive much current debate are graduation and transfer rates.
Participation rates also remain important in institutions created to promote equity.
While other outcomes might reasonably be considered in any analysis, they cannot
substitute for the purposes most closely associated with the policy decision to establish
community colleges as opportunity institutions.

Institutions v 'th declining participation rates may discover that changes in the policy
environment, including quality initiatives and diminishing student financial assistance,
have eroded some of the progress they had previously made in serving underrepresented
populations. The strategies for removing barriers to participation are grouped under
stage 1 of the model.

Community colleges in Chicago and elsewhere have placed greater emphasis on
recruiting from inner-city schools and have established merit scholarships for students of
color. Such actions communicate their interest in serving the academically talented as
well as those with preparation problems. Many community colleges have also placed
renewed emphasis on the transfer sequence, often in collaboration with neighboring
four-year institutions. Urban community colleges have adopted multiple admissions
criteria for selective allied health programs to ensure enrollments reflective of the racial
and ethnic composition of their open-door programs.

Fine tuning stage 1 strategies may provide help to community colleges in changing the
image they present to better prepared students. However, additional emphasis on
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removing barriers has at least as much potential for increasing the preparation problem
as for moderating it. More promising for most community colleges are the stage 2
strategies that focus on preparation, broadly defined, as a means of reducing the
mismatch between institutional expectations and student capabilities.

Commurny colleges zan motivate high school students to stay in school and to take
more rigorous coursework through outreach programs of the type offered in Los Angeles
and elsewhere. They can strengthen preparation and assist transition through summer
programs of the type offered by South Mountain College in Phoenix. They can
emphasize mentoring and tutoring to offset limited opportunity orientations in addition
to providing extra help for students with nontraditional academic preparation. And they
can give special attention to buffering identifiable minority students from the racism that
often intrudes from the surrounding community.

It is not sufficient to offer some of these interventions io students who qualify under
state or federal equal opportunity guidelines. Community colleges are most often the
institution of choice for first-generation college students. Such individuals are, at best,
uncertain climbers. Providing them with a ladder with missing rungs is a sure recipe for
failure. The institutions most advanced in their use of stage 2 strategies provide a
comprehensive and coherent combination of these interventions to all students on the
basis of need rather than race or ethnicity.

Community colleges also need to enhance their competitive position for the first-
generation students in the traditional age group most likely to benefit from stage 2
interventions. One promising approach is the guaranteed acceptance program currently
offered in the states of Pennsylvania and Washington. At the Community College of
Philadelphia (CCP), students are guaranteed acceptance to the main campus of Penn
State in the program of their choice with full credit for all coursework upon completion
of the provisions of an agreement they sign at the time they enter CCP. Any attempt to
improve advising and remove barriers to t,nv.ble-free transfer will improve the appeal of
community colleges to better prepared and more serious students.

Stage 2 strategies can be found in abundance in most community colleges. Some
improvement in outcomes may result from further refinement, better coordination and
making the programs and services more widely available. It seems highly unlikely,
however, that race and ethnicity-related differences in participation and achievemer,t, in
addition to generally low graduation and transfer rates, can be fully offset by relying
exclusively on stage 1 or stage 2 interventions. Conununity colleges will also have to
consider stage 3 strategies for changing their learning environments.

Technology has been (and perhaps remains) the great hope of administrators and state
policy officials for changing the learning environment. The results of implementing new
technologies have been disappointing, however, largely because technology has had little
impact on classroo-i instruction?' Altering the values and beliefs of faculty members so
that technology and other forms of pedagogy are used effectively with the students who
now attend community colleges, as distinct from those the faculty might prefer, requires

12
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changes in organizational culture. Such changes are most likely to occur when stage 3
strategies are systematically employed.25

Student assessment helps to create more manageable learning conditions within the
classroom. It may also be used, not necessarily to popular acclaim, to enforce
accountability for student learning as in Florida and Texas. Developmental education --
reading, vrk-ting, mathematics, study skills, test-taking skills, and personal adjustmene --
represents a major stage 3 strategy for addressing deficiencies between student
preparation and the demands of academic programs. Developmental programs pressure
existing faculty practices by demonstrating that under the right conditions underprepared
students can persist and achieve at rates that sometimes exceed the performance of
better prepared counterparts in the standard programs. For optimum contribution, such
programs must be designed to counter the common student perception that they
constime an obstacle separating them from their reasons for attending college.

Curricular and pedagogical change can be powerful strategies for changing culture where
faculty are a central part of the decision-making process. While the focus of
institutional response to diversity has often involved incorporating the contributions of
other cultures through adding courses or changing the content of existing courses, there
is also the opportunity to strengthen faculty accountability for transfer programs (as
distinct from individual' courses)v and to bring transfer courses into closer alignment
with the offerings of four-year institutions which accept the largest proportion of a
college's transfers.

Arguably, community colleges have paid more attention to all three of the stages than
their four-year sister institutions. Part of the transfer issue clearly relates to the
unwillingness of four-year institutions to match the scheduling adjustments, support
services and responsive learning environments routinely provided by many community
colleges.n

While changing organizational culture represents the most promising long-term approach
for dealing with preparation issues, short-term strategies are also necessary to address
immediate problems. Two possibilities for exploration are suggested by the experiences
of urban schools and university professional schools.

City schocl districts in Memphis, Los Angeles and elsewhere have chose', tn concentrate
resources on helping some students achieve excellence rather than attempting to bring
everyone to some minimum level of underachievement. While the results are sometimes
demoralizing for those who remain behind in neighborhood schools stripped of their
more talented students, the outcomes for those who remain behind are not discernibly
worse than before and the more talented are challenged to develop their full potential.
Honors programs in community colleges represent a manifestation of this line of
thought. Too often, however, the criteria for participation exclude highly motivated and
talented students of color who have been diagnosed by the deficiency model as
underprepared.

13
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The Boston University (BU) Medical School recruits college juniors from historically
Black colleges and universities in the South. Students are admitted to medical school as
an honor at the end of their junior year based on grades and instructors'
recommendations. No test scores are involved. Students spend their senior year at BU
where they earn credits toward graduation from their sending colleges, while
concurrently receiving credit for several of the courses required for their first year of
medical school. Those who belong to ,.-.1rorities and fraternities at sending colleges are
given full membership in related BU sororities and fraternities. At the end of their
senior year at BU, they receive a bachelor's degree from the sending institution and
enter medical school a step ahead of those who came in through regular admissions
procedures." The tech-prep option represents a similar approach by community colleges
for career programs."

The BU program and those offered by the public schools in Los Angeles and Memphis
are important because they represent radical departures from the deficiency model. Ma
magnet programs identify and build on students' strengths rather than focusing on
weaknesses. The BU program provides an alternative for students who would never
qualify for admission to a medical school under standard procedures. Both programs
make use of the concepts embodied in the model through addressing systematically all
three stages of adaptation within a single program. Both the magnet program and the
alternative medical school program remove barriers, help students adjust to high
expectations, and change the learning environments students experience.

Community colleges are not free to choose between the deficiency and achievement
models. Given scarce resources and continuing pressures from students seeking access,
they must continue to implement the deficiency model as best they can. Concurrently
. .me may choose to dedicate more of their resources to programs where carefully
selected and highly motivated nontraditional learners from underrepresented
communities experience an opportunity to achivve excellence. Perhaps the most
compelling reason for seeking better balance between deficiency and achievement
approaches rests with the contribution of the latter to administrative efforts to alter
organizational culture.

14
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The Role of Leadership

As a function of their philosophy and funding, community colleges remain more firmly
attached to unrestricted access, job training, community service, convenience and low
cost than to such correlates of achievement as intellectual inquiry, the collegiate function
or a generally educated population.' While most community colleges display
characteristics of all three of the stages depicted in the model, many could improve their
outcomes for more diversely prepared students by giving greater attention to stage 2 and
stage 3 strategies.

How do institutions change to achieve a better balance between the emphasis given to
increasing diversity and the attention focused on changing the learning environment to
promote higher levels of student achievement? The answer suggested by the model
involves the management of organizational culture.

Adrniaistrators manage or3anizational culture through strategic planning, by coordinating
and controlling the implementation of plans, by assessing outcomes, by selecting new
staff who embody the values and behaviors desired in the changed culture, and by
providing incentives and support to existing staff to encourage them to change in desired
directionc.

The recent efforts of Miami-Dade Community College furnish a case study of how the
process operates. Through consensus-building task force activity, the college defined
seven shared values related to teaching and learning. These values were legitimated
through adoptic-.. by the Board of Trustees in December 1987." In a related activity, a
second subcommittee, studying the environment Miami-Dade provided for teaching and
learning, produced a statement on faculty excellence which was adopted by the board in
October 1988."

After reaching consensus on shared values and faculty behaviors related to the
attainment of those values, a third subcommittee developed a framework for relating the
institution's system of rewards and recognition to the identified values and behaviors.
Following extensive discussion and appropriate revisions, the framework was adopted by
majority vote of the faculty in April 1989. Concurrent with these efforts to mobilize and
empower existing staff, Miami-Dade has worked with the University of Miami to define
expectations for new staff and developed a program to ensure new staff develop the
values, beliefs and knowledge necessary for them to become fully contributing members
of the Miami-Dade community.
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When these efforts are placed in the context of student assessment as mandated by
Florida and the learning assistance for which Mimi-Dade has long been widely
recognized,' it is apparent that college leadership has cousciously managed the culture
to ensure systematic attention to each of the variables that are involved in changing the
learning environment. Other community colleges have paid attention to stage 2 and
stage 3 interventions as well, but most have not been as systematic or persisteat in their
efforts over such an extended period of time.
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Conclusion

The preparation issue is arguably the most important challenge community colleges
currently confront. It cannot be neutralized by redefining outcomes so that
underprepared students can achieve them. Nor can it be avoided by excluding students
who are assessed as extremely high risk. Increasing the numbers who participate without
corresponding increases in the cumbers who attain outcomes to which the public
attaches priority, only aggravates the problem. Changing the learning environment,
especially that part which is determined by student interaction with faculty members, is
the only alternative that offers much hope for long-term improvement.

Approaching the issue of student diversity from the perspective of organizational culture
can help institutional leaders avoid the pursuit of strategies that promise diminishing
returns. It is organizational culture that furnishes the context within which faculty
beliefs and values define teaching and the learning process. It is organizational culture
that gives meaning to the concept of underpreparation and defines the appropriate
institutional response.

The prevailing community college approach to student preparation issues involves a
deficiency model where remediation is emphasized as the dominant strategy for bringing
everyone to minimum standards. Needed as well is an achievement model that
challenges faculty to design an environment where diversity is valued and individuals are
inspired to build on strengths to attain maximum potential. A complicating factor is that
the two models need to coexist in most community colleges for the foreseeable future.

The task of implementing achievement models in institutions historically committed to
access is, above all, a task of managing culture. While culture management is more
time-consuming and difficult than the introduction of technology, it is the only approach
through which the faculty who control the nature of the learning environment and its
impact on students can be influenced to augment deficiency views and practices. There
are emerging models of the way the process works. Efforts to manage culture will be
aided by the opportunity to employ new staff as those representative of founding values
and beliefs retire in large numbers over the next decade.
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